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THE OHIO STATE UNIVERSITY 
 

OFFICIAL PROCEEDINGS OF THE 
 

ONE THOUSAND FOUR HUNDRED AND SIXTY-SECOND 
 

MEETING OF THE BOARD OF TRUSTEES 
 
 

Columbus, Ohio, February 9-10, 2012 
 
 
The Board of Trustees met Thursday, February 9, and Friday, February 10, 2012, at 
Longaberger Alumni House, Columbus, Ohio, pursuant to adjournment. 
 

**  **  ** 
 

Minutes of the last meeting were approved. 
 

**  **  ** 
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The Chairman, Mr. Wexner, called the meeting of the Board of Trustees to order on 
Thursday, February 9, 2012 at 8:41 am.  
 
Present: Leslie H. Wexner, Chairman, Walden W. O’Dell, Alex Shumate, Brian K. Hicks, 
John C. Fisher, Robert H. Schottenstein, Alan W. Brass, Ronald A. Ratner, Algenon L. 
Marbley, Linda S. Kass, Janet B. Reid, William G. Jurgensen, Timothy P. Smucker, G. 
Gilbert Cloyd, Corbett A. Price, Brandon N. Mitchell and Evann K. Heidersbach. 
 

Good morning, I would like to convene the meeting of the Board of Trustees. Before we 
take the roll call vote to go into Executive Session, I want to announce that the full Board 
will reconvene tomorrow morning at 9:00 am. 
 
I hereby move that the Board recess into Executive Session to consider personnel 
matters regarding appointment, employment and compensation of public officials, to 
consult with legal counsel regarding pending or imminent litigation, and to consider 
matters required to be kept confidential by Federal and State Statutes. 

 
Upon motion of Mr. Wexner, seconded by Judge Marbley, the Board of Trustees adopted 
the foregoing motion by unanimous roll call vote, cast by Trustees Wexner, O’Dell, 
Shumate, Hicks, Fisher, Schottenstein, Brass, Ratner, Marbley, Kass, Reid, Jurgensen, 
and Smucker. 

 
*** 

 
The Chairman, Mr. Wexner, called the meeting of the Board of Trustees to order on Friday, 
February 10, 2012, at 9:00 am.  
 
Present: Leslie H. Wexner, Chairman, Walden W. O’Dell, Alex Shumate, Brian K. Hicks, 
John C. Fisher, Robert H. Schottenstein, Alan W. Brass, Algenon L. Marbley, Linda S. 
Kass, William G. Jurgensen, Jeffrey Wadsworth, Timothy P. Smucker, G. Gilbert Cloyd, 
Corbett A. Price, Brandon N. Mitchell and Evann K. Heidersbach. 
 

Good morning. I would like to reconvene the meeting of the Board of Trustees. Before 
we take the roll call to go into Executive Session, I want to announce that the full Board 
will reconvene at 10:00 am today. 
 
I hereby move that the Board recess into Executive Session to consider matters required 
to be kept confidential by Federal and State Statutes. 
 

Upon motion of Mr. Wexner, seconded by Dr. Wadsworth, the Board of Trustees adopted 
the foregoing motion by unanimous roll call vote, cast by Trustees Wexner, O’Dell, 
Shumate, Hicks, Fisher, Schottenstein, Brass, Marbley, Kass, Jurgensen, Wadsworth, and 
Smucker. 

 
*** 

 
The Chairman, Mr. Wexner, called the meeting of the Board of Trustees to order on Friday, 
February 10, 2012, at 10:05 am.  
 
Present: Leslie H. Wexner, Chairman, Walden W. O’Dell, Alex Shumate, Brian K. Hicks, 
John C. Fisher, Robert H. Schottenstein, Alan W. Brass, Ronald A. Ratner, Algenon L. 
Marbley, Linda S. Kass, William G. Jurgensen, Jeffrey Wadsworth, Timothy P. Smucker, 
G. Gilbert Cloyd, Brandon N. Mitchell and Evann K. Heidersbach. 
 
Mr. Wexner: 
 

I want to call the meeting to order and convene the Trustee meeting. David, do you want 
to note the attendance of the Board?  
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Dr. Horn: 
 

A quorum is present, Mr. Chairman. 
 
Mr. Wexner: 
 

Good, thank you. I would like to remind everybody to please turn off their electronic 
devices, cell phones, and other things so they do not disrupt the meeting. We have a full 
agenda today, so if we can control the disturbances, it will be appreciated. The minutes 
of the November and December meetings have been distributed. I would assume there 
are no additions or corrections and the minutes can be approved as distributed. I hear 
no objections. Evann, do you want to begin with the Student Recognition Awards 
please? Thank you. 

 
*** 

 
STUDENT RECOGNITION AWARDS 

 
Ms. Heidersbach: 
 

Thank you, Mr. Chairman. If I could, I would like to call Drew and Graham up to the table, 
please. A little known fact, I just found this out; they were actually roommates in their 
freshman and sophomore years, and they just found out that they were both getting this 
award today, so that is kind of fun.  
 
Let me first introduce Drew Enigk from the College of Food, Agricultural, and 
Environmental Sciences. Drew is a senior majoring in Animal Sciences from Cincinnati, 
Ohio. He is active as an honors student in the College of Food, Agricultural, and 
Environmental Sciences (CFAES) and serves as their ambassador as well as a member 
of the Animal Sciences Community Alliance. Drew is a member of Sphinx Honorary and 
treasurer for Phi Kappa Phi Honor Society. Drew has completed three research projects 
during his undergraduate career, including his honors thesis, which is a cross-sectional 
investigation of non-kin affiliation in Bonobos. He has participated in three University 
study abroad programs to Australia, Costa Rica and Mexico and is a member of the 
Office of International Affairs Study Abroad Student Advisory Committee. In November 
of 2011 he traveled to Brazil as part of the Brazil Research Exchange Program to present 
on Comparative Behavior of Grevy’s Zebras and Somali Wild Asses. Drew was also 
selected as a recipient of the Wolfe Scholarship to study abroad. 
 
He is an exceptional student, outstanding role model and extraordinary leader and has 
contributed in many meaningful ways to his Department, the College, and the University. 
Upon graduation Drew plans to continue his studies of animal behavior by pursuing his 
PhD in biological anthropology as a graduate student beginning this fall. His graduate 
program will provide him with the opportunity to conduct field research on wild primates 
in Africa or South America for his dissertation. 
 
Joining Drew today is Mariette Benage, the Student Success Coordinator in the 
Department of Animal Sciences. Thank you for being here, Drew. 
 
Next we have Graham Welling. Graham is a senior in the honors program, double 
majoring in City and Regional Planning and Russian. He is an outstanding student who 
has thrived academically, as well as an active citizen and emerging leader and has 
embraced OSU as a gateway to the world. 
 
He is deeply interested in international development in Russia and has pursued deep 
studies in the Russian language during his time at OSU. In the spring of 2010 he 
participated in a quarter-long language emersion program through OSU in Russia. 
Graham then arranged for an internship with the Institute of Urban Economics in Russia 
in the summer of 2011. Graham was responsible for investigating legal regulation of 
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development, smart growth, and the formulation of master plans in Perm, Russia. 
Through his internship he was able to write a journal article, in Russian, about the 
development plan for the city, which has been submitted for publication in a Russian law 
journal. 
 
Graham has been active in service and extracurricular activities at OSU as well. He is 
the Vice President of the Russian Club. He was selected as the Center for Slavic and 
Eastern European Studies 2011-12 Fellowship. Graham participates in the ESL 
conversation partners program. He serves on the Committee of 88 and is involved in 
TerrAqua, which is a student group involved in water-quality and conservation projects. 
In addition to his academic and service activities, he works for the Campus Area Bus 
Service as a bus driver. 

 
Graham is on track to graduate Magna Cum Laude this spring and hopes to have a 
career with a company or NGO involved in planning and development in Russia or 
Eastern Europe. Joining Graham today are his parents Douglas and Victoria Welling. 
Thank you for being here. Please join me in congratulating both of these exceptional 
students. Graham and Drew, if you have anything to say, please share with the group 
here. 

 
Mr. Enigk: 
 

First of all I would like the thank the College of Food, Agricultural, and Environmental 
Sciences for nominating me and also the Board for selecting me for this award. When I 
started my undergraduate career my plan was to make a difference and make my mark 
at Ohio State, but I never pictured myself being in front of the Board of Trustees my 
senior year, so this is just an amazing opportunity. 
 
My accomplishments would not have been possible without my amazing mentors, Dr. 
Guatelli-Steinberg and Mariette. I first met Mariette through my freshman year survey 
class, and she has been wonderful. She connected me with my first research mentor 
and encouraged me to apply for the Saint Louis Zoo internship. Also, I would not be the 
current Sergeant-at-Arms of the Sphinx Senior Class Honorary had it not been for her 
stellar letter of recommendation.  

 
I met Dr. Guatelli-Steinberg my junior year after beginning to pursue a minor in physical 
anthropology. I thank her for all of the time that she has allowed me to come to her office 
and discuss the endless fascinating aspects of primatology. I thank her also for 
motivating me to become a primatologist. I cannot thank you enough for all of the 
outstanding letters of recommendation that you have provided me with for the Marshall 
Scholarship, the National Science Foundation of Graduate Research Fellowship, and 
graduate schools. 
 
I would also like to extend my gratitude to Chairman Wexner, President Gee, and Dean 
Moser, and all of the other leaders, faculty, staff, and benefactors of Ohio State who 
work tirelessly to make this such an amazing institution. I am truly honored to have been 
selected for this esteemed award and tremendously proud to have attended The Ohio 
State University. As I move on to graduate school and the future that lies beyond, I will 
undoubtedly draw upon the confidence that has been instilled in my time here at Ohio 
State and uphold the tradition of excellence that this fabulous institution promotes. Thank 
you. 

 
Mr. Welling: 
 

Good morning everyone. I would like to say that I am pleased and honored to be here 
and to represent the College of Engineering and the Knowlton School of Architecture. I 
would like to express my gratitude to all the faculty and staff at the Knowlton School of 
Architecture and, of course, in my other major, Russian, for selecting me for this 
prestigious honor. Again, I would like to thank President Gee and all of the members of 
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the Board for their great leadership and continuing to make this University the great 
place that it is. 
 
When I first started here, I started in Environmental Science, actually in Drew’s college 
and, in coincidence of coincidences, we were freshman and sophomore year 
roommates, and he remains a good friend of mine to this day. In my studies of Russian, 
I found that Russians call Moscow, a city of eleven to twenty million, no one seems to 
know exactly how many, a large village because no matter how many people there are, 
you always seem to run in to people you know at all occasions. I think that Ohio State 
also exemplifies that giant village experience as well. For how big this University is, for 
how many directions you can go in any one day, for how many clubs, sports, activities, 
all the places you can be, you always seem to run in to the same people, the great 
people, all the time and that, I think, is what makes this University great.  
 
Again, I am pleased to be here and I would like to thank all of the faculty and staff. Thank 
you. 

 
*** 

 
PRESIDENT’S REPORT 

 
President Gee: 
 

Ladies and gentlemen, thank you very much, and to the students, congratulations to you 
and to the family and friends. With 65,000 outstanding students, to pick and choose 
among them is very difficult, but what great representatives you are, and we are thankful 
for that. 
 
I will start by saying in my report to the Board that the two months since our last meeting, 
we have had a lull for the holidays, but I can assure you that as you can tell from the 
energy and all the things that are happening including all the cranes and other things 
going on here and all of our construction that we are now back to our proper roar. So I 
am going to be very brief today because we have a long agenda. In many ways, the past 
several weeks have had a common theme of partnerships a word that I love and one 
that I want to underscore with higher education, our communities, businesses, 
supporters, and elected officials. 
 
Early last month we celebrated the launch of PACT, Partners Achieving Community 
Transformation, which has been created to reinvigorate the city’s near East side 
neighborhood, where our University Hospital East is located. PACT, for those of you 
who do not know, is a collaboration among Ohio State, the City of Columbus, the 
Columbus Housing Authority, and the near East side residents, and it demonstrates the 
living mission of the University’s founding purpose to enrich lives and improve 
communities, that is our land grant heritage. 
 
Our economic development work in that area and in the neighborhood adjacent to our 
campus, received a tremendous boost last week, when we announced our 
groundbreaking new $125 million partnership with Huntington National Bank. Moreover, 
Huntington is also investing in our students, our faculty, and our staff. Through this 
partnership, the bank has provided $25 million to us that we are using for things such as 
scholarships, classroom improvements, new instructional technologies, and career 
services for students and alumni. This is the most comprehensive arrangement of its 
kind in the country, and I am deeply grateful to Steve Steinour, Huntington’s visionary 
leader, and to Geoff Chatas, our Senior Vice President and Chief Financial Officer, for 
their work to forge this partnership It is a great partnership and is something that we can 
all celebrate today.  
 
That collaboration is the most recent tactic in our comprehensive strategy to ensure that 
Ohio State’s excellence, and the boundless opportunities it provides to young people, is 
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not just sustained, but also deepened and accelerated. I first began talking about our 
financial strategies in my October address to the faculty, and I have been hitting the road 
to evangelize about them during the past couple of months. It is, I believe, the fulcrum, 
the center, of the University’s ability to fulfill its role as a great public university, as a 
leading public university, in the 21st century. The other critical piece of the equation is, 
to be sure, access and attainment. And here again, partnerships play an essential role. 
Last month, I was honored to co-host a forum with the College Board at the Ohio 
Statehouse that focused on those issues.  

 
Through new partnerships with Columbus State Community College and community 
college partners around the state and beyond, we are making promising headway. We 
are also addressing the issue nationally, and it should be, because of the conversations 
that are taking place as you well know in this environment. There is a commission that 
has been created on the future of higher education, and I am honored to be chairing that 
commission. The commission is a novel one for one important reason: it includes 
presidents of every type of college and university, two-year colleges, small private ones, 
and comprehensive public universities. Our work is just beginning, but together we 
intend to lead a broad-sweeping national discussion about the role of higher education 
in America’s future. 
 
Increasingly, much of my time is spent working in concert with our state’s elected 
leaders, through such things as the JobsOhio Board and, recently, working with other 
higher education leaders in the state on a collaborative proposal for capital projects at 
our institutions. I will say that I am honored that some of those efforts were highlighted 
by Governor Kasich in his State of the State address this past Tuesday. 
 
Despite the cold, and it is cold in the winter in Columbus, winter quarter is one of my 
favorite times at the University because it is when I have the opportunity to celebrate the 
accomplishments of our faculty award-winners. As a university president, this is my one 
bit of acceptable cloak-and-dagger, bursting in on faculty while they teach or during a 
department meeting. We all know special teachers are so important to recognize 
because they change the course of our lives. If we are fortunate, we have had several 
of them. In my own instance, I had a fourth-grade teacher who enchanted me. I can 
remember my first taste of Greek mythology. And then I can remember undergraduate 
and graduate advisors who really set my own life’s course. At Ohio State, I know we are 
fortunate to have scores of these special teachers. 
 
I will say that this has also been the season for birthday celebrations. My Chairman 
surprised me last week by leading hundreds of attendees at the annual Tech Columbus 
awards program in a chorus of “Happy Birthday” in my honor. Of course, I was up leading 
it myself as you can imagine, but earlier in the day, the students surprised me with some 
cupcakes and some dancing. And, tonight, of course, we join in celebrating the 200th 
anniversary of our great city. I am looking forward to turning the attention toward 
something other than my own age, I can assure you. 
 
As I close, I want to say that I am particularly looking forward to another milestone 
celebration. On February 20th, Ohio State will lead the 50th anniversary commemoration 
of John Glenn’s historic orbiting of the Earth aboard Friendship Seven. Those of us of a 
certain age recall that day and how perilous an endeavor it was. I will always remember 
what they said when he took off in that Roman candle, “God speed John Glenn.” It really 
resonates with me, even today, and as we know, safe return was anything but 
guaranteed. 
 
John Glenn was then, and is today, the very best of what this state and this nation has 
to offer, a man of determination, bravery, and profound dedication to public service. He 
walks our campus every day. All of us are eagerly looking forward to celebrating Senator 
Glenn, his wife, Annie, his great life partner, and their shared leadership and 
engagement at Ohio State. 
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With that, Mr. Chairman, I conclude my report. Much good news to report today. 
 
Mr. Wexner: 
 

Thank you.  
 
As you were talking about John Glenn, we should all be proud that not only did John 
have a heroic career in the Marine Corps, obviously flying in space and being a 
distinguished United States Senator, but when John retired from the Senate he and I 
had become acquainted he began a conversation saying that he wanted to put his 
archives someplace.  
 
The Smithsonian, Harvard, and Princeton had asked him for his archives because of the 
great things that he had done. He had started, when he was in college, collecting and 
saving all kinds of maps and letters and notes and I said, “That’s really interesting, John, 
where are you going to place your archives?” He said, “I don’t know. I don’t want to 
impose, but do you think there is a chance I could keep them at Ohio State? It is so 
important to me.” He didn’t go to Ohio State, but he connected the state with Ohio State. 
I remember calling Gordon and I said, “I just had the most extraordinary conversation.”  
 
The legitimacy of John’s connection to us should be known. He does walk the campus, 
but he really wanted to walk the campus and wants to be part of the University.  
 
I told a story yesterday that I want to tell again. I told the Board that I was invited to speak 
at the Tech Columbus dinner and I knew that Gordon was going to introduce me. I also 
knew that it happened to be his birthday. In the introduction, I got everybody to stand 
about 1,000 people and sing “happy birthday” to Gordon. I had another plan in mind that 
I wanted to share with this group, and it is something else I wanted to talk about. 

 
Recently, recent is how you judge time, Ohio State recruited a great coach, a really great 
coach, and that coach has a proven record of successes and is a coach that was 
admired. The coach also came back to Ohio from being, if you will, in the wilderness, 
and that coach came back to really change the game up the game, and promised to 
make changes in the way the game is played here. That coach focuses on talent, 
assistant coaches and players. The primary focus of the coach was to recruit and obtain 
the best assistant coaches that knew how to play the game, but also knew how to recruit 
talent, and he clearly has done that. 
 
When that coach came back I was not part of the recruiting process one of the things 
that attracted him to us was the specialness of the University and the great students that 
are produced in Ohio. The population of students that come largely from public education 
is just a great place to recruit talent. Being part of this institution and being the beneficiary 
of one of those daughters or, in this case, a son of Ohio, to benefit from this institution 
was quite meaningful to me. The punch line of course is, as I can imagine what you are 
thinking, is that I was describing Gordon Gee.  
 
I would just take this moment as Gordon and I are appreciating John Glenn and the 
University, to appreciate Gordon on an anniversary of his birthday, so happy birthday 
again.  
 
Changing chapters, Bob Schottenstein, working with the University administration, has 
spent a significant amount of time as chairman of the Audit and Compliance Committee 
and, most recently, doing a thorough review of University-wide audit and compliance 
issues. Bob, I would like you to talk about that please. 

 
*** 
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UNIVERSITY-WIDE COMPLIANCE REPORT 
 

Mr. Schottenstein: 
 
Thank you very much, Mr. Chairman. Just following on what you said, I think all the 
members know, and for the benefit of those who are with us today, during the past eight 
months the Audit and Compliance Committee has met virtually monthly focusing on a 
comprehensive University-wide assessment of all compliance functions.  
 
I think everyone here knows that undertaking was prompted by problems that first 
occurred in our athletic department a little over a year ago. At the time it was the view of 
both this Board and the Audit and Compliance Committee and supported whole-
heartedly by the entire University, including our President, the administration, and the 
athletic department that we should use that incident as an opportunity to take a hard 
look inward at our processes, which we felt were good but we wanted to look at them to 
see if we could make them better. 
 
With that in mind, and with a goal of trying to create a compliance practice and a 
compliance system that was very strong, very robust, that contained checks and 
balances and maximum opportunities for independent review, we undertook to hire 
outside consultants who are here with us today the law firm of Dewey & LeBoeuf and 
the consulting firm, Protiviti. Those outside consultants were supported superbly by an 
internal working group co-chaired by our CFO, Geoff Chatas, as well as our General 
Counsel, Chris Culley, and I cannot underscore enough the quality of the work 
performed by that internal working group, the hundreds and hundreds of hours that they 
spent working with the consultants to help get us to today. 

 
The work that was done included a thorough review of our current practices how we 
currently manage compliance across all systems and all areas of the University, 
including understanding the organizational structure, who was involved in compliance, 
who reports to whom, and how those reporting lines moved through the system, as well 
as a very in-depth benchmarking of how other universities, financial institutions and 
health care facilities managed compliance. 
 
We knew this was going to be a multi-phase process. The analogy that we have used at 
the committee level, which I think is helpful and I will share it today, is that it is a little bit 
like building a house. First you have to dream, plan, and design, and then, once you get 
the architecture done, you start construction, and at some point, you move in and live in 
it.  
 
The process that culminates today is the end of a dreaming, planning, and design 
function. So we are here today to, in effect, prove the architecture of a new compliance 
model for Ohio State. Let me make really clear that we are still at the beginning, and if 
this architecture is approved today, we will then undertake, over the next 12 or so 
months, construction. There may be a little remodeling and a few change orders along 
the way, but I think we have a very strong design. I know the committee feels that way, 
and that we have moved to a place where we believe we will have as robust and as 
sound a compliance process that exists within higher education. That is a place where 
we think Ohio State should be. 
 
I also want to underscore, and this was a comment that President Gee made to me this 
is real change, and it is going to require real change within the institution. This is not 
about creating another bureaucracy. This is substantive and it is procedural with the 
highlight of it being a move to a much more centralized compliance process. With that 
introduction, what I would like to do is call on either Mr. Chatas or Mr. Culley to introduce 
our consultants from Dewey & LeBoeuf and Protiviti who are going to provide the Board 
with the highlights of their final report. 
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Mr. Pajakowski: 
 

Hello. I am Jim Pajakowski, Executive Vice President with Protiviti. I will give you an 
overview of the project and our findings and recommendations.  
 
At the top of this chart is a quote that we took and extracted from the June 24 Board 
meeting. What it did was set you on a course to hire us, Protiviti, as well as Dewey & 
LeBoeuf, to engage in a project to help you look at the compliance process here, 
University-wide, and make recommendations for its improvement.  
 
In doing that, we followed some guiding principles. Those guiding principles were as 
follows. First of all, we were told that you aspire not just to get to average but to get to 
leading practice you wanted to form a model from this experience that could be looked 
upon as a practice that others would aspire to across the country. Secondly, we were 
told to look outside of higher education for examples of how you could improve, or for 
benchmarks of how you might improve the compliance process but to do so in a way 
that does not lose sight of the fact that this is a university. Universities have unique 
cultures. 

 
Recently in Economist magazine, there was an article on the changing role of higher 
education. In it was a quote attributed to Clark Kerr from the University of California that 
I thought was interesting and sums up the culture of universities in a somewhat 
humorous way. It goes like this; “It is sometimes thought the modern university is a series 
of individual faculty entrepreneurs held together by a common grievance of parking.” 
The point is we wanted to make sure we shaped recommendations that were specific to 
this university and would work here. 
 
And finally, you wanted us to provide recommendations that would lead to a compliance 
function that had greater independence and more authority to do its role. We followed a 
methodology and Mr. Schottenstein went over it. I will point out a couple additional 
things.  
 
We identify 12 areas that we called Categories of Requirements. Those range from 
functions and departments, such as the Medical Center, Research, and Athletics to 
compliance areas such as environmental safety, technology and the American 
Disabilities Act. There were 12 of these areas, and we looked at each of them. We looked 
at many documents; we talked to a lot of people; and we conducted many group 
sessions to vet our observations, insights, and preliminary recommendations.  
 
We also did extensive benchmarking both within the University and around the country, 
probably most intensely within the Big 10, but we also went outside and looked at health 
care as an industry and financial services as an industry.  
 
We came up with eight recommendations. I will make a few overarching comments. I 
am not going to go into all of the detail with limited time, but I will walk you through these. 
First of all, you need to look at these eight recommendations not as individual actions 
but as a unit that needs to be done comprehensively to cause the effect that you want 
to cause.  
 
The first two establish a new organizational structure within Ohio State University. The 
first is appointing someone in a Vice President position to head up a new department, 
which we have suggested be called the Office of University Compliance and Integrity. 
At the committee level, there is still some debate as to the proper title, but I think 
everybody agrees on the structure.  
 
This is a chart of the way compliance works today, so this is how lines report up and 
where responsibility for compliance exists, and we want to move to that. I am not going 
to get into the details, but I am going to make a couple points. Going to this should 
increase the amount of transparency, the degree of communication, greater streamlined 
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efforts and, ultimately, create a more powerful and efficient compliance process. That is 
the intent.  
 
The other six recommendations address the major functions of a compliance effort from 
risk assessment, establishing a code of conduct and communicating expectations, 
putting policy in place, managing change in the organization and addressing the impact 
that change has on the compliance function, putting in effective training programs, and 
ultimately, monitoring and investigating.  
 
We have recommendations for each one of these to improve the maturity level to align 
with this new structure and to make each of them more effective than they are today. I 
will note that we did not find anything to be particularly ineffective today. You actually 
have a pretty good process in place but this takes it to an even better level. 
 
Finally, there is a lot of change here, so with this we also have two additional 
recommendations as you go about this process, which we think will take about a year or 
so to put in place. One is that you put a project management structure in place to deal 
with the number of moving parts and the number of activities that are going to take place 
and be necessary, and that you put in a communication plan. Everybody is going to be 
impacted by this at some level some very little and some quite a bit and that needs to 
be taken into account. The communication plan needs to explain this change in ways 
that people understand. I think it needs to communicate the value, the benefit, and the 
impact. I do not think there is anybody here or associated with the University, there may 
be resistance to this, I know there will as it is just natural who will argue with this if they 
understand that this is about protecting the good name and reputation of this school and 
that benefits everybody that is going to be impacted by it.  
 
That pretty much wraps up our comments. I would like to leave you with one analogy, 
which is a little different than the house analogy this is a car analogy. At Protiviti, a lot of 
work that we do is around risk management and compliance functions and we ask the 
question why do you think they put brakes on a car? The common answer is to slow it 
down. We do not think that way. We believe that brakes exist on a car to allow it to go 
faster. I think you need to keep that in mind as these recommendations are put in place 
because this is intended to be a braking system for the University, not to slow it down. 
This is an institution that is growing. This is an institution that wants to lead. This is an 
institution that wants to move fast, but they ought to do it safely and they ought to do it 
in a way that protects the University. That is what this system will do for you. Thank you. 

 
Mr. Schottenstein: 
 

Thank you very much. Let me just say a couple things and then ask if there are any 
questions.  
 
First, the report, which is very detailed, was approved unanimously by the Audit and 
Compliance Committee yesterday. I want to underscore a couple of things. One, we are 
now at the beginning of this construction or implementation phase. The first part of that 
will be the hiring of this new chief compliance officer, which is expected to occur 
sometime in the next 60 days.  
 
The other thing I want to underscore and this is a very significant change from where we 
were to where we are headed is that the new Office of Compliance will report directly to 
the Audit and Compliance Committee with dual reporting for administrative and other 
functional purposes to the Chief Financial Officer and the Office of the General Counsel, 
which is an integral part of the recommendation. 
 
The last thing that I would like to say and then if there are any other members of the 
committee that would like to comment, obviously they should is that the point was made, 
and it became very clear to us in this process, which I’m not sure we understood it fully 
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before we started what compliance really means. It is very hard; it is the guardian of our 
reputation; and I think we feel this is a really positive step forward.  
 
I do not know if any other members of our Committee want to comment, but I also want 
to say that this is in the form of a motion to approve this report, so I will make that motion.  

 
Mr. Wexner: 
 

This is a significant issue for us and a primary responsibility of the Board, so I would really 
encourage discussion and consideration. 

 
Dr. Cloyd: 
 

A question on the code of conduct that would be developed seems to be of extraordinary 
importance. Everybody will understand how we want to operate and what is allowable 
and what is not going to be allowable. Could you describe a little bit of the process of 
how that is going to be developed and the timeframe to get the development of the code 
of conduct?  

 
Mr. Schottenstein: 
 

I will take a crack at it and then I will let our friends also comment. First of all today, Gil, 
I think there exists four, five or six codes at the Medical Center. There is a Student Code 
of Conduct. This Board has its Statement of Expectations. It is not that no code of 
conduct exists, but that there are a lot of them, so part of the process will be to integrate, 
consolidate, and make certain that what they say in terms of comportment and behavior 
is what we want them to say. 
 
In terms of the timing on that and how that rolls out over the next year and the process 
for that, it is my expectation that once we get this person hired that person will form a 
compliance committee that will begin to craft the specifics on all eight of the buckets of 
recommendations including that code. I do not know if you want to comment further.  

 
Mr. Pajakowski: 
 

I think that is absolutely right. I think there are lots of pieces but nothing that holds them 
all together. And there are parts of the institution that are not covered through existing 
codes, so it is a matter of doing the research to pull all of that forward. I think it is going 
to be important to bring on the chief compliance and integrity officer to lead that effort, 
to pull together as we recommended, the compliance and integrity committee which will 
be a broad representation of the University and use that function to vet it. I think there is 
going to be a lot of change management that goes along with this because this is 
probably the one that you are going to want to communicate and involve and engage 
many parts of the University in developing so people will accept and engage with it. 

 
Dr. Cloyd: 
 

I fully agree with that. Part of the reason I am making the comment is, I like the process 
and I like the consolidation, but it seems to me that this is going to be the beacon or the 
compass as we move into the change management that is going to bring clarity to all of 
the people associated with the University and covered by it, and this is what we are 
about. 
 
Otherwise, as I think you said at the start Bobby, compliance as people can see it is 
sometimes a little bit ambiguous. What does it really mean? While I think that the 
document for code of conduct should have the appropriate broad input and should be 
as clear as we can make it, it should not get lost in word knit-picking so it drags on for 
long periods of time, because I think it is going to be critically important to effective 
change management.  
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Mr. Shumate: 
 

I have one question. It might be premature, but have you thought about the qualities, 
characteristics and experiences for candidates for this new position and how might we 
go about the selection process? 

 
Mr. Schottenstein: 
 

Yes. I do not know where Mr. Chatas is he is hiding in the back, but the short answer is 
yes. In the course of some of the work and the benchmarking that we have done, we 
have begun to craft the kind of qualities and characteristics we are looking for. This is a 
position that does not exist in a lot of our peer institutions, but it is a position that has 
begun to emerge now within some of the financial sectors and health care institutions 
we benchmarked against. It is likely the candidate would come from someplace like that. 
I do not know if you want to add anything Geoff. 

 
Mr. Chatas: 
 

We will work with a headhunter and the Human Resources department. 
 
Mr. Brass:  
 

Bobby, I commend the work of the committee. It was fantastic, and I am glad we looked 
at it from a University-wide standpoint because that is the appropriate thing to do. Just 
a point of clarification, I think I know the answer to this, but we will end up with an office 
of compliance. Could you describe a little bit about the office of audit as to how these 
are going to work together, the audit function itself? 

 
Mr. Schottenstein: 
 

You mean the internal audit function? 
 
Mr. Brass: 
 

Yes. 
 

Mr. Schottenstein: 
 

Yes, they are separate. Internal audit will continue to report directly to the Audit 
Committee with University functional and administrative reporting, but I think from an 
operational standpoint, internal audit is sort of a left arm to this compliance function. It is 
intended to be, and you might want to comment on that as well some of the detail that 
is behind this report, the other side of the coin on some of the checks and monitoring. 

 
Mr. Pajakowski: 
 

If you look at the second recommendation, the University compliance and integrity 
committee is a committee constructed with a number of different constituents including, 
or led by, the chief compliance and integrity officer. But it also involves the compliance 
heads of each of the major areas and departments of the University. In addition to that, 
internal audit will be a member of that group as well as legal and faculty representation. 
That will be one intersection point. 
 
The second point that I would say is that internal audit’s role, effectively, is insuring 
auditing at a level that reports if the compliance function within this University is 
operating effectively. That is part of their charter, so that is another way that they will 
interact. That does not excuse compliance from also making sure they have procedures 
to monitor and insure that compliance processes are operating effectively. And, as was 
mentioned, both will report independently and to the Audit and Compliance committee.  
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Mr. Brass: 
 

Thank you very much. Because they do overlap in some areas, I wanted to see exactly 
where the continuity of thought would come from and I think you have explained it well. 
Thank you.  

 
Mr. Wexner: 
 

Before we get to voting on the acceptance of the report, I want to address the issue of 
audit and compliance and the implications of that on the reputation of the University for 
the newer members of the Board. We have recognized that for a long time and the 
question is, how do we discharge our responsibilities as Trustees representing the 
stakeholders to the University, representing the State, to make sure that things are at 
the highest possible standard? Thinking about it and re-thinking about it, which the Audit 
and Compliance Committee has done in this review, is to make sure the standards of 
audit and compliance are uniform and we can audit across not just in the silos of the 
University, so that we have certainty as Trustees, and so that the public and students 
and every constituent holder knows that we are serious about making sure the 
standards, behavior, audit, integrity, and every aspect of this is at the highest standard 
and then pulled together so we can communicate and understand all pieces of this.  
 
I think, Bob, your description of the architecture is that this is there and now we have to 
build it, which is important to the Trustees. We have a sense of the architecture and what 
I would ask you to do is think about the calendar of the design development as to 
construction. What pace are we on, so that perhaps at the next meeting, everybody can 
know where we are in time whether it is recruiting people or implementing critical stages? 
So we are holding, if you would, you and our feet to the fire, so we are marching through 
this. 

 
President Gee: 
 

Mr. Chairman, one thing before we move, because this is a discussion that we had the 
other day, which I wanted to underscore again and is important for the Board to 
understand. We are not creating a new oversight infrastructure. What we are really 
creating is a new structure, one which is meant to make us much more progressive, but 
is not meant to make us auditors auditing auditors. It is very easy in creating these kinds 
of systems to create another layer; and in many ways, I think that is antithetical to what 
we are trying to do. So I really appreciate, and we did have that discussion, the fact that 
recognizing the values and cultures of this institution, the fact that we are trying to 
become very swift that this is a swift moment for us. It is not yet another compliance 
issue; it is a new way to think about what we are doing. 
 

Mr. Wexner: 
 

Is everybody comfortable? Any more comments, questions, suggestions? 
 
Well the motion has been made and seconded. David, do you want to call the roll? 
 

Dr. Horn: 
 

I would be happy to.  
 
Upon motion of Mr. Schottenstein, seconded by Judge Marbley, the Board of Trustees 
adopted the foregoing motion by unanimous roll call vote, cast by Trustees Wexner, O’Dell, 
Shumate, Hicks, Fisher, Schottenstein, Brass, Ratner, Marbley, Kass, Jurgensen, 
Wadsworth, and Smucker.  
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Mr. Wexner: 
 

Let me now call on Alex Shumate. Alex, do you want to report on Trusteeship please? 
 

*** 
 

COMMITTEE REPORTS 
 

Mr. Shumate: 
 

Thank you, Mr. Chairman. The Trusteeship Committee has been very actively engaged 
over the past several months with carrying out one of our principal responsibilities, which 
is to lead the process to recommend to this Board the officers that will serve the 
University. To that end, we have been conducting meetings and engaging in an in depth 
process, which has been a challenge in many ways particularly, Mr. Chairman, when we 
look at the leadership that you have provided over the past three years, it has truly been 
world-class leadership. Our goal is to continue that momentum and continue the Board’s 
focus on governance. 
 
We started with a process and an approach that we thought it was important to take a 
look initially at the critical issues that are facing the University and then look at desired 
characteristics and qualities that we thought were important to assist and lead the Board 
in helping the University deal effectively with those issues. I would like to take a couple 
moments to review that because I think it is important to give you an indication as to why 
we are making the recommendation that we are.  
 
This morning when we looked at the challenges that we face as a University, we 
identified them as: (1) implementing the academic strategic plan; (2) developing and 
implementing plans to enhance the undergraduate experience; (3) prioritizing the capital 
expenditures; (4) identifying new resources, sources of revenue rather, including 
commercialization; (5) streamlining and reducing expenses with savings to be redirected 
to academic priorities; (6) developing and implementing the advancement framework 
plan focusing on development communications as well as alumni relations; (7) achieving 
the Medical Center long-range plan; (8) developing and implementing a talent 
development plan including continuity and succession planning; and (9) exploring 
opportunities for new relationships with the state. 
 
We then spent some time looking at desired characteristics in our next chairperson: 
collaborative and inclusive, encourages open, candid, and productive dialogue among 
all Board members, a consensus builder, a person who is objective and decisive and 
also, very importantly, one who could keep the Board focused on the important strategic 
issues facing the University, an individual who puts the Board and University before 
themselves, an effective communicator, a person that advances good governance 
practices, a person who is a tireless advocate for the University willing to invest the time 
necessary for Board duties and also an individual who is engaged with the broader 
University community. 
 
As a result of our process, our committee is unanimous, and we strongly recommend 
Robert H. Schottenstein to serve as the next chair of our Board of Trustees. That would 
be a two year term according to our Bylaws. In addition, Mr. Chairman, we would like to 
place a nomination for Brian K. Hicks and John “Jack” Fisher to serve as vice chairs of 
the Board and David G. Horn as secretary of the Board, and I would so move. 

 
Mr. Wexner: 
 

Thank you. The motion has been made. Is there any discussion, further nominations? 
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Judge Marbley: 
 

I would second that. 
 
Mr. Wexner: 
 

Well, in hearing then, we can close the nominations. I am instructed to ask a show of 
hands, but can I say it is by acclamation? Would that be good enough? 
 

Upon motion of Mr. Shumate, seconded by Judge Marbley, the Board of Trustees adopted 
the foregoing motion by acclamation of Trustees Wexner, O’Dell, Shumate, Hicks, Fisher, 
Schottenstein, Brass, Ratner, Marbley, Kass, Jurgensen, Wadsworth, and Smucker.  
 
Mr. Ratner: 
 

I am sitting here next to Bobby, and as you were reading the list of qualifications, I saw 
him getting more and more nervous, but I think he really will accomplish everything that 
your qualifications indicate that he will need to do. 

 
Mr. Shumate 
 

Absolutely. As we have talked about and as Dr. Chait has advised us, one of the principle 
responsibilities of a Board Chair is to facilitate the work of the Board and, again, we have 
great confidence, Bobby, in your ability. I don’t know if you want to make any comments. 

 
Mr. Schottenstein: 
 

Thank you. I am a little nervous, but I really appreciate everything you said Alex and I 
thank the committee and every one of my fellow Trustees, Gordon, and your 
administration. This is a very special time for Ohio State. I think we have got momentum. 
We have got a very strong sense of optimism and I think a lot of clarity about where we 
are headed, and it is a good place. We have made a lot of progress.  
 
Gordon, you say all the time that you cannot have a great university without a great 
board and I think, by the way, the opposite is true: a board can’t be great without great 
leadership. The comments that Les restated at the beginning of this meeting about you 
are very heartfelt by the people of this room and many others, and we are very fortunate 
this time.  
 
I also think that one of the things that has struck me since I have been on this Board is 
first of all how great the University is. There is no better evidence than the student reports 
that we see at every single meeting and that is where the real winning occurs in the 
classroom every day. There are boards that have great people on them that are not 
effective boards and this is a Board that is very effective. I think that one of the big 
reasons, and I want to mention first you, Gil, your chairmanship, which I was very 
privileged to witness, I think really created very strong qualities of governance. You 
brought us together, which we needed. We were not as effective. We knew we had a lot 
of work, but we were not sure how to go about doing it, and your style and your approach 
was very special and continues to be in the role that you play. I learned a great deal from 
watching the way you managed and ran this Board, and I think it was a great thing for 
the University. 
 
The last, not quite yet three years, Les, you made a comment earlier this morning in 
reference to something else, and I always love the way you put things. You said, “This 
is a landmark day.” It had nothing to do with me. It was about something else we were 
discussing in Executive Session regarding our strategy, our goals and our aspirations 
for the University, and you said, “This is a landmark day.” We have had a lot of landmark 
days in the last three years. If I can quote you, “but for” Les Wexner, and I mean that 
from the bottom of my heart. Your leadership has been transformative. There has got to 
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be a better word than that. It has been unforgettable, and therein lies the great challenge 
for all of us to continue.  
 
The stage is set and we are very lucky to be here at this time, so I just want to thank you 
for so many things. 
 

President Gee: 
 

Mr. Chairman, I really want to speak on behalf of the University. It is great to have a 
person assume a role who loves the institution so much, and I think that we all agree 
that Bobby loves it.  
 
We have all been privileged, Bob, to work with you over the last three or four years, and 
certainly it has been my privilege. I knew your father well, who was one of my favorite 
people in the whole world. I knew your uncle well, and I was telling this story the other 
night, he was the first man who greeted me, Mel Schottenstein. I had moved in and 
caused disruption in the neighborhood. I was sneaking in in the middle of the night and 
this big massive guy comes and lands on my doorstep and would not let me alone until 
he made certain that I was comfortable. Your family has had an enormous impact on 
this community and certainly on me personally. 
 
I think that the thing, though, that we recognize as an administration is that you stand on 
the shoulder of giants. Gil Cloyd, who we are privileged to have as our continuing 
national Trustee, really did set a standard of excellence. I think that we all subscribe to 
and the word for Les is not transformative, it is just remarkable. What we have 
accomplished together, all of us, over the last three years is something that today was 
kind of a culminating moment in that we realize that this is a University in which we do 
not have trustees and faculty and students in strife, but rather we have us in unity, and 
I think that is highly unusual in today’s environment. I feel very privileged to be here with 
you and, more importantly, I want you to know that you have the full support of our 
65,000 students, our 48,000 faculty and staff, and our 520,000 living alumni, and we 
look forward to having you visit every one of them.  
 
This is a privileged day for us, too. 

 
Mr. Wexner: 
 

And Gordon is going to give all of us and them your phone number and email address, 
so that we can communicate openly and clearly.  
 
Well, congratulations. We continue to get better and, Bob, with your leadership, we will 
get better. Thank you all. Bob, thank you for taking the responsibilities. 
 
I am going to move forward with the committee reports, and I will start off with Gil Cloyd. 
 

Dr. Cloyd: 
 

Thank you, Mr. Chairman. The Advancement Committee met yesterday. The first item 
on the agenda, we had the wonderful opportunity to welcome Nancy Kramer as a new 
non-Trustee member of the Advancement Committee. I think most of you here know 
Nancy. She is Chairman and Chief Culture Officer of Resource Interactive. Certainly the 
marketing and cultural leadership skills that Nancy has are going to serve us very well, 
particularly with our major activity moving forward in creating and then putting in place 
the new advancement model for the University. 
 
We then had a report on the development activities for the first six months of the year 
through December 31. Total activity is $177.4 million, and that is measured against what 
has been set as a very stretching goal of $355.7 million for the year. We are really in 
very good shape. We are almost 50% of where we want to be in the amount of lapsed 
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time. As compared to where we have been sometimes in the past, this is good news. 
For example, if we look at our receipts, this year we are at 50% of achieved receipts. 
When we look at total receipts, we are 29% above where we were last year. 
 
Overall, while in the economic environment we are in, we are cautiously optimistic as we 
are going forward. I think everyone felt that it is right to have a sense of optimism in this 
troubled environment that Ohio State is doing very, very well in the development area.  
 
Brian Hastings provided some other background information from some recent surveys 
from our benchmark universities, and it shows Ohio State is doing extraordinarily well 
as compared to those universities. We look at number of donors and dollars that we are 
bringing in at this point in time. 
 
We also talked a little bit about key activities. As you all know, we are in the quiet phase 
of our campaign planning right now so the majority of the development staff time is being 
spent in doing the planning for our potential top gifts, and there you can think about 
seven figure plus types of gifts, developing that potential list, looking to how we could 
best approach those people and hopefully gain their support at a seven plus figure for 
the University. 
 
With the work of the Advancement Framework Planning Team, which I will talk about in 
a moment, right now everything looks to be on track for a fall move to a public phase of 
the campaign that will most likely occur in October. People are looking at exact timings. 
It is going to be the election time of the year this year, and we want to make sure we can 
have a good kick off of the public phase campaign. 
 
The thing I feel very good about is the level of planning, where we stand in terms of 
numbers of donors and the increases we are seeing in dollars coming in that would really 
well position the campaign. As you all know, our target has been that we want to be at 
the 50% range of the total campaign when we go public the $2.5 billion goal that we 
have set for that. 
 
The Development report is on the consent agenda and the Committee has 
recommended it for your approval.  
 
I would next like to transition to the work of the Advancement Framework Planning 
Team. As you know, we kicked off this activity in December. We have engaged Edelman 
in Chicago to help us in this framework planning effort. Following our first meeting in 
December, we have been meeting monthly as a full team as well as have had numerous 
other interactions amongst the team with Edelman and also, importantly, within the 
University. We had personnel from Edelman yesterday present to provide their 
perspective on the status of where we are. 
 
There are two things that I want to highlight for the Board. As we have gotten into more 
detail in thinking about advancement, we have understood that it is going to be important 
that we get even more granular or crisp in how we are defining advancement so people 
will really understand what it is that we want to achieve and that we begin to establish 
some of the guiding principles. Some of this may change as we finish the work, but I 
wanted to provide you with where the team has defined where we are today around 
those first two points. 
 
First of all, we have defined advancement. The definition we used is that advancement 
is a University-wide initiative to increase the eminence of The Ohio State University 
through efforts to build awareness, engagement, and giving among critical stakeholder 
groups including students, faculty, alumni, Ohioans, corporate partners, and national 
leaders. 
 
Secondly, we have three guiding principles. The first one, I think, is very important as 
we have gotten into the discussion. Ohio State strives for its constituents to be a 
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meaningful part of the life and the success of the institution. When you think about that 
type of paradigm, what we are saying is that we are really going to take on the 
responsibility that we have a lot of stakeholders out there who love this University and 
want to be more engaged. Part of our responsibility is to identify the ways that we can 
create the awareness they want, help them identify where they can participate at the 
University and something that moves well beyond just the fundraising activities but 
allows them to be actively engaged in the University. 

 
Second, advancement enables us to deepen our connections with all of our audiences 
to engage, inform, and inspire them and to jointly leverage our resources to accelerate 
Ohio State’s eminence. Third, advancement streamlines and organizes us to provide 
powerful and engaging experiences, information and support for our constituencies, and 
unites us to act as One University as we pursue our visionary and transformative goals. 
 
I could not be more complimentary about the work that the Edelman Group has provided 
as we are moving forward as a team to establish our Advancement Model. Our work is 
organized along two groups of work. First, is establishing the Ohio State brand 
positioning. The second group of work involves establishing the most efficient and 
effective organizational design. All of this work is moving forward in parallel. 
 
For each group of work there is a Discovery Phase where background information is 
collected and assessed; then a Development Phase where Ohio State specific branding 
and organizational design elements are developed; and a third Strategize Phase where 
the branding and organizational design work is integrated into one proposed 
Advancement Strategy. We are well along in the Discovery Phase and will move to the 
Development Phase in March. We remain on schedule to have a final recommended 
approach to consider in July. 
 
At the Committee meeting we revisited the goals for Advancement that the Board 
approved last year. There are eight goals divided into three general areas: 1) awareness, 
2) engagement, and 3) financial. We have a lot of additional learning since these goals 
were established, and we recognized at the time that we were very early in our thinking 
about Awareness and Engagement. We had a good discussion with a lot of input from 
Committee members. Before finalizing a scorecard for Advancement, we identified 
additional work to be done by the Advancement Framework Planning Team, and the 
goals will be discussed again in our April meeting. We are very close to finalizing the 
financial goals and one Engagement goal, but expect some significant change in goal 
structure for awareness and some of the engagement goals. I expect we will recommend 
final financial advancement goals to the Board in April, but we may have further work to 
do for awareness and engagement at that time. 

 
Mr. Wexner: 
 

Any questions or comments? Thanks Gil. Ron, Physical Environment. 
 
Mr. Ratner: 
 
[Due to a recording malfunction, several minutes of this presentation were inaudible.] 

 
…We clearly believe that we need a sort of timeframe for our planning, so we are really 
going to a context where we have a long-term, 15-year look to make sure that we are 
within the larger issues and that we are on board with these larger issues. We are 
breaking that down to a very specific five-year plan and then to an annual plan that will, 
of course, be reviewed and recalibrated on an annual basis. 
 
We were only given the beginnings of this yesterday. The full report on this will be made 
in June. Again, one of the things that we are going to do is align the capital planning 
update to our fiscal year rather than where it had been at the first meeting of the calendar 
year, which made it uncoordinated with the actual financial planning and the fiscal year 
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planning. In June we will get a full report on that but I believe that all the tools are there. 
We know where we are at and what we need to do and, therefore, we can look at the 
amount of money we spend, which is very significant. We have well over $1.4 billion 
under way on campus currently just to give you an idea of context. It is a major effort 
and we have to make sure that we are not only achieving all of the smaller projects but 
that all the larger projects help us move forward towards the larger goals.  
 
We then had a report on some of the specific initiatives that came out of the framework 
plan. One of them, which I find very significant, is the progress we have made on way-
finding. Those of us who weren’t that familiar with the campus I have now begun to 
become familiar with it, but I still frequently get lost I do not think there is anyone in this 
room who has not had the experience of getting lost on our campus, and we are trying 
to make a difference in that way. We have had four major directions, which we are 
currently very active with. One is to help re-define the regional context. In this regard we 
have had very good cooperation with ODOT, with the city, which are the scales with 
which we are looking at the region. We are looking at approaches to the University from 
both highways and major arteries and then within the campus itself at the larger scale of 
way-finding.  
 
We are spending a lot of time focusing on the visitors’ experience, particularly something 
very mundane, which is parking. How do you get to a parking garage, how do you find 
your way within it and how do you get out of it and find your way to where you want to 
be on campus? We are looking at lots of things from a very active sort of GPS and 
technology upgrades to making sure that as we go through some capital planning 
programs in which we are updating a number of our parking facilities that we integrate 
way-finding within that so it is not negative where can’t you park but where can you park 
and how you get from here to there.  
 
A lot of focus has been on the Medical Center as part of the overall capital budgets and 
the building that we are doing there. Each of those buildings has specifically targeted 
within it and the major Medical Center expansion has targeted within it obviously a series 
of way-finding initiatives, but we want to make sure those are coordinated with the 
context of how you find your way around the overall campus how you find your way to, 
though, and around the Medical Center so we are really doing the right job of integrating 
that and what we need to do from a University-wide perspective. 
 
The last area is one that we have really begun to focus on, which is the arts district. We 
have a very significant arts district. We are making significant new investments in it. It is 
also interesting to hear from the  
 
Dean how important those arts initiatives have become within the University’s own sense 
of our educational initiatives. We need to make sure, particularly because this is a place 
where we intersect with the greater Columbus community and hopefully with the broader 
community across Ohio people come to the campus in order to participate in these 
extraordinary arts programs that we are sure that people are greeted and welcomed, 
know where they are and feel that they are very much welcomed and a part of the Ohio 
State campus.  
 
I think we have very strong initiatives in those areas and we will report further on them. 
In fact, we will not need a report on them. You will see them in place. We then had a 
quick capital project update over the last calendar year. We have completed $110 million 
of projects. They were completed on time and on budget, which is an extraordinary 
achievement, particularly because they were done under the earlier contracting 
approach, which has now been changed so we were handicapped in a way that we will 
not be going forward.  
 
We had a report on the progress of the Hale and South residential high-rises. They are 
on target for fall opening; however, we have had, as many people here know, a glitch in 
terms of the geo-thermal systems that we are putting in. Anybody who has looked at 
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parts of the Oval and wondered why there is still this sort of strange looking field of pipes 
that come up from portions of the Oval and from portions of what had been the Hale lot 
that is the geo-thermal wells. We have previously reported that we have had a problem 
with that. There was an underestimation based on simply not knowing exactly what was 
going on underground, which is not a-typical with construction, but as we got into the 
underground construction, got into drilling these wells, we found that we needed to 
change the drilling methodology that caused a complete reload with the contractor and 
the approach, so we are significantly behind in terms of time. However, we are on the 
schedule that was reset last year. The wells in the Hale lot will be completed in, I believe 
April, which will be able to service the initial opening of the facilities this fall. It will be 
almost through the spring of next year that we will be able to complete the other wells. 
Just to give you a sense, there are 450 geo-thermal wells that are each over 500 feet 
deep, so it is not a minor task. 
 
We also spent a very short time talking about the river restoration. As you know, it 
supports a framework principle of expanding and refocusing our relationship to the river, 
particularly to create very active, open space along the river’s edge. We are moving 
quite rapidly on Cannon Drive relocation, but the city itself is proceeding with the 
restoration and the Fifth Avenue dam removal. We will begin to see some real benefits 
and some new and, I think, very exciting open space along the river. 
 
I might add, if you have seen the drawings that have been published, it shows this nice, 
bright, blue river. I don’t believe that unless there is something new that is coming out of 
some of our research programs that we will be able to get that river quite like that, but it 
will be a significant restoration of what I think will be an exciting component of campus. 
 
The last two items are that we had a report on the North Residential District planning 
that we are doing. We will have a full report to the Board in April. We have made some 
very significant progress. We have confirmed a lot of what we thought. We have begun 
to recognize that we can accomplish the program in a way that I think will be very exciting 
and will create an extraordinary new and refreshed district on campus. The other good 
news is that we believe we will be able to not use all of the land that we originally thought 
we would have to use, so there is some land that will be made available for other future 
University uses in context of the framework plan, and that we will be able to accomplish 
the full 6,200 beds, I believe is the number, in a way that will create the appropriate open 
space, recreational space, dining space, and a lot of the academic facilities we need to 
integrate in the student experience. 
 
The last item is we had a report on the athletic facilities area where, I think with some 
leadership from Geoff Chatas and the Athletic Director; we realized that we are spending 
a lot of money. We wanted to look at this in a coherent way. The total cost of athletic 
facilities improvements over the next few years will be close to $40 million. It includes 
some very specific programs, which have already been brought through for approval, 
the indoor golf facility and basketball practice facilities, but it includes a series of other 
initiatives, new video board at the stadium, new lighting, new sound systems, and a 
whole series of maintenance and renewal items.  
 
We decided to look at that in an overall context, but a lot of that is already gift funded. 
We decided we needed to take a better look at that, understand it within an entire context 
of the athletic department and what is being done. I think we have done that. We have 
our arms around the entire scope of what is happening and we will be coming forward 
with a more specific financial plan that relates to these improvements, I believe, in the 
June meeting. 
 
That is the meeting we had. I think we made great progress in a number of different 
areas and, again, the staff is just doing an extraordinary job of accomplishing these 
things. I am particularly excited that Jay Kasey has really done a remarkable job of 
stepping into his new role and, I think, it has been seamless with the Medical Center. He 



February 10, 2012 meeting, Board of Trustees 
 

367 

has not dropped any of his applications there, but he has picked up a whole series of 
new applications and is providing terrific leadership and partnership. 

 
Mr. Wexner: 
 

Thank you. Gil? 
 
Dr. Cloyd: 
 

Two comments and a question, Mr. Ratner. First of all, on the way-finding project, I think 
that is absolutely terrific. I was not at your meeting, but I had a chance to look at the 
materials and I think it is extraordinarily important for the engagement we want to create 
with Ohio State. When I think of getting around this campus, I reflect back to when I lived 
in Japan. I had a friend tell me one time, “You know if you never got off the wrong train 
station in Japan, you never rode a train.” I think if anyone says, “I have never been 
frustrated or lost on the Ohio State campus,” they have never tried to travel around the 
Ohio State campus. I think today I would describe it to the outsider as intimidating. We 
need to make it inviting, which I think is really a big deal from my perspective so I am 
really glad to see that project going forward. 
 
The second thing was I had a chance to look at the materials of the new capital planning 
project and, again, I think that is another breakthrough. I really compliment you and your 
Committee and the University staff that has done it. This is going to bring such a better 
way to look at our total capital plans and understand what we are doing, and I just think 
it is going to make all of our work more effective and easier, so thank you for doing that. 
 
I did raise one question, because we have some of these creative tools, particularly on 
space utilization, have we looked at if there is any way that we can protect that at all and 
make a commercial opportunity out of the software and the planning that we have put 
together on that. It seems like an outstanding tool that a lot of people would love. 

 
Mr. Ratner: 
 

We have raised that issue before. I do not know if Jay or anybody else could help with 
that, but I do not really know for sure, Gil, and it is certainly something that we should 
look at. I thought it was an excellent tool when it was presented to us, and yesterday I 
asked specifically if it is really being utilized. Does it work in terms of a dynamic tool, 
because many of these things are easy in presentation and just don’t actually work in 
terms of being something that can meet the daily needs of the University. They are telling 
me that it absolutely is -you are right that it could work for both large constituents of any 
sort by the way, whether private or public.  

 
Dr. Cloyd: 
 

It seems like it would be so outstanding if we could put some property around that and 
license it; I think it could be a big deal.  

 
Mr. Ratner: 
 

We should certainly look into that. I think we did have a discussion about that originally. 
 
President Gee: 
 

We are having a discussion about that. I am not quite certain where that is, but remember 
our friend Sasaki and we had that discussion when they developed that with us, and we 
have a strong proprietary right to it. It is the best of its kind, so whoever is back there, 
please make it happen. Thank you, Jay. 
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Mr. Kasey: 
 

We will examine the opportunity to control and market this planning tool. 
 
President Gee: 
 

I think the question was how we have the Ohio State concept commercialized in the way 
that we are actually getting money from other institutions. They need to give us some. 

 
Dr. Cloyd: 
 

I would suggest we get Mr. Cummings engaged in this conversation. 
 
Mr. Ratner: 
 

That is perfect. I was just going to say that it will be one of our first successful 
commercialization efforts out of our new program, so I think we should certainly look at 
that. I am very impressed with how robust it is and how effective it has been, particularly 
in actual utilization over the last year or year-and-a-half. 

 
Mr. Wexner: 
 

So this is a joint venture between Physical Environment and Development? Are you 
guys hooked up? Medical Affairs. Alan? 
 

Mr. Brass: 
 

Thank you, Mr. Chair. Over the last three days, we have spent a lot of time on the 
Medical Center. The Medical Center Board of Trustees met Wednesday morning and, 
of course, we spent a number of hours on the Medical Center in the Medical Affairs 
Committee. 
 
I would like to start by asking Steve Gabbe to comment on a couple of announcements 
that I think the Board would find very interesting. We had a presentation in Medical 
Affairs; we are not going to go into great depth, but on our MD/PhD program, I have 
asked Steve just to give the highlights of it because it is one of those programs that will 
allow our University to really move forward as it relates to the Medical Center so, Steve, 
with that then I will come back and finish up with a few other items. 

 
Dr. Gabbe: 
 

Thank you so much, Alan. Thank you for this opportunity. I wanted to bring to the Board’s 
attention a few exciting developments that have been happening across the University 
at the Medical Center. We were very pleased that we could join President Gee. He 
mentioned before how he surprises our distinguished faculty educators, and we were 
able to join President Gee when he surprised Dr. Michael Grever, the chair of our 
Department of Internal Medicine when he was named a University Distinguished 
Scholar. Mike has a remarkable career in Oncology and Experimental Therapeutics. I 
think when his family walked in along with President Gee, he realized something very 
special was going to happen that morning. 
 
President Gee mentioned that PACT, Partners Achieving Community Transformation, 
had a wonderful kick off at East High School. That program is chaired by Fred Ransier, 
and I want to recognize Dawn Tyler Lee and Elizabeth Seely and Jerry Friedman who 
are working very hard to help us transform the east side community. As you know, we 
have committed $10 million to that effort to improve jobs and the economy in the 
community, to improve the neighborhoods, health and wellness of its citizens, education 
and housing. The very day after the PACT program was launched, we learned that the 
Columbus Metropolitan Housing Agency had received a $300,000 US Housing and 
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Urban Development Choice Neighborhoods Planning Grant that will be used to help our 
work in working with the community to plan that neighborhood. 
 
If you have been by the Ross Heart Hospital in the evening, you will see that it is lit in 
red. This is to celebrate the red dress or Women’s Health Month and Dr. Martha Gulati, 
who is the Sara Ross Soter Chair of Women’s Cardiovascular Health, is going to be 
honored on February 15 with a major award from the American Heart Association. She 
is joining our Surgeon General and receiving that award, so it is a great honor. 
 
We reported to the Medical Affairs Committee something we are very proud of and that 
is our efforts to improve patient satisfaction across our six hospitals and across our entire 
Medical Center. Our goal has been to reach the 90th percentile in patient satisfaction in 
the survey that is used around the country, and in the month of December we reached 
that goal.  
 
It is great work by our nurses, physicians, and everyone on our team. The scores do 
fluctuate. We hope that we will stay at that 90th or go even higher, but that is something 
we have been working on for the past four years, so it is great to be there. 
 
Alan mentioned the MSTP or MD/PhD program. We heard yesterday from Larry 
Schlesinger who, like Dr. Grever, was a Distinguished University Scholar; he received 
that award last year. Larry is the Chair of our new Department of Microbiology and 
Microbial Infection and Immunity. He also leads a University-wide program on Microbial 
Interface Biology. Ohio State, like most of the medical schools in the United States, has 
had an MD/PhD program for about 30 years. We train about four or five students each 
year. These are the students that are going to make the biggest difference in medical 
research in the future. They spend four years in medical school, and four years in the 
research laboratory. Generally, they will do two years of medical school, four years of 
research getting their PhD, and then return for the final two years of medical school. 
 
Most of the programs in the country are self-funded, but this year we joined a very elite 
group of 45 medical schools in receiving funding for our program from the NIH. The only 
way you get on that list is to bump somebody off of it. It is not easy, but thanks to Larry 
and his team’s efforts, we did. This will allow us to train an additional six MD/PhD 
students each year and will approach the average for the nation which is 82 students 
across eight years.  
 
If you are wondering what our aspirational peers have, they have about twice that 
number. These students are very special people. They come from the top universities. 
They have incredible research experience before they even enter medical school and, 
as I said, they will make a great difference. They also make a great difference in helping 
us to retain and recruit the best research faculty. They are always looking to have these 
young folks in their laboratories. 
 
We have already seen a benefit from receiving this NIH grant. Our applications for the 
MSTP or MD/PhD program this year are up 20 percent. We have 140 applicants for ten 
positions.  
 
Now, Larry also reported to us a new program they started. Some are undergraduate 
courses in creating excellence in science study. This is a program to bring in college 
students from across the country that have completed two years of college and who are 
committed to a career in science to give them an intense experience in research here at 
Ohio State. This is a real pipeline for future MSTP or MD/PhD students. We are focusing 
in this program on bringing in disadvantaged and underrepresented students so we can 
help diversify the ranks of the MD/PhDs. 
 
Finally, I wanted the Board to be aware of another important activity at the Medical 
Center. We have had great successes over the past five years. We thank the Board of 
Trustees and the University leadership as we journey toward being one of the top 
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academic medical centers and national cancer institute comprehensive cancer centers 
in the country, but we know that health care is entering a turbulent time and already is 
in a turbulent time. This will change the way we care for our patients and the way we are 
reimbursed for that care. It will emphasize value, as it should, quality, safety and patient 
satisfaction. It will emphasize ambulatory care, so we have examined our long-range 
financial plan with a group of consultants, Kaufman Hall, twice, and now we are working 
with Deloite so we can fully understand the stressors, the risks and the strategies we 
face going forward so we can continue to meet those metrics that are so important to 
us: days cash on hand, EBIDA, and debt service while continuing our model of an 
academic medical center that excels in research, patient care, and education. We will 
keep the Board apprised of those discussions. 

 
Mr. Wexner: 
 

Thank you. 
 
Mr. Brass: 
 

Thank you, Steve, very much. I will just say that with our MD/PhD program moving into 
NIH that puts us on a national platform, which is absolutely fantastic and very hard to 
do. We are now there, and these young men and women that are going through this 
program with an eight-year commitment for their schooling, funding becomes an issue. 
NIH will help with that, but for their four years of medical school, they still have to carry 
their tuition and room and board themselves, so that is something that we need to be 
looking at as far as scholarships because it will allow us to become one of the top 
academic medical systems in the country. 
 
I want to share with you just a couple of other items. In October and November of this 
past year, I mentioned to you that we implemented and went fully online throughout the 
entire health care system. One of the issues that you have when you go fully online and 
change your entire billing systems as well as your electronic medical record systems is 
you have an AR blip. It is almost a given. If you look at the financials, you will notice that 
our days’ cash on hand dipped about four or five days. The way to interpret this is that 
we had about $200 million in accounts receivable over five days when we first flipped 
the switch. I am happy to tell you that within 60 to 70 days, it went from $200 million to 
$87 million, and our norm is $75 million, which is what we normally carry on the AR. 
Those days’ cash on hand should bounce right back. We know exactly what happened, 
and I will tell you our electronic system has been a total success on conversion, which 
is really important.  
 
As it relates to our Medical Center expansion scorecard, the best thing I can tell you on 
that is it is on time and on budget. We are doing great on a $1.1 billion construction 
program right now. A couple things to highlight that might be of interest to you are that 
we will top out the building in May of this year. We have had a wonderful winter. Steel 
was going up quickly so we will be topping out that building if everything stays on 
schedule, as it is right now, in May of 2012. That will put us at the 50 percent mark of 
completion of this project.  
 
We will be awarding three additional guaranteed max pricings through Turner and, upon 
those three GMPs being signed, 85 percent of our project is covered under guaranteed 
max pricing. When you get to that point and you are still on time and on budget and 
everything is rolling, you start to breathe a little easier; it just makes life a little better. We 
are doing very, very well. 
 
85% of all of our GMPs will be awarded here very soon. The two that are remaining is 
the one that goes with the radiation oncology unit, which was the $100 million grant that 
came to our University, which we added on to the project. The other one is the interior 
program that will be awarded a GMP. The last thing left to be awarded, which we are 
doing internally, will be the furniture, equipment, computers and telephones.  
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Bottom line: our contingency is holding; our GMPs are looking good; the project is going 
very, very well. Today on the consent agenda you will see a request for $64.6 million, 
which will carry us to July with this project. Hopefully we will approve that. 
 
The last item that I want to mention just so we do not get surprised is health care reform. 
I keep trying to make sure the Board is up to speed with this. There is another big hairpin 
turn coming on the reimbursement for the health system in this country. Right now, 
everybody understands, I hope, that we will be reimbursed on quality and satisfaction. 
You get readmits, you lose money, and you do not get paid. Starting in about 2014, the 
ambulatory side kicks in and patient satisfaction in an ambulatory setting starts to be 
monitored. The same thing goes for quality and satisfaction again.  
 
In an organization as large as ours, where we are dealing with a couple million patients 
a year, this is a big deal. We are implementing a program now that will start with the 
employees of our University, which is going to be called the 48 hour policy. You need to 
see a primary care doctor, 48 hours you are in; a sub-specialist, 48 hours you are in; 
and soon thereafter diagnostics, 48 hours you are in. If we don’t do this right, and if we 
don’t get the model in right and if we don’t implement the methodology correctly, we will 
find ourselves not looking very good as it relates to the national platform and we will not 
be reimbursed, so we are a couple of years ahead of the curve. You may start hearing 
about this, but it is going to be the 48 hour policy at the Medical Center so I want you to 
be aware of that. More importantly, I want you to be aware that there is another wave 
coming at us as it relates to change in reimbursement at our Medical Center, so we have 
got to get ready for it.  
 
With that, Mr. Chairman, I would be happy to answer some questions and that completes 
my report. Thank you very much. 

 
Mr. Wexner: 
 

This is a shy group today.  
 
Mr. O’Dell: 
 

I have a question about the 48 hour program. How does that work with doctor’s 
vacations? Is it just a substitute doctor? 

 
Mr. Brass: 
 

Steve, I want you to come back up, because I think I know the answer to this, but I 
would rather you be accountable for it. 

 
Dr. Gabbe: 
 

Well, thank you. The policy is that if you need to see a provider, you will be seen in 48 
hours. Ideally, you will see the physician that you have asked to see. If he or she is 
unable to see you, another physician will. You may see a nurse practitioner but you will 
be seen for your problem within 48 hours. Every department has developed their plan to 
meet this and, on Wednesday morning our medical staff leadership voted this into our 
bylaws. This is how we will carry out our business.  
 
This is a very important change and I am so glad that Alan described it in improving 
access to our care. After all, 90 % of the best doctors in Columbus work at Ohio State, 
so we ought to be sure that our employees can see them. 

 
President Gee: 
 

I must say, Mr. Chairman, I thought it was a 48 minute rule. Whenever I follow up, I get 
right in.   
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Dr. Gabbe: 
 

I am surprised it took that long for you. 
 
Mr. Schottenstein: 
 

Just a quick comment, I know that the hour is getting late. The presentation at Medical 
Affairs by Dr. Schlesinger about the joint MD/PhD program was probably one of the most 
inspirational and remarkable programs that we have heard about in a long time. He has 
breathed life into this with a passion that was very compelling at the presentation and 
the students that are participating in this, you hear about the best and the brightest which 
is an overused term, but they are close to our best and brightest. They are warriors and 
they make an eight year commitment to Ohio State. They do so much for us both for 
recruiting and retaining faculty and providing an underbelly for research, but they also 
do so much by what they become thereafter and what they give back to the University 
and Ohio. At some point, because it was so inspiring for us, perhaps we should have 
that group or Dr. Schlesinger come to the entire Board with the opportunity to hear 
firsthand about that work. It is really impressive. 

 
Mr. Brass: 
 

I think that is a great idea, Bobby. One of the things that I took away from that, and I 
know Dr. Gabbe and Dr. Lockwood really believe this, is that by having a program like 
this, it helps us recruit the best doctors out there because they want to know if you are 
an NIH MD/PhD program, if you have those resources, and if you are approved. I think 
this is a win-win, that’s why I said that it puts us on the national platform, so thank you 
for the comments, Bobby. 

 
Mr. Wexner: 
 

Thank you. Judge Marley. 
 

Judge Marbley: 
 

Mr. Chair, on February 9, Academic Affairs and Student Life met and began with an 
update on campus safety, which was led by Vice President for Student Life, Dr. Javaune 
Adams-Gaston and Senior Vice President for Administration and Planning, Jay Kasey. 
This arose because in the areas adjacent to campus where students are to live, last 
October witnessed an increase in crime such as burglary, assault, and armed robbery. 
Columbus and Ohio State public safety professionals say that there is an uptick in crime 
every fall. Although the number of crime notices issued in November was higher, the 
overall notices issued last year were consistent with the averages of the past five years.  
 
Nonetheless, we took steps to enhance the safety in the University District including the 
following: President Gee appointed a multidisciplinary task force to suggest 
improvement. Secondly, with encouragement from Ohio State, the city of Columbus has 
increased patrols in the off-campus area in collaboration between OSU public safety and 
the Columbus Department of Public Safety. Police divisions are being explored as those 
discussions are ongoing, and we are looking at ways to beef up security and improve 
collaboration and response time.  

 
Two additional vehicles have been purchased to allow the Student Safety Service to 
transport more students, and the University switched to a new crime notification system 
that significantly increased the number of students, faculty, and staff who receive alerts. 
A Buckeye Block Watch program has been created and lighting in off-campus 
neighborhoods is being improved. Though it is not possible to draw a direct cause and 
effect conclusion, we can say that since these changes were implemented, crime has 
declined with assaults, burglaries, and armed robberies all substantially down in 
December. That trend line from January has continued.  
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Our committee requested data to disaggregate the number of Ohio State students 
directly affected by these crimes from the population at large. We didn’t have the exact 
number of students who might have been affected in the numbers we received yesterday 
so that information is being gathered for us. 
 
The second very important issue that we addressed yesterday was a briefing on the 
proposal for students to live on campus for their first two years at Ohio State. We call it 
the On-Campus Experience. As you know, it is not a housing issue; it is an on-campus 
experience issue. Whenever I am done, if Ron wants to comment on it, he is free to 
because he is spearheading a portion of that. 
 
But we know from all of the data that first year retention, graduation rates, and a sense 
of engagement in the University are all enhanced when students live on campus. This 
is one of the initiatives that President Gee brought to us. For example, at Ohio State 
students who live in residence halls for two years have a substantially higher second 
year retention rate, 92%, than those students who move out of the halls after one year, 
80.4%. The overall graduation rate for the University is 79.7%, close to 80%. When you 
just look at students who have lived in the residence halls for two years, however, that 
graduation rate becomes 88.2%. We know the students who live on campus have a 
higher graduation rate than students who never live on campus, 81% to 65%. The 
national survey of student engagement in 2010 shows that more than 50% of our 
students never interact with faculty members outside the classroom, nearly 30% only 
sometimes work with faculty on activities other than coursework, to only 17% of our 
students are engaging with faculty members on a regular basis outside the classroom. 
36% of the students who have lived on campus report engaging with faculty on a regular 
basis, so over one-third.  
 
Describing what she called a transformational residential experience, Dr. J. said that a 
two-year residency will be guided by the following principles: access or academic 
engagement with the University, community that is a variety of learning environments on 
campus, and self-awareness or co-curricular discovery and development. 
 
During a student’s first year, the instances across these defining parameters would be 
on discovery in the University. In their second year, the instances would be on the 
student’s discovering their future. During their second year, she said, experiential 
stipends would be proposed to enhance the student experience through internships and 
assistance-ships as well as service learning, study abroad, and leadership opportunities. 
This would increase student-faculty engagement by providing a structure for faculty to 
work with students directly where they live in the University residential communities. If I 
may digress for a moment, one of the things that we have considered and one of the 
centerpieces of the on-campus experience is that faculty would be an integral part of 
that experience. Some would live there, but many would have activities centered in the 
residence halls, so you would increase the student-faculty contact and enhance the out 
of classroom learning experience. 
 
We then had a report from Dr. Janet Reid, who provided a brief overview of a report on 
diversity at Ohio State. The report is simply a preliminary assessment by consultants 
Martin Davidson of the University of Virginia, Darden School of Business, and Dr. Alan 
Richter, who is out of New York and specializes in international diversity. We retained 
these consultants to study the University’s diversity profile. Phase one of this 
assessment covers students, faculty, staff, community, suppliers, and research. The 
consultants found that, when measured against global best practices in diversity and 
inclusion, Ohio State has done considerable work. Aspirations for diversity and inclusion 
are consistently high, though as with everything else, there is room for improvement. For 
example, while there are pockets of great leadership with regard to diversity and 
inclusion, there is not consistent leadership in this regard throughout the University. 
 
The consultants found that we need to improve performance in diversity and inclusion 
education and training, recruitment, development, and advancement and customer 
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service. With the diagnostic phase now completed, the consultants will begin to generate 
strategies for enhancing the University’s diversity and inclusion footprint. 
 
Then and finally, Mr. Chair, the Committee endorsed the following: the naming of the 
Lawrence and Isabel Barnett Center for Integrated Arts and Enterprise, the Barnett 
Theater and the Barnett Conference Room in Sullivant Hall, the naming of the Mary H. 
and J. Churchill Hodges Non-Invasive Imaging Center in the Ross Heart Hospital, the 
naming of the Keith B. Key Center for Student Leadership and Service in the Ohio Union, 
the naming of the Ralph Regula Plant and Animal Agrosecurity and Research Facility at 
Ohio Agricultural Research and Development Center Campus in Wooster, and the 
naming of the Fred Yenkin Clinical Exam Room in the Richard Ross Heart Hospital.  
 
Then we endorsed a number of routine personnel matters and went into executive 
session. 

 
Mr. Wexner: 
 

Thank you. Questions, comments?  
 
Mr. Ratner: 
 

Just one quick comment. Judge referred to the work that’s been done on trying to put 
real definition around the student experience, the two-year experience. I have heard that 
report from Dr. J, and I am very enthusiastic about the kind of progress that has been 
made.  
 
On the physical facility side, we are charged with trying to create great physical facilities, 
but I have often said that great architecture really requires a great client. If, as a client, 
you don’t articulate what your real goals and aspirations are, what kind of experience 
you want, what uses you want it to have, the architectural team, and I think we have an 
excellent team, but that team really wouldn’t stand a chance. 
 
In fact, that work has really progressed to a great degree. I think when we get the full 
report to the Board and we all get to hear it and get to see what it is, both the Board and 
the community at large will begin to really understand the concepts that are driving our 
idea. It is really President Gee’s vision of creating a two-year experience that is really 
transformative. As that has been fleshed out, it has really begun to inform the work that 
we are doing on the physical side. 
 
Again, this is a place where I think we have really got One University working well, and 
we have an integrated kind of planning model that is going back and forth between the 
ability to create a transformative experience in terms of the actual experience of the 
students and then the physical facilities that really accommodate that so I think we have 
made great progress and when we get this to the point when we are really able to fully 
flesh out to the entire Board and the community, I think everyone will be very thrilled with 
what we have been able to accomplish. 

 
Mr. Wexner: 
 

Thank you.  
 
Judge Marbley: 
 

I will also say that it has energized the faculty because it is a unique experience. As we 
noticed with the Medical Center, it just is one of those types of programs that I think will 
aid in our recruitment of top faculty and researchers. 
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Dr. Cloyd: 
 

Judge Marbley talked when we reviewed this in the Committee yesterday. We spent a 
fair amount of time when Dr. J was outlining the power of creating more interactions 
between faculty and students. We have great students and great faculty, but the power 
of changing lives is so key that if we can facilitate that interaction that would be ideal. I 
couldn’t help but think that when the two students we recognized this morning were 
describing their experiences, would those have happened had they not had these 
wonderful faculty engagements? The answer is no, so it just seems that this is a 
tremendous opportunity for us to help our students in the development of their lives. 

 
Mr. Wexner: 
 

Thank you. Jeff? 
 
Dr. Wadsworth: 
 

Okay, the Finance Committee. It is late, and we had a very full agenda, Mr. Chairman. I 
am going to try to do it quickly.  
 
Five items were presented for discussion, and there are eleven in the consent agenda. 
We did review, of course, the full financial update with Mr. Chatas. The sixth month 
period ended on December 31. In summary, the revenue for the University was up over 
the second quarter of the previous year by about 6% or $126 million, which was 
somewhat offset by a decline in state support of about $32 million. 
 
Research funding remained strong, but we are monitoring it very closely because there 
are great uncertainties in the federal budget and in the state budget, so we will be 
following that carefully. 
 
Operating expenses increased by about $100 million largely due to the fairly moderate 
salary increases and some early retirement incentives. 
 
Our investment portfolio unfortunately showed a loss. We never like to see red ink; 
however, if we look at the benchmarks that the University uses, although we had a 4%, 
and these are unrealized loses, the benchmark loss was 11%, so this actually represents 
a silver lining in the performance of the portfolio. Both Mr. Chatas and Mr. Hook 
presented a deeper dive into the various components so we understood the various 
pieces within that. 
 
Mr. Chatas also described a proposed change to the debt policy that is going to be 
worked over a period of time and will be brought back to this committee in April. We 
heard from Ms. Ready on construction projects. All that reported on time, budget and 
scope, so that was very positive. Then we moved to the eleven items on the consent 
agenda. I am going to give you one sentence on each. 
 
The first had to do with the establishment of a $100 fee for distance learning. We looked 
at the various elements of that and felt that that was a fair assessment. We also heard 
from Ms. Ready on a proposed change to the policy on purchasing and competitive 
bidding to reflect changes from the approved state construction form. This sets the levels 
of which you have to go after competitive bids and so on. 
 
The next three resolutions were presented by Ms. McCutcheon and relate to the 
amendments to the University’s 457B plan. These are mostly compliance and 
administrative changes and consolidation of various elements into the 457 plan and to 
make the plan comply with IRS regulations. The sixth resolution was mentioned already 
and that had to do with professional services contracts for various construction contracts 
that we have heard about on chilled water, agricultural engineering and also a basketball 
practice facility.  
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The seventh, eighth and ninth resolutions were presented by Mr. Foegler. They 
represent, respectively, the selling, the purchasing and the leasing of three pieces of 
property. We looked at the independent appraisals and believe the University is doing 
all the appropriate financial benchmarking, and those are good to go. 
 
The tenth resolution represents the $64.6 million that my colleague, Alan, presented 
earlier, which is for the Medical Center expansion. Finally, the eleventh is the resolution 
to ratify the interim approval of the design phase of the indoor golf facility. This was 
something that was approved by the chair of the Finance Committee during the previous 
interim. 
 
We did hit two more things, so that is the consent agenda. We have heard about the first 
one, which is a three year capital plan for athletics. I will not go back into that, but we did 
discuss the University creation of an athletic parking and pricing committee, which 
comprises nine members including our new chair, Mr. Schottenstein. This committee will 
engage a consultant and meet to look vigorously at the football and basketball ticketing 
pricing options by using appropriate benchmarks in the top 20 programs. They will 
review the budget and five to ten year forecasts for the Department of Athletics to 
propose recommendations to the full Board in the fall of this year for implementation of 
ticket prices in 2013. 
 
That concludes my report, Mr. Chairman. 

 
Mr. Wexner: 
 

Thank you, Jeff. 
 
Mr. Schottenstein: 
 

I have a comment just to follow up on what Jeff said. The committee is going to look at 
not just ticket prices, but all sources of revenue in a comprehensive way that come in to 
our Athletic Department, be they from our contracts with Nike, Coca-Cola or IMG, to look 
at the entire scope of the Athletic Department budget to see ways to creatively enhance 
and build up revenues. 

 
Mr. Wexner: 
 

Any other questions, comments? Mr. Fisher. 
 
Mr. Fisher: 
 

Thank you, Mr. Chairman. In the spirit of recognizing rural America, the Agricultural 
Affairs Committee met at 7:30 this morning; and indeed, there is a lack of competition 
for that time slot as well, but I would like to keep in front of the Board our opportunity as 
a University and a society that food, energy, environment particularly on water quality, 
health, and wellness are major issues in a world that just reached seven billion people 
and is quickly growing on a path to nine billion plus people. I would encourage future 
participation from the Board in Agricultural Affairs and just say that we are about food, 
fiber, fuel, flowers, and fun.  
 
We welcomed this morning Dr. Tony Forshey, who is the interim director at the Ohio 
Department of Agriculture. We also announced to the Committee President Gee and 
Provost Alutto’s announcement of the research committee chaired by Dean David 
Williams in Engineering for Bobby Moser’s replacement. 
 
The overall structure of our meeting was to talk about the reinvention and reformulating 
of cooperative extension service driven both by technology and new ways to distribute 
information and also because of finances and budgeting. Under this new arrangement, 
which is pretty much in place now, we talked specifically about three subject areas this 
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morning. First, the Sub-Surface Energy Research Center, a collaboration of several 
disciplines here on campus, which is easier for me to understand that this is all about 
oil, gas and shale development in eastern Ohio. We talked about food processors. The 
number that we have in the state of Ohio exceeds 1,000 and this presents an opportunity 
for this to be a part of our economic develop and job creation by maintaining these 
institutes and adding new ones. 
 
Lastly, we talked about water quality, specifically agricultural nutrients, and the fact that 
we have issues to deal with relative to phosphorous and nitrogen as it impacts, you have 
probably heard about, algae blooms and St. Mary’s, Lake Erie, and all of our Great 
Lakes. How do we deal with these issues, produce food and sustain clean water? 
 
Lastly, we heard an update from the Ohio Agricultural Research and Development 
Center. You heard Judge Marbley talk about the PARR facility naming, and certainly we 
want to publicly recognize the contribution of Congressman Regula in helping us with all 
aspects of that facility, but particularly with the funding and his role as a Congressman 
in that district. 
 
The greenhouses that were taken down by the tornado where the temporary 
greenhouses are up, we now have the plans in place to go ahead with the permanent 
replacement of the greenhouses. Overall, damage now from the tornado is at $28.8 
million of which $17 million was in structural repairs. We should complete this summer 
a lot of the roof repairs and things that we are waiting for better weather to do, so things 
should be back to normal at the Ohio Agricultural Research and Development Center by 
the early fall. 
 
Finally, we had a check presentation from Brent Porteus of Porteus Farms in Coshocton, 
Ohio, in memory of his wife, Debbie, who we lost to breast cancer. This was an effort in, 
as it was characterized, cultivating the cure, and it is a combination of the Porteus Farms 
reaching out to leadership in Ohio agriculture to work on cancer research. 
 
Finally, I would like to ask Jerry, if he will, he very well summarized our work about 
extension and outreach this morning in the committee, and rather than for me to 
paraphrase it, I just ask Jerry to repeat that here if he would. 

 
Mr. Jurgensen: 
 

Thanks, Jack. The point that I made was both our Chairman and our President came up 
with the idea of branding our University as the engine for economic development in the 
state of Ohio, and to the extent that is true, then it seems to be that the railroad that that 
engine should run on is extension. The challenge is the classic challenge of perception 
versus reality. The perception is that extension exists solely for the farmers in the state 
of Ohio, and the reality is that there is not a single issue, challenge or opportunity that 
confronts any one of Ohio’s 88 counties or any single citizen in those 88 counties that is 
not informed by this University. Not a single issue, not a single opportunity. 
 
The shale presentation was interesting. We have the oil and gas industry investing 
billions of dollars in the state of Ohio to extract this energy source. They would not have 
put the first nickel in if it were not for the help and involvement of Ohio State. Our 
scientists, our extension people, working with the landowners, working on leases, 
working on the environmental issues and concerns that derive from this activity, none of 
it happened without Ohio State. We are the only institution in the state of Ohio that has 
an on the ground, existing human-based information network that covers 100% of the 
state. Our challenge is to make sure that we are delivering 100% of the intellectual cargo 
of this University and not just the fruits of a single college. I think it even goes, President 
Gee, to where it is housed because where it is housed historically made a lot of sense 
but the unintended consequence of where it is housed is that it perpetuates 
misperception of what it is and it is way more than that. 
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President Gee: 
 

I was just going to say that, first of all, that it is currently because of New Castle, 
Pennsylvania. Not only do we understand that, but I really appreciate your articulation 
of it. I also think that the opportunity that we have right now is to really make the case 
for the reinvention of the land grant mission based upon its traditions but based upon its 
new history, and that is precisely what we are doing. I love the articulation that we just 
heard from Jerry. 

 
Mr. Wexner: 
 

Thank you very much. Before we call the consent agenda, it is a reminder to all of us 
and I give my appreciation for the work that the committees do and what the whole Board 
does, and so much more has been done by the Board in committees. There are long 
meetings between the normally scheduled Board meetings, engagement with non-
Trustees on most of these committees to get input and collaboration with the 
administration, faculty and staff; we have a very robust schedule and a lot of hours. 
 
I was thinking this morning why I was so tired; it was because yesterday, we started at 
8:30 and we ended at 8:30, so it was one of those 12 hour days. This morning Agriculture 
started at 7:30, so the hours are being put in. I think it is a good thing for us to take 
inventory in the work that we are doing. Not only is there scope in terms of across 
committees and across members of the Board, but the amount of energy and knowledge 
that is shared, how many things come together here, is quite remarkable. I think we 
should just pause a second to reflect on the work that is done and how good the work is 
that is in support of the University, the President, and, of course, the consent agenda. 

 
President Gee: 
 

Before I move to the consent agenda, Mr. Chairman, in our discussions yesterday, we 
realized that we had an opportunity, so it is my pleasure to offer for consideration a 
resolution regarding expansion of our student Trustees’ full engagement in the Board’s 
activities. Our General Assembly, as we speak, is considering two pieces of legislation 
to allow student Trustees full voting and other privileges at our public universities.  
 
As you know, I have consistently supported this legislation given the experience we have 
had at this institution with our student Trustees. Brandon Mitchell and Evann 
Heidersbach, our current Trustees, exemplify the best of today’s young people, and I 
just want to acknowledge that. They are deeply thoughtful, they are forward thinking, 
and they are clearly committed to this institution. They bring to the Board’s discussions, 
the essential perspective of the very people whom we seek to serve, and they are not 
alone in possessing these qualities. 
 
To a person, our student Trustees have been insightful, responsible, and engaged, so it 
is really important to recognize that. It is my honor to count them as my colleagues, and 
it is my hope that the Board will offer its favorable consideration on this resolution 
distributed for its consideration today. It will need a formal motion and a second.  

 
Mr. Wexner: 
 

This is by acclamation unanimous, I think. 
 
Dr. Horn: 
 

It is a roll call. 
 
Upon motion of Mr. O’Dell, seconded by Mr. Shumate, the Board of Trustees adopted the 
foregoing motion by unanimous roll call vote, cast by Trustees Wexner, O’Dell, Shumate, 
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Hicks, Fisher, Schottenstein, Brass, Ratner, Marbley, Kass, Reid, Jurgensen, and 
Smucker. 
 
President Gee: 
 

This will be deeply appreciated by our students and by students and parents around the 
state.  

 
*** 

 
ACCEPTANCE OF REPORT ON COMPLIANCE ASSESSMENT  

AND ADOPTION OF RECOMMENDATIONS 
Resolution No. 2012-48 

 
Synopsis: Acceptance of Report on Compliance Assessment Results and Adoption of the 
Recommendations presented by Protiviti and Dewey & LeBoeuf. 
 
WHEREAS the Audit and Compliance Committee of the Board of Trustees has been 
working diligently for the past eight months on a university-wide assessment of our 
compliance function; and 
 
WHEREAS the University has undertaken this assessment with the assistance of two 
outside expert firms we engaged specifically for this purpose, Dewey & LeBoeuf and 
Protiviti, as well as an outstanding internal working group co-chaired by Geoffrey Chatas, 
Senior Vice President for Business and Finance and Chief Financial Officer, and 
Christopher Culley, Senior Vice President and General Counsel; and 
 
WHEREAS the University’s goal is to ensure that our compliance programs and protocols 
represent a model for compliance among institutions of higher education; and 
 
WHEREAS the work that has been completed to date has included a thorough review of 
the university’s current practices, its organizational structure, and benchmarking against 
both universities and financial/for profit institutions; and 
 
WHEREAS the recommendations for a new structure are significant and represent real 
change that the University believes will significantly enhance existing compliance efforts 
and establish a more robust compliance process; and 
 
WHEREAS the report will provide a framework for the future implementation of the 
compliance restructuring; and 
 
WHEREAS the Audit and Compliance Committee will continue to oversee the 
implementation of the report’s recommendations: 
 
NOW THEREFORE 
 
BE IT RESOLVED, that the Report on Compliance Assessment and Recommendations 
prepared by Protiviti and Dewey & LeBoeuf be accepted and that the proposed 
recommendations contained in that report be adopted as a framework for commencing the 
University’s new compliance program. 
 
(See Appendix XX for background information, page 453.) 
 
Upon motion of Mr. Schottenstein, seconded by Judge Marbley, the Board of Trustees 
adopted the foregoing motion by unanimous roll call vote, cast by Trustees Wexner, O’Dell, 
Shumate, Hicks, Fisher, Schottenstein, Brass, Ratner, Marbley, Kass, Jurgensen, 
Wadsworth, and Smucker.  

 
***  
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ELECTION OF OFFICERS 
Resolution No. 2012-49 

 
Robert H. Schottenstein, Chair 

Brian K. Hicks, Vice Chair 
John C. Fisher, Vice Chair 

David Horn, Secretary 
 
Upon motion of Mr. Shumate, seconded by Judge Marbley, the Board of Trustees adopted 
the foregoing motion by acclamation of Trustees Wexner, O’Dell, Shumate, Hicks, Fisher, 
Schottenstein, Brass, Ratner, Marbley, Kass, Jurgensen, Wadsworth, and Smucker.  

 
*** 

 
SUPPORT FOR STATE LEGISLATION REGARDING VOTING AND PARTICIPATION 

PRIVILEGES FOR STUDENT TRUSTEES 
Resolution No. 2012-50 

 
Synopsis: Support for state legislation regarding voting and participation privileges for 
student trustees. 
 
WHEREAS the Ohio State University understands that the Ohio General Assembly has 
legislation before it that would grant student members of public university boards of 
trustees full voting and other participation privileges currently afforded to other trustees; 
and 
 
WHEREAS the Ohio State University student trustee experience has been that its student 
trustees have consistently served the people of Ohio exceptionally well through their hard 
work, thorough preparation, and full engagement in the business of the board; and 
 
WHEREAS Ohio State University’s student trustees have consistently represented the best 
interests of the people of Ohio and the entire university community: 
 
NOW THEREFORE 
 
BE IT RESOLVED, That the Board of Trustees wishes to express its support for state 
legislation which would provide student trustees full voting and participation privileges 
afforded to other University trustees. 
 
Upon motion of Mr. O’Dell, seconded by Mr. Shumate, the Board of Trustees adopted the 
foregoing motion by unanimous roll call vote, cast by Trustees Wexner, O’Dell, Shumate, 
Hicks, Fisher, Schottenstein, Brass, Ratner, Marbley, Kass, Reid, Jurgensen, and 
Smucker. 

 
*** 

 
CONSENT AGENDA 

 
President Gee: 
 

Today we have a total of 23 resolutions on the consent agenda. I would like to note that 
you have received an amended resolution for item 10, and resolution 14 has been 
removed, so we are seeking approval for the following: 
 

THE OHIO STATE UNIVERSITY BOARD OF TRUSTEES  
RATIFICATION OF COMMITTEE APPOINTMENTS 2011 - 2012 

Resolution No. 2012-51 
 
BE IT RESOLVED, That the Committee appointments for 2011-12 are as follows:  
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Academic Affairs and Student Life 
Committee:  
Algenon L. Marbley, Chair 
Brian K. Hicks, Vice Chair 
Linda S. Kass 
Janet B. Reid 
Clark C. Kellogg 
Evann K. Heidersbach 
G. Gilbert Cloyd (Charter Trustee) 
Robert M. Duncan 
Kevin G. Boyle (Faculty Member) 
Leslie H. Wexner (ex officio) 
 
Advancement Committee 
G. Gilbert Cloyd, Chair (Charter 

Trustee) 
Linda S. Kass, Vice Chair 
Brian K. Hicks 
Clark C. Kellogg 
Timothy P. Smucker 
Evann K. Heidersbach 
Corbett A. Price (Charter Trustee) 
John W. Kessler 
Philip J. Duncan 
NANCY J. KRAMER 
Michael Clark (Alumni Assoc Mbr) 
Donald H. Schriver (Alumni Assn 

Member) 
John B. Gerlach (Foundation Brd) 
David T. Kollat (Foundation Brd) 
Leslie H. Wexner (ex officio) 
 
Agricultural Affairs Committee: 
John C. Fisher, Chair 
William G. Jurgensen, Vice Chair 
Timothy P. Smucker 
Evann K. Heidersbach 
James J. Zehringer (ex officio) 
Leslie H. Wexner (ex officio) 
 
Audit and Compliance Committee:  
Robert H. Schottenstein, Chair  
John C. Fisher, Vice Chair 
Ronald A. Ratner 
Algenon L. Marbley  
William G. Jurgensen 

Brandon N. Mitchell 
James Gilmour 
LAWRENCE A. HILSHEIMER 
Leslie H. Wexner (ex officio) 
 
Committee on Trusteeship: 
Alex Shumate, Chair 
Janet B. Reid, Vice Chair 
John C. Fisher 
Linda S. Kass 
Brandon N. Mitchell 
G. Gilbert Cloyd (Charter Trustee) 
Leslie H. Wexner (ex officio) 
 
Finance Committee: 
Jeffrey Wadsworth, Chair 
Alan W. Brass, Vice Chair 
Alex Shumate 
Walden W. O’Dell  
John C. Fisher 
Robert H. Schottenstein 
Ronald A. Ratner 
William G. Jurgensen 
Brandon N. Mitchell 
Corbett A. Price (Charter Trustee) 
Jo Ann Davidson 
Leslie H. Wexner (ex officio) 
 
Medical Affairs Committee: 
Alan W. Brass, Chair 
Jeffrey Wadsworth, Vice Chair 
Brian K. Hicks 
Robert H. Schottenstein 
Algenon L. Marbley 
Janet B. Reid 
Corbett A. Price (Charter Trustee) 
Leslie H. Wexner (ex officio) 
 
Physical Environment Committee: 
Ronald A. Ratner, Chair 
William G. Jurgensen, Vice Chair 
Walden W. O’Dell  
Clark C. Kellogg 
Evann K. Heidersbach 
Leslie H. Wexner (ex officio) 

 
*** 

 
DISTINGUISHED SERVICE AWARDS 

Resolution No. 2012-52 
 

Synopsis: Approval of the University's 2012 Distinguished Service Awards is proposed. 
 
WHEREAS the President's Council, upon the recommendation of the Committee on 
Distinguished Service Awards, nominated and recommended the following for approval by 
the Board of Trustees to receive the Distinguished Service Award at a time convenient to 
the University and the recipient: 
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 Ann “Tanny” B. Crane 

 John “Jack” W. Kessler 

 Keith D. Monda 

 Trella Hemmerly Romine 

 Stephen A. Sterrett 

 James R. Tootle 

 Alec Wightman 
 
WHEREAS these awards are given in recognition of distinguished service to The Ohio 
State University and the awards are in accordance with action taken by the Board of 
Trustees in 1952: 
 
NOW THEREFORE 
 
BE IT RESOLVED, that the 2012 Distinguished Service Awards be approved for awarding 
as designated above. 

 
*** 

 
HONORARY DEGREES 

Resolution No. 2012-53 
 
Synopsis: The awarding of honorary degrees is recommended for approval. 
 
WHEREAS the Committee on Honorary Degrees and the University Senate, pursuant to 
rule 3335-5-488 of the Administrative Code, have approved for recommendation to the 
Board of Trustees the awarding of honorary degrees as listed below: 
 
 Donald Harris Doctor of Music 
 Ray Jackendoff Doctor of Humane Letters 
 Tobin J. Marks Doctor of Science 
 Thomas Pollard Doctor of Science 
 Reiner Rummel Doctor of Science 
 
NOW THEREFORE 
 
BE IT RESOLVED, That the above honorary degrees be awarded in accordance with the 
recommendation at a time convenient to the University and the recipient. 

 
*** 

 
DEGREES AND CERTIFICATES 

Resolution No. 2012-54 
 
Synopsis: Approval of Degrees and Certificates for winter quarter is proposed. 
 
WHEREAS pursuant to paragraph (E) of rule 3335-1-06 of the Administrative Code, the 
Board has authority for the issuance of degrees and certificates; and 
 
WHEREAS the faculties of the colleges and schools shall transmit, in accordance with rule 
3335-9-29 of the Administrative Code, for approval by the Board of Trustees, the names of 
persons who have completed degree and certificate requirements: 
 
NOW THEREFORE 
 
BE IT RESOLVED, That the degrees and certificates be conferred on March 18, 2012, to 
those persons who have completed the requirements for their respective degrees and 
certificates and are recommended by the colleges and schools, and that the names of 
those persons awarded degrees and certificates be included in the minutes of this meeting.  
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(See Appendix XXXI for background information, page 502.) 
 

*** 
 

NAMING OF THE CENTER FOR INTEGRATED ARTS AND ENTERPRISE, THE 
THEATRE, AND THE CONFERENCE ROOM 

Resolution No. 2012-55 
 

In Sullivant Hall, the College of Arts and Sciences: 
“Lawrence and Isabel Barnett Center forIntegrated Arts and Enterprise” 

“Barnett Theatre” 
“Barnett Conference Room” 

 
Synopsis: The naming of the “Lawrence and Isabel Barnett Center for Integrated Arts and 
Enterprise,” “Barnett Theatre,” and “Barnett Conference Room” in Sullivant Hall, located at 
1813 North High Street on the OSU Columbus campus, will be the new front door to the 
new University Arts District. 
 
WHEREAS the generosity of Isabel and Lawrence Barnett has made a lasting impact on 
the arts at The Ohio State University by providing educational opportunities to outstanding 
students, unique annual events for distinguished visiting lecturers, and a biannual 
symposium on topics related to public and non-profit sector policies and practices; and  
 
WHEREAS the Lawrence and Isabel Barnett Charitable Foundation has provided 
significant contributions to the College of Arts and Sciences for The Lawrence and Isabel 
Barnett Fellowship Fund and The Lawrence and Isabel Barnett Distinguished Visiting 
Professor Fund in Arts Policy and Administration; and 
 
WHEREAS the Lawrence and Isabel Barnett Charitable Foundation has provided 
contributions to the College of Arts and Sciences for Sullivant Hall renovations designated 
to reopen in fall 2013; and 
 
WHEREAS the renovated Sullivant Hall is the future home of the Department of Dance, 
the Department of Art Education, and the Advanced Computing Center for Arts and Design; 
and 
 
WHEREAS a new center for integrated arts and enterprise will be located in the renovated 
Sullivant Hall upon the Hall’s opening:  
 
NOW THEREFORE 
 
BE IT RESOLVED, That in accordance with paragraph (F) of rule 3335-1-08 of the 
Administrative Code, the Board of Trustees approves that the aforementioned Center, 
Theatre and Conference Room in Sullivant Hall be temporarily named the “Lawrence and 
Isabel Barnett Center for Integrated Arts and Enterprise,” “Barnett Theatre,” and “Barnett 
Conference Room” during the Hall’s renovation and officially be named upon the Hall’s 
reopening scheduled for the fall of 2013.  

 
*** 

 
NAMING OF THE NON-INVASIVE IMAGING CENTER 

Resolution No. 2012-56 
 

In the Richard M. Ross Heart Hospital, the Medical Center: 
The Mary H. and J. Churchill Hodges Non-Invasive Imaging Center 

 
Synopsis: The naming of the Non-Invasive Imaging Center in the Richard M. Ross Heart 
Hospital, located at 452 West 10th Avenue, Columbus, Ohio 43210 on the Medical Center 
campus is requested. The Richard M. Ross Heart Hospital was recognized in the 2011 
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survey by U.S. News and World Report as a leader in cardiology and heart surgery, ranking 
24th out of nearly 500 hospitals around the country. 
 
WHEREAS the Richard M. Ross Heart Hospital is a state-of-the-art facility for heart and 
vascular procedures; and 
 
WHEREAS Mary and Churchill Hodges have provided contributions to the Ross Heart 
Hospital to the Mary H. and J. Churchill Hodges Prevention Program Fund for a clinical 
prevention program in cardiovascular disease and cancer prevention; and 
 
WHEREAS Mary and Churchill Hodges have also provided significant contributions to the 
Medical Center: 
 
NOW THEREFORE 
 
BE IT RESOLVED, That in accordance with paragraph (F) of rule 3335-1-08 of the 
Administrative Code, the Board of Trustees approves that the aforementioned Non-
Invasive Imaging Center in the Richard M. Ross Heart Hospital be named The Mary H. and 
J. Churchill Hodges Non-Invasive Imaging Center. 

 
*** 

 
NAMING OF THE CENTER FOR STUDENT LEADERSHIP AND SERVICE SUITE 

Resolution No. 2012-57 
 

In the Ohio Union: 
The Keith B. Key Center for Student Leadership and Service 

 
Synopsis: The naming of the Center for Student Leadership and Service Suite in the Ohio 
Union, located at 1739 N. High Street on the Columbus campus is requested. The Ohio 
Union is a premier facility that meets the changing needs of the college student by serving 
as a timeless center of activity, community dialogue, and learning. 
 
WHEREAS the Center for Student Leadership and Service offers programs, resources, 
and services for individual students and student groups to connect with leadership and 
service initiatives, engage with student organizations, advance their learning, and create 
lasting memories in one convenient location; and  
 
WHEREAS Keith B. Key has committed to provide significant contributions to the Ohio 
Union to establish a new program dedicated to Social Entrepreneurship within the Center 
for Student Leadership and Service:  
 
NOW THEREFORE 
 
BE IT RESOLVED, That in accordance with paragraph (F) of rule 3335-1-08 of the 
Administrative Code, the Board of Trustees approves that the aforementioned Center for 
Student Leadership and Service in the Ohio Union be named The Keith B. Key Center for 
Student Leadership and Service. 

 
*** 

 
NAMING OF THE PLANT AND ANIMAL AGROSECURITY  

RESEARCH (PAAR) FACILITY 
Resolution No. 2012-58 

 
At the OARDC Campus in Wooster, Ohio: 

Ralph Regula Plant and Animal Agrosecurity Research Facility 
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Synopsis: The naming of the Plant and Animal Agrosecurity Research (PAAR) Facility, 
located at 1345 Ferguson Road on the OARDC Campus in Wooster, Ohio, allows 
researchers at Ohio State University’s Ohio Agricultural Research and Development 
Center to study microscopic organisms that present serious health risks to plants and food-
producing animals and that could also cause undue economic hardship to Ohio and the 
nation. 
 
WHEREAS the Plant and Animal Agrosecurity Research (PAAR) Facility is the only facility 
in Ohio and one of only two nationally with capacity for both plant and animal research at 
the BSL-3 and BSL-3 Ag safety levels; and 
 
WHEREAS Ralph Regula was instrumental in acquiring federal funding for the design, 
engineering, and construction of the Plant and Animal Agrosecurity Research (PAAR) 
Facility; and 
 
WHEREAS he represented the 16th District of Ohio in the United States Congress for 36 
years, making him the longest-serving Congressman with unbroken service in Ohio history 
with 18 consecutive terms; and 
 
WHEREAS Representative Regula is a champion of the State of Ohio, especially the 16th 
District of which Wayne County and Wooster are a part: 
 
NOW THEREFORE 
 
BE IT RESOLVED, That in accordance with paragraph (F) of rule 3335-1-08 of the 
Administrative Code, the Board of Trustees approves that the aforementioned Plant and 
Animal Agrosecurity Research (PAAR) Facility on the OARDC Campus in Wooster, Ohio, 
is to be named the Ralph Regula Plant and Animal Agrosecurity Research Facility. 

 
*** 

 
NAMING OF THE CLINICAL EXAM ROOM 

Resolution No. 2012-59 
 

In the Richard M. Ross Heart Hospital, the Medical Center: 
The Fred Yenkin Clinical Exam Room 

 
Synopsis: The naming of the Clinical Exam Room in the Richard M. Ross Heart Hospital, 
located at 452 West 10th Avenue, Columbus, Ohio 43210 on the Medical Center campus 
is requested. The Richard M. Ross Heart Hospital was recognized in the 2011 survey by 
U.S. News and World Report as a leader in cardiology and heart surgery, ranking 24th out 
of nearly 500 hospitals around the country. 
 
WHEREAS the Richard M. Ross Heart Hospital is a state-of-the-art facility for heart and 
vascular procedures; and 
 
WHEREAS Merom and Judith Brachman and Cynthia Levinson have provided 
contributions to the Ross Heart Hospital General Building Fund for construction of the Ross 
Heart Hospital to include planning, design, and construction plant fund; and  
 
WHEREAS Merom and Judith Brachman have also provided significant contributions to 
the Medical Center: 
 
NOW THEREFORE 
 
BE IT RESOLVED, That in accordance with paragraph (F) of rule 3335-1-08 of the 
Administrative Code, the Board of Trustees approves that the aforementioned Clinical 
Exam Room in the Ambulatory Care Center in the Richard M. Ross Heart Hospital be 
named The Fred Yenkin Clinical Exam Room.  
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*** 
 

AMENDED PERSONNEL ACTIONS 
Resolution No. 2012-60 

 
BE IT RESOLVED, That the personnel actions as recorded in the Personnel Budget 
Records of the University since the November 4, 2011, meeting of the Board, including the 
following Appointments, Reappointments, Appointments/Reappointments of 
Chairpersons/Directors, Professional Improvement Leave, Professional Improvement 
Leave, Change in Dates, Professional Improvement Leave, Cancellation, Emeritus Titles, 
and Promotion, Tenure, and Reappointment, offcycle appointment be approved. 
 
Appointments 
 
Name: MELINDA D. CHURCH 
Title: Vice President of Communication and Special Assistant to the President 
Office: President 
Effective: December 1, 2011 
 
Name: MICHAEL A. CUNNINGHAM 
Title: Acting Dean and Director 
Office: The Ohio State University, Lima 
Effective: November 15, 2011 
 
Name: JEFF M.S. KAPLAN 
Title: Senior Vice President for Advancement and SpecialAssistant to the President 
Office: President 
Effective: September 1, 2011 
 
Reappointments 
 
Name: BOBBY D. MOSER 
Title: Vice President 
Office: Agricultural Administration 
Title: Dean 
Office: College of Food, Agricultural, and Environmental Sciences 
Effective: July 1, 2011 
 
Name: PETER T. WARD 
Title: Professor (The Richard M. Ross Chair in Management) 
College: Fisher College of Business 
Term: November 1, 2011 through October 31, 2016 
 
Appointments/Reappointments of Chairpersons/Directors 
 
ERIC M. ANDERMAN, Director, School of Educational Policy and Leadership, effective 
January 1, 2012, through June 30, 2016. 
 
MICHAEL B. CADWELL, Director, Knowlton School of Architecture, effective July 1, 2012, 
through May 31, 2016. 
 
STUART L. COOPER**, Chair, Lowrie Department of Chemical and Biomolecular 
Engineering, effective July 1, 2012, through May 31, 2016. 
 
RONALD S. KENSINGER, Chair, Department of Animal Sciences, effective January 1, 
2012, through June 30, 2015. 
 
CAROLYN J. MERRY**, Chair, Department of Civil and Environmental Engineering and 
Geodetic Science, effective July 1, 2012, through May 31, 2013.  
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AHMET SELAMET, Chair, Department of Mechanical and Aerospace Engineering, 
effective July 1, 2012, through May 31, 2016. 
 
PHILIP J. SMITH, Interim Chair, Department of Integrated Systems Engineering, effective 
December 1, 2011, through August 31, 2013. 
 
SETH B. YOUNG, Interim Chair, Department of Aviation, effective January 1, 2012, 
through June 30, 2012. 
 
**reappointment 
 
Professional Improvement Leave  
 
DOUGLAS DOOHAN, Professor, Department of Horticulture and Crop Science (Wooster), 
effective Winter Quarter and Spring Quarter 2012. 
 
Professional Improvement Leave, Change in Dates 
JOHN C. LIPPOLD, Professor, Department of Materials Science and Engineering, from 
Winter Quarter and Spring Quarter 2012, to Spring Semester 2013. 
 
Professional Improvement Leave, Cancellation 
JULIA F. ANDREWS, Professor, Department of History of Art, effective Winter Quarter 
and Spring Quarter 2012. 
 
Emeritus Titles 
 
MAUREEN AHERN, Professor, Department of Spanish and Portuguese, effective July 1, 
2012. 
 
MARILYN J. BLACKWELL, Professor, Department of Germanic Languages and 
Literatures, effective April 1, 2012. 
 
PACKIANATHAN CHELLADURAI, Professor, School of Physical Activity and Educational 
Services, effective June 1, 2012. 
 
DONNA A. CANIANO, Professor, Department of Surgery, effective December 1, 2011. 
 
DONALD H. DEAN, Professor, Department of Biochemistry, effective July 1, 2012. 
 
BRENDA L. DERVIN, Professor, School of Communication, effective April 1, 2012. 
 
WOODBRIDGE A. FOSTER, Professor, Department of Evolution, Ecology, and 
Organismal Biology, effective January 1, 2012. 
 
SALVADOR GARCIA, Professor, Department of Spanish and Portuguese, effective July 1, 
2012. 
 
REBECCA M. KANTOR-MARTIN, Professor, School of Teaching and Learning, effective 
January 1, 2012. 
 
LYDIA C. MEDEIROS, Professor, Department of Human Nutrition, effective January 1, 
2012. 
 
NEIL G. JACOBS, Professor, Department of Germanic Languages and Literatures, 
effective April 1, 2012. 
 
RICHARD C. PRATT, Professor, Department of Horticulture and Crop Science, effective 
February 1, 2012. 
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FRANKLIN H. PROANO, Professor, Department of Comparative Studies (Marion), 
effective September 1, 2012. 
 
CLAIRE C. ROBERTSON, Professor, Department of History, effective July 1, 2012. 
 
DOUGLAS A. RUND, Professor, Department of Emergency Medicine, effective February 
1, 2012. 
 
RICHARD A. BRADLEY, Associate Professor, Department of Evolution, Ecology, and 
Organismal Biology (Marion), effective October 1, 2012. 
 
ALEXIS C. COLLIER, Associate Professor, Department of Psychology, effective January 
1, 2012. 
 
CHARLES W. GOOD, Associate Professor, Department of Evolution, Ecology, and 
Organismal Biology, effective December 1, 2011. 
 
GEORGE H. HINKLE, Associate Professor, College of Pharmacy, effective January 1, 
2012. 
 
NICOLETTE N. MCNEELY, Associate Professor, University Extension, effective February 
1, 2012. 
 
GOLDEN JACKSON-MERGLER, Associate Professor, Department of Consumer 
Sciences, effective February 1, 2012. 
 
WILLIAM L. SMEAD, Associate Professor, Department of Surgery, effective February 1, 
2012. 
 
PHILIP L. SMITH, Associate Professor, School of Educational Policy and Leadership, 
effective February 1, 2012. 
 
BARBARA S. THOMSON, Associate Professor, School of Teaching and Learning, 
effective February 1, 2012. 
 
STANLEY G. VERMILYEA, Associate Professor, College of Dentistry, effective February 
1, 2012. 
 
PHEORIS WEST, Associate Professor, Department of Art, effective January 1, 2012. 
 
SHARON A. WEST, Associate Professor, School of Communication, effective October 1, 
2012. 
 
Promotion, Tenure, and Reappointment (off cycle) 
 
COLLEGE OF FOOD, AGRICULTURAL AND ENVIRONMENTAL SCIENCES 
 
PROMOTION TO ASSOCIATE PROFESSOR WITH TENURE 
Erbaugh, Mark, Extension, November 1, 2011 

 
*** 

 
RESOLUTIONS IN MEMORIAM 

Resolution No. 2012-61 
 
Synopsis: Approval of Resolutions in Memoriam is proposed. 
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BE IT RESOLVED, That the Board of Trustees adopt the following Resolutions in 
Memoriam and that the President be requested to convey copies to the families of the 
deceased. 

 
 

H. Joyce Coures 
 

The Board of Trustees of The Ohio State University expresses its sorrow upon the death 
on December 21, 2011, of H. Joyce Coures, Assistant Professor Emeritus in the Ohio State 
University Extension. 
 
Ms. Coures was born December 4, 1936, in Waverly, Ohio. She received her Bachelor of 
Science in Home Economics degree in 1959 from The Ohio State University, and an M.E. 
degree in home economics education from Miami University in 1977. 
 
Professor Coures began her Extension career in Ohio in July 1978 as the county extension 
agent, home economics in Preble County. In 1993, she became the county extension 
agent, home economics in Butler County. She was awarded emeritus status upon her 
retirement on January 31, 1999. 
 
Ms. Coures’ work with clothing, home management, nutrition projects, and workshops 
demonstrated that she was a truly dedicated teacher for Extension clientele. She was a 
member of and served on many committees of several professional organizations. Joyce 
was a piano teacher and an artist (painter), and she loved to garden and travel. 
 
On behalf of the University community, the Board of Trustees expresses to the family of 
Assistant Professor Emeritus H. Joyce Coures its deepest sympathy and sense of 
understanding of their loss. It is directed that this resolution be inscribed upon the minutes 
of the Board of Trustees and that a copy be tendered to her family as an expression of the 
Board’s heartfelt sympathy. 
 
 

Walter Fredric Hink 
 
The Board of Trustees of The Ohio State University expresses its sorrow upon the death 
on February 23, 2011, of W. Fredric Hink, Professor Emeritus in the Department of 
Entomology. 
 
Professor Hink received his Ph.D. degree at The Ohio State University and, after spending 
several years in industry, he returned to his alma mater as an assistant professor of 
Entomology and quickly ascended the ranks to professor. 
 
Professor Hink taught courses both in general entomology for lower level students, as well 
as a course in his specialty of insect pathology for graduate students. He entered the 
department at a time when the sub-discipline of insect pathology was just beginning and, 
together with his own Ph.D. mentor, Professor John Briggs, and Professor Gordon Stairs, 
helped to form a unique center of excellence for insect pathology at Ohio State. Many of 
the students trained in this area went on to major research and teaching positions 
throughout the United States and elsewhere. 
 
The work he performed during his Ph.D. studies was foundational in that it was the first 
demonstration showing that insects could generate an immune response. Insect immunity 
differs from immunity in humans but, prior to his work, it was assumed that insects did not 
have this capacity. An impressive body of important work on insect immune responses 
followed Professor Hink’s discovery, culminating in the awarding of the 2011 Nobel Prize 
in Physiology and Medicine to Jules Hoffmann from France for his elucidation of the 
molecules in the immune pathway of insects, a pathway that provided a template for 
immune studies of humans. 
 



February 10, 2012 meeting, Board of Trustees 
 

390 

In addition to his cutting-edge work on insect immune responses, Professor Hink pioneered 
techniques for culturing insect cells in vitro. Several currently used insect cell lines and 
culture media bear his name. This technology was particularly important for new biomedical 
breakthroughs, including the large-scale industrial production of interferon and other 
medicines of importance to human health. 
 
Professor Hink was well known within the department for his competence and ability to 
manage important assignments. Many of the strategic plans and major departmental 
documents prepared during his tenure reflected his guidance. He served many years as 
chair of the Graduate Committee for the Department of Entomology. His was known for his 
fairness, high standards, and smooth-running meetings. Clearly, Professor Hink was one 
of the stars in the Department of Entomology. 
 
On behalf of the University community, the Board of Trustees expresses to the family of 
Professor Emeritus W. Fredric Hink its deepest sympathy and sense of understanding of 
their loss. It is directed that this resolution be inscribed upon the minutes of the Board of 
Trustees and that a copy be tendered to his family as an expression of the Board’s heartfelt 
sympathy. 
 
 

Louis Malspeis 
 
The Board of Trustees of The Ohio State University expresses its sorrow upon the death 
on October 24, 2011, of Louis Malspeis, Professor Emeritus in the College of Pharmacy. 
 
Professor Malspeis received a B.S. in Pharmacy degree from Rutgers University in 1949 
and a Ph.D. degree in chemistry from the University of California in 1953. His academic 
career began in 1953 as an assistant professor in the College of Pharmacy at Columbia 
University in New York City, and he became a professor at Columbia in 1962. Professor 
Malspeis joined the faculty of the College of Pharmacy at The Ohio State University in 
1965, teaching and expanding his research in pharmaceutical chemistry. He taught 
courses in pharmaceutical chemistry and analysis, chemistry and kinetics in 
pharmaceutical systems, physical pharmacy, drug metabolism, and radioisotope tracer 
techniques in pharmaceutical research. 
 
The major research focus of Professor Malspeis was the development of therapeutic 
agents for the treatment of cancer, and his research focused on preclinical pharmacology 
studies on new anticancer agents. He was instrumental in the development of several 
anticancer drugs, including merbarone, anthracycline antibiotics, azacytidine, fludarabine 
phosphate, 2'-deoxycoformycin, flavone acetic acid, and flavopiridol. Professor Malspeis 
was involved in the establishment of the OSU Comprehensive Cancer Center and provided 
major leadership in experimental therapeutics during the early development of the cancer 
center. Upon his retirement in 1990, he was named Professor Emeritus. 
 
In 1990, Professor Emeritus Malspeis joined the Division of Cancer Treatment, National 
Cancer Institute, Bethesda, Maryland, as the chief of the Laboratory of Pharmaceutical 
Chemistry. His laboratory performed preclinical pharmacokinetic and pharmacology 
studies on new anticancer agents developed at NCI. Professor Emeritus Malspeis retired 
from NCI in 1995. 
 
Among many honors received, Professor Malspeis was elected as a Fellow of the 
American Association of Pharmaceutical Scientists. He authored over 75 publications in 
pharmaceutical chemistry, cancer research, and related fields. He mentored many 
students and postdoctoral researchers, and many would develop their own cancer 
research programs. Professor Malspeis is remembered as a leader in the development of 
the field of pharmaceutical chemistry and cancer research in the College of Pharmacy, the 
University, and across the nation.  
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On behalf of the University community, the Board of Trustees expresses to the family of 
Professor Emeritus Louis Malpeis its deepest sympathy and sense of understanding of 
their loss. It is directed that this resolution be inscribed upon the minutes of the Board of 
Trustees and that a copy be tendered to his family as an expression of the Board’s heartfelt 
sympathy. 
 
 

Wilbur A. Rapp 
 
The Board of Trustees of The Ohio State University expresses its sorrow upon the death 
on August 14, 2011, of Wilbur A. Rapp, Professor Emeritus in the Department of Finance 
in The Max M. Fisher College of Business. 
 
Professor Rapp was born in Ironton, Ohio, on September 24, 1933. After serving in the 
United States Army during the Korean War he received his bachelor's degree from Ohio 
University in 1960, an M.B.A. degree from the University of Virginia's Darden School of 
Business in 1962, and his Ph.D. degree from Northwestern University's Kellogg School of 
Management in 1966. 
 
Dr. Rapp was a member of The Ohio State University faculty for 25 years, retiring in 1988, 
He served as a consultant for numerous savings and loans throughout the United States 
and served on the board of directors for several of them. He developed an asset and liability 
management program that was used on the national level and was sponsored by the U.S. 
Savings and Loan League for 25 years. These activities reflected his scholarly interest in 
the areas of financial management of savings and loans and commercial banks. 
 
Highly regarded for his contributions in the classroom, Professor Rapp was recognized for 
outstanding teaching by the Undergraduate Student Forum in 1975. He was recognized by 
students as a rigorous and demanding teacher who tested their decision-making and 
analytical skills in the classroom. One former student noted in a letter to Dr. Rapp that "the 
training in organization of our time and energy, in establishing priorities, in communication, 
and in cooperation with and responsibility to fellow workers" was "by far the most beneficial 
asset of my college education." 
 
In addition to serving students through direct classroom instruction, Professor Rapp 
developed several case studies to be used as a basis for discussion in various 
undergraduate classes as well as in executive development (now Executive Education) 
programs. 
 
Faculty colleagues elected Dr. Rapp to the Graduate Council where he served on the 
curriculum committee. 
 
He offered executive and personnel development training programs and taught asset and 
liability management programs in the federal home loan bank system for 15 years, 
including programs designed specifically for the Federal Home Loan Banks of Boston, 
Atlanta, Pittsburgh, Cincinnati, Chicago, San Francisco, and Seattle. 
 
On behalf of the University community, the Board of Trustees expresses to the family of 
Professor Emeritus Wilbur A. Rapp its deepest sympathy and sense of understanding of 
their loss. It is directed that this resolution be inscribed upon the minutes of the Board of 
Trustees and that a copy be tendered to his family as an expression of the Board’s heartfelt 
sympathy. 
 
 

Marcus H. Sandver 
 
The Board of Trustees of The Ohio State University expresses its sorrow upon the death 
on September 18, 2011, of Marcus H. Sandver, Professor Emeritus in the Department of 
Management and Human Resources in The Max M. Fisher College of Business.  
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Professor Sandver was born in Bethesda, Maryland, on August 13, 1949. He grew up in 
Silverton, Oregon, and earned his B.A. degree in economics from Pacific Lutheran 
University in 1970, his M.A. degree in labor relations from the University of Colorado in 
1973, and his Ph.D. degree in labor relations from the University of Wisconsin in 1976. 
 
Dr. Sandver became a member of The Ohio State University faculty as an assistant 
professor in 1976 and served for 35 years before retiring in June of 2011. He received 
tenure in 1982 and was promoted to full professor in 1991. 
 
His primary areas of research interest included collective bargaining, mediation, and 
compensation issues. Professor Sandver authored his first book, Labor Relations: Process 
and Outcomes, in 1987. He made numerous presentations at academic conferences, and 
received two Fulbright Professorships to present at Istanbul University and Marmara 
University. During his career he was actively involved in over 90 state and regional 
arbitrations and fact-findings. 
 
Marc provided significant service to the University. Although too extensive for a complete 
listing, his contributions included membership on the University Senate in various 
capacities from 1994-2007, participation in University-wide orientation sessions, service to 
no fewer than five Graduate School committees, and appointment to several University-
level committees related to benefits, salaries, and employment disputes. In 1991 he began 
a three-year term as Ph.D. program chair in the Fisher College of Business and served as 
acting chair of the Department of Management and Human Resources in 1988. 
 
Professor Sandver had planned to return to the classroom as an Emeritus Professor and 
was scheduled to teach a course in human resources negotiations during autumn quarter 
of 2011. 
 
On behalf of the University community, the Board of Trustees expresses to the family of 
Professor Emeritus Marcus H. Sandver its deepest sympathy and sense of understanding 
of their loss. It is directed that this resolution be inscribed upon the minutes of the Board of 
Trustees and that a copy be tendered to his family as an expression of the Board’s heartfelt 
sympathy. 

 
*** 

 
UNIVERSITY FOUNDATION REPORT 

Resolution No. 2012-62 
 
Synopsis: The University Foundation Report as of December 31, 2011, is presented for 
Board acceptance. 
 
WHEREAS monies are solicited and received on behalf of the University from alumni, 
industry, and various individuals in support of research, instructional activities, and service; 
and 
 
WHEREAS such gifts are received through The Ohio State University Development Fund 
and The Ohio State University Foundation; and 
 
WHEREAS this report includes the establishment of the Vig/Williams Endowed Chair in 
Orthodontics and The Chief Justice Thomas J. Moyer Professorship for the Administration 
of Justice and Rule of Law; the establishment of forty-six (46) named endowed funds; and 
the revision of five (5) named endowed funds; and the closure of two (2) named endowed 
funds: 
 
NOW THEREFORE 
 
BE IT RESOLVED, That the acceptance of the report from The Ohio State University 
Foundation as of December 31, 2011, be approved.  
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(See Appendix XXI for background information, page 455.) 
 

UNIVERSITY FOUNDATION REPORT 
Total  
Gifts 

Establishment of Named Endowed Funds 
 
The Century Bond Repayment Endowment Fund $10,000,000.00 
(Established with a portion of gain on a Treasury (Not gift money) 
rate lock transaction; used to help cover the interest payments on the 
$500,000,000 century bonds until paid and the bonds defeased) 
 
The Sneed Family Alumni Association Scholarship Endowment $50,000.00 
Fund 
(Established with gifts from Thomas and Phyllis Sneed; used to 
provide scholarships to currently enrolled students at any of OSU’s 
campuses not receiving freshman recruiting) 
 
4-H Equine Endowment Fund $40,575.00 
(Established with gifts from Schneider Saddlery Company, Inc. and 
friends of the 4-H Equine program; used to equally support the Ohio 
4-H Horse Achievement Award and 4-H Equine programs) 
(grandfathered) 
 
OSU Wyandot County Alumni Scholarship Endowment Fund $30,545.00 
(Established with gifts from alumni and friends; used to provide 
scholarship support for students from Wyandot County, Ohio) 
(grandfathered) 
 
William A. Henson Endowed Mathematics Student Travel Fund $25,200.00 
(Established with gifts from William A. Henson; used to support 
students in the Department of Mathematics so they may participate 
in academic and professional events beyond the OSU campus) 
(grandfathered) 
 
Paul P. and Annabelle W. Mechling Scholarship Fund $25,119.95 
(Established with gifts from Paul P. Mechling and Annabelle W. 
Mechling; used to equally to provide scholarships for students 
studying agriculture education in the College of Food, Agricultural, 
and Environmental Sciences and human ecology education in the 
College of Education and Human Ecology) (grandfathered) 
 
OSU Alumni Club of Philadelphia, Pennsylvania Endowment $25,000.00 
Fund 
(Established with gifts from alumni and friends; used for scholarships 
for students from Philadelphia, Pennsylvania) (grandfathered) 
 
Change in Name and Description of Named Endowed Fund 
 
From: OSU Medical Center Autism Endowment Fund in Neurology 
To:  The OSU Medical Center Autism Endowment Fund at Nisonger Center 
 
Establishment of Named Endowed Chair 
 
Vig/Williams Endowed Chair in Orthodontics $1,519,906.51 
(Established with gifts from alumni and friends to honor Dr. Katherine 
Vig and Dr. Benjamin Williams; used to provide salary and program 
support to a distinguished faculty member in the Section of 
Orthodontics in the College of Dentistry) (grandfathered)  
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Establishment of Named Endowed Professorship 
 
The Chief Justice Thomas J. Moyer Professorship for the  $1,002,000.00 
Administration of Justice and Rule of Law 
(Established with memorial gifts from friends, family, and colleagues; 
used to support a professorship position at the Moritz College of Law) 
 
The Keith and Linda Monda International Experience  $1,010,781.25 
Scholarships Fund  
(Established with gifts from Keith D. and Linda L. Monda; used to 
provide scholarships for students in the College of Arts and Sciences 
to participate in study-abroad programs) 
 
The Stanley D. and Joan H. Ross Chair Fund in Neuromodulation $1,000,000.00 
(Established with gifts from Stanley D. and Joan H. Ross; used for a 
chair position supporting a physician faculty member in the field of 
brain neuromodulation in the Department of Neurological Surgery) 
 
The Ann W. La Fontaine and John Garfield Williams  $500,000.00 
Distinguished Scholars Endowment Fund 
(Established with gifts from the estate of Ann W. La Fontaine; used 
to provide merit-based scholarships) 
 
The Wandell Family Football Defensive Coordinator Endowment $392,105.48 
Fund 
(Established with a gift from Deborah and Keith Wandell; to 
supplement costs of funding defensive coordinator positions for the 
football program) 
 
The Lloyd L. Mambourg Agriculture Student Support Endowment $266,833.00 
Fund  
(Established with funding from a charitable remainder trust created 
by Lorayne G. Mambourg; used to support scholarships for students 
attending the College of Food, Agricultural, and Environmental 
Sciences) 
 
The Hugh B. and Marie Carr Williams Distinguished  $200,000.00 
Scholars Endowment Fund 
(Established with gifts from the estate of Ann W. La Fontaine; used 
to provide merit-based scholarships) 
 
The Sally Lee Huston Endowed Scholarship Fund in  $161,073.05 
the College of Veterinary Medicine 
(Established with an estate gift from Sally Lee Huston; to provide 
scholarship support for outstanding students in the College of 
Veterinary Medicine from Clinton County, Ohio) 
 
Establishment of Named Endowed Funds 
The Ruth C. Bailey Endowed Award Fund for Naturalized $100,000.00 
American Students 
(Established with a gift from Mr. Vincenzo Ferranti; used to further 
the mission of the Office of Diversity and Inclusion by providing 
scholarships to students who are foreign born, naturalized American 
citizens) 
 
The Mary Beth Fontana Wise M.D. Faculty Development and  $100,000.00 
Medical Education Fund 
(Established with gifts from Dr. Mary Beth Fontana Wise; used for the 
Master Teacher program in the College of Medicine)  
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Ronald E. Myers, DDS, Diplomate, American Board  $75,000.00 
of Prosthodontics, Scholarship Fund 
(Established with an estate gift from Dr. Ronald E. Myers and Ms. 
Kathleen Ann Kiefer; used to provide scholarships for students 
pursuing a D.D.S. degree) 
 
The Albert M. Wiggins, Jr. Dean’s Discretionary Fund $75,000.00 
(Established with a charitable gift annuity from Albert M. Wiggins, Jr.; 
used by the dean of the College of Business) 
 
The Al Wiggins Men’s Swimming Scholarship Fund $75,000.00 
(Established with a charitable gift annuity from Albert M. Wiggins, Jr.; 
used to supplement the grant-in-aid scholarship costs of an 
intercollegiate student-athlete who is a member of the men’s 
swimming team) 
 
Lois Kemp Shinkle Memorial Scholarship Fund in History $62,493.22 
(Established with an estate gift from Lois Kemp Shinkle; used to 
support students and programs with a focus on education within the 
Department of History) 
 
The Telich Family Scholarship Fund $60,000.00 
(Established with a gift from MJPT II and Associates, Ltd.; used to 
supplement the grant-in-aid scholarship costs of an intercollegiate 
student-athlete who is a member of the football team) 
 
The Betty Finke Bonnell, R.N. Scholarship Fund $53,671.14 
(Established with a gift from Susan Jane Bonnell in honor of her 
mother, Betty; used to provide financial aid to a student who is a 
member of The Ohio State University Marching Band) 
 
The Elizabeth Heller Fox Fund for Study Abroad $51,171.78 
(Established with gifts from The Fox Foundation in honor of Elizabeth 
Heller Fox; used to provide study abroad support for undergraduate 
students in the College of Food, Agricultural, and Environmental 
Sciences) 
 
The Robert L. and Phyllis J. Iles Award Fund for the Graduate $50,200.00 
Study of Myth 
(Established with a gift from Sarah Iles Johnston; used for one award 
each spring quarter for a graduate student to support the student’s 
research on myth) 
 
The Paul A. and Barbara D. Fodor Endowed Engineering $50,077.50 
Scholarship Fund 
(Established with gifts from Barbara D. Fodor in memory of her 
husband Paul A. Fodor; used for undergraduate scholarships for 
engineering majors) 
 
The Harold R. Adams Scholarship Fund $50,000.00 
(Established with gifts from Kevin Adams in memory of his father, 
Harold R. Adams; used to provide scholarships to freshmen in the 
College of Food, Agricultural, and Environmental Sciences) 
 
Dr. Bruce W. Dunnington Engineering Scholarship Endowment $50,000.00 
Fund 
(Established with a gift from Adele Foley in honor of Dr. Bruce W. 
Dunnington; used to provide scholarships to students in the College 
of Engineering)  
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The Nell Ann Frump Memorial Scholarship Fund $50,000.00 
(Established with a gift from Timothy A. Frump; used for scholarships 
for undergraduate students who are graduates of Leesburg Fairfield 
High School) 
 
The Richard C. Castor and Eva N. Castor Gross Scholarship  $50,000.00 
Fund 
(Established with a gift from Eva Castor Gross; used to provide 
scholarships to undergraduate students with preference given to 
graduates of Nelsonville York High School) 
 
The Tim and Jo Ellen Hayes Scholarship Endowment Fund $50,000.00 
(Established with a gift from Timothy and Jo Ellen Hayes; used to 
provide scholarships for students in the College of Veterinary 
Medicine) 
 
The Gladys Mason Scholarship Fund $50,000.00 
(Established with an estate gift from Gladys Mason; used to provide 
scholarships for students in the College of Education and Human 
Ecology) 
 
The Tomski Family Athletic Scholarship Fund $50,000.00 
(Established with a gift from TH Manufacturing; used to supplement 
the grant-in-aid scholarship costs of an intercollegiate student-athlete 
who is a member of the women’s gymnastics team) 
 
The Albert M. Wiggins, Jr. Longaberger Building Fund $50,000.00 
(Established with a charitable gift annuity from Albert M. Wiggins, Jr.; 
used for maintenance and capital improvements for the Longaberger 
Alumni House) 
 
The Al Wiggins Discretionary Fund for Men’s Swimming $50,000.00 
(Established with a charitable gift annuity from Albert M. Wiggins, Jr.; 
used at the discretion of the coach of the men’s swimming team) 
 
The Rudolph Family Fund $42,500.74 
(Established with a gift from Fred J. Rudolph; used to equally 
supplement “The John H. Dunlap, Jr. Fund for Education, Outreach, 
and Development at Stone Laboratory” and the “Sheila and Gene 
Smith Northwest Ohio Athletic Scholarship Fund”) (grandfathered) 
 
Eileen Grice Consumer Sciences Teacher Education Scholarship $35,776.12 
Fund  
(Established with gifts in memory of Eileen Grice from numerous 
donors; used to provide scholarship support to students preparing for 
careers in family and consumer sciences secondary teaching) 
(grandfathered) 
 
Hervida 4-H Camp Endowment Fund $28,720.63 
(Established with gifts from friends of Hervida 4-H Camp; used to 
support Hervida 4-H Camp) (grandfathered) 
 
Wayne K. Hoy and Anita Woolfolk Hoy Scholarship Fund $27,124.63 
(Established with gifts from Dr. Wayne K. Hoy and Dr. Anita Woolfolk 
Hoy; used to provide scholarships for students in the College of 
Education and Human Ecology) (grandfathered) 
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The Robert G. Gottesman Excellence in Viticulture and Enology $26,785.67 
Endowment Fund 
(Established with gifts made from members of the Ohio Wine and 
Grape Association; used to support faculty and students within the 
viticulture and enology program) (grandfathered) 
 
The Michael L. Scott Fund for Technology Education $26,474.11 
(Established with gifts made in memory of Dr. Michael L. Scott from 
numerous donors; used to purchase equipment for the Technology 
Education Program in the College of Education and Human Ecology) 
(grandfathered) 
 
The Mike and Jill Eversole Nolan and Family Study Abroad Fund $26,080.00 
(Established with a gift from Mike and Jill Eversole Nolan; used for 
scholarships for undergraduate students enrolled in an approved 
study abroad program in the College of Food, Agricultural, and 
Environmental Sciences) (grandfathered) 
 
Buckeye Leadership Workshop Endowment Fund $25,617.38 
(Established with gifts from friends of Buckeye Leadership 
Workshop, Inc.; used to provide awards for OSU Extension staff and 
faculty, Ohio 4-H members and volunteers, and/or OSU Extension 
volunteers to attend the Buckeye Leadership Workshop) 
(grandfathered) 
 
Food, Agricultural and Biological Engineering (FABE) $25,450.00 
Departmental Student Organizations Development Fund 
(Established with gifts from Thomas L. Bean, FABE Student 
Organizations, alumni, and friends of the department; used to enrich 
experiences for students participating in student clubs and 
organizations within the Department of FABE) (grandfathered) 
 
Ohio State Fair Hall of Fame Junior Fair Board Scholarship $25,085.00 
Endowment Fund 
(Established with gifts from Ohio State Fair Hall of Fame recipients 
and friends; used to provide scholarship awards to members of the 
Ohio State Fair Junior Fair Board) (grandfathered) 
 
Norman Levine Memorial Endowment Fund $25,000.00 
(Established with anonymous gifts from a grateful student of 
Professor Levine; used at the discretion of the director of the 
University Libraries) (unrestricted) 
 
The Kanaan Beckwith Sievers Fund  $25,000.00 
(Established with gifts from Samira Beckwith; used to provide support 
split between three specific areas to be used at the discretion of each 
area’s top administrator) (unrestricted) 
 
Change in Name of Named Endowed Fund 
 
From: Kathleen Retzler Memorial 4-H Endowment Fund for Clermont County 
To:  Clermont County 4-H Endowment Fund in Memory of Kathleen Retzler 
 
Change in Name and Description of Named Endowed Funds 
 
From: Hrusovsky Family / GroundWork Group Internship Fund 
To:  Hrusovsky Family Internship Fund  
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From: Donald D. Mayhew Memorial Fellowship Endowment Fund 
To:  Donald D. Mayhew Memorial Scholarship Fund  
 
From: Photography Endowment Fund 
To:  Arthur and Geraldine Nelson Photography Endowment Fund 
 
 Total Gifts $7,791,367.16 
 
Establishment of Named Endowed Funds 
 

The Century Bond Repayment Endowment Fund 
 
The Century Bond Repayment Endowment Fund was established February 10, 2012, by 
the Board of Trustees of The Ohio State University with a transfer from a portion of the 
proceeds from a gain on a Treasury rate lock transaction. 
 
Until the earlier of 1) when market value and realized distribution combined reach 
$500,000,000, or 2) June 1, 2111 has been reached, the annual distribution from this 
endowed fund shall be reinvested in the endowment principal. 
 
If the combined market value and realized distribution reaches $500,000,000 before June 
1, 2111, then $500,000,000 shall be withdrawn from this fund and placed in an operating 
fund account (segregated for the purpose of paying off the $500,000,000 principal of the 
General Receipts Bonds Series 2011 A due on June 1, 2111). The annual distribution from 
the remainder of this fund, and principal if needed, shall then be used to help cover the 
interest payments on the $500,000,000 century bonds. Once all century bond payments, 
both interest and principal, have been made or the bonds defeased, this endowment fund 
will dissolve and the remainder will be used at the discretion of the chief financial officer 
and senior vice president for Business and Finance in consultation with the president. 
 
If the fund does not reach $500,000,000 by June 1, 2111, the fund will terminate and all 
available market value and distribution will be used to pay the $500,000,000 principal. 
Additional University funds will be used to cover the difference. 
 
The investment and management of and expenditures from all endowment funds shall be 
in accordance with University policies and procedures as approved by the Board of 
Trustees. As authorized by the Board of Trustees, a fee may be assessed against the 
endowment portfolio for the University’s costs of development and fund management. 
 
Should unforeseen circumstances arise in the future so that the need for this endowment 
ceases to exist, then another use shall be designated by the University’s Board of Trustees 
in consultation with the chief financial officer and senior vice president for Business and 
Finance in consultation with the president. 
 
Amount Establishing Endowment: $10,000,000.00 (not gift money) 
 

The Sneed Family Alumni Association Scholarship Endowment Fund 
 
The Sneed Family Alumni Association Scholarship Endowment Fund was established 
February 10, 2012, by the Board of Trustees of The Ohio State University, with gifts from 
Thomas (B.S. 1981) and Phyllis (Ph.D. 1985) Sneed of Houston, Texas. 
 
The annual distribution from this fund shall provide undergraduate scholarships to currently 
enrolled students at any of The Ohio State University campuses not receiving freshman 
recruiting scholarships (i.e. Maximus and Morrill Programs), with preference given based 
on academic performance and financial need. The scholarship may be renewed based 
upon continued superior academic performance and financial need. One or more of the 
scholarships shall be used to support educational diversity at the University with particular 
attention to, but not limited to, African Americans or other underrepresented groups. 
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Scholarships will be awarded by the Alumni Association in consultation with Office of 
Student Financial Aid. 
 
The Ohio State University’s mission and admissions policy supports educational diversity. 
The University may modify any criteria used to select scholarship recipients should the 
criteria be found, in whole or in part, to be contrary to federal or state law or University 
policy. 
 
In any given year that the endowment distribution is not fully used for its intended purpose, 
the unused portion should be held in the distribution account to be used in subsequent 
years and only for the purposes of the endowment, or reinvested in the endowment 
principal at the discretion of the director of Student Financial Aid.  
 
The investment and management of and expenditures from all endowment funds shall be 
in accordance with University policies and procedures as approved by the Board of 
Trustees. As authorized by the Board of Trustees, a fee may be assessed against the 
endowment portfolio for the University's costs of development and fund management. 
 
It is the desire of the donors that the endowment established herein should benefit the 
University in perpetuity. Should unforeseen circumstances arise in the future so that the 
need for this endowment ceases to exist, then another use as nearly aligned with the 
original intent of the contribution as good conscience and need dictate shall be designated 
by the University’s Board of Trustees. In making this alternate designation, the Board shall 
seek advice from the donors, if possible, and from the director of the Alumni Association 
and the director of Student Financial Aid.  
 
Amount Establishing Endowment: $50,000.00 
 

4-H Equine Endowment Fund 
 
The 4-H Equine Endowment Fund was established February 10, 2012, by the Board of 
Trustees of The Ohio State University, with gifts from Schneider Saddlery Company, Inc. 
and friends of the 4-H Equine program. 
 
One half of the annual distribution from this fund shall be used to support the Ohio 4-H 
Horse Achievement Award sponsored by Schneider Saddlery Company, Inc. If this award 
ceases to exist, this portion of the annual distribution may be used for other 4-H Equine 
programming needs.  
 
The remaining half of the annual distribution shall be used to support 4-H Equine programs 
including, but not limited to, education and programs for 4-H youth, 4-H volunteer training, 
and awards and recognition for 4-H members. Expenditures from this fund must be 
approved by the assistant director of OSU Extension for 4-H Youth Development or his/her 
designee. 
 
In any given year that the endowment distribution is not fully used for its intended purpose, 
the unused portion should be held in the distribution account to be used in subsequent 
years and only for the purposes of the endowment, or reinvested in the endowment 
principal at the discretion of the vice president for Agricultural Administration and executive 
dean for Food, Agricultural, and Environmental Sciences in consultation with the assistant 
director of OSU Extension for 4-H Youth Development. 
 
The investment and management of and expenditures from all endowment funds shall be 
in accordance with University policies and procedures as approved by the Board of 
Trustees. As authorized by the Board of Trustees, a fee may be assessed against the 
endowment portfolio for the University’s costs of development and fund management.  
 
It is the desire of the donors that the endowment established herein should benefit the 
University in perpetuity. Should unforeseen circumstances arise in the future so that the 
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need for this endowment ceases to exist, then another use as nearly aligned with the 
original intent of the contribution as good conscience and need dictate shall be designated 
by the University’s Board of Trustees. In making this alternate designation, the Board shall 
seek advice from the vice president for Agricultural Administration and executive dean for 
Food, Agricultural, and Environmental Sciences in consultation with the assistant director 
of OSU Extension for 4-H Youth Development. 
 
Amount Establishing Endowment: $40,575.00 (grandfathered) 
 

OSU Wyandot County Alumni Scholarship Endowment Fund 
 
The OSU Wyandot County Alumni Scholarship Endowment Fund was established 
February 10, 2012, by the Board of Trustees of The Ohio State University, with gifts from 
alumni and friends. 
 
The annual distribution from this fund shall provide scholarship support for students from 
Wyandot County, Ohio. Scholarship recipients shall be selected by the director of the Office 
of Student Financial Aid. 
 
The Ohio State University’s mission and admissions policy supports educational diversity. 
The University may modify any criteria used to select scholarship recipients should the 
criteria be found, in whole or in part, to be contrary to federal or state law or University 
policy. 
 
In any given year that the endowment distribution is not fully used for its intended purpose, 
the unused portion should be held in the distribution account to be used in subsequent 
years and only for the purposes of the endowment, or reinvested in the endowment 
principal at the discretion of the director of the Office of Student Financial Aid. 
 
The investment and management of and expenditures from all endowment funds shall be 
in accordance with University policies and procedures as approved by the Board of 
Trustees. As authorized by the Board of Trustees, a fee may be assessed against the 
endowment portfolio for the University’s costs of development and fund management.  
 
It is the desire of the donors that the endowment established herein should benefit the 
University in perpetuity. Should unforeseen circumstances arise in the future so that the 
need for this endowment ceases to exist, then another use as nearly aligned with the 
original intent of the contribution as good conscience and need dictate shall be designated 
by the University’s Board of Trustees. In making this alternate designation, the Board shall 
seek advice from a representative of the donors, if possible, and from the director of the 
Office of Student Financial Aid.  
 
Amount Establishing Endowment: $30,545.00 (grandfathered) 
 

William A. Henson Endowed Mathematics Student Travel Fund 
 
The William A. Henson Endowed Mathematics Student Travel Fund be established 
February 10, 2012, by the Board of Trustees of The Ohio State University, with gifts from 
William A. Henson (B.S. 1978). 
 
The annual distribution from this fund shall be used to enable undergraduate and/or 
graduate students in the Department of Mathematics in the College of Arts and Sciences 
to participate in academic and professional events beyond The Ohio State University 
campus at the discretion of the chairperson with approval from the executive dean of the 
College of Arts and Sciences. 
 
In any given year that the endowment distribution is not fully used for its intended purpose, 
the unused portion should be reinvested in the endowment principal.  
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The investment and management of and expenditures from all endowment funds shall be 
in accordance with University policies and procedures as approved by the Board of 
Trustees. As authorized by the Board of Trustees, a fee may be assessed against the 
endowment portfolio for the University’s costs of development and fund management.  
 
It is the desire of the donor that the endowment established herein should benefit the 
University in perpetuity. Should unforeseen circumstances arise in the future so that the 
need for this endowment ceases to exist, then another use as nearly aligned with the 
original intent of the contribution as good conscience and need dictate shall be designated 
by the University’s Board of Trustees. In making this alternate designation, the Board shall 
seek advice from the donor, if possible, and from the executive dean of the College of Arts 
and Sciences. 
 
Amount Establishing Endowment: $25,200.00 (grandfathered) 
 

Paul P. and Annabelle W. Mechling Scholarship Fund 
 
The Paul P. and Annabelle W. Mechling Scholarship Fund was established February 10, 
2012, by the Board of Trustees of The Ohio State University, with gifts from Paul P. 
Mechling (B.S. 1942 Agriculture Education, M.S. 1954 Agriculture Education) and 
Annabelle W. Mechling (B.S. 1942 Home Economics). 
 
The annual distribution from this fund shall be used to equally support scholarships in 
agriculture education in the College of Food, Agricultural, and Environmental Sciences and 
human ecology education in the College of Education and Human Ecology at The Ohio 
State University main campus or regional campuses including the Agricultural Technical 
Institute. Qualified candidates must be from Champaigne, Darke, Fairfield, Hocking, 
Muskingum or Perry Counties in Ohio and have a minimum 2.75 GPA during year of 
application. Preference shall be given to students who are current or former members of 
Ohio 4-H or Ohio FFA. In the event there are no qualified students from the counties 
specified the scholarship may be awarded to a student from anywhere in Ohio. 
 
Recipients shall be selected by the scholarship selection committee in each college in 
accordance with the guidelines approved by the respective dean, and in consultation with 
the University’s Office of Student Financial Aid.  
 
The Ohio State University’s mission and admissions policy supports educational diversity. 
The University may modify any criteria used to select scholarship recipients should the 
criteria be found, in whole or in part, to be contrary to federal or state law or University 
policy. 
 
In any given year that the endowment distribution is not fully used for its intended purpose, 
the unused portion should be reinvested in the endowment principal. 
 
The investment and management of and expenditures from all endowment funds shall be 
in accordance with University policies and procedures as approved by the Board of 
Trustees. As authorized by the Board of Trustees, a fee may be assessed against the 
endowment portfolio for the University’s costs of development and fund management.  
 
It is the desire of the donors that the endowment established herein should benefit the 
University in perpetuity. Should unforeseen circumstances arise in the future so that the 
need for this endowment ceases to exist, then another use as nearly aligned with the 
original intent of the contribution as good conscience and need dictate shall be designated 
by the University’s Board of Trustees. In making this alternate designation, the Board shall 
seek advice from the donors, if possible, and the vice president for agricultural 
administration and executive dean for Food, Agricultural, and Environmental Sciences, and 
the dean of the College of Education and Human Ecology.  
 
Amount Establishing Endowment: $25,119.95 (grandfathered)  



February 10, 2012 meeting, Board of Trustees 
 

402 

OSU Alumni Club of Philadelphia, Pennsylvania Endowment Fund 
 
The OSU Alumni Club of Philadelphia, Pennsylvania Endowment Fund be established 
February 10, 2012, by the Board of Trustees of The Ohio State University, with gifts from 
alumni and friends. 
 
The annual distribution from this fund shall provide merit-based scholarships for students 
from Philadelphia, Pennsylvania. Scholarship recipients shall be selected by the director 
of the Office of Student Financial Aid. 
 
The Ohio State University’s mission and admissions policy supports educational diversity. 
The University may modify any criteria used to select scholarship recipients should the 
criteria be found, in whole or in part, to be contrary to federal or state law or University 
policy. 
 
In any given year that the endowment distribution is not fully used for its intended purpose, 
the unused portion should be held in the distribution account to be used in subsequent 
years and only for the purposes of the endowment, or reinvested in the endowment 
principal at the discretion of the director of the Office of Student Financial Aid.  
 
The investment and management of and expenditures from all endowment funds shall be 
in accordance with University policies and procedures as approved by the Board of 
Trustees. As authorized by the Board of Trustees, a fee may be assessed against the 
endowment portfolio for the University’s costs of development and fund management.  
 
It is the desire of the donors that the endowment established herein should benefit the 
University in perpetuity. Should unforeseen circumstances arise in the future so that the 
need for this endowment ceases to exist, then another use as nearly aligned with the 
original intent of the contribution as good conscience and need dictate shall be designated 
by the University’s Board of Trustees. In making this alternate designation, the Board shall 
seek advice from a representative of the donors, if possible, and from the director of the 
Office of Student Financial Aid.  
 
Amount Establishing Endowment: $25,000.00 (grandfathered) 
 
Change in Name and Description of Named Endowed Fund 
 

The OSU Medical Center Autism Endowment Fund at Nisonger Center 
 
The OSU Medical Center Autism Endowment Fund in Neurology was established 
September 22, 2006, by the Board of Trustees of The Ohio State University, in honor of 
David Beversdorf M.D. with support from Stephen Strasser, Ph.D. (retired associate 
professor of Health Services Management and Policy) of Dublin, Ohio. The name and 
description were revised February 10, 2012. 
 
The annual distribution from this fund shall support research and professional education 
and training programs on the diagnosis, treatment, and cure of autism and/or related 
conditions or diseases. Income allocation shall be made at the recommendation of the 
director of Nisonger Center in consultation with the senior vice president for Health 
Sciences. Support may be provided for, but is not limited to: lectures by visiting faculty; 
supplies or equipment; conference, travel or publishing costs for research or educational 
purposes; implementation of new instructional technology or teaching models; or for 
fellowships or scholarships. 
 
In any given year that the endowment distribution is not fully used for its intended purpose, 
the unused portion should be held in the distribution account to be used in subsequent 
years and only for the purposes of the endowment, or reinvested in the endowment 
principal at the discretion of the director of Nisonger Center. 
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The investment and management of and expenditures from all endowment funds shall be 
in accordance with University policies and procedures as approved by the Board of 
Trustees. As authorized by the Board of Trustees, a fee may be assessed against the 
endowment portfolio for the University’s costs of development and fund management. 
 
It is the desire of the donor that the endowment established herein should benefit the 
University in perpetuity. Should unforeseen circumstances arise in the future so that the 
need for this endowment ceases to exist, then another use as nearly aligned with the 
original intent of the contribution as good conscience and need dictate shall be designated 
by the University’s Board of Trustees. In making this alternate designation, the Board shall 
seek advice from the donor (or their representative) and as recommended by the director 
of Nisonger Center in consultation with the senior vice president for Health Sciences. 
 
Establishment of Named Endowed Chair 
 

Vig/Williams Endowed Chair in Orthodontics 
 
The College of Dentistry Endowed Chair Fund in Orthodontics was established May 6, 
2005, by the Board of Trustees of The Ohio State University in accordance with the 
guidelines approved by the Board of Directors of The Ohio State University Foundation, 
with gifts from alumni and friends to honor Dr. Katherine Vig and Dr. Benjamin Williams, 
two former chairs of the Section of Orthodontics. The name was revised April 4, 2008. The 
funding level was reached and the chair was established February 10, 2012. 
 
The annual distribution shall be used to provide salary and program support to a 
distinguished faculty member in the Section of Orthodontics in the College of Dentistry. 
The holder of this position will be recommended to the executive vice president and provost 
by the dean of the College of Dentistry in consultation with the chair of the Section of 
Orthodontics and approved by the Board of Trustees. 
 
In any given year that the endowment distribution is not fully used for its intended purpose, 
the unused portion should be held in the distribution account to be used in subsequent 
years and only for the purposes of the endowment, or reinvested in the endowment 
principal at the discretion of the dean of the College of Dentistry and the chair of the Section 
of Orthodontics. 
 
The investment and management of and expenditures from all endowment funds shall be 
in accordance with University policies and procedures as approved by the Board of 
Trustees. As authorized by the Board of Trustees, a fee may be assessed against the 
endowment portfolio for the University’s costs of development and fund management. 
 
It is the desire of the donors that the endowment established herein should benefit the 
University in perpetuity. Should unforeseen circumstances arise in the future so that the 
need for this endowment ceases to exist, then another use as nearly aligned with the 
original intent of the contribution as good conscience and need dictate shall be designated 
by the Foundation’s Board of Directors and the University’s Board of Trustees. In making 
this alternate designation, the Boards shall seek advice from the dean of the College of 
Dentistry and the chair of the Section of Orthodontics. 
 
Amount Establishing Chair: $1,519,906.51 (grandfathered) 
 
Establishment of Named Endowed Professorship 
 

The Chief Justice Thomas J. Moyer Professorship  
for the Administration of Justice and Rule of Law 

 
The Chief Justice Thomas J. Moyer Professorship for the Administration of Justice and 
Rule of Law was established February 10, 2012, by the Board of Trustees of The Ohio 
State University in accordance with the guidelines approved by the Board of Directors of 



February 10, 2012 meeting, Board of Trustees 
 

404 

The Ohio State University Foundation, with memorial gifts from friends, family, and 
colleagues to honor and continue Chief Justice Moyer’s legacy of integrity and 
professionalism, deepening the impact of these qualities on the lives of countless students 
and on the law itself. 
 
The annual distribution shall support a professorship position at The Michael E. Moritz 
College of Law. The holder of this position will be recommended by the dean of the Moritz 
College of Law to the executive vice president and provost and to the Board of Trustees 
for their approval.  
 
In any given year that the endowment distribution is not fully used for its intended purpose, 
the unused portion should be held in the distribution account to be used in subsequent 
years and only for the purposes of the endowment, or reinvested in the endowment 
principal at the discretion of the dean of the Moritz College of Law.  
 
The investment and management of and expenditures from all endowment funds shall be 
in accordance with University policies and procedures as approved by the Board of 
Trustees. As authorized by the Board of Trustees, a fee may be assessed against the 
endowment portfolio for the University’s costs of development and fund management.  
 
It is the desire of the donors that the endowment established herein should benefit the 
University in perpetuity. Should unforeseen circumstances arise in the future so that the 
need for this endowment ceases to exist, then another use as nearly aligned with the 
original intent of the contribution as good conscience and need dictate shall be designated 
by the Foundation’s Board of Directors and the University’s Board of Trustees. In making 
this alternate designation, the Boards shall seek advice from the dean of the Moritz College 
of Law.  
 
Amount Establishing Professorship: $1,002,000.00 
 
Establishment of Named Endowed Funds 
 

The Keith and Linda Monda International Experience Scholarships Fund 
 
The Keith and Linda Monda International Experience Scholarships Fund was established 
February 10, 2012, by the Board of Trustees of The Ohio State University in accordance 
with the guidelines approved by the Board of Directors of The Ohio State University 
Foundation, with gifts from Keith D. (B.S. 1968, M.A. 1971) and Linda L. Monda.  
 
The annual distribution from this fund shall be used to provide need-based scholarships 
for students enrolled in the College of Arts and Sciences to participate in study-abroad 
programs. Expenses may include, but are not limited to travel, housing, program fees, and 
other costs associated with living and studying in a foreign country. A committee of faculty 
appointed by the executive dean of the College of Arts and Sciences shall select the 
scholarship recipients. The Office of Student Programs in the College of Arts and Sciences 
shall administer the program in consultation with the University’s Office of Student Financial 
Aid.  
 
The Ohio State University’s mission and admissions policy supports educational diversity. 
The University may modify any criteria used to select scholarship recipients should the 
criteria be found, in whole or in part, to be contrary to federal or state law or University 
policy. 
 
In any given year that the endowment distribution is not fully used for its intended purpose, 
the unused portion should be held in the distribution account to be used in subsequent 
years and only for the purposes of the endowment. 
 
The investment and management of and expenditures from all endowment funds shall be 
in accordance with University policies and procedures as approved by the Board of 
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Trustees. As authorized by the Board of Trustees, a fee may be assessed against the 
endowment portfolio for the University’s costs of development and fund management.  
 
It is the desire of the donors that the endowment established herein should benefit the 
University in perpetuity. Should unforeseen circumstances arise in the future so that the 
need for this endowment ceases to exist, then another use as nearly aligned with the 
original intent of the contribution as good conscience and need dictate shall be designated 
by the Foundation’s Board of Directors and the University’s Board of Trustees. In making 
this alternate designation, the Boards shall seek advice from the donors, if possible, and 
from the executive dean of the College of Arts and Sciences.  
 
Amount Establishing Endowment: $1,010,781.25 
Total Commitment: $5,000,000.00 
 

The Stanley D. and Joan H. Ross Chair Fund in Neuromodulation 
 
The Stanley D. and Joan H. Ross Chair Fund in Neuromodulation was established 
February 10, 2012, by the Board of Trustees of The Ohio State University in accordance 
with the guidelines approved by the Board of Directors of The Ohio State University 
Foundation, with gifts from Stanley D. Ross (B.A. English 1962) and Joan “Jodi” H. Ross 
of Columbus, Ohio. 
 
Until the principal balance reaches $2,000,000, the annual distribution from this fund shall 
be held in the distribution fund. After the principal balance reaches $2,000,000, the annual 
distribution from this fund shall be used for a chair position supporting a nationally or 
internationally recognized physician faculty member in the field of brain neuromodulation 
in the Department of Neurological Surgery, with a preference for the holder to be the 
director of the Center for Neuromodulation. 
 
The chair holder shall be appointed by the Board of Trustees of The Ohio State University 
as recommended by the chairperson of the Department of Neurological Surgery and 
approved by the senior vice president for Health Sciences and the dean of the College of 
Medicine. The activities of the chair holder shall be reviewed no less than every four years 
by the dean to determine compliance with the intent of the donors, as well as the academic 
and research standards of the University. 
 
In any given year that the endowment distribution is not fully used for its intended purpose, 
the unused portion should be held in the distribution account to be used in subsequent 
years and only for the purposes of the endowment, or reinvested in the endowment 
principal at the discretion of the director or chairperson.  
 
The investment and management of and expenditures from all endowment funds shall be 
in accordance with University policies and procedures as approved by the Board of 
Trustees. As authorized by the Board of Trustees, a fee may be assessed against the 
endowment portfolio for the University’s costs of development and fund management. 
 
It is the desire of the donors that the endowment established herein should benefit the 
University in perpetuity. Should unforeseen circumstances arise in the future so that the 
need for this endowment ceases to exist, then another use as nearly aligned with the 
original intent of the contribution as good conscience and need dictate shall be designated 
by the Foundation’s Board of Directors and the University’s Board of Trustees. In making 
this alternate designation, the Boards shall seek advice from a representative of the 
donors, and as recommended by the chairperson of the Department of Neurological 
Surgery in consultation with the dean of the College of Medicine and the senior vice 
president for Health Sciences. 
 
Amount Establishing Endowment: $1,000,000.00 
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The Ann W. La Fontaine and John Garfield Williams 
Distinguished Scholars Endowment Fund 

 
The Ann W. La Fontaine and John Garfield Williams Distinguished Scholars Endowment 
Fund was established February 10, 2012, by the Board of Trustees of The Ohio State 
University in accordance with the guidelines approved by the Board of Directors of The 
Ohio State University Foundation, with gifts from the estate of Ann W. La Fontaine (B.S. 
1937) of Stuart, Florida, honoring her brother, John Garfield Williams (B.S. 1946) of Oak 
Harbor, Ohio. 
 
The annual distribution from this fund shall provide one or more merit scholarships for Ann 
W. La Fontaine and John Garfield Williams Distinguished Scholars. Recipients shall be 
National Merit Scholars and selected based upon the criteria for Distinguished Scholars. 
This fund shall be administered by the University Honors Center in consultation with the 
Office of Student Financial Aid.  
 
The Ohio State University’s mission and admissions policy supports educational diversity. 
The University may modify any criteria used to select scholarship recipients should the 
criteria be found, in whole or in part, to be contrary to federal or state law or University 
policy. 
 
In any given year that the endowment distribution is not fully used for its intended purpose, 
the unused portion should be held in the distribution account to be used in subsequent 
years and only for the purposes of the endowment, or reinvested in the endowment 
principal at the discretion of the director of the University Honors Center. 
 
The investment and management of and expenditures from all endowment funds shall be 
in accordance with University policies and procedures as approved by the Board of 
Trustees. As authorized by the Board of Trustees, a fee may be assessed against the 
endowment portfolio for the University’s costs of development and fund management.  
 
It is the desire of the donor that the endowment established herein should benefit the 
University in perpetuity. Should unforeseen circumstances arise in the future so that the 
need for this endowment ceases to exist, then another use as nearly aligned with the 
original intent of the contribution as good conscience and need dictate shall be designated 
by the Foundation’s Board of Directors and the University’s Board of Trustees. In making 
this alternate designation, the Boards shall seek advice from the director of the University 
Honors Center.  
 
Amount Establishing Endowment: $500,000.00 
 

The Wandell Family Football Defensive Coordinator Endowment Fund 
 
The Wandell Family Football Defensive Coordinator Endowment Fund was established 
February 10, 2012, by the Board of Trustees of The Ohio State University in accordance 
with the guidelines approved by the Board of Directors of The Ohio State University 
Foundation, with a gift from Deborah and Keith Wandell from Mequon, Wisconsin. 
 
The annual distribution from this fund shall supplement the cost of funding defensive 
coordinator positions for the football program at The Ohio State University, as approved by 
the director of the Department of Athletics.  
 
In any given year that the endowment distribution is not fully used for its intended purpose, 
the unused portion should be held in the distribution account to be used in subsequent 
years and only for the purposes of the endowment, or reinvested in the endowment 
principal at the discretion of the director of the Department of Athletics.  
 
The investment and management of and expenditures from all endowment funds shall be 
in accordance with University policies and procedures as approved by the Board of 
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Trustees. As authorized by the Board of Trustees, a fee may be assessed against the 
endowment portfolio for the University’s costs of development and fund management.  
 
It is the desire of the donors that the endowment established herein should benefit the 
University in perpetuity. Should unforeseen circumstances arise in the future so that the 
need for this endowment ceases to exist, then another use as nearly aligned with the 
original intent of the contribution as good conscience and need dictate shall be designated 
by the Foundation’s Board of Directors and the University’s Board of Trustees. In making 
this alternate designation, the Boards shall seek advice from the donors, if possible, and 
from the director of the Department of Athletics.  
 
Amount Establishing Endowment: $392,105.48 
 

The Lloyd L. Mambourg Agriculture Student Support Endowment Fund 
 
The Lloyd L. Mambourg (B.S. 1954) Agriculture Student Support Endowment Fund was 
established February 10, 2012, by the Board of Trustees of The Ohio State University in 
accordance with the guidelines approved by the Board of Directors of The Ohio State 
University Foundation, with funding from a charitable remainder trust created by Lorayne 
G. Mambourg to honor her husband, with an initial gift of her ancestral land in Granger 
Township, County of Medina, State of Ohio, settled by her family shortly after Ohio became 
a state of the United States. 
 
The annual distribution from this fund shall be used to support scholarships for worthy 
students attending the College of Food, Agricultural, and Environmental Sciences (the 
College) based on financial need, leadership skills, and academic promise. The recipients 
of the scholarships should be those “best and brightest” students who are experiencing 
financial difficulties. Recipients shall be informed about the grantor and her husband, Lloyd 
L. Mambourg, who was an alumnus of the College. Scholarship recipients shall be selected 
by the College’s scholarship selection committee in accordance with guidelines approved 
by the vice president for Agricultural Administration and executive dean of Food, 
Agricultural, and Environmental Sciences or his/her designee, and in consultation with the 
University’s Office of Student Financial Aid. 
 
The Ohio State University’s mission and admissions policy supports educational diversity. 
The University may modify any criteria used to select scholarship recipients should the 
criteria be found, in whole or in part, to be contrary to federal or state law or University 
policy. 
 
Additionally, the funds may be used for an ”excellence program” to provide state-of-the-art 
equipment for the College and to provide for distinguished visitors and speakers, to be 
known as the Mambourg Lectures Program when used for this purpose. The funds also 
may be used for “leadership development” to enable various outside-the-classroom 
student enrichment events and activities, and to augment the executive dean’s emergency 
funds for student financial emergencies. 
 
In any given year that the endowment distribution is not fully used for its intended purpose, 
the unused portion should be held in the distribution account to be used in subsequent 
years and only for the purposes of the endowment, or reinvested in the endowment 
principal at the discretion of the vice president for Agricultural Administration and executive 
dean of Food, Agricultural, and Environmental Sciences. 
 
The investment and management of and expenditures from all endowment funds shall be 
in accordance with University policies and procedures as approved by the Board of 
Trustees. As authorized by the Board of Trustees, a fee may be assessed against the 
endowment portfolio for the University’s costs of development and fund management.  
 
It is the desire of the donor that the endowment established herein should benefit the 
University in perpetuity. Should unforeseen circumstances arise in the future so that the 
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need for this endowment ceases to exist, then another use as nearly aligned with the 
original intent of the contribution as good conscience and need dictate shall be designated 
by the Foundation’s Board of Directors and the University’s Board of Trustees. In making 
this alternate designation, the Boards shall seek advice from the vice president for 
Agricultural Administration and executive dean of Food, Agricultural, and Environmental 
Sciences. 
 
Amount Establishing Endowment: $266,833.00 
 

The Hugh B. and Marie Carr Williams Distinguished Scholars Endowment Fund 
 
The Hugh B. and Marie Carr Williams Distinguished Scholars Endowment Fund was 
established February 10, 2012, by the Board of Trustees of The Ohio State University in 
accordance with the guidelines approved by the Board of Directors of The Ohio State 
University Foundation, with gifts from the estate of Ann W. La Fontaine (B.S. 1937) of 
Stuart, Florida, in memory of her parents.  
 
The annual distribution from this fund shall provide one or more merit scholarships for Hugh 
B. and Marie Carr Williams Distinguished Scholars. Recipients shall be National Merit 
Scholars and selected based upon the criteria for Distinguished Scholars. This fund shall 
be administered by the University Honors Center in consultation with the Office of Student 
Financial Aid.  
 
The Ohio State University’s mission and admissions policy supports educational diversity. 
The University may modify any criteria used to select scholarship recipients should the 
criteria be found, in whole or in part, to be contrary to federal or state law or University 
policy. 
 
In any given year that the endowment distribution is not fully used for its intended purpose, 
the unused portion should be held in the distribution account to be used in subsequent 
years and only for the purposes of the endowment, or reinvested in the endowment 
principal at the discretion of the director of the University Honors Center. 
 
The investment and management of and expenditures from all endowment funds shall be 
in accordance with University policies and procedures as approved by the Board of 
Trustees. As authorized by the Board of Trustees, a fee may be assessed against the 
endowment portfolio for the University’s costs of development and fund management.  
 
It is the desire of the donor that the endowment established herein should benefit the 
University in perpetuity. Should unforeseen circumstances arise in the future so that the 
need for this endowment ceases to exist, then another use as nearly aligned with the 
original intent of the contribution as good conscience and need dictate shall be designated 
by the Foundation’s Board of Directors and the University’s Board of Trustees. In making 
this alternate designation, the Boards shall seek advice from the director of the University 
Honors Center.  
 
Amount Establishing Endowment: $200,000.00 
 

The Sally Lee Huston Endowed Scholarship Fund  
in the College of Veterinary Medicine 

 
The Sally Lee Huston Endowed Scholarship Fund in the College of Veterinary Medicine 
was established February 10, 2012, by the Board of Trustees of The Ohio State University 
in accordance with the guidelines approved by the Board of Directors of The Ohio State 
University Foundation, with an estate gift from Sally Lee Huston.  
 
The annual distribution from this fund shall provide scholarship support for one or two 
outstanding student(s) in the College of Veterinary Medicine from Clinton County, Ohio. 
Recipients will be selected by the dean of the College of Veterinary Medicine in 
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consultation with the University’s Office of Student Financial Aid and the associate dean 
for Student Affairs 
 
The Ohio State University’s mission and admissions policy supports educational diversity. 
The University may modify any criteria used to select scholarship recipients should the 
criteria be found, in whole or in part, to be contrary to federal or state law or University 
policy. 
 
In any given year that the endowment distribution is not fully used for its intended purpose, 
the unused portion should be reinvested in the endowment principal.  
 
The investment and management of and expenditures from all endowment funds shall be 
in accordance with University policies and procedures as approved by the Board of 
Trustees. As authorized by the Board of Trustees, a fee may be assessed against the 
endowment portfolio for the University’s costs of development and fund management.  
 
It is the desire of the donor that the endowment established herein should benefit the 
University in perpetuity. Should unforeseen circumstances arise in the future so that the 
need for this endowment ceases to exist, then another use as nearly aligned with the 
original intent of the contribution as good conscience and need dictate shall be designated 
by the Foundation’s Board of Directors and the University’s Board of Trustees. In making 
this alternate designation, the Boards shall seek advice from the dean of the College of 
Veterinary Medicine.  
 
Amount Establishing Endowment: $161,073.05 
 

The Ruth C. Bailey Endowed Award Fund for Naturalized American Students 
 
The Ruth C. Bailey Endowed Award Fund for Naturalized American Students was 
established February 10, 2012, by the Board of Trustees of The Ohio State University in 
accordance with the guidelines approved by the Board of Directors of The Ohio State 
University Foundation, with a gift from Mr. Vincenzo Ferranti (B.A. 1970, M.B.A. 1972).  
 
Mr. Ferranti is a naturalized American citizen who was born in Italy. He attended The Ohio 
State University on the G.I. bill and was profoundly touched by the dedication and 
assistance provided to him by Miss Ruth C. Bailey, an Ohio State University staff member 
from 1937-1974. She was the first to step in to handle the thousands of soldiers who flocked 
to the campus after WW II. As the war ended, more students from foreign countries 
expressed an interest in attending Ohio State. Various projects were started to bring these 
students to the University to study. Miss Bailey had the job of getting them situated, and 
started spending more and more time with them as they grew in number. This award will 
carry on her caring tradition by supporting a multicultural student population and 
celebrating excellence in multicultural interaction and understanding provided by Ohio 
State faculty and staff.  
 
The annual distribution from this fund shall be used to further the mission of the Office of 
Diversity and Inclusion. First priority is to provide scholarships to students with 
demonstrated financial need who are foreign born, naturalized American citizens. The 
scholarship may support up to three students annually. Expenditures may include general 
tuition costs, room and board, and/or participation in study abroad programs. Students who 
wish to study Italian culture will be given special priority.  
 
The Office of Diversity and Inclusion shall be responsible for reviewing scholarship 
applications to ensure they meet the above criteria and selecting the scholarship recipients. 
Scholarships shall be awarded in consultation with the Office of International Affairs and 
the Office of Student Financial Aid. Prior to awarding the scholarships, the Office of 
Diversity and Inclusion shall share information about the selected recipients with the donor 
and answer questions about the selection process.  
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The Ohio State University’s mission and admissions policy supports educational diversity. 
The University may modify any criteria used to select scholarship recipients should the 
criteria be found, in whole or in part, to be contrary to federal or state law or University 
policy. If an alternate designation is needed, the Foundation shall seek advice from the 
donor or his designee, and the vice provost for Diversity and Inclusion.  
 
Second priority is to provide awards to faculty and staff of The Ohio State University who 
in the previous year have demonstrated a significant contribution toward multicultural 
interaction and understanding. To qualify, candidates must be nominated by the Office of 
Diversity and Inclusion.  
 
In any given year that the endowment distribution is not fully used for its intended purpose, 
the unused portion should be reinvested in the endowment principal. 
 
The investment and management of and expenditures from all endowment funds shall be 
in accordance with University policies and procedures as approved by the Board of 
Trustees. As authorized by the Board of Trustees, a fee may be assessed against the 
endowment portfolio for the University’s costs of development and fund management.  
 
It is the desire of the donor that the endowment established herein should benefit the 
University in perpetuity. Should unforeseen circumstances arise in the future so that the 
need for this endowment ceases to exist, then another use as nearly aligned with the 
original intent of the contribution as good conscience and need dictate shall be designated 
by the Foundation’s Board of Directors and the University’s Board of Trustees. In making 
this alternate designation, the Boards shall seek advice from the donor, if possible, and the 
vice provost for Diversity and Inclusion.  
 
Amount Establishing Endowment: $100,000.00 
 

The Mary Beth Fontana Wise M.D. Faculty  
Development and Medical Education Fund 

 
The Mary Beth Fontana Wise M.D. Faculty Development and Medical Education Fund was 
established February 10, 2012, by the Board of Trustees of The Ohio State University in 
accordance with the guidelines approved by the Board of Directors of The Ohio State 
University Foundation, with gifts from Dr. Mary Beth Fontana Wise of Columbus, Ohio. 
 
At OSU, Dr. Mary Beth Fontana Wise earned two degrees (B.A. Arts and Sciences 1963, 
M.D. 1966) and completed medical residency and cardiology fellowship training from 1967-
1971. Dr. Fontana Wise joined the faculty of the Department of Internal Medicine in 1970, 
becoming an assistant professor in 1971 and an associate professor in 1976. In 2004, she 
was appointed as Associate Professor Emeritus of Internal Medicine.  
 
During her tenure in the College of Medicine, Dr. Fontana Wise received numerous honors 
and recognitions as a clinician and educator, devoting much of her career to innovative 
medical education and public service. From 1972 with her early involvement with the 
Independent Study Program, later with Integrated Pathway Med I and Med II programs, 
and through the present, her leadership and teaching efforts have greatly strengthened 
curriculum, teaching effectiveness, problem-based learning, medical student experiences, 
CME activities, and recertification courses.  
 
She received the College’s Distinguished Educator Award (1999), Alumni Achievement 
Award (2002), Professor of the Year (2005), Faculty Teaching Award (2011), and the 
Department of Internal Medicine’s Earl N. Metz Distinguished Physician Award of Internal 
Medicine (2004) and Charles F. Wooley MD Transmission of Excellence Teaching Award 
(2000). Additionally, medical students have chosen her 20 times as Outstanding Teacher 
from 1986-2011. Since 2009, she has held The Harry C. and Mary Elizabeth Powelson 
Professorship in Medicine appointment. 
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The annual distribution from this fund shall be used for the Master Teacher program of the 
College of Medicine as an award to current or retired/emeriti faculty of the College 
recognized through the Courage To Teach (CTT) program as exemplary teachers in the 
development of excellent, professional, and humanistic clinical physicians. The award shall 
be known as The Mary Beth Fontana Wise MD Master Teacher Award.  
 
Candidates for the award must be designated as Master Teacher. The goals, 
responsibilities, qualifications and selection process of Master Teacher are defined by CTT 
faculty and the Center of Education and Scholarship (CES) under the Faculty 
Advancement Mentoring and Engagement (FAME) umbrella. Appointment as a Master 
Teacher as well as the selection of Master Teacher award recipients will be made by the 
dean of the College of Medicine on recommendation by CTT and CES. Should the CTT 
and CES cease to exist, the Master Teacher program and this respective award will be 
continued by a committee, of faculty educators dedicated to the principles established by 
CTT, who shall be appointed by the dean of the College of Medicine.  
 
Distribution of funds will occur at the time of Master Teacher designation and will go directly 
to the faculty member, not their department, unless the designee wishes to use the funds 
to obtain release time for teaching from their department. Award funding to a Master 
Teacher may be renewed if criteria for faculty development and employment of active 
education strategies are fulfilled according to guidelines established by CTT and CES. 
 
Distribution will not be used for faculty or administrative salaries or benefits and will be 
allocated by the vice dean for Education in the College of Medicine in consultation with the 
dean of the College of Medicine. 
 
In any given year that the endowment distribution is not fully used for its intended purpose, 
the unused portion should be held in the distribution account to be used in subsequent 
years and only for the purposes of the endowment, or reinvested in the endowment 
principal at the discretion of the dean or vice dean. 
 
The investment and management of and expenditures from all endowment funds shall be 
in accordance with University policies and procedures as approved by the Board of 
Trustees. As authorized by the Board of Trustees, a fee may be assessed against the 
endowment portfolio for the University’s costs of development and fund management. 
 
It is the desire of the donor that the endowment established herein should benefit the 
University in perpetuity. Should unforeseen circumstances arise in the future so that the 
need for this endowment ceases to exist, then another use as nearly aligned with the 
original intent of the contribution as good conscience and need dictate shall be designated 
by the Foundation’s Board of Directors and the University’s Board of Trustees. In making 
this alternate designation, the Boards shall seek advice from a representative of the donor, 
if possible, and as recommended by the vice dean for Education in the College of Medicine 
in consultation with the dean of the College of Medicine. 
 
Amount Establishing Endowment: $100,000.00 
 

Ronald E. Myers, DDS, Diplomate,  
American Board of Prosthodontics, Scholarship Fund 

 
The Ronald E. Myers, DDS, Diplomate, American Board of Prosthodontics, Scholarship 
Fund was established February 10, 2012, by the Board of Trustees of The Ohio State 
University in accordance with the guidelines approved by the Board of Directors of The 
Ohio State University Foundation, with an estate gift from Dr. Ronald E. Myers (B.A. 1973, 
D.D.S. 1979) and Ms. Kathleen Ann Kiefer (B.S. 1974, M.S. 1979) of Brooksville, Florida. 
 
The annual distribution from this fund shall provide scholarships for students pursuing a 
D.D.S. degree within the College of Dentistry. Scholarship recipients shall be selected by 
the dean of the College of Dentistry in consultation with the Office of Student Financial Aid. 
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It is the donors’ desire that the scholarships be awarded with particular attention to, but not 
limited to, students who are veterans of the United States Armed Services who have been 
honorably discharged from their service obligations. If multiple students enrolled in the 
College of Dentistry meet these criteria, the student who demonstrates the highest degree 
of academic merit shall be awarded the scholarship. Scholarships shall be renewable for 
a maximum of three (3) years.  
 
If no candidates exist, or if the annual distribution of the fund exceeds the tuition liabilities 
of all qualified students, the annual distribution should be awarded to a student or students 
with unmet tuition responsibilities who demonstrate a financial need and have the highest 
degree of academic merit. 
 
The Ohio State University’s mission and admissions policy supports educational diversity. 
The University may modify any criteria used to select scholarship recipients should the 
criteria be found, in whole or in part, to be contrary to federal or state law or University 
policy. 
 
The investment and management of and expenditures from all endowment funds shall be 
in accordance with University policies and procedures as approved by the Board of 
Trustees. As authorized by the Board of Trustees, a fee may be assessed against the 
endowment portfolio for the University’s costs of development and fund management.  
 
In any given year that the endowment distribution is not fully used for its intended purpose, 
the unused portion should be held in the distribution account to be used in subsequent 
years and only for the purposes of the endowment, or reinvested in the endowment 
principal at the discretion of the dean of the College of Dentistry.  
 
It is the desire of the donors that the endowment established herein should benefit the 
University in perpetuity. Should unforeseen circumstances arise in the future so that the 
need for this endowment ceases to exist, then another use as nearly aligned with the 
original intent of the contribution as good conscience and need dictate shall be designated 
by the Foundation’s Board of Directors and the University’s Board of Trustees. In making 
this alternate designation, the Boards shall seek advice from the dean of the College of 
Dentistry.  
 
Amount Establishing Endowment: $75,000.00 
 

The Albert M. Wiggins, Jr. Dean’s Discretionary Fund 
 
The Albert M. Wiggins, Jr. Dean’s Discretionary Fund was established February 10, 2012, 
by the Board of Trustees of The Ohio State University in accordance with the guidelines 
approved by the Board of Directors of The Ohio State University Foundation, with a 
charitable gift annuity from Albert M. Wiggins, Jr. (B.S. 1957) of Ligonier, Pennsylvania.  
 
The annual distribution from this fund shall be used by the dean of The Max M. Fisher 
College of Business to support such activities of the faculty, students, and staff as he or 
she shall determine to be in accordance with the strategic plans of the College.  
 
In any given year that the endowment distribution is not fully used for its intended purpose, 
the unused portion should be held in the distribution account to be used in subsequent 
years and only for the purposes of the endowment, or reinvested in the endowment 
principal at the discretion of the dean of the Fisher College of Business. 
 
The investment and management of and expenditures from all endowed funds shall be in 
accordance with University policies and procedures as approved by the Board of Trustees. 
As authorized by the Board of Trustees, a fee may be assessed against the endowment 
portfolio for the University’s cost of development and fund management.  
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It is the desire of the donor that the endowment established herein should benefit the 
University in perpetuity. Should unforeseen circumstances arise in the future so that the 
need for this endowment ceases to exist, then another use as nearly aligned with the 
original intent of the contribution as good conscience and need dictate shall be designated 
by the Foundation’s Board of Directors and the University’s Board of Trustees. In making 
this alternate designation, the Boards shall seek advice from the dean of the Fisher College 
of Business. 
 
Amount Establishing Endowment: $75,000.00  
 

The Al Wiggins Men’s Swimming Scholarship Fund 
 
The Al Wiggins Men’s Swimming Scholarship Fund was established February 10, 2012, 
by the Board of Trustees of The Ohio State University in accordance with the guidelines 
approved by the Board of Directors of The Ohio State University Foundation, with a 
charitable gift annuity from Albert M. Wiggins, Jr. (B.S. 1957) of Ligonier, Pennsylvania.  
 
The annual distribution from this fund shall be used to supplement the grant-in-aid 
scholarship costs of an intercollegiate student-athlete who is pursuing an undergraduate 
degree and is a member of the men’s varsity swimming team. Scholarship recipients shall 
be selected by the director of the Department of Athletics in consultation with the 
University’s Office of Student Financial Aid.  
 
The Ohio State University’s mission and admissions policy supports educational diversity. 
The University may modify any criteria used to select scholarship recipients should the 
criteria be found, in whole or in part, to be contrary to federal or state law or University 
policy. 
 
In any given year that the endowment distribution is not fully used for its intended purpose, 
the unused portion should be held in the distribution account to be used in subsequent 
years and only for the purposes of the endowment, or reinvested in the endowment 
principal at the discretion of the director of the Department of Athletics in consultation with 
the coach of the men’s swimming team.  
 
The investment and management of and expenditures from all endowed funds shall be in 
accordance with University policies and procedures as approved by the Board of Trustees. 
As authorized by the Board of Trustees, a fee may be assessed against the endowment 
portfolio for the University’s cost of development and fund management.  
 
It is the desire of the donor that the endowment established herein should benefit the 
University in perpetuity. Should unforeseen circumstances arise in the future so that the 
need for this endowment ceases to exist, then another use as nearly aligned with the 
original intent of the contribution as good conscience and need dictate shall be designated 
by the Foundation’s Board of Directors and the University’s Board of Trustees. In making 
this alternate designation, the Boards shall seek advice from the director of the Department 
of Athletics in consultation with the coach of the men’s swimming team.  
 
Amount Establishing Endowment: $75,000.00  
 

Lois Kemp Shinkle Memorial Scholarship Fund in History 
 
The Lois Kemp Shinkle Memorial Scholarship Fund in History was established February 
10, 2012, by the Board of Trustees of The Ohio State University in accordance with the 
guidelines approved by the Board of Directors of The Ohio State University Foundation, 
with an estate gift from Lois Kemp Shinkle (B.S. 1943).  
 
The annual distribution from this fund shall provide support to students and programs with 
a focus on education within the Department of History as recommended by the 
Department’s chairperson and approved by the executive dean of the College of Arts and 
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Sciences. Scholarship recipients shall be selected in consultation with the University’s 
Office of Student Financial Aid.  
 
The Ohio State University’s mission and admissions policy supports educational diversity. 
The University may modify any criteria used to select scholarship recipients should the 
criteria be found, in whole or in part, to be contrary to federal or state law or University 
policy. 
 
In any given year that the endowment distribution is not fully used for its intended purpose, 
the unused portion should be held in the distribution account to be used in subsequent 
years and only for the purposes of the endowment, or reinvested in the endowment 
principal at the discretion of the executive dean of the College of Arts and Sciences in 
consultation with the chairperson of the Department of History. 
 
The investment and management of and expenditures from all endowment funds shall be 
in accordance with University policies and procedures as approved by the Board of 
Trustees. As authorized by the Board of Trustees, a fee may be assessed against the 
endowment portfolio for the University’s costs of development and fund management.  
 
It is the desire of the donor that the endowment established herein should benefit the 
University in perpetuity. Should unforeseen circumstances arise in the future so that the 
need for this endowment ceases to exist, then another use as nearly aligned with the 
original intent of the contribution as good conscience and need dictate shall be designated 
by the Foundation’s Board of Directors and the University’s Board of Trustees. In making 
this alternate designation, the Boards shall seek advice from the executive dean of the 
College of Arts and Sciences in consultation with the chairperson of the Department of 
History. 
 
Amount Establishing Endowment: $62,493.22 
 

The Telich Family Scholarship Fund 
 
The Telich Family Scholarship Fund was established February 10, 2012, by the Board of 
Trustees of The Ohio State University in accordance with the guidelines approved by the 
Board of Directors of The Ohio State University Foundation, with a gift from MJPT II and 
Associates, Ltd.  
 
The annual distribution from this fund shall supplement the grant-in-aid scholarship costs 
of an intercollegiate student-athlete who is a member of the football team and is pursuing 
an undergraduate degree at The Ohio State University. Recipients shall be selected by the 
director of the Department of Athletics in consultation with the Office of Student Financial 
Aid.  
 
The Ohio State University’s mission and admissions policy supports educational diversity. 
The University may modify any criteria used to select scholarship recipients should the 
criteria be found, in whole or in part, to be contrary to federal or state law or University 
policy. 
 
In any given year that the endowment distribution is not fully used for its intended purpose, 
the unused portion should be held in the distribution account to be used in subsequent 
years and only for the purposes of the endowment, or reinvested in the endowment 
principal at the discretion of the director of the Department of Athletics.  
 
The investment and management of and expenditures from all endowment funds shall be 
in accordance with University policies and procedures as approved by the Board of 
Trustees. As authorized by the Board of Trustees, a fee may be assessed against the 
endowment portfolio for the University’s costs of development and fund management.  
 



February 10, 2012 meeting, Board of Trustees 
 

415 

It is the desire of the donor that the endowment established herein should benefit the 
University in perpetuity. Should unforeseen circumstances arise in the future so that the 
need for this endowment ceases to exist, then another use as nearly aligned with the 
original intent of the contribution as good conscience and need dictate shall be designated 
by the Foundation’s Board of Directors and the University’s Board of Trustees. In making 
this alternate designation, the Boards shall seek advice from a representative of the donor, 
if possible, and from the director of the Department of Athletics.  
 
Amount Establishing Endowment: $60,000.00 
Total Commitment: $150,000.00 
 

The Betty Finke Bonnell, R.N. Scholarship Fund 
 
The Betty Finke Bonnell, R.N. Scholarship Fund was established February 10, 2012, by 
the Board of Trustees of The Ohio State University in accordance with the guidelines 
approved by the Board of Directors of The Ohio State University Foundation, with a gift 
from Susan Jane Bonnell (B.A. 1970) in honor of her mother, Betty (Cert. 1937).  
 
The annual distribution from this fund shall provide financial aid to a student who is a 
member of The Ohio State University Marching Band. Recipients shall be selected by the 
director of the Marching Band in consultation with the University’s Office of Student 
Financial Aid.  
 
The Ohio State University’s mission and admissions policy supports educational diversity. 
The University may modify any criteria used to select scholarship recipients should the 
criteria be found, in whole or in part, to be contrary to federal or state law or University 
policy. 
 
In any given year that the endowment distribution is not fully used for its intended purpose, 
the unused portion should be held in the distribution account to be used in subsequent 
years and only for the purposes of the endowment, or reinvested in the endowment 
principal at the discretion of the director of the Marching Band.  
 
The investment and management of and expenditures from all endowment funds shall be 
in accordance with University policies and procedures as approved by the Board of 
Trustees. As authorized by the Board of Trustees, a fee may be assessed against the 
endowment portfolio for the University’s costs of development and fund management.  
 
It is the desire of the donor that the endowment established herein should benefit the 
University in perpetuity. Should unforeseen circumstances arise in the future so that the 
need for this endowment ceases to exist, then another use as nearly aligned with the 
original intent of the contribution as good conscience and need dictate shall be designated 
by the Foundation’s Board of Directors and the University’s Board of Trustees. In making 
this alternate designation, the Boards shall seek advice from the donor, if possible, and the 
director of the Marching Band.  
 
Amount Establishing Endowment: $53,671.14 
 

The Elizabeth Heller Fox Fund for Study Abroad 
 
The Elizabeth Heller Fox Fund for Study Abroad was established February 10, 2012, by 
the Board of Trustees of The Ohio State University in accordance with the guidelines 
approved by the Board of Directors of The Ohio State University Foundation, with gifts from 
The Fox Foundation in honor of Elizabeth Heller Fox (B.S. 2011 Landscape Horticulture), 
daughter of Elizabeth (B.A. 1986 Political Science) and Robert Fox. 
 
The annual distribution from the fund shall be used to provide study abroad scholarship 
support for undergraduate students in the College of Food, Agricultural, and Environmental 
Sciences who are participating in study abroad programs. Preference shall be given to 
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those students majoring in Sustainable Plant Systems with Horticulture or Landscape 
Design specializations. Recipients shall be selected by the College’s scholarship selection 
committee in accordance with guidelines established by the vice president for Agricultural 
Administration and executive dean of Food, Agricultural, and Environmental Sciences, and 
in consultation with the Office of Student Financial Aid.  
 
The Ohio State University’s mission and admissions policy supports educational diversity. 
The University may modify any criteria used to select scholarship recipients should the 
criteria be found, in whole or in part, to be contrary to federal or state law or University 
policy. 
 
As sufficient funds are available, it is the donor’s preference to have scholarship awards 
equivalent to 100% of the cost of the study abroad program including airfare. This 
preference shall not preclude the College from making awards of lesser amounts based on 
the number and needs of qualified candidates. 
 
In any given year that the endowment distribution is not fully used for its intended purposes, 
the unused portion should be held in the distribution account to be used in subsequent 
years and only for the purposes of the endowment, or reinvested in the endowment 
principal at the discretion of the vice president for Agricultural Administration and executive 
dean of Food, Agricultural, and Environmental Sciences.  
 
The investment and management of and expenditures from all endowment funds shall be 
in accordance with University policies and procedures as approved by the Board of 
Trustees. As authorized by the Board of Trustees, a fee may be assessed against the 
endowment portfolio for the University’s costs of development and fund management. 
 
It is the desire of the donor that the endowment established herein should benefit the 
University in perpetuity. Should unforeseen circumstances arise in the future so that the 
need for this endowment ceases to exist, then another use as nearly aligned with the 
original intent of the contribution as good conscience and need dictate shall be designated 
by the Foundation’s Board of Directors and the University’s Board of Trustees. In making 
this alternate designation, the Boards shall seek advice from the donor, should it exist, and 
from the vice president for Agricultural Administration and executive dean of Food, 
Agricultural, and Environmental Sciences. 
 
Amount Establishing the Endowment: $51,171.78 
 

The Robert L. and Phyllis J. Iles Award for the Graduate Study of Myth 
 
The Robert L. and Phyllis J. Iles Award for the Graduate Study of Myth in the Center for 
the Study of Religion was established February 10, 2012, by the Board of Trustees of The 
Ohio State University in accordance with the guidelines approved by the Board of Directors 
of The Ohio State University Foundation, with a gift from Sarah Iles Johnston.  
 
The annual distribution from this fund shall be used for one award of up to $2,000 each 
spring quarter to a graduate student in the Division of Arts and Humanities in support of 
that student’s research on myth. The award shall be supplemented by $1,000 from the 
Division of the Arts and Humanities and supplemented by up to $1,000 from the student’s 
home department for a possible total of up to $4,000. Studies of the myths of any culture 
from any period of human history are eligible for consideration. A myth is a story that is 
sacred to and shared by a group of people who find important meanings in it, as it is 
conveyed through narrative, art or ritual. Eligible projects include, but are not limited to: the 
relationships between myths and religious practices, the uses of myth in literary and artistic 
productions, and the reuse of one culture’s myths by other cultures. Possible approaches 
include, but are not limited to, the anthropological, the literary, the historical, and the 
folkloric, as well as creative approaches that aim to re-present a myth as part of a new 
artistic product.  
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Candidates will be selected based on merit, although some preference will be given to 
proposals that cite specific need of funding for travel or for other expenses related to 
research or to performance or production of artistic projects. Preference will be given to 
candidates whose projects are part of a doctoral dissertation (with exceptions granted for 
students in departments that offer only the master’s degree). Recipients shall be selected 
by the executive dean of the College of Arts and Sciences, the director of the Center for 
the Study of Religion, the director for the Center of Folklore Studies, and a member of the 
Department of Greek and Latin as appointed by the chairperson in consultation with the 
Office of Student Financial Aid and Sarah Iles Johnston or their appointee. If the Center for 
the Study of Religion ceases to exist as an independent entity at The Ohio State University, 
then the endowment will be placed in the Department of Greek and Latin and the selection 
process will remain in place.  
 
The Ohio State University’s mission and admissions policy supports educational diversity. 
The University may modify any criteria used to select scholarship recipients should the 
criteria be found, in whole or in part, to be contrary to federal or state law or University 
policy. 
 
In any given year that the endowment distribution is not fully used for its intended purpose, 
the unused portion should be reinvested in the endowment principal.  
 
The investment and management of and expenditures from all endowment funds shall be 
in accordance with University policies and procedures as approved by the Board of 
Trustees. As authorized by the Board of Trustees, a fee may be assessed against the 
endowment portfolio for the University’s costs of development and fund management.  
 
It is the desire of the donor that the endowment established herein should benefit the 
University in perpetuity. Should unforeseen circumstances arise in the future so that the 
need for this endowment ceases to exist, then another use as nearly aligned with the 
original intent of the contribution as good conscience and need dictate shall be designated 
by the Foundation’s Board of Directors and the University’s Board of Trustees. In making 
this alternate designation, the Boards shall seek advice from the donor, if possible, and 
from the executive dean of the College of Arts and Sciences.  
 
Amount Establishing Endowment: $50,200.00 
 

The Paul A. and Barbara D. Fodor Endowed Engineering Scholarship Fund 
 
The Paul A. and Barbara D. Fodor Endowed Engineering Scholarship Fund was 
established February 10, 2012, by the Board of Trustees of The Ohio State University in 
accordance with the guidelines approved by the Board of Directors of The Ohio State 
University Foundation, with gifts from Barbara D. Fodor in memory of her husband Paul A. 
Fodor (B.S. Chemical Engineering 1940).  
 
The annual distribution from this fund shall provide a scholarship to an undergraduate 
student in good academic standing, with a minimum grade point average of 2.5, who is 
majoring in engineering and demonstrates financial need. This scholarship shall be 
renewable for a maximum of eight semesters as long as the recipient continues to fulfill all 
selection criteria. Recipients shall be selected by the dean of the College of Engineering in 
consultation with the University’s Office of Student Financial Aid.  
 
The Ohio State University’s mission and admissions policy supports educational diversity. 
The University may modify any criteria used to select scholarship recipients should the 
criteria be found, in whole or in part, to be contrary to federal or state law or University 
policy. 
 
In any given year that the endowment distribution is not fully used for its intended purpose, 
the unused portion should be reinvested in the endowment principal. 
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The investment and management of and expenditures from all endowment funds shall be 
in accordance with University policies and procedures as approved by the Board of 
Trustees. As authorized by the Board of Trustees, a fee may be assessed against the 
endowment portfolio for the University’s costs of development and fund management.  
 
It is the desire of the donor that the endowment established herein should benefit the 
University in perpetuity. Should unforeseen circumstances arise in the future so that the 
need for this endowment ceases to exist, then another use as nearly aligned with the 
original intent of the contribution as good conscience and need dictate shall be designated 
by the Foundation’s Board of Directors and the University’s Board of Trustees. In making 
this alternate designation, the Boards shall seek advice from the donor, if possible, and the 
dean of the College of Engineering.  
 
Amount Establishing Endowment: $50,077.50 
 

The Harold R. Adams Scholarship Fund 
 
The Harold R. Adams Scholarship Fund was established February 10, 2012, by the Board 
of Trustees of The Ohio State University in accordance with the guidelines approved by 
the Board of Directors of The Ohio State University Foundation, with gifts from Kevin 
Adams (B.S. 1983 Animal Science, M.S. 1986 Agricultural Economics) of Covington, 
Louisiana, in memory of his father, Harold R. Adams (B.S. 1951 Animal Science). 
 
The annual distribution shall be used to support one or more scholarships in the College 
of Food, Agricultural, and Environmental Sciences excluding the School of Environment 
and Natural Resources. Eligible students must be entering freshmen on the Columbus, 
Ohio, campus and graduates of one of the following Highland County, Ohio, high schools, 
Fairfield, Hillsboro, White Oak, Greenfield, and Lynchburg Clay, with at least a 2.5 
cumulative grade point average, and with demonstrated leadership in co-curricular 
activities. Preference shall be given to students with financial need. The scholarship may 
be awarded to the same students in successive years, not to exceed two years, provided 
the students remain in good academic standing, progress towards their degrees, and 
continue to meet the scholarship’s criteria including at least a 2.5 cumulative grade point 
average. 
 
Scholarship recipients shall be selected by the College’s scholarship selection committee 
in accordance with guidelines approved by the vice president for Agricultural Administration 
and the executive dean of Food, Agricultural, and Environmental Sciences, and in 
consultation with the University’s Office of Student Financial Aid. 
 
The Ohio State University’s mission and admissions policy supports educational diversity. 
The University may modify any criteria used to select scholarship recipients should the 
criteria be found, in whole or in part, to be contrary to federal or state law or University 
policy. 
 
In any given year that the endowment distribution is not fully used for its intended purposes, 
the unused portion should be reinvested in the endowment principal.  
 
The investment and management of and expenditures from all endowment funds shall be 
in accordance with University policies and procedures as approved by the Board of 
Trustees. As authorized by the Board of Trustees, a fee may be assessed against the 
endowment portfolio for the University’s costs of development and fund management.  
 
It is the desire of the donor that the endowment established herein should benefit the 
University in perpetuity. Should unforeseen circumstances arise in the future so that the 
need for this endowment ceases to exist, then another use as nearly aligned with the 
original intent of the contribution as good conscience and need dictate shall be designated 
by the Foundation’s Board of Directors and the University’s Board of Trustees. In making 
this alternate designation, the Boards shall seek advice from the donor, if possible, and 
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from the vice president for Agricultural Administration and the executive dean of Food, 
Agricultural, and Environmental Sciences. 
 
Amount Establishing Endowment: $50,000.00  
 

Dr. Bruce W. Dunnington Engineering Scholarship Endowment Fund 
 
The Dr. Bruce W. Dunnington Engineering Scholarship Endowment Fund was established 
February 10, 2012, by the Board of Trustees of The Ohio State University in accordance 
with the guidelines approved by the Board of Directors of The Ohio State University 
Foundation, with a gift from Adele Foley in honor of Dr. Bruce W. Dunnington (B.S. 1948, 
M.S. 1949, Ph.D. 1951). 
 
Bruce was born in Lore City, Ohio, on November 26, 1924. His mother died when he was 
14 having suffered for 10 years with Tuberculosis. During that period Bruce was shifted 
back and forth from his maternal and paternal grandmothers. At 17 he went to work in the 
steel mills and at 18 enlisted in the U.S. Army in 1942. Because he was very intelligent, 
the army sent him to school for meteorology. After the war he enrolled at Ohio State. 
 
Dr. Bruce Dunnington was the founder and president of Glennel Corporation, now well-
known as Wendt USA; Dunnington Division. Bruce was known worldwide as an expert on 
diamond abrasives, dressing products, and diamond finishing processes. Early in his 
distinguished career he worked at DuPont as a senior research supervisor for the Atomic 
Energy Division. Later he was involved in diamond development activities, was co-inventor 
of the process for synthesizing diamond, and was instrumental in commercializing this 
valuable new product. He also held a position at Battelle Institute where he was active in 
the development of nuclear fuels and other advanced materials. 
 
The annual distribution from this fund shall be used to provide scholarship support to 
students enrolled in the College of Engineering who are first generation college students 
demonstrating financial need. Scholarship recipients shall be selected by the College’s 
scholarship committee in consultation with the University’s Office of Student Financial Aid. 
The scholarships are renewable as long as recipients maintain a minimum 3.0 grade point 
average.  
 
The Ohio State University’s mission and admissions policy supports educational diversity. 
The University may modify any criteria used to select scholarship recipients should the 
criteria be found, in whole or in part, to be contrary to federal or state law or University 
policy. 
 
In any given year that the endowment distribution is not fully used for its intended purpose, 
the unused portion should be held in the distribution account to be used in subsequent 
years and only for the purposes of the endowment, or reinvested in the endowment 
principal at the discretion of the dean of the College of Engineering.  
 
The investment and management of and expenditures from all endowment funds shall be 
in accordance with University policies and procedures as approved by the Board of 
Trustees. As authorized by the Board of Trustees, a fee may be assessed against the 
endowment portfolio for the University’s costs of development and fund management.  
 
It is the desire of the donor that the endowment established herein should benefit the 
University in perpetuity. Should unforeseen circumstances arise in the future so that the 
need for this endowment ceases to exist, then another use as nearly aligned with the 
original intent of the contribution as good conscience and need dictate shall be designated 
by the Foundation’s Board of Directors and the University’s Board of Trustees. In making 
this alternate designation, the Boards shall seek advice from the donor, if possible, and 
from the dean of the College of Engineering.  
 
Amount Establishing Endowment: $50,000.00  
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The Nell Ann Frump Memorial Scholarship Fund 
 
The Nell Ann Frump Memorial Scholarship Fund was established February 10, 2012, by 
the Board of Trustees of The Ohio State University in accordance with the guidelines 
approved by the Board of Directors of The Ohio State University Foundation, with a gift 
from Timothy A. Frump (B.S. 1987) of Taylorville, Illinois. 
 
The annual distribution from this fund shall provide one or more non-renewable 
scholarships to undergraduate students with demonstrated financial need who are 
graduates of Leesburg Fairfield High School. First preference will be given to entering 
freshmen who are enrolled at the Columbus campus. Second preference will be given to 
entering freshmen who are enrolled at any OSU campus. Third preference will be given to 
current undergraduate student(s) who are enrolled at the Columbus campus. Fourth 
preference will be given to current undergraduate student(s) who are enrolled at any OSU 
campus. If there are no eligible candidates from the preferred high school or if the preferred 
high school ceases to exist, consideration may be given to residents of Highland County, 
Ohio. Scholarship recipients shall be selected by the University’s Office of Student 
Financial Aid.  
 
The Ohio State University’s mission and admissions policy supports educational diversity. 
The University may modify any criteria used to select scholarship recipients should the 
criteria be found, in whole or in part, to be contrary to federal or state law or University 
policy. 
 
In any given year that the endowment distribution is not fully expended, the unused portion 
should be reinvested in the endowment principal. 
 
The investment and management of and expenditures from all endowment funds shall be 
in accordance with University policies and procedures as approved by the Board of 
Trustees. As authorized by the Board of Trustees, a fee may be assessed against the 
endowment portfolio for the University’s costs of development and fund management.  
 
It is the desire of the donor that the endowment established herein should benefit the 
University in perpetuity. Should unforeseen circumstances arise in the future so that the 
need for this endowment ceases to exist, then another use as nearly aligned with the 
original intent of the contribution as good conscience and need dictate shall be designated 
by the Foundation’s Board of Directors and the University’s Board of Trustees. In making 
this alternate designation, the Boards shall seek advice from the donor, if possible, and 
from the director of the Office of Student Financial Aid.  
 
Amount Establishing Endowment: $50,000.00 
 

The Richard C. Castor and Eva N. Castor Gross Scholarship Fund 
 
The Richard C. Castor and Eva N. Castor Gross Scholarship Fund was established 
February 10, 2012, by the Board of Trustees of The Ohio State University in accordance 
with the guidelines approved by the Board of Directors of The Ohio State University 
Foundation, with a gift from Eva Castor Gross of Dayton, Ohio. 
 
The annual distribution from this fund shall provide one or more renewable merit-based 
scholarships to undergraduate students with preference given to graduates of Nelsonville 
York High School in Nelsonville, Ohio. If there are no eligible candidates from the preferred 
high school or if the preferred high school no longer exists, consideration may be given to 
residents of Athens County, Ohio. Scholarships are renewable for up to 12 quarters (or 8 
semesters) as long as the recipient(s) maintains a cumulative 3.0 grade point average. 
Scholarships may be used for tuition, room and board, books, and supplies. Scholarship 
recipients will be selected by the Office of Student Financial Aid.  
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The Ohio State University’s mission and admissions policy supports educational diversity. 
The University may modify any criteria used to select scholarship recipients should the 
criteria be found, in whole or in part, to be contrary to federal or state law or University 
policy. 
 
In any given year that the endowment distribution is not fully expended, the unused portion 
should be reinvested in the endowment principal. 
 
The investment and management of and expenditures from all endowment funds shall be 
in accordance with University policies and procedures as approved by the Board of 
Trustees. As authorized by the Board of Trustees, a fee may be assessed against the 
endowment portfolio for the University’s costs of development and fund management.  
 
It is the desire of the donor that the endowment established herein should benefit the 
University in perpetuity. Should unforeseen circumstances arise in the future so that the 
need for this endowment ceases to exist, then another use as nearly aligned with the 
original intent of the contribution as good conscience and need dictate shall be designated 
by the Foundation’s Board of Directors and the University’s Board of Trustees. In making 
this alternate designation, the Boards shall seek advice from the donor, if possible, and 
from the director of the Office of Student Financial Aid.  
 
Amount Establish Endowment: $50,000.00 
 

The Tim and Jo Ellen Hayes Scholarship Endowment Fund 
 
The Tim and Jo Ellen Hayes Scholarship Endowment Fund was established February 10, 
2012, by the Board of Trustees of The Ohio State University in accordance with the 
guidelines approved by the Board of Directors of The Ohio State University Foundation, 
with a gift from Timothy (B.S. 1973, D.V.M. 1974) and Jo Ellen (B.S. 1971, M.S. 1972, J.D. 
1993) Hayes from Cambridge, Ohio. 
 
The annual distribution from this fund shall provide one scholarship for a student enrolled 
in The Ohio State University, College of Veterinary Medicine who is in good academic 
standing with preference given to students from Guernsey, Noble, or Muskingum counties 
of Ohio. Scholarship recipients shall be selected by the dean of the College of Veterinary 
Medicine in consultation with the University’s Office of Student Financial Aid.  
 
The Ohio State University’s mission and admissions policy supports educational diversity. 
The University may modify any criteria used to select scholarship recipients should the 
criteria be found, in whole or in part, to be contrary to federal or state law or University 
policy. 
 
In any given year that the endowment distribution is not fully used for its intended purpose, 
the unused portion should be reinvested in the endowment principal.  
 
The investment and management of and expenditures from all endowment funds shall be 
in accordance with University policies and procedures as approved by the Board of 
Trustees. As authorized by the Board of Trustees, a fee may be assessed against the 
endowment portfolio for the University’s costs of development and fund management.  
 
It is the desire of the donors that the endowment established herein should benefit the 
University in perpetuity. Should unforeseen circumstances arise in the future so that the 
need for this endowment ceases to exist, then another use as nearly aligned with the 
original intent of the contribution as good conscience and need dictate shall be designated 
by the Foundation’s Board of Directors and the University’s Board of Trustees. In making 
this alternate designation, the Boards shall seek advice from the donors, if possible, and 
from the dean of the College of Veterinary Medicine.  
 
Amount Establishing Endowment: $50,000.00  
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The Gladys Mason Scholarship Fund 
 
The Gladys Mason Scholarship Fund was established February 10, 2012, by the Board of 
Trustees of The Ohio State University in accordance with the guidelines approved by the 
Board of Directors of The Ohio State University Foundation, with an estate gift from Gladys 
Mason (B.S. 1929).  
 
The annual distribution from this fund shall provide scholarships for students enrolled in 
the College of Education and Human Ecology, Department of Human Nutrition or dietetic 
programs. Scholarship recipients shall be recommended by the Department’s chairperson 
and selected by the College’s dean in consultation with the University’s Office of Student 
Financial Aid.  
 
The Ohio State University’s mission and admissions policy supports educational diversity. 
The University may modify any criteria used to select scholarship recipients should the 
criteria be found, in whole or in part, to be contrary to federal or state law or University 
policy. 
 
In any given year that the endowment distribution is not fully used for its intended purpose, 
the unused portion should be held in the distribution account to be used in subsequent 
years and only for the purposes of the endowment, or reinvested in the endowment 
principal at the discretion of the dean of the College of Education and Human Ecology. 
 
The investment and management of and expenditures from all endowment funds shall be 
in accordance with University policies and procedures as approved by the Board of 
Trustees. As authorized by the Board of Trustees, a fee may be assessed against the 
endowment portfolio for the University’s costs of development and fund management.  
 
It is the desire of the donor that the endowment established herein should benefit the 
University in perpetuity. Should unforeseen circumstances arise in the future so that the 
need for this endowment ceases to exist, then another use as nearly aligned with the 
original intent of the contribution as good conscience and need dictate shall be designated 
by the Foundation’s Board of Directors and the University’s Board of Trustees. In making 
this alternate designation, the Boards shall seek advice from the dean of the College of 
Education and Human Ecology. 
 
Amount Establishing Endowment: $50,000.00 
 

The Tomski Family Athletic Scholarship Fund 
 
The Tomski Family Athletic Scholarship Fund was established February 10, 2012, by the 
Board of Trustees of The Ohio State University in accordance with the guidelines approved 
by the Board of Directors of The Ohio State University Foundation, with a gift from TH 
Manufacturing of New Paris, Ohio.  
 
The annual distribution from this fund shall supplement the grant-in-aid scholarship costs 
of an intercollegiate student-athlete who is a member of the women’s gymnastics team and 
is pursuing an undergraduate degree at The Ohio State University. Scholarship recipients 
shall be selected by the director of the Department of Athletics in consultation with the 
Office of Student Financial Aid.  
 
The Ohio State University’s mission and admissions policy supports educational diversity. 
The University may modify any criteria used to select scholarship recipients should the 
criteria be found, in whole or in part, to be contrary to federal or state law or University 
policy. 
 
In any given year that the endowment distribution is not fully used for its intended purpose, 
the unused portion should be held in the distribution account to be used in subsequent 
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years and only for the purposes of the endowment, or reinvested in the endowment 
principal at the discretion of the director of the Department of Athletics.  
 
The investment and management of and expenditures from all endowment funds shall be 
in accordance with University policies and procedures as approved by the Board of 
Trustees. As authorized by the Board of Trustees, a fee may be assessed against the 
endowment portfolio for the University’s costs of development and fund management.  
 
It is the desire of the donor that the endowment established herein should benefit the 
University in perpetuity. Should unforeseen circumstances arise in the future so that the 
need for this endowment ceases to exist, then another use as nearly aligned with the 
original intent of the contribution as good conscience and need dictate shall be designated 
by the Foundation’s Board of Directors and the University’s Board of Trustees. In making 
this alternate designation, the Boards shall seek advice from a representative of the donor, 
if possible, and from the director of the Department of Athletics.  
 
Amount Establishing Endowment: $50,000.00 
Total Commitment: $150,000.00 
 

The Albert M. Wiggins, Jr. Longaberger Building Fund 
 
The Albert M. Wiggins, Jr. Longaberger Building Fund was established February 10, 2012, 
by the Board of Trustees of The Ohio State University in accordance with the guidelines 
approved by the Board of Directors of The Ohio State University Foundation, with a 
charitable gift annuity from Albert M. Wiggins, Jr. (B.S. 1957) of Ligonier, Pennsylvania.  
 
The annual distribution from this fund shall be used for maintenance and capital 
improvements for the Longaberger Alumni House as determined by the responsible 
University officials in consultation with the president/CEO of The Ohio State University 
Alumni Association.  
 
In any given year that the endowment distribution is not fully used for its intended purpose, 
the unused portion should be held in the distribution account to be used in subsequent 
years and only for the purposes of the endowment, or reinvested in the endowment 
principal at the discretion of the president/CEO of the Alumni Association. 
 
The investment and management of and expenditures from all endowed funds shall be in 
accordance with University policies and procedures as approved by the Board of Trustees. 
As authorized by the Board of Trustees, a fee may be assessed against the endowment 
portfolio for the University’s cost of development and fund management.  
 
It is the desire of the donor that the endowment established herein should benefit the 
University in perpetuity. Should unforeseen circumstances arise in the future so that the 
need for this endowment ceases to exist, then another use as nearly aligned with the 
original intent of the contribution as good conscience and need dictate, shall be designated 
by the Foundation’s Board of Directors and the University’s Board of Trustees. In making 
this alternate designation, the Boards shall seek advice from the president/CEO of the 
Alumni Association. 
 
Amount Establishing Endowment: $50,000.00  
 

The Al Wiggins Discretionary Fund for Men’s Swimming 
 
The Al Wiggins Discretionary Fund for Men’s Swimming was established February 10, 
2012, by the Board of Trustees of The Ohio State University in accordance with the 
guidelines approved by the Board of Directors of The Ohio State University Foundation, 
with a charitable gift annuity from Albert M. Wiggins, Jr. (B.S. 1957) of Ligonier, 
Pennsylvania.  
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The annual distribution from this fund shall be used at the discretion of the coach of the 
men’s swimming team for such uses and purposes as he or she shall determine from time 
to time and approved by the director of the Department of Athletics.  
 
In any given year that the endowment distribution is not fully used for its intended purpose, 
the unused portion should be held in the distribution account to be used in subsequent 
years and only for the purposes of the endowment, or reinvested in the endowment 
principal at the discretion of the director of the Department of Athletics in consultation with 
the coach of the men’s swimming team.  
 
The investment and management of and expenditures from all endowed funds shall be in 
accordance with University policies and procedures as approved by the Board of Trustees. 
As authorized by the Board of Trustees, a fee may be assessed against the endowment 
portfolio for the University’s cost of development and fund management.  
 
It is the desire of the donor that the endowment established herein should benefit the 
University in perpetuity. Should unforeseen circumstances arise in the future so that the 
need for this endowment ceases to exist, then another use as nearly aligned with the 
original intent of the contribution as good conscience and need dictate shall be designated 
by the Foundation’s Board of Directors and the University’s Board of Trustees. In making 
this alternate designation, the Boards shall seek advice from the director of the Department 
of Athletics in consultation with the coach of the men’s swimming team.  
 
Amount Establishing Endowment: $50,000.00  
 

The Rudolph Family Fund 
 
The Rudolph Family Fund was established February 10, 2012, by the Board of Trustees of 
The Ohio State University in accordance with the guidelines approved by the Board of 
Directors of The Ohio State University Foundation, with a gift from Fred J. Rudolph (B.S. 
1985), of Walbridge, Ohio.  
 
The annual distribution from this fund shall supplement two funds at The Ohio State 
University. Fifty percent of the annual distribution will go to “The John H. Dunlap, Jr. Fund 
for Education, Outreach, and Development at Stone Laboratory” (241860) and fifty percent 
of the annual distribution will go to the “Sheila and Gene Smith Northwest Ohio Athletic 
Scholarship Fund” (266720).  
 
The investment and management of and expenditures from all endowment funds shall be 
in accordance with University policies and procedures as approved by the Board of 
Trustees. As authorized by the Board of Trustees, a fee may be assessed against the 
endowment portfolio for the University’s costs of development and fund management.  
 
It is the desire of the donor that the endowment established herein should benefit the 
University in perpetuity. Should unforeseen circumstances arise in the future so that the 
need for this endowment ceases to exist, then another use as nearly aligned with the 
original intent of the contribution as good conscience and need dictate shall be designated 
by the Foundation’s Board of Directors and the University’s Board of Trustees. In making 
this alternate designation, the Boards shall seek advice from the vice president for 
Agriculture Administration and executive dean of Food, Agricultural, and Environmental 
Sciences, and director of the Department of Athletics and the.  
 
Amount Establishing Endowment: $42,500.74 (grandfathered) 
 

Eileen Grice Consumer Sciences Teacher Education Scholarship Fund 
 
The Eileen Grice Consumer Sciences Teacher Education Scholarship Fund was 
established February 10, 2012, by the Board of Trustees of The Ohio State University in 
accordance with the guidelines approved by the Board of Directors of The Ohio State 
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University Foundation, with gifts in memory of Eileen Grice (B.S. 1939, M.A. 1944) from 
numerous donors.  
 
The annual distribution from this fund shall provide scholarship support to students 
preparing for careers in family and consumer sciences secondary teaching. Scholarship 
recipients shall be selected by the dean of the College of Education and Human Ecology 
in consultation with the University’s Office of Student Financial Aid.  
 
The Ohio State University’s mission and admissions policy supports educational diversity. 
The University may modify any criteria used to select scholarship recipients should the 
criteria be found, in whole or in part, to be contrary to federal or state law or University 
policy. 
 
In any given year that the endowment distribution is not fully used for its intended purpose, 
the unused portion should be held in the distribution account to be used in subsequent 
years and only for the purposes of the endowment, or reinvested in the endowment 
principal at the discretion of the dean of the College of Education and Human Ecology.  
 
The investment and management of and expenditures from all endowment funds shall be 
in accordance with University policies and procedures as approved by the Board of 
Trustees. As authorized by the Board of Trustees, a fee may be assessed against the 
endowment portfolio for the University’s costs of development and fund management.  
 
It is the desire of the donors that the endowment established herein should benefit the 
University in perpetuity. Should unforeseen circumstances arise in the future so that the 
need for this endowment ceases to exist, then another use as nearly aligned with the 
original intent of the contribution as good conscience and need dictate shall be designated 
by the Foundation’s Board of Directors and the University’s Board of Trustees. In making 
this alternate designation, the Boards shall seek advice from the dean of the College of 
Education and Human Ecology  
 
Amount Establishing Endowment: $35,776.12 (grandfathered) 
 

Hervida 4-H Camp Endowment Fund 
 
The Hervida 4-H Camp Endowment Fund was established February 10, 2012, by the Board 
of Trustees of The Ohio State University in accordance with the guidelines approved by 
the Board of Directors of The Ohio State University Foundation, with gifts from friends of 
Hervida 4-H Camp.  
 
The annual distribution from this fund shall be used to support Hervida 4-H Camp. This 
support may include, but is not limited to, improving camp facilities, administrative costs, 
and developing and implementing programming for 4-H youth at Hervida 4-H Camp. 
Expenditures shall be recommended by the Camp Hervida camp manager and approved 
by the vice president for Agricultural Administration and executive dean of Food, 
Agricultural, and Environmental Sciences in consultation with the OSU Extension 
professional in charge of the Washington County 4-H program. 
 
In any given year that the endowment distribution is not fully used for its intended purpose, 
the unused portion should be held in the distribution account to be used in subsequent 
years and only for the purposes of the endowment, or reinvested in the endowment 
principal at the discretion of the vice president for Agricultural Administration, and executive 
dean of Food, Agricultural, and Environmental Sciences in consultation with the Extension 
professional in charge of the Washington County 4-H program. 
 
The investment and management of and expenditures from all endowment funds shall be 
in accordance with University policies and procedures as approved by the Board of 
Trustees. As authorized by the Board of Trustees, a fee may be assessed against the 
endowment portfolio for the University’s costs of development and fund management.   
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It is the desire of the donors that the endowment established herein should benefit the 
University in perpetuity. Should unforeseen circumstances arise in the future so that the 
need for this endowment ceases to exist, then another use as nearly aligned with the 
original intent of the contributions as good conscience and need dictate shall be designated 
by the Foundation’s Board of Directors and the University’s Board of Trustees. In making 
this alternate designation, the Boards shall seek advice from the vice president for 
Agricultural Administration, and executive dean of Food, Agricultural, and Environmental 
Sciences in consultation with the Extension professional in charge of the Washington 
County 4-H program. 
 
Amount Establishing Endowment: $28,720.63 (grandfathered) 
 

Wayne K. Hoy and Anita Woolfolk Hoy Scholarship Fund 
 
The Wayne K. Hoy and Anita Woolfolk Hoy Scholarship Fund was established February 
10, 2012, by the Board of Trustees of The Ohio State University in accordance with the 
guidelines approved by the Board of Directors of The Ohio State University Foundation, 
with gifts from Dr. Wayne K. Hoy and Dr. Anita Woolfolk Hoy. 
 
The annual distribution from this fund shall provide need-and merit-based scholarships for 
students enrolled in the College of Education and Human Ecology who are majoring in 
educational psychology during even-numbered years, and K-12 Education Administration 
during odd-numbered years. Scholarship recipients shall be selected by the College’s dean 
in consultation with the University’s Office of Student Financial Aid.  
 
The Ohio State University’s mission and admissions policy supports educational diversity. 
The University may modify any criteria used to select scholarship recipients should the 
criteria be found, in whole or in part, to be contrary to federal or state law or University 
policy. 
 
In any given year that the endowment distribution is not fully used for its intended purpose, 
the unused portion should be held in the distribution account to be used in subsequent 
years and only for the purposes of the endowment, or reinvested in the endowment 
principal at the discretion of the dean of the College of Education and Human Ecology.  
 
The investment and management of and expenditures from all endowment funds shall be 
in accordance with University policies and procedures as approved by the Board of 
Trustees. As authorized by the Board of Trustees, a fee may be assessed against the 
endowment portfolio for the University’s costs of development and fund management.  
 
It is the desire of the donors that the endowment established herein should benefit the 
University in perpetuity. Should unforeseen circumstances arise in the future so that the 
need for this endowment ceases to exist, then another use as nearly aligned with the 
original intent of the contribution as good conscience and need dictate shall be designated 
by the Foundation’s Board of Directors and the University’s Board of Trustees. In making 
this alternate designation, the Boards shall seek advice from the donors, if possible, and 
from the dean of the College of Education and Human Ecology.  
 
Amount Establishing Endowment: $27,124.63 (grandfathered) 
 

The Robert G. Gottesman Excellence  
in Viticulture and Enology Endowment Fund 

 
The Robert G. Gottesman Excellence in Viticulture and Enology Endowment Fund was 
established February 10, 2012, by the Board of Trustees of The Ohio State University in 
accordance with the guidelines approved by the Board of Directors of The Ohio State 
University Foundation, with gifts made from members of the Ohio Wine and Grape 
Association. 
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The annual distribution from this fund shall be used to support faculty and students within 
the viticulture and enology program, including research, teaching, and outreach. 
Expenditures from the fund shall be made at the discretion of the chairperson of the 
Department of Horticulture and Crop Science. 
 
In any given year that the endowment distribution is not fully expended, the unused portion 
should be reinvested in the endowment principal.  
 
The investment and management of and expenditures from all endowment funds shall be 
in accordance with University policies and procedures as approved by the Board of 
Trustees. As authorized by the Board of Trustees, a fee may be assessed against the 
endowment portfolio for the University’s costs of development and fund management.  
 
It is the desire of the donors that the endowment established herein should benefit the 
University in perpetuity. Should unforeseen circumstances arise in the future so that the 
need for this endowment ceases to exist, then another use as nearly aligned with the 
original intent of the contribution as good conscience and need dictate, shall be designated 
by the Foundation’s Board of Directors and the University’s Board of Trustees In making 
this alternate designation, the Boards shall seek advice from the vice president for 
Agricultural Administration and executive dean of Food, Agricultural, and Environmental 
Sciences, and the chairperson of the Department of Horticulture and Crop Science.  
 
Amount Establishing Endowment: $26,785.67 (grandfathered) 
 

The Michael L. Scott Fund for Technology Education 
 
The Michael L. Scott Fund for Technology Education was established February 10, 2012, 
by the Board of Trustees of The Ohio State University in accordance with the guidelines 
approved by the Board of Directors of The Ohio State University Foundation, with gifts 
made in memory of Dr. Michael L. Scott (B.S. 1973, M.A. 1975, Ph.D. 1979) from numerous 
donors. 
 
The annual distribution from this fund shall be used to purchase equipment for the 
Technology Education Program in the College of Education and Human Ecology as 
approved by the College’s dean.  
 
In any given year that the endowment distribution is not fully used for its intended purpose, 
the unused portion should be held in the distribution account to be used in subsequent 
years and only for the purposes of the endowment, or reinvested in the endowment 
principal at the discretion of the dean of the College of Education and Human Ecology.  
 
The investment and management of and expenditures from all endowment funds shall be 
in accordance with University policies and procedures as approved by the Board of 
Trustees. As authorized by the Board of Trustees, a fee may be assessed against the 
endowment portfolio for the University’s costs of development and fund management.  
 
It is the desire of the donors that the endowment established herein should benefit the 
University in perpetuity. Should unforeseen circumstances arise in the future so that the 
need for this endowment ceases to exist, then another use as nearly aligned with the 
original intent of the contribution as good conscience and need dictate shall be designated 
by the Foundation’s Board of Directors and the University’s Board of Trustees. In making 
this alternate designation, the Boards shall seek advice from the dean of the College of 
Education and Human Ecology.  
 
Amount Establishing Endowment: $26,474.11 (grandfathered) 
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The Mike and Jill Eversole Nolan and Family Study Abroad Fund 
 
The Mike and Jill Eversole Nolan and Family Study Abroad Fund was established February 
10, 2012, by the Board of Trustees of The Ohio State University in accordance with the 
guidelines approved by the Board of Directors of The Ohio State University Foundation, 
with a gift from Mike (B.S. 1974, M.S. 1997, Ph.D. 2008) and Jill Eversole (B.S. 1974, Ph.D. 
1997) Nolan of Wakeman, Ohio. 
 
The annual distribution from this fund shall be used to support one scholarship for an 
undergraduate student currently enrolled in an approved study abroad program in the 
College of Food, Agricultural, and Environmental Sciences. The scholarship may be used 
for, but is not limited to, tuition, books, airfare, and other associated programmatic 
expenses. Eligible students must be enrolled at the University’s Columbus campus, be in 
good academic standing, and be progressing toward their degrees. The scholarship may 
not be renewed. Recipients shall be selected by the College’s scholarship selection 
committee in accordance with guidelines established by the vice president for Agricultural 
Administration and executive dean of Food, Agricultural, and Environmental Sciences or 
his/her designee, and in consultation with the University’s Office of Student Financial Aid. 
 
The Ohio State University’s mission and admissions policy supports educational diversity. 
The University may modify any criteria used to select scholarship recipients should the 
criteria be found, in whole or in part, to be contrary to federal or state law or University 
policy. 
 
In the event there is excess distribution after awarding the scholarship, the College may 
make awards of lesser amounts to additional students following the same criteria. 
 
In any given year that the endowment distribution is not fully expended, the unused portion 
may be reinvested in the endowment principal or held in the distribution account to be used 
in subsequent years and only for the purposes of the endowment at the direction of the 
vice president for Agricultural Administration and executive dean of Food, Agricultural, and 
Environmental Sciences. 
 
The investment and management of and expenditures from all endowment funds shall be 
in accordance with University policies and procedures as approved by the Board of 
Trustees. As authorized by the Board of Trustees, a fee may be assessed against the 
endowment portfolio for the University’s costs of development and fund management. 
 
It is the desire of the donors that the endowment established herein should benefit the 
University is perpetuity. Should unforeseen circumstances arise in the future so that the 
need for this endowment ceases to exist, then another use as nearly aligned with the 
original intent of the contribution as good conscience and need dictate shall be designated 
by the Foundation’s Board of Directors and the University’s Board of Trustees. In making 
this alternate designation, the Boards shall seek advice from the donors, if possible, and 
from the vice president for Agricultural Administration and executive dean of Food, 
Agricultural, and Environmental Sciences. 
 
Amount Establishing Endowment: $26,080.00 (grandfathered) 
 

Buckeye Leadership Workshop Endowment Fund 
 
The Buckeye Leadership Workshop Endowment Fund was established February 10, 2012, 
by the Board of Trustees of The Ohio State University in accordance with the guidelines 
approved by the Board of Directors of The Ohio State University Foundation, with gifts from 
friends of Buckeye Leadership Workshop, Inc. 
 
The annual distribution from this fund shall be used to provide awards for OSU Extension 
staff and faculty, Ohio 4-H members and volunteers, and/or OSU Extension volunteers to 
attend the Buckeye Leadership Workshop. Recipients shall be recommended by the 
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Buckeye Leadership Workshop Scholarship Selection Committee and approved by the 
assistant director of OSU Extension for 4-H Youth Development. Guidelines for application 
and selection, and expenditures shall be approved by the vice president for Agricultural 
Administration and executive dean of Food, Agricultural, and Environmental Sciences in 
consultation with the assistant director of OSU Extension for 4-H Youth Development. 
 
If Buckeye Leadership Workshop, Inc. should cease to exist, the annual distribution shall 
be used for activities that contribute to professional development in the area of leadership 
for OSU Extension staff and faculty, Ohio 4-H members and volunteers, and/or OSU 
Extension volunteers. Expenditures shall be approved by the vice president for Agricultural 
Administration and executive dean of Food, Agricultural, and Environmental Sciences in 
consultation with the assistant director of OSU Extension for 4-H Youth Development. 
 
In any given year that the endowment distribution is not fully used for its intended purpose, 
the unused portion should be reinvested in the endowment principal. 
 
The investment and management of and expenditures from all endowment funds shall be 
in accordance with University policies and procedures as approved by the Board of 
Trustees. As authorized by the Board of Trustees, a fee may be assessed against the 
endowment portfolio for the University’s costs of development and fund management.  
 
It is the desire of the donors that the endowment established herein should benefit the 
University in perpetuity. Should unforeseen circumstances arise in the future so that the 
need for this endowment ceases to exist, then another use as nearly aligned with the 
original intent of the contribution as good conscience and need dictate shall be designated 
by the Foundation’s Board of Directors and the University’s Board of Trustees. In making 
this alternate designation, the Boards shall seek advice from the vice president for 
Agricultural Administration and executive dean of Food, Agricultural, and Environmental 
Sciences in consultation with the assistant director of OSU Extension for 4-H Youth 
Development. 
 
Amount Establishing Endowment: $25,617.38 (grandfathered) 
 

Food, Agricultural and Biological Engineering Departmental  
Student Organizations Development Fund 

 
The Food, Agricultural and Biological Engineering (FABE) Departmental Student 
Organizations Development Fund was established February 10, 2012, by the Board of 
Trustees of The Ohio State University in accordance with the guidelines approved by the 
Board of Directors of The Ohio State University Foundation, with gifts from Thomas L. 
Bean, FABE Student Organizations, alumni, and friends of the Department.  
 
The annual distribution from this fund shall be used to enrich experiences for students 
participating in student clubs and organizations within the Department of FABE by 
enhancing their activities and community service. Expenditures may include, but are not 
limited to, participation in state/regional/national events, field trips, invited lecturers, and 
awards for contests and competitions. The annual distribution may also be used to 
supplement existing funds for refreshments, program promotion, travel costs, honoraria, 
awards, and other related costs. The chairperson of the Department of FABE shall approve 
all expenditures from this fund.  
 
In any given year that the endowment distribution is not fully used for its intended purpose, 
the unused portion should be reinvested in the endowment principal.  
 
The investment and management of any expenditure from all endowment funds shall be in 
accordance with University policies and procedures as approved by the Board of Trustees. 
As authorized by the Board of Trustees, a fee may be assessed against the endowment 
portfolio for the University’s costs of development and fund management.  
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It is the desire of the donors that the endowment established herein should benefit the 
University in perpetuity. Should unforeseen circumstances arise in the future so that the 
need for this endowment ceases to exist, then another use as nearly aligned with the 
original intent of the contribution as good conscience and need dictate shall be designated 
by the Foundation’s Board of Directors and the University’s Board of Trustees. In making 
this alternate designation, the Boards shall seek advice from Thomas L. Bean, if possible, 
and the vice president for Agricultural Administration and executive dean of Food, 
Agricultural, and Environmental Sciences.  
 
Amount Establishing Endowment: $25,450.00 (grandfathered) 
 

Ohio State Fair Hall of Fame Junior Fair Board Scholarship Endowment Fund 
 
The Ohio State Fair Hall of Fame Junior Fair Board Scholarship Endowment Fund was 
established February 10, 2012, by the Board of Trustees of The Ohio State University in 
accordance with the guidelines approved by the Board of Directors of The Ohio State 
University Foundation, with gifts from Ohio State Fair Hall of Fame recipients and friends. 
 
The annual distribution from this fund shall be used to provide a minimum of two (2) 
scholarship awards to members of the Ohio State Fair Junior Fair Board. Recipients must 
be entering The Ohio State University main campus, ATI or any of its regional campuses. 
Candidates shall be nominated by a committee of supervisors for the Ohio State Fair Junior 
Fair Board, and recipients will be selected by the OSU Extension 4-H Youth Development 
scholarship selection committee in accordance with guidelines established by the vice 
president for Agricultural Administration and executive dean of Food, Agricultural, and 
Environmental Sciences, and in consultation with the Office of Student Financial Aid.  
 
In any given year that the endowment distribution is not fully used for its intended purpose, 
the unused portion will be made available to support an area of need within OSU Extension-
4-H Youth Development as determined by the State 4-H Leader or reinvested in the 
endowment principal at the discretion of the vice president for Agricultural Administration, 
and executive dean of Food, Agricultural, and Environmental Sciences.  
 
The investment and management of and expenditures from all endowment funds shall be 
in accordance with University policies and procedures as approved by the Board of 
Trustees. As authorized by the Board of Trustees, a fee may be assessed against the 
endowment portfolio for the University’s costs of development and fund management.  
 
It is the desire of the donors that the endowment established herein should benefit the 
University in perpetuity. Should unforeseen circumstances arise in the future so that the 
need for this endowment ceases to exist, then another use as nearly aligned with the 
original intent of the contribution as good conscience and need dictate shall be designated 
by the Foundation’s Board of Directors and the University’s Board of Trustees. In making 
this alternate designation, the Boards shall seek advice from the vice president for 
Agricultural Administration and executive dean of Food, Agricultural, and Environmental 
Sciences in consultation with the assistant director, OSU Extension- 4-H Youth 
Development.  
 
Amount of Endowment: $25,085.00 (grandfathered) 
 

Norman Levine Memorial Endowment Fund 
 
The Norman Levine Memorial Endowment Fund was established February 10, 2012, by 
the Board of Trustees of The Ohio State University in accordance with the guidelines 
approved by the Board of Directors of The Ohio State University Foundation, with 
anonymous gifts from a grateful student of Professor Levine. 
 
The annual distribution from this fund shall be used at the discretion of the director of the 
University Libraries.   
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In any given year that the endowment distribution is not fully used for its intended purpose, 
the unused portion should be held in the distribution account to be used in subsequent 
years and only for the purposes of the endowment, or reinvested in the endowment 
principal at the discretion of the director of the University Libraries.  
 
The investment and management of and expenditures from all endowment funds shall be 
in accordance with University policies and procedures as approved by the Board of 
Trustees. As authorized by the Board of Trustees, a fee may be assessed against the 
endowment portfolio for the University’s costs of development and fund management.  
 
It is the desire of the donor that the endowment established herein should benefit the 
University in perpetuity. Should unforeseen circumstances arise in the future so that the 
need for this endowment ceases to exist, then another use as nearly aligned with the 
original intent of the contribution as good conscience and need dictate shall be designated 
by the Foundation’s Board of Directors and the University’s Board of Trustees. In making 
this alternate designation, the Boards shall seek advice from the donor, if possible, and 
from the director of the University Libraries. 
 
Amount Establishing Endowment: $25,000.00 (unrestricted) 
 

The Kanaan Beckwith Sievers Fund 
 
The Kanaan Beckwith Sievers Fund was established February 10, 2012, by the Board of 
Trustees of The Ohio State University in accordance with the guidelines approved by the 
Board of Directors of The Ohio State University Foundation, with gifts from Samira 
Beckwith (B.A. 1974, M.A. 1977).  
 
The annual distribution from this fund shall provide unrestricted support split between three 
areas to be used at the discretion of each area’s top administrator: 25% to the Alumni 
Association, 25% to the College of Social Work, and 50% to the Office of the President. 
 
The Ohio State University’s mission and admissions policy supports educational diversity. 
The University may modify any criteria used to select scholarship recipients should the 
criteria be found, in whole or in part, to be contrary to federal or state law or University 
policy. 
 
In any given year that the endowment distribution is not fully used for its intended purpose, 
the unused portion should be held in the distribution account to be used in subsequent 
years and only for the purposes of the endowment, or reinvested in the endowment 
principal at the discretion of the president/CEO of the Alumni Association, the dean of the 
College of Social Work or the University President as appropriate.  
 
The investment and management of and expenditures from all endowment funds shall be 
in accordance with University policies and procedures as approved by the Board of 
Trustees. As authorized by the Board of Trustees, a fee may be assessed against the 
endowment portfolio for the University’s costs of development and fund management.  
 
It is the desire of the donor that the endowment established herein should benefit the 
University in perpetuity. Should unforeseen circumstances arise in the future so that the 
need for this endowment ceases to exist, then another use as nearly aligned with the 
original intent of the contribution as good conscience and need dictate shall be designated 
by the Foundation’s Board of Directors and the University’s Board of Trustees. In making 
this alternate designation, the Boards shall seek advice from the donor, if possible, and 
from the president/CEO of the Alumni Association, the dean of the College of Social Work, 
and the University President.  
 
Amount Establishing Endowment: $25,000.00 (unrestricted) 
Total Commitment: $100,000.00 
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Change in Name of Named Endowed Fund 
 

Clermont County 4-H Endowment Fund in Memory of Kathleen Retzler 
 
The Kathleen Retzler Memorial 4-H Endowment Fund for Clermont County was 
established September 18, 2009, by the Board of Trustees of The Ohio State University in 
accordance with the guidelines approved by the Board of Directors of The Ohio State 
University Foundation, with gifts from the Kathleen Retzler 4-H Memorial Scholarship Fund. 
The name was revised February 10, 2012. 
 
The annual distribution will provide awards in equal amounts, with a minimum of $500 
each, for the Clermont County Junior Fair King and Queen as elected by the Junior Fair 
Board through an application and interview process. If the annual earnings do not allow for 
two $500 awards, then two awards in equal amounts will be made to the Junior Fair King 
and Queen. Any remaining funds each year will be used to provide program funding for the 
4-H youth and volunteers of the Clermont County 4-H Youth Development Program. The 
OSU Extension professional in charge of the Clermont County 4-H Program, in consultation 
with the Clermont County 4-H Committee, shall approve all expenditures from this fund.  
 
In any given year that the endowment distribution is not fully used for its intended purpose, 
the unused portion should be held in the distribution account to be used in subsequent 
years and only for the purposes of the endowment, or reinvested in the endowment 
principal at the discretion of the vice president for Agricultural Administration and executive 
dean of Food, Agricultural, and Environmental Sciences.  
 
The investment and management of and expenditures from all endowment funds shall be 
in accordance with University policies and procedures as approved by the Board of 
Trustees. As authorized by the Board of Trustees, a fee may be assessed against the 
endowment portfolio for the University’s costs of development and fund management.  
 
It is the desire of the donor that the endowment established herein should benefit the 
University in perpetuity. Should unforeseen circumstances arise in the future so that the 
need for this endowment ceases to exist, then another use as nearly aligned with the 
original intent of the contribution as good conscience and need dictate shall be designated 
by the Foundation’s Board of Directors and the University’s Board of Trustees. In making 
this alternate designation, the Boards shall seek advice from the vice president for 
Agricultural Administration and executive dean of Food, Agricultural, and Environmental 
Sciences in consultation with the assistant director of OSU Extension, 4-H Youth 
Development. 
 
Change in Name and Description of Named Endowed Funds 
 

Hrusovsky Family Internship Fund 
 
The Hrusovsky Family Excellence Award Fund at The Max M. Fisher College of Business 
was established October 29, 2009, by the Board of Trustees of The Ohio State University 
in accordance with the guidelines approved by the Board of Directors of The Ohio State 
University Foundation, with gifts from John J. Hrusovsky II (B.S.Bus.Adm. 1986). The name 
and description were revised February 5, 2010, to the Hrusovsky Family / GroundWork 
Group Internship Fund. The name and description were revised again February 10, 2012. 
 
The annual distribution from this fund will support Fisher College of Business students 
seeking internships in information technology. The award may be distributed anytime 
during the calendar year. Placements will be coordinated through the Center for 
Entrepreneurship in consultation with the University’s Office of Student Financial Aid.  
 
The Ohio State University’s mission and admissions policy supports educational diversity. 
The University may modify any criteria used to select scholarship recipients should the 
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criteria be found, in whole or in part, to be contrary to federal or state law or University 
policy. 
 
In any given year that the endowment distribution is not fully used for its intended purpose, 
the unused portion should be held in the distribution account to be used in subsequent 
years and only for the purposes of the endowment, or reinvested in the endowment 
principal at the discretion of the dean of the Fisher College of Business.  
 
The investment and management of and expenditures from all endowment funds shall be 
in accordance with University policies and procedures as approved by the Board of 
Trustees. As authorized by the Board of Trustees, a fee may be assessed against the 
endowment portfolio for the University’s costs of development and fund management.  
 
It is the desire of the donor that the endowment established herein should benefit the 
University in perpetuity. Should unforeseen circumstances arise in the future so that the 
need for this endowment ceases to exist, then another use as nearly aligned with the 
original intent of the contribution as good conscience and need dictate shall be designated 
by the Foundation’s Board of Directors and the University’s Board of Trustees. In making 
this alternate designation, the Boards shall seek advice from the donor, if possible, and 
from the dean of the Fisher College of Business.  
 

Donald D. Mayhew Memorial Scholarship Fund 
 
The Donald D. Mayhew Memorial Fellowship Endowment Fund was established February 
5, 1999, by the Board of Trustees of The Ohio State University in accordance with the 
guidelines approved by the Board of Directors of The Ohio State University Foundation, 
with gifts from the estate of Helen E. Mayhew of Lima, Ohio. The gifts were made in 
memory of her son. The name and description were revised February 10, 2012. 
 
At least fifty percent (50%) of the annual distribution shall be used to support 
undergraduate scholarships and internships in the College of Food, Agricultural, and 
Environmental Sciences. Eligible students must have demonstrated interest in ornamental 
plants and public gardens, be pursuing a College major, or be pursuing a horticulture and 
crop science minor if pursuing a major outside the College. Recipients of the Mayhew 
Scholarship also will be expected to fulfill a paid internship equivalent in monetary value to 
their scholarship awards within the Chadwick Arboretum and Learning Gardens during their 
current scholarship year.  
 
The remainder of the annual distribution shall be used to provide scholarships to support 
undergraduate co-curricular activities which shall include, but not be limited to, awards for 
at least four (4) full-time summer interns in the Arboretum, independent undergraduate 
research projects, study abroad scholarships, and scholarships to attend professional 
conferences. Only current recipients of the Mayhew Scholarship will be eligible to apply for 
additional support from this fund for their co-curricular activities. 
 
The scholarships are renewable, not to exceed four (4) years, provided the students remain 
in good academic standing, are progressing towards their degrees, and continue to meet 
the scholarship’s criteria. Quality of performance associated with their Arboretum 
internships also will be considered. 
 
Scholarship recipients shall be selected by the Department of Horticulture and Crop 
Science scholarship selection committee in accordance with guidelines approved by the 
vice president for Agricultural Administration and executive dean of the College, and in 
consultation with the director of the Arboretum and the University’s Office of Student 
Financial Aid. Scholarships for co-curricular activities shall be awarded by the chairperson 
of the Department of Horticulture and Crop Science and the director of the Arboretum or 
their designees in accordance with guidelines approved by the vice president for 
Agricultural Administration and executive dean of the College of Food, Agricultural, and 
Environmental Sciences.  
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The Ohio State University’s mission and admissions policy supports educational diversity. 
The University may modify any criteria used to select scholarship recipients should the 
criteria be found, in whole or in part, to be contrary to federal or state law or University 
policy. 
 
In any given year that the endowment distribution is not fully used for its intended purposes, 
the unused portion should be held in the distribution account to be used in subsequent 
years and only for the purposes of the endowment, or reinvested in the endowment 
principal at the discretion of the vice president for Agricultural Administration and executive 
dean of Food, Agricultural, and Environmental Sciences in consultation with the 
chairperson of the Department of Horticulture and Crop Science. 
 
The investment and management of and expenditures from all endowment funds shall be 
in accordance with University policies and procedures as approved by the Board of 
Trustees. As authorized by the Board of Trustees, a fee may be assessed against the 
endowment portfolio for the University’s costs of development and fund management.  
 
It is the desire of the donor that the endowment established herein should benefit the 
University in perpetuity. Should unforeseen circumstances arise in the future so that the 
need for this endowment ceases to exist, then another use as nearly aligned with the 
original intent of the contribution as good conscience and need dictate shall be designated 
by the Foundation’s Board of Directors and the University’s Board of Trustees. In making 
this alternate designation, the Boards shall seek advice from the vice president for 
Agricultural Administration and executive dean of Food, Agricultural, and Environmental 
Sciences in consultation with the chairperson of the Department of Horticulture and Crop 
Science. 
 

Arthur and Geraldine Nelson Photography Endowment Fund 
 
The Photography Endowment Fund was established June 7, 2005, by the Board of 
Trustees of The Ohio State University in accordance with the guidelines approved by the 
Board of Directors of The Ohio State University Foundation, with gifts from an anonymous 
donor. Upon her retirement from the University, Ardine Nelson disclosed her identity and 
renamed the fund in memory of her parents. The name and description were revised 
February 10, 2012. 
 
The annual distribution from this fund shall be used to support the needs of the photography 
area within the Department of Art in the College of Arts and Sciences, with benefit to 
photography students. Expenditures shall be approved by the photography area 
coordinator in consultation with the chairperson of the Department of Art. 
 
In any given year that the endowment distribution is not fully used for its intended purpose, 
the unused portion should be reinvested in the endowment principal.  
 
The investment and management of and expenditures from all endowment funds shall be 
in accordance with University policies and procedures as approved by the Board of 
Trustees. As authorized by the Board of Trustees, a fee may be assessed against the 
endowment portfolio for the University’s costs of development and fund management.  
 
It is the desire of the donor that the endowment established herein should benefit the 
University in perpetuity. Should unforeseen circumstances arise in the future so that the 
need for this endowment ceases to exist, then another use as nearly aligned with the 
original intent of the contribution as good conscience and need dictate shall be designated 
by the Foundation’s Board of Directors and the University’s Board of Trustees. In making 
this alternate designation, the Boards shall seek advice from the chairperson of the 
Department of Art.  

 
*** 

 



February 10, 2012 meeting, Board of Trustees 
 

435 

APPROVAL FOR THE ESTABLISHMENT OF A FEE FOR  
THE DISTANCE EDUCATION PROGRAM 

Resolution No. 2012-63 
 
Synopsis: Approval is requested for the establishment of a $100 distance education 
administration fee and an additional $5 non-resident distance education fee per term for 
Distance Education Students. The fee funding will be used to operate the distance 
education program at the University and the non-resident fee will be applied toward the 
instructional costs of the program. These fees are to be effective starting Summer 2012. 
 
WHEREAS the Board of Trustees of the Ohio State University supports the University’s 
continued implementation of the Academic Plan and its initiatives to meet the needs of 
Ohio State students; and 
 
WHEREAS consultations have taken place within the University to determine the 
appropriate administration fee and non-resident distance education fee for the Distance 
Education Program, as described in the accompanying narrative; and 
 
WHEREAS the administration now presents the distance education fee for Summer 2012; 
and 
 
WHEREAS the administration also presents the non-resident distance education fee of $5 
beginning Summer 2012: 
 
NOW THEREFORE 
 
BE IT RESOLVED, That the Board of Trustees hereby confirms the recommendation of 
the administration and approves the Distance Education Fee to be established at the rate 
of $100 per term; and,  
 
BE IT FURTHER RESOLVED, That the Board of Trustees hereby confirms the 
recommendation of the administration and approves the non-resident distance education 
fee to be established at the rate of $5 per term; and 
 
BE IT FURTHER RESOLVED, That these fees become effective Summer 2012. 
 
(See Appendix XXII for background information, page 457.) 

 
*** 

 
REVISIONS TO THE POLICY ON PURCHASING AND COMPETITIVE BIDDING 

Resolution No. 2012-64 
 
Synopsis: Authorization for the adoption of the revised policy on purchasing and 
competitive bidding is requested. 
 
WHEREAS it is the policy of The Ohio State University to solicit competitive bids or 
proposals in making University purchases in all cases wherein the best interest of the 
University will be served by such competition; and 
 
WHEREAS the University’s policy on purchasing and competitive bidding has been 
established by the Board of Trustees through Resolutions 84-61, 85-29, 86-41, 87-38, 87-
39, 88-55, 92-78, 95-17, 2002-97,2008-70 and 2011-78 and there is a need to revise and 
update the University’s policy on purchasing to reflect changes enacted in Ohio’s 
Construction Reform Law, Am. Sub. H.B. 153 of the 129th General Assembly: 
 
NOW THEREFORE 
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BE IT RESOLVED, That the Board of Trustees hereby revises the policy on purchasing, 
as follows, effective immediately: 
 
1. Under the direction of the Senior Vice President for Business and Finance, the 

Director of Purchasing shall have the responsibility and requisite authority for the 
purchase of equipment, materials, supplies, and services for the University. 

 
2. Unless otherwise provided, all equipment, materials, supplies, and services shall be 

purchased through solicitation of competitive bids or proposals except in the following 
instances: 

 
A. Where such equipment, materials, supplies, or services are purchased pursuant 

to Sections 4115.31 to 4115.35 and 5147.07 of the Revised Code; or 
B. Where the amount of such purchase of equipment, materials, and/or supplies is 

less than $25,000; or  
C. Where the purchase of services, or any combination of services, equipment, 

materials, and supplies, is less than $50,000; or 
D. Where the purchase is less than $200,000 and is for the construction, addition, 

alteration, structural or other improvements of a University building or structure. 
 

The above threshold amounts notwithstanding, the University may require competitive 
bidding for purchases below these threshold amounts if it determines that such 
bidding is in the best interest of the University. Contracts shall be awarded to the 
lowest responsible and responsive bidder. In accordance with policies and procedures 
established by the Office of Business and Finance, the University may accept or reject 
any or all bids or proposals in whole or by item. For any contract authorized by the 
University’s policy on purchasing, the University is authorized to make multiple awards 
as provided for in the University’s request for bids or proposals 

 
3. The President and/or Senior Vice President for Business and Finance, or his or her 

designee, may grant a waiver from competitive bidding when he or she determines 
that an emergency or a sufficient economic reason exists, or that the equipment, 
materials, supplies, or services can be purchased only from a single supplier (“sole 
source”). 

 
4. The President and/or Senior Vice President for Business and Finance, or his or her 

designee, may grant a waiver from competitive bidding when he or she determines 
that the services to be purchased are technical and specialized consulting services 
that are temporary in nature and there are sufficient economic reasons to support 
such a waiver and where such terms and conditions as are in the best interest of the 
University. The exercise of this authority shall be subject to the oversight authority of 
the Senior Vice President for Business and Finance 

 
5. The President and/or Senior Vice President for Business and Finance, upon 

recommendation of the appropriate University office responsible for University 
collections and with any necessary budgeting approval, is authorized on behalf of the 
University, on a continuing basis, to purchase (including through the commissioning 
of such work or objects), without competitive bidding, objects of fine or decorative art 
or other objects to be collected for and on behalf of the University, from funds 
authorized for such purposes, upon such terms and conditions as are deemed to be 
in the best interest of the University, but not to exceed $1 million per art work or 
collection based on an appraisal (or appraisals) acceptable to the University. This 
provision rescinds Resolution 84-61.  

 
6. The President and/or Senior Vice President for Business and Finance is authorized 

on behalf of the University, on a continuing basis, to purchase, without competitive 
bidding, equipment, materials, supplies, or services through any non-profit or 
governmental agencies or consortia (including but not limited to the Inter University 
Council Purchasing Group) whose contracts meet the competitive bidding 
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requirements as determined by the University, upon such terms and conditions as are 
in the best interest of the University.  

 
7. The President and/or Senior Vice President for Business and Finance is authorized 

on behalf of the University, on a continuing basis, to enter into agreements, without 
competitive bidding, for entertainment acts, performers, and artists, and their selected, 
required, or contractually mandated promoters or associated vendors, as scheduled 
by various University departments, upon such terms and conditions as are in the best 
interest of the University. 

 
8. Resolution 87-38 is hereby reconfirmed and the President and/or Senior Vice 

President for Business and Finance, in consultation with the Vice President for 
Research, is authorized on behalf of the University, on a continuing basis, to negotiate 
and to enter into, without competitive bidding, agreements, including purchase 
agreements, as are necessary or desirable to acquire, finance, install, equip, maintain, 
operate, and update current generation and subsequent new generation 
supercomputing equipment developed by or for use with Cray Research, Inc. 
supercomputing equipment.  

 
9. In accordance with Section 5513.01(B) of the Revised Code, the President and/or 

Senior Vice President for Business and Finance is authorized on behalf of the 
University, on a continuing basis, to purchase, without competitive bidding, through 
Ohio Department of Transportation agreements, machinery, materials, supplies or 
other articles upon such terms and conditions that are in the best interest of the 
University. 

 
10. The President and/or Senior Vice President for Business and Finance is authorized 

on behalf of the University, on a continuing basis, to purchase, without competitive 
bidding, books, periodicals, and other related items for the University Libraries’ 
collections. 

 
11. In compliance with Section 125.081 of the Revised Code and any applicable court 

decisions, the University shall set aside a number of purchases each year for bidding 
by certified minority businesses only. The bidding procedures for such contracts shall 
be the same as for all other contracts except that: 1) only minority business 
enterprises certified by the State of Ohio Equal Employment Opportunity Coordinator 
shall be qualified to submit bids; and 2) the cost of products and services may not 
exceed the estimated market price by more than approximately 10%. If bids are 
rejected because of this cost consideration, the purchase shall be offered again for 
bid by all interested vendors in accordance with standard bidding procedures. 

 
12.  Resolution 95-17 is hereby reconfirmed, and notwithstanding any other provision of 

this policy on purchasing, the Vice President of Health Services shall have the 
responsibility and requisite authority for the purchase of equipment, materials, 
supplies, and services for the Hospitals of the University and their related facilities, in 
accordance with this University Purchasing Policy. The exercise of this authority by 
the Vice President of Health Services shall be subject to the oversight authority of the 
Senior Vice President for Business and Finance who shall review the application of 
this delegation of authority every three years.  

 
13. Resolutions 87-39 and 88-55 are hereby reconfirmed, and the President and/or Senior 

Vice President for Business and Finance is authorized, on a continuing basis, to 
purchase, without competitive bidding, equipment, materials, supplies, or services 
through the University Hospital Consortium, Inc., and the Hospital Helicopter 
Consortium of Central Ohio, whose contracts meet the competitive bidding 
requirements as determined by the University, and upon such terms and conditions 
as are in the best interest of the University. 
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14. The President and/or Senior Vice President for Business and Finance is authorized, 
on behalf of the University, on a continuing basis, to negotiate and enter into 
agreements, to purchase services for blood and organ products for transplantation, 
without competitive bidding, upon such terms and conditions as are in the best interest 
of the University. This provision rescinds Resolution 86-41. 

 
15. The President and/or the Senior Vice President for Business and Finance is 

authorized on behalf of the University to employ reverse-auctioning procurement 
methods for the purchase of goods and services, in accordance with the competitive 
bidding requirements as determined by the University. 

 
16.  Resolution 2002-97 is hereby reconfirmed, and the President and/or Senior Vice 

President for Business and Finance is authorized on behalf of the University, on a 
continuing basis, to purchase without competitive bidding, equipment, materials, 
supplies, or services through participation in State of Ohio term schedules in which 
the vendor guarantees that the State will receive the lowest price as offered to the 
federal government and in which the vendor agrees to accept all of the State’s terms 
and conditions. 

 
17. The President and/or Senior Vice President for Business and Finance is authorized 

on behalf of the University, on a continuing basis, to purchase without competitive 
bidding, the renewal of licenses and maintenance agreements for existing mission 
critical enterprise-wide software applications, upon such terms and conditions as are 
in the best interest of the University. 

 
18. The President and/or Senior Vice President for Business and Finance is authorized 

on behalf of the University, on a continuing basis and without competitive bidding, to 
negotiate and enter into real estate lease agreements in accordance with existing 
University procedures, upon such terms and conditions as are in the best interest of 
the University.  

 
19.  The President and/or Senior Vice President for Business and Finance is authorized 

on behalf of the University, on a continuing basis, to purchase without competitive 
bidding, municipally based and other single-source supplies of utility services, upon 
such terms and conditions as are in the best interest of the University. 

 
20.  The President and/or Senior Vice President for Business and Finance is authorized 

on behalf of the University, on a continuing basis, to purchase without competitive 
bidding and in support of the mission of WOSU Public Media, products and services 
available solely through the Public Broadcast Service, National Public Radio and the 
National Program Service (including but not limited to programming fees and 
promotional products), upon such terms and conditions as are in the best interest of 
the University. 

 
21. The President and/or Senior Vice President for Business and Finance is authorized 

on behalf of the University, on a continuing basis, to purchase without competitive 
bidding, necessary services for authorized student exchange programs with other 
institutions of higher education, upon such terms and conditions as are in the best 
interest of the University.  

 
22. The President and/or Senior Vice President for Business and Finance is authorized, 

on behalf of the University, on a continuing basis, to negotiate and enter into 
agreements to purchase physician services in support of the University Health 
System, without competitive bidding, upon such terms and conditions are in the best 
interest of the University. 

 
23. Notwithstanding any other provision of this policy to the contrary, any contract or 

purchase, whether competitively bid or not, for goods or services which contract or 
purchase is in excess of $1 million must have the prior written approval of the Senior 
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Vice President for Business and Finance or his or her designee within the Office of 
Business and Finance. 

 
Notwithstanding any other provision of this policy to the contrary, any contract or 
purchase for goods or services for which competitive bidding is waived, and which 
contract or purchase is in excess of $500,000 must have the prior written approval of 
the Senior Vice President for Business and Finance or his or her designee within the 
Office of Business and Finance. 

 
24. Only the President and/or Senior Vice President for Business and Finance is 

authorized, on behalf of the University, on a continuing basis, to negotiate and enter 
into agreements, to engage in and sign agreements with various financial institutions 
and advisors relating to financial consulting services, banking, brokerage, leasing, 
asset financing and related financial services without competitive bidding, upon such 
terms and conditions are in the best interest of the University. 

 
25. All contracts or purchases for goods or services for which contract or purchase is in 

excess of $250,000 for which competitive bidding is waived, shall be reported to the 
Board on a quarterly basis.  

 
A report of all contracts or purchases for goods or services for which competitive 
bidding is waived shall be provided to the Board of Trustees Office on an annual basis. 

 
This policy applies to all funds administered by The Ohio State University and applies to 
the purchases of all products and services that are not conditions of existing contracts that 
have been previously negotiated and competitively bid. Also this Policy applies only to 
purchases of products and services acquired from outside The Ohio State University and 
its affiliates. 

 
*** 

 
RATIFICATION AND APPROVAL OF AMENDMENTS TO THE OHIO STATE 

UNIVERSITY DEFERRED COMPENSATION PLANS 
Resolution No. 2012-65 

 
Synopsis: Ratification and approval of the amendment of The Ohio State University ING 
Financial Advisers Deferred Compensation Plan, The Ohio State University Deferred 
Compensation Plan funded by TIAA-CREF, The Ohio State University Lincoln National 
Deferred Compensation Plan and The Ohio State University VALIC Deferred 
Compensation Plan (collectively, the “Deferred Compensation Plans”) is proposed.  
 
WHEREAS certain amendments were required to be made to the Deferred Compensation 
Plans by December 31, 2011 to comply with the requirements of the Pension Protection 
Act of 2006 (“PPA”), the Heroes Earnings Assistance and Relief Tax Act of 2008 (“HEART”) 
and the Worker, Retiree, and Employer Recovery Act of 2008 (“WRERA”); and 
 
WHEREAS the University has the authority to amend the Deferred Compensation Plans 
from time to time; and 
 
WHEREAS the University is amending, restating and consolidating the Deferred 
Compensation Plans into one plan document named The Ohio State University Amended 
and Restated 457(B) Deferred Compensation Plan; and 
 
WHEREAS the restatement incorporates changes necessary to maintain compliance with 
Section 457(b) of the Internal Revenue Code and related guidance; adds the ability for 
active participants to make withdrawals due to unforeseeable emergencies; and removes 
the ability for active participants to make certain catch-up contributions to the plan; and 
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WHEREAS the Board of Trustees has reviewed and considered the actions of the Office 
of Legal Affairs, the Office of Human Resources and the Senior Vice President for Business 
and Finance and Chief Financial Officer to amend the Deferred Compensation Plans to 
comply with PPA, HEART and WRERA, as set forth in the amendment attached as Exhibit 
A and incorporated herein by reference; and 
 
WHEREAS the Board of Trustees has determined that the actions of the Office of Legal 
Affairs, the Office of Human Resources and the Senior Vice President for Business and 
Finance and Chief Financial Officer to amend the Deferred Compensation Plans and 
execute the amendment prior to the date of this Resolution were proper and in the best 
interests of the University: 
 
NOW THEREFORE 
 
BE IT RESOLVED, That the amendment of the Deferred Compensation Plans, in the form 
attached hereto as Exhibit A, be and hereby is approved, ratified and adopted effective as 
stated therein; and 
 
BE IT FURTHER RESOLVED, That the adoption and implementation of the amendment 
and any actions relating thereto by the Office of Legal Affairs, the Office of Human 
Resources and the Senior Vice President for Business and Finance and Chief Financial 
Officer that have been taken or made prior to the date of this Resolution are hereby ratified, 
affirmed and approved. 
 
(See Appendix XXIII for background information, page 460.) 

 
*** 

 
APPROVAL OF AMENDMENT AND RESTATEMENT OF  

THE OHIO STATE UNIVERSITY DEFERRED COMPENSATION PLANS 
Resolution No. 2012-66 

 
Synopsis: The University maintains The Ohio State University ING Financial Advisers 
Deferred Compensation Plan, The Ohio State University Deferred Compensation Plan 
funded by TIAA-CREF, The Ohio State University Lincoln National Deferred Compensation 
Plan and The Ohio State University VALIC Deferred Compensation Plan (collectively, the 
“Deferred Compensation Plans”). Approval of the amendment, restatement and 
consolidation of the Deferred Compensation Plans into The Ohio State University 
Amended and Restated 457(b) Deferred Compensation Plan (the “457(b) Plan”) and 
authorization for adopting future amendments to the 457(b) Plan are proposed. 
 
WHEREAS the University maintains the Deferred Compensation Plans; and 
 
WHEREAS the University has the authority to amend the Deferred Compensation Plans 
from time to time; and 
 
WHEREAS the University desires to amend, restate and consolidate the Deferred 
Compensation Plans into the 457(b) Plan to comply with applicable laws, regulations and 
administrative authority and to make certain administrative changes: 
 
NOW THEREFORE 
 
BE IT RESOLVED, That the amendment, restatement and consolidation of the Deferred 
Compensation Plans into the 457(b) Plan, in substantially the form attached hereto as 
Exhibit A, be, and hereby is, adopted effective as of January 1, 2012; and 
 
BE IT FURTHER RESOLVED, That the Senior Vice President for Business and Finance 
and Chief Financial Officer is hereby authorized to execute the 457(b) Plan and any other 
agreements, certificates, instruments, documents, or conveyances necessary to effectuate 
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the amendment, restatement and consolidation of the Deferred Compensation Plans into 
the 457(b) Plan; and 
 
BE IT FURTHER RESOLVED, That if, in the future, further amendments to the 457(b) Plan 
(or to any other ancillary documents for the 457(b) Plan) of a technical or non-discretionary 
nature become necessary to either: (1) secure or maintain compliance with federal tax 
laws; or (2) conform to amendments of the governing provisions of the Ohio Revised Code, 
then the Senior Vice President for Business and Finance and Chief Financial Officer, in 
consultation with the Office of Human Resources and the Office of Legal Affairs, is hereby 
authorized to take such actions and execute such documents as are necessary to 
effectuate such amendments and ancillary documents, without further review or resolution 
by the Board of Trustees. 
 
(See Appendix XXIV for background information, page 465.) 

 
*** 

 
RATIFICATION AND APPROVAL OF AMENDMENT RELATING TO THE OHIO 

PUBLIC EDUCATION INSTITUTIONS’ ALTERNATIVE RETIRMENT PLAN 
Resolution No. 2012-67 

 
Synopsis: Ratification and approval of amendment to certain individual alternative 
retirement plans (collectively, the “Individual Plans”) made on behalf of adopting employers 
for compliance with the requirements of the Pension Protection Act of 2006 (“PPA”), the 
Heroes Earnings Assistance and Relief Tax Act of 2008 (“HEART”), and the Worker, 
Retiree, and Employer Recovery Act of 2008 (“WRERA”) is proposed. 
 
WHEREAS the IRS required that certain amendments be made to all individual alternative 
retirement plans by December 31, 2011 in order to comply with the Pension Protection Act 
of 2006 (“PPA”), the Heroes Earnings Assistance and Relief Tax Act of 2008 (“HEART”), 
and the Worker, Retiree, and Employer Recovery Act of 2008 (“WRERA”); and 
 
WHEREAS the University adopted those amendments for its individual Alternative 
Retirement Plan at its November 4, 2011, meeting of the Board of Trustees; and 
WHEREAS as the Volume Submitter Plan sponsor, the University also exercised its 
authority to adopt those amendments on behalf of other individual alternative retirement 
plans that previously had not adopted them. The amendment on behalf of those other 
individual alternative retirement plans was approved by the Office of Legal Affairs, the 
Office of Human Resources and outside counsel, and was executed by the Senior Vice 
President for Business and Finance and Chief Financial Officer on December 15, 2011; 
and 
WHEREAS the Board of Trustees has reviewed and considered the actions of the Office 
of Legal Affairs, the Office of Human Resources and the Chief Financial Officer and Senior 
Vice President for Business and Finance to amend certain Individual Plans, as set forth in 
the amendment attached as Exhibit A and incorporated herein by reference; and 
 
WHEREAS the Board of Trustees has determined that the actions of the Office of Legal 
Affairs, the Office of Human Resources and the Senior Vice President for Business and 
Finance and Chief Financial Officer to amend those Individual Plans and execute the 
amendment on behalf of the applicable adopting employers prior to the date of this 
Resolution were proper and in the best interests of the University and such adopting 
employers: 
 
NOW THEREFORE 
 
BE IT RESOLVED, That the amendment, in the form attached hereto as Exhibit A, be and 
hereby is approved, ratified and adopted effective as of the date specified therein; and  
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BE IT FURTHER RESOLVED, That the adoption and implementation of the amendment 
and any actions relating thereto by the Office of Legal Affairs, the Office of Human 
Resources and the Senior Vice President for Business and Finance and Chief Financial 
Officer that have been taken or made prior to the date of this Resolution are hereby ratified, 
affirmed and approved. 
 
(See Appendix XXV for background information, page 482.) 

 
*** 

 
AUTHORIZATION TO ENTER INTO PROFESSIONAL SERVICES CONTRACT AND 

TO ENTER INTO AND/OR INCREASE CONSTRUCTION CONTRACTS 
Resolution No. 2012-68 

 
APPROVAL TO ENTER INTO PROFESSIONAL SERVICES CONTRACTS 

OARDC, REPLACE AGRONOMY AND FORESTRY GREENHOUSES 
 

APPROVAL TO ENTER INTO/INCREASE CONSTRUCTION CONTRACTS 
EAST REGIONAL CHILLED WATER PLANT 

OARDC, REPLACE AGRONOMY AND FORESTRY GREENHOUSES 
SCHOTTENSTEIN CENTER, BASKETBALL PRACTICE FACILITY 

SELECTED TUNNEL REPLACEMENT PROJECTS 
 
Synopsis: Authorization to enter into professional services and to enter into and/or increase 
construction contracts, as detailed in the attached materials, is requested.  
 
WHEREAS in accordance with the attached materials, the University desires to undertake 
and enter into professional services contract for the following projects: 
 

 Prof 
Svcs. 
Amount 

Total 
Project 

 

OARDC, Replace Agronomy and Forestry 
Greenhouses 

 

$0.8M $4.1M Insurance funds 

WHEREAS in accordance with the attached materials, the University desires to undertake 
and enter into and/or increase construction contracts for the following projects: 
 

 
Constr. 
Amount 

Total 
Project 

 

East Regional Chilled Water Plant $34.7M $43.0M University bond 
proceeds 

 
OARDC, Replace Agronomy and 

Forestry Greenhouses 
 

$3.3M $4.1M Insurance funds 

Schottenstein Center, Basketball 
Practice Facility 

$10.9M $13.8M Auxiliary funds 
Development funds 
 

Selected Tunnel Replacement Projects 
 

$4.9M $6.4M University bond 
proceeds 

 
NOW THEREFORE  
 
BE IT RESOLVED, That the President and/or Senior Vice President for Administration and 
Planning be authorized to enter into a professional services contract and to enter into 
and/or increase construction contracts for the projects listed above in accordance with 



February 10, 2012 meeting, Board of Trustees 
 

443 

established University and State of Ohio procedures, with all actions to be reported to the 
Board at the appropriate time. 
 
(See Appendix XXVI for background information, page 488.) 

 
*** 

 
SALE OF REAL ESTATE 

Resolution No. 2012-69 
 

VACANT LAND, 0.69 ACRES 
APPLE CREEK, OHIO 

 
Synopsis: Authorization is requested to sell vacant land owned by the University containing 
approximately 0.69 acres located on Grange Street, Apple Creek, Ohio, to an adjacent 
property owner.  
 
WHEREAS in 2001, the University and ATI, Wooster Campus, acquired approximately 
1725 acres of land and buildings from the Ohio Department of Mental Retardation and 
Developmental Disabilities in Wayne County, near Apple Creek, Ohio (Resolution 2001-
14); and 
 
WHEREAS the property is being used to support various programs being offered by ATI 
but some of the land containing wooded areas is not being used by OSU/ATI and can be 
considered excess to the mission of ATI; and  
 
WHEREAS Jason and Ronda Shultzman have offered to purchase land from Ohio State 
adjacent to their property located at 150 Grange Street, Apple Creek, Ohio 44606, to 
remedy an encroachment issue; and 
 
WHEREAS the vacant land to be purchased has been appraised indicating a market value 
of $13,800; and 
 
WHEREAS the Shultzmans have agreed to pay $13,800 for the property plus the costs of 
the appraisal and survey of the property, and closing costs for a total of $15,900; and 
 
WHEREAS the appropriate Ohio State offices have determined that the property is excess 
to any immediate or long-term needs of the University and the sale of this real estate is in 
the best interest of the University: 
 
NOW THEREFORE 
 
BE IT RESOLVED, That the President and/or Senior Vice President for Administration & 
Planning be authorized to take any action required to effect the sale of vacant land 
containing approximately 0.69 acres on Grange Street, Apple Creek, Ohio upon such terms 
and conditions deemed to be in the best interest of the University. 
 
(See Appendix XXVII for background information, page 495.) 

 
*** 

 
PURCHASE OF REAL ESTATE 

Resolution No. 2012-70 
 

TWO CITY ALLEYS IN THE SOUTH CAMPUS DISTRICT 
COLUMBUS, OHIO 43201 
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Synopsis: Authorization is requested to purchase property from the City of Columbus 
described as the East/West alley immediately south of West 11th Avenue between Hunter 
and Highland Avenues and the North/South alley between Hunter and Highland Avenues.  
 
WHEREAS at the request of the University, the City of Columbus has offered to vacate 
and sell the above described alleys for $24,900, subject to approval of the sale by the 
Columbus City Council and subject to retention of a general utility easement for public 
utilities currently located in the alley, and an appraisal of this property that supports the 
purchase price that is being offered by the City to sell the property to the University; and 
 
WHEREAS the purchase of this property supports the University’s approved Framework 
Plan, will provide land required for construction projects in the South Campus District; and  
 
WHEREAS the property is located within the University’s South Campus Acquisition Area; 
and  
 
WHEREAS the appropriate University offices have determined that the purchase of this 
property would be in the best interest of the University: 
 
 
NOW THEREFORE  
 
BE IT RESOLVED, That the President and/or Senior Vice President for Administration and 
Planning be authorized to take any action required to effect the purchase of the East/West 
alley, immediately south of West 11th Avenue and the North/South alley between Hunter 
and Highland Avenues from the City of Columbus, and to acquire title to this property upon 
such terms and conditions deemed to be in the best interest of the University. 
 
(See Appendix XXVIII for background information, page 497.) 

 
*** 

 
SUBLEASE 

Resolution No. 2012-71 
 

BETWEEN SCITECH AND THE OHIO STATE UNIVERISITY 
CENTER FOR ELECTRON MICROSCOPY ANALYSIS (CEMAS) 

COLUMBUS, OHIO 
 

Synopsis: Authorization is requested for entering into a 10-year sublease of approximately 
22,000 square feet with SciTech, a not-for-profit corporation, for the development of 
Material Science Laboratories, the College of Engineering, at 1305 Kinnear Road, located 
in Columbus, Ohio. 
 
WHEREAS the Board of Trustees of The Ohio State University and the State of Ohio is 
presented with the opportunity to enter into a 10-year sublease of real property in 
Columbus, Ohio with SciTech, a not-for-profit corporation; and  
 
WHEREAS the Center for Electron Microscopy Analysis (CEMAS) project will provide 
additional space for purposes deemed critical to the College of Engineering, Material 
Science mission; and 
 
WHEREAS The Ohio State University, College of Engineering will pay rent / operating 
expenses in the amount of $5.1M and Tenant Improvements in the amount of $5.0M and 
will reimburse Business and Finance for the extension of a Line of Credit and will also use 
current cash on hand in the College of Engineering; and  
 
WHEREAS the sublease of this facility is in the best interest of the University: 
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NOW THEREFORE 
 
BE IT RESOLVED, That the President and/or the Chief Financial Officer and Senior Vice 
President for Business and Finance be authorized to take any action required to effect the 
execution of a 10-year sublease with SciTech at such terms determined to be in the best 
interest of the State of Ohio and the University. 
 
(See Appendix XXIX for background information, page 499.) 

 
*** 

 
AUTHORIZATION FOR RELEASE OF FUNDS 

Resolution No. 2012-72 
 
Synopsis: Release of funds for the Medical Center Expansion Project is recommended. 
 
WHEREAS in September 2009 the Board of Trustees authorized the Medical Center 
Expansion (ProjectONE) at a cost not to exceed $1 billion and authorized the President 
and/or Senior Vice President for Administration and Planning, in consultation with the 
Senior Vice President for Health Sciences, to enter into design, construction, construction 
management, and other contracts as necessary for the project in accordance with the 
established University and state of Ohio procedures, with all actions to be reported to the 
Board at the appropriate time; and 
 
WHEREAS the project is expected to be funded by $925 million from University bond 
proceeds and $75 million from development funds for a total authorized project amount not 
to exceed $1 billion; and 
 
WHEREAS in April 2011 the Board of Trustees authorized the acceptance of a federal 
Health Resources and Services Administration (HRSA) $100M grant to be expended for 
an expanded cancer ambulatory program for radiation oncology services and authorized 
such program as part of the Medical Center Expansion Project; and 
 
WHEREAS the President and/or Senior Vice President for Administration and Planning in 
consultation with the Senior Vice President for Health Sciences, shall only spend such 
funds as are released by the Board; and 
 
WHEREAS the President and/or Senior Vice President for Administration and Planning, in 
consultation with the Senior Vice President for Health Sciences, shall report to the Board 
on the progress of the project every six months or more frequently as appropriate or as 
requested by the Board and, as a part of such reports, shall request release of such funds 
as needed; and 
 
WHEREAS the following funds for construction commitments are requested for release: 
 
Commitments to be made through June 2012: 
 
Cancer & Critical Care Tower  $34.9M 
Infrastructure & Roadways  $22.6M 
Rhodes, Doan, James, Cramblett Mechanical Electrical Plumbing $ 7.1M 
 $64.6M 
 
NOW THEREFORE 
 
BE IT RESOLVED, That a total amount of $64.6 million is hereby released for construction 
and related services as requested. 

 
*** 
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REPORT OF INTERIM APPROVAL  
APPROVAL TO ENTER INTO PROFESSIONAL SERVICES CONTRACTS 

Resolution No. 2012-73 
 

INDOOR GOLF FACILITY 
 
The Indoor Golf facility was presented for interim approval to the Chair of the Fiscal Affairs 
Committee during the period between the December and the February meetings of the 
Board of Trustees, in order to begin the design process and coincide with the 
implementation dates for construction reform. Utilizing the design-build method will allow 
completion of the facility for use during the fall/winter of 2013. 
 
Professional Services Contracts 
 

 
Prof Svc 
Amount 

Total 
Project 

 

Indoor Golf Facility 
 

$0.5M $6.1M Development funds 

Through the submission of this report, the interim approval for this project is being 
presented for your ratification. 
 
(See Appendix XXX for background information, page 501.) 

 
Upon motion of Mr. Brass, seconded by Mr. O’Dell, the Board of Trustees adopted the 
foregoing resolutions by unanimous roll call vote, cast by Trustees Wexner, O’Dell, 
Shumate, Hicks, Fisher, Schottenstein, Brass, Ratner, Marbley, Kass, Jurgensen, 
Wadsworth and Smucker. 

 
*** 

 
COMMITTEE OF THE WHOLE 

 
Dr. Cloyd: 
 

Mr. Chairman, may I ask that we move to a Committee of the Whole to take under 
consideration a new item of business proposed by the administration involving the 
naming of the Medical Center with the understanding that a vote of the Committee will 
constitute a vote by the full body? 

 
Mr. Wexner: 
 

Yes. 
 
Upon motion of Dr. Cloyd, seconded by Mr. Shumate, the Board of Trustees adopted the 
motion by acclamation of Trustees Wexner, O’Dell, Shumate, Hicks, Fisher, Schottenstein, 
Brass, Ratner, Marbley, Kass, Jurgensen, Wadsworth and Smucker. 
 
Dr. Cloyd: 
 

Thank you, Mr. Chairman. Could I ask that you recuse yourself from the consideration 
of the matter as I call on President Gee to make his presentation? 

 
President Gee: 
 

Thank you. So it is my great pleasure to introduce for the Board’s consideration a 
proposal for the honorific naming of our academic Medical Center to commemorate the 
incalculable leadership and legacy of Leslie Wexner at The Ohio State University. 
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I will not read the resolution because I think everyone has a copy, but I do want to take 
this opportunity in fact I insisted on taking this opportunity to make a few remarks. 
 
The Chairman’s colleagues on the Board know that he is a man whose determination 
and abilities abound in equal measure a person of enormous talents that he has used to 
touch and improve countless lives at this University, in our community, and certainly 
across the country and around the world. Through his decades of leadership, service 
and strategic guidance, he has quite simply transformed Ohio State.  
 
Think of the remarkable contemporary arts center named in honor of his father. The 
groundbreaking partnership forged with the Royal Shakespeare Company, the efforts 
he has led to honor friends and mentors in business, law and global trade and his 
personal involvement with and mentorship of current students. 
 
But the area in which he and his wife, Abigail, who I am pleased to say is in the audience 
today, have made their most indelible mark is surely our Medical Center. Abigail, of 
course, serves on its Board, and their family is firmly intertwined with signature programs 
such as Pelotonia and the James Fund for Life that raise substantial funds to advance 
the Medical Center’s work. Here, Les’ passion, purpose, and unyielding vision take a 
laser focus, and the result is the same bold aspirations that characterize his own 
remarkable life story. 
 
As we all know, a year ago nearly to this very day we celebrated the largest gift in the 
University’s history; $100 million from the Wexner’s and the Limited Brands Foundation. 
That gift is, by any measure, a transformative one. But today we celebrate the 
innumerable ways in which Les Wexner’s leadership and engagement have forever 
changed the University. 
 
One of the greatest pleasures of my career has been the opportunity to work closely with 
Les for now over 20 years, my friend. He has taught me a great deal about creating the 
future, inspiring others, and always, always reaching beyond the known. That is what 
we celebrate with today’s proposed honorific naming of the Wexner Medical Center, 
where “reaching beyond what is known” will forevermore be the ethos shared with the 
man whose name it bears. 
 
Finally, on a personal level, I will say that this day ranks among the high points of my 
life’s work in higher education. I am proud to be part of this moment. With that, I 
respectfully submit this resolution to the Board. 

 
Dr. Cloyd: 
 

Thank you, President Gee. May I have a motion to adopt this resolution, which would be 
the honorific naming of our academic Medical Center? In the future it would be known 
as the Wexner Medical Center at The Ohio State University. 

 
Mr. Brass: 

 
I would be honored to so move. 

 
Dr. Wadsworth: 

 
I second the motion. 

 
Dr. Cloyd: 
 

The naming of our academic Medical Center is a major event, or as our Chairman would 
often say about things like this, “This is really a big deal.” It represents a very significant 
recognition. Our naming guidelines for honorific namings require us to only honor 
individuals who have made outstanding service to the University or outstanding service 
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to our community. Les and Abigail Wexner have consistently provided extraordinary 
leadership both to our great University and the Ohio community.  
 
It is so appropriate to name our academic Medical Center for Les and his family for their 
great service and all the passion, energy and leadership they bring to enhance the 
quality of peoples’ lives. It is also a great honor for our academic Medical Center to now 
have the name Wexner Medical Center associated with it. 

 
Any other comments from any other Board members? 

 
Mr. Schottenstein: 
 

I just have a couple things that I want to say. This is a very special day for the University 
as special as perhaps any other and we are very lucky to have both Les and Abigail with 
us today. 
 
Gordon, you mentioned my dad earlier, and my dad passed away in 2004 on February 
11, which would be tomorrow. He adored Les for all the right reasons, and I think the 
feeling was mutual. I remember once asking my dad, “Why do you like him so much?” 
And he said that he has a great heart, and my dad was a man of few words. He said, 
“He has a great heart and he is a leader.” I said, “What makes him a leader?” And he 
said, “He leads.” I guess leaders lead and Abigail is no different. 
 
No one cares more for this University or works harder on behalf of this University than 
you. I don’t know how you do it 24/7, 365 days of every year, so this is a very special 
moment and a very appropriate moment. We have heard about how great our Medical 
Center is doing and today it got better. I just think this is a great day, and I am so pleased 
to be a part of it. 

 
Dr. Cloyd: 
 

Thank you, Bob. Yes. Alan? 
 
Mr. Brass: 
 

You know, since I came on this Board, I have been associated with our Medical Center, 
and I think it was probably within 24 hours that Les and I were talking about the Medical 
Center. It has come a long way. It is on a climb that I think we all can be very proud of. 
 
I think probably the most important thing in having your name associated with it is your 
love for the students, the residents, the fellows, and the thousands of people that are 
going to come through that Medical Center to be trained and be charged with healing. I 
just can’t think of a better name for someone who has dedicated his life to trying to make 
things better. It has got the right name. It has got the right name. 

 
Dr. Cloyd: 
 

Thank you, Alan. Thank you for your comments. 
 
Mr. Shumate: 
 

If I might add, I have had the privilege of serving on the Board for two terms with Les as 
our Chair. His first term was in the 90s, and again I think as you pointed out, Gil, this is 
based on a lifetime of commitment and dedication to Ohio State University based upon 
outstanding leadership. One of the things that I have often said is that I don’t know a 
person that has greater vision than Les Wexner.  
 
He is truly a visionary leader. But I think that over the years, what I have appreciated so 
much is his passion to turn that vision into reality. Our University is better, certainly our 
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Medical Center is better when we think about not just the building project but the quality 
of what is going on as evidenced by the report that Dr. Gabbe gave to us today. So it is 
more than appropriate for what Les has done for helping all of us better understand the 
importance of the University as well as the academic Medical Center to our city, our 
state and, in fact, the world.  
 

Dr. Cloyd: 
 

Judge Marbley? 
 

Judge Marbley: 
 

I am going to try not to repeat everything that has already been said, but as I look 
around the Board, I am one of the few people that have had the distinct pleasure of 
serving both with Les and with Abigail. I have served a number of years with Abigail as 
the Chair of the Nationwide Children’s Hospital. It was under Abigail’s leadership that 
she brought in that transformative gift that Jerry and his company were responsible for.  
 
What I will say about them is that they are people of uncommon compassion and simply 
prelapsarian integrity. It has been an honor to live in this community where you all have 
been so dedicated to the well-being of the children of this community as well as the 
adults and, of course, your commitment to this University is unparalleled. But what 
others will also know is that your commitment to the world is consistent with your 
commitment to this University, so we now have a world class Medical Center thanks to 
you and Abigail. I think that the vision and the compassion that you bring to this, and 
that you will continue to bring to this, will be a bellwether for all of us and will be a 
beacon of hope for many. So I congratulate you on this day and I am honored to have 
the opportunity to serve with you both.  

 
Mr. Wexner: 

 
Thank you. 
 

Dr. Cloyd: 
 

Thank you all for those comments, very well intended. I would like to call the question 
and ask the Secretary to please call the roll. 

 
HONORIFIC NAMING OF THE OHIO STATE UNIVERSITY MEDICAL CENTER 

Resolution No. 2012-74 
 

IN THE OHIO STATE UNIVERSITY MEDICAL CENTER 
WHEREVER THE CURRENT MEDICAL CENTER NAME IS PRESENTED: 

“WEXNER MEDICAL CENTER AT THE OHIO STATE UNIVERSITY” 
 

Synopsis: The honorific naming of the “Wexner Medical Center at the Ohio State 
University” located at 410 W. 10th Ave. on the OSU Columbus Campus, is respectfully 
recommended in recognition of Mr. and Mrs. Wexner, as well as their family and 
companies, to acknowledge and celebrate the history of transformational contributions to 
the University as well as to local, state, national and international communities. 
 
WHEREAS Abigail and Leslie Wexner, their family, associated corporate and foundation 
interests and related business partners have had an enormous impact on our University 
and our community, and they continue to provide outstanding, dedicated service to both. 
The results of their loyalty and devotion of time continue to make a positive and dramatic 
impact. And their work here is not yet complete; 
 
WHEREAS the University values and recognizes the significant interest in community 
health care that both Abigail and Les demonstrate at Ohio State and elsewhere; and  
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WHEREAS while articulating the entire story of the University’s relationship with the 
Wexners would fill volumes, some examples of Abigail and Les Wexner’s unwavering 
service and commitment to The Ohio State University that reinforce the case for this 
honorific naming include: 
 

 Holding leadership positions on seven different governing boards over the past 
20+ years, and have personally dedicated thousands of hours helping to gather 
support for university programs; 

 Raising more than $60 million for the Wexner Center Foundation; 

 Being the major funder of the Wexner Center for the Arts, named to honor his 
father; 

 Les has more than 15 years of service to the Board of Trustees, including two 
years as Chair; 

 Being the leaders in establishing Royal Shakespeare Company Partnership; 

 Hosting the biennial Go Bucks Beat Blue! rally from 2004-2008, raising $968,000 
in family gifts & proceeds; 

 Helping lead efforts to honor friends/mentors/professors by establishing 
- Pfahl Hall (Dr. John K. Pfahl), Fisher COB Building Complex Fund 
-  Fisher Prize (Fisher Council on Global Trade & Technology) honoring Max 

Fisher in 1998 
- Cullman MBA Fellowship (Dr. W. Arthur Cullman) 
- John C. Elam/Vorys Sater Professorship in Law; and  

 
WHEREAS Abigail and Leslie Wexner, their family, associated corporate and foundation 
interests and related business partners continue to be leaders in the advocacy for Health 
and Wellness and Medical Research. Some examples of which include: 
 

• Limited Brands Foundation is a major funding partner ($2.5 million through 2014) 
for Pelotonia to support cancer research at The James Cancer Center of The 
Ohio State University.  

• The entire Wexner family participates in Pelotonia: with Les and Abigail ranking 
among the top Pelotonia 2011 fundraisers, Hannah, David, Harry, and Sarah 
having ridden in the event all three years. 

• The initiation of the James Fund for Life, now in its 11th year, which the Wexners 
continue to chair.  

 
NOW THEREFORE 
 
BE IT RESOLVED, That in accordance with paragraph (F) of Rule 3335-1-08 of the 
Administrative Code, the Board of Trustees approves that the aforementioned Ohio State 
University Medical Center be honorifically named the ““Wexner Medical Center at The Ohio 
State University.” Further, in accordance with the University’s naming guidelines, the Board 
of Trustees waives any condition that Les or Abigail Wexner cease service to the University 
prior to this honorific naming.  

 
*** 

 
Upon motion of Mr. Brass, seconded by Dr. Wadsworth, the Board of Trustees adopted 
the foregoing resolution by unanimous roll call vote, cast by Trustees O’Dell, Shumate, 
Hicks, Fisher, Schottenstein, Brass, Ratner, Marbley, Kass, Jurgensen, Wadsworth and 
Smucker. 
 
Mr. Wexner: 
 

Thank you. I woke up this morning at around 4:00 a.m. anticipating this day, and I 
thought about different things to say and reflections of clear and incredible appreciation. 
 
Just simply, I appreciate being associated with the University and all of you. But for Ohio 
State, I would not have been able to go to college, and I know that but also for the friends 
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and the provocations of faculty. I went through the school, and I didn’t know that I was 
getting an education. I just kind of went through. I have to admit, I decided to go to 
college because it was a good thing to do. Once I started, I couldn’t wait to get out. I 
remember sitting in that stadium on a warm June day thinking that I am done, and they 
are going to give me a diploma and I am through. 
 
Even speculating that I might never wonder around the campus again, I tend not to go 
back, I have never had any particular desire to go back and visit my high school or visit 
a house I lived in or neighborhood, that is just not how I am, but something did happen, 
which was probably instigated most by Jack Kessler who is here. Jack and I have been 
friends since college. Neither one of us could afford the store that he worked in, so he 
got free cleaning and I got to look at nice clothes. Jack influenced me to get engaged 
with the University and to think about spending some time here, which I have done, and 
it has been quite remarkable, the connection.  
 
I think the thank you is for those people that created the institution before I set foot in it 
and for those people that have governed it since. I often think about that day in June of 
graduation and people standing around. Some were laughing and some crying when 
singing Carmen Ohio, and I was speculating, because some of them seemed very intent 
about it, but I was kind of a spectator. They talked about how firm thy friendship and the 
years will roll, and I thought those were kind of silly words. But the years do roll and time 
does change, hopefully for the better, and clearly the friendship of the University in the 
broadest sense since those first days when a 17 year old came on campus, it has been 
the core of the things I care about and the core of influence. It extends not only through 
me, but to Abigail and to the children. 
 
In the same spirit, I do affirm my friendship and do appreciate the friendship of all of you 
and the University. Thank you. 

 
President Gee: 
 

I will take executive privilege and dismiss us. 
 

*** 
 

Thereupon the Board adjourned to meet Friday, April 6, 2012, at The Ohio State University, 
Longaberger Alumni House, Columbus, OH. 
 
 
Attest: 
 
 
 
Leslie H. Wexner David G. Horn  
Chairman  Secretary  
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(APPENDIX XX) 
 

Compliance Assessment

Results and Recommendations

Presented to the Board of Trustees

February 10, 2012

 
 

© 2012 Protiviti Inc. and Dewey & LeBoeuf LLP

CONFIDENTIAL: This document is for your company's internal use only and may not be copied nor distributed to another third party.

Consolidated Recommendations

The University should establish an enterprise-wide Office of University Compliance and 

Integrity, led by a newly-created position of Chief Compliance and Integrity Officer

Office of University 

Compliance and Integrity

The University should establish a University Compliance and Integrity Committee to be 

chaired by the Chief Compliance and Integrity Officer

University Compliance 

and Integrity Committee

The University should develop an enterprise-wide compliance and integrity risk 

assessment methodology as a part of its ongoing initiative to establish an enterprise risk 

management program

Compliance and Integrity 

Risk Assessment

The scope and intended audience of the existing Code of Ethics should be expanded to 

serve as a comprehensive, University-wide Code of Conduct
Code of Conduct

OSU should revise and streamline the existing policy-making process by modifying the 

“University Policy Process” and harmonizing the University’s procedure framework
Policy-Making Process

Significant new University initiatives, or significant changes to existing processes, should 

be subject to appropriate review by University Compliance and Integrity Committee
Change Management

The University should establish a consistent methodology to identify the compliance 

training needs of faculty, administrators, employees, and other stakeholders, and provide 

appropriate tools designed to ensure that necessary training has been effectively delivered

Training

Office of University Compliance and Integrity should be charged with ensuring that key 

integrity and compliance risks to the University are subject to consistent and 

comprehensive monitoring

Monitoring and 

Investigations
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© 2012 Protiviti Inc. and Dewey & LeBoeuf LLP
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Background, Objectives, and Scope

“We are determined to do all we can to assure that our programs and protocols are a model, and in order to 

achieve this, we think that, and I speak for the Committee when I say this, that it is necessary to perhaps look at 

compliance in a slightly different way, and that is to think of it as a matter of institutional integrity.”

Report of the Audit and Compliance Committee – June 24, 2011 Meeting of the Board of Trustees:  

Our Guiding Principles

• Aspire to the Committee’s goal of having the University’s compliance function as a model among higher 

education institutions

• Recognize the unique culture of higher education institutions and embrace concepts of shared governance

• Provide improved independence and authority for the University’s compliance function, ensuring that the root 

causes of compliance issues are effectively and timely addressed 

Scope and Methodology

• Conducted a current state assessment of the University’s compliance efforts across 12 Categories of 

Requirements (“CoRs”)

• Benchmarked the University’s compliance program against leading higher education and private industry 

peers and aspirational targets

• Developed and validated proposed future state operating model and supporting recommendations with 

process owners and University leadership  

 
 

© 2012 Protiviti Inc. and Dewey & LeBoeuf LLP

CONFIDENTIAL: This document is for your company's internal use only and may not be copied nor distributed to another third party.

Implementation Strategy Considerations

• Effectively managing the communication of the University’s compliance and integrity strategy will be key to be 

setting an appropriate foundation for cultural changes, as well as maximizing the value of contributions from current 

compliance leaders and minimizing the risk of attrition in key roles.  

The University should establish a communications strategy and Project Management 

Office (PMO) to direct the announcement and socialization, as well as the detailed design 

and execution, of the recommended Compliance and  Integrity Program enhancements.  

Recommendation

Communications Strategy

0

• With the magnitude of  implementation steps necessary, and the expected timeline,  establishing a PMO 

structure is recommended to manage tasks and coordinate with the various internal and external process owners 

and stakeholders.  

• Key responsibilities would include establishing and managing ongoing project steering committee, overseeing 

project activities at both a holistic level and detailed level, creating a status tracking and reporting mechanism to 

highlight key milestones, deliverables, responsible parties, project risks and project status, and evaluating change 

enablement needs, given potential cultural challenges.  

PMO Function
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(APPENDIX XXII) 
 

THE OHIO STATE UNIVERSITY BOARD OF TRUSTEES 
FINANCE COMMITTEE 

 
February 9, 2012 

 
TOPICS:   
 
 Semester Fee Conversion 
 Establishment of a Distance Education Fee  
 
CONTEXT: 
 

The purpose of this report is to outline the semester fee conversion process for 
discussion and to recommend approval of a distance education fee effective 
Summer Term 2012.  

 
SUMMARY: 
 

The conversion of the FY 2012 quarter fee structure to a semester fee structure 
was completed with the pledge (the “Pledge”) to our Students as the guiding 
principle: full-time tuition (general and instructional fees) for an academic year 
under semesters (2 semesters) will not cost more than tuition for that same year 
would have cost under quarters (3 quarters).  
  
A review of the current structure of the distance education program was 
completed and it was determined that there was a need for a revision of the fee 
structure. A summary of this issue and the resolution for a distance education 
fee is attached.  

 
CONSIDERATIONS: 
 

 Was the pledge to the students maintained in the conversion of fees? 

 Is the need for revision of the distance education fee structure explained 
and the need for the new fee justified? 

 
REQUESTED OF THE FINANCE COMMITTEE: 
 

Semester fee conversion - discussion item.  
Distance education fee – review of background material and request for approval 

of proposed fee.  
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THE OHIO STATE UNIVERSITY BOARD OF TRUSTEES 
FINANCE COMMITTEE 

 
February 9, 2012 

 
A. Semester Fee Conversion 
 

With the beginning of the semester structure for the University starting Summer 2012, 
it was necessary to review and convert the student paid fee structure from quarters 
to semesters. This review included instructional and general fees, mandatory fees, 
the non-resident surcharge, program/tech/lab fees and course fees. Per our Pledge 
to the Students, full-time tuition (general and instructional fees) for an academic year 
under semesters will not cost more than tuition for that same year would have cost 
under quarters. The cost of tuition and fees will not be affected by the shift to 
semesters. On the semester calendar, however, students will have two tuition/fee 
payments per year instead of three. 
 
Most fees were converted based on this methodology of three quarters of costs equals 
two semesters of costs. Therefore for most fees, the semester fee rates are 1.5 the 
quarter fee rate. For example, under the quarter system for FY 2012, a full-time 
resident undergraduate student is charged $3,109 per quarter or $9,309 for the 
academic year for instructional and general fees. Under the semester structure, the 
student would be charged $4,654.40 per semester or $9,309 for the academic year 
at the current FY 2012 fee rates. 
 
While this methodology was applicable to most of the student fees, it was not 
universally applicable to all course fees. As part of the conversion process, the entire 
course and academic program structure was reviewed and changed. Therefore, it was 
necessary to cross-walk the current course structure and related fees to the new 
course structure, then convert fees accordingly. This analysis was a joint project of 
the Registrar’s Office, the Office of Financial Planning and Analysis and all colleges 
with course fees. Again the overriding philosophy was to keep the fees cost neutral 
to students. It should also be noted that because of the transition from quarters to 
semesters, the summer 2012 instructional period will be shorter than a typical summer 
under semesters. Some fees, e.g. the Ohio Union Fee and Recreation Fee were more 
appropriately considered as “time based” and not directly tied to academic enrollment. 
Therefore, a different transitional rate was utilized for those fees. Again, this method 
should be cost neutral to students. 
 
All current fees have now been converted for implementation Summer Term 2012.  
 
Any increase in fees for Fiscal Year 2013 will be brought forward for Board of 
Trustees’ review and approval at the April 2012 meeting. This will include any 
increases in tuition, non-resident surcharge, room and board, mandatory fees, 
program/tech/course fees, etc. Any increases that will be brought to the Board of 
Trustees at that time will not be due to semester conversion activities. In bringing any 
increases to the Board of Trustees, the University will be cognizant of the impact the 
tuition payment cycle change will have on the cash flow for students and their parents.  

 
B.  Distance Education Fee Structure  

 
Distance education has long been a focus of various University committees. The 
most recent formal report, released in 2010, was a joint report of the eLearning 
Strategy Committee and the eLearning Strategy Implementation Committee. 
The Strategy Committee, primarily comprised of faculty members and chaired 
by CIO Kathy Starkoff, was tasked with recommending strategic goals for 
eLearning at Ohio State.  
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One of the first recommendations of the Strategy Implementation Committee 
was to “review tuition models for Distance Learning programs and recommend 
alternatives, if appropriate.” Two issues were identified to be addressed 
simultaneously in determining an appropriate tuition model for distance 
education: the inconsistent use of distance education coding within the Student 
Information System (SIS) and the use of the third party contract model by 
colleges for tuition and fees associated with existing distance education courses.  
 
To address these issues, the committees devised a framework for coding course 
sections that would be implemented and monitored on a continuing basis by the 
Office of the University Registrar. Distance education courses are defined as 
courses with no scheduled in-classroom or on-site activities and would be 
uniquely coded in the SIS system. Courses with some scheduled in-classroom 
or on-site activities would be considered hybrid courses and also coded uniquely. 
All other courses would continue to be considered as traditional/regular in SIS.  
 
The following outlines the proposal for the fee structure for distance education 
courses as defined above:  
 
If for a given term a student is enrolled in courses which are ALL defined as 
distance courses, the following fee structure is recommended: 
 

 The standard residential instructional, general, and program fees 
associated with each particular program will be assessed. All course 
specific fees will also be assessed. 

 All on-site fees, including, but not limited to the COTA, recreational, 
Ohio Union, student activities, and technology/lab fees will be waived.  

 A distance education administration fee of $100 per student per term 
will be assessed. The revenue from this fee will fund distance 
education student support and oversight from the Office of the 
University Registrar. 

 If a student is enrolled as a non-resident, a non-resident distance fee 
of $5 will be assessed. 

 
Note that if a student is enrolled in ANY class coded as a hybrid or regular 
course, all standard university fees would apply.  
 
In order to implement this fee structure beginning Summer 2012 as 
recommended by the eLearning Committee, a proposed resolution is attached 
for approval by the Board of Trustees. 
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(APPENDIX XXIII) 
 

RATIFICATION AND APPROVAL OF AMENDMENTS TO 
THE OHIO STATE UNIVERSITY DEFERRED COMPENSATION PLANS 

SUMMARY 
 
Background on the Deferred Compensation Plans: 
 
The University maintains four plans that are eligible deferred compensation plans under 
Section 457(b) of the Internal Revenue Code: The Ohio State University ING Financial 
Advisers Deferred Compensation Plan; The Ohio State University Deferred Compensation 
Plan funded by TIAA-CREF; The Ohio State University Lincoln National Deferred 
Compensation Plan; and The Ohio State University VALIC Deferred Compensation Plan 
(collectively, the “Deferred Compensation Plans”). The terms of these plans are 
substantially the same; only the providers differ. 
 
The Deferred Compensation Plans are voluntary plans designed to assist faculty and staff 
in supplementing their retirement savings. Each plan allows employees to contribute a 
portion of their compensation to the plan and exclude the contribution from taxable income 
for federal and state tax purposes. The plans are subject to rules described in Section 
457(b) of the Internal Revenue Code. 
 
Ratification and approval of the amendment of the Deferred Compensation Plans: 
 
The IRS required that certain amendments to the Deferred Compensation Plans be made 
by December 31, 2011 to comply with the Pension Protection Act of 2006 (“PPA”), the 
Heroes Earnings Assistance and Relief Tax Act of 2008 (“HEART”), and the Worker, 
Retiree, and Employer Recovery Act of 2008 (“WRERA”). That amendment was approved 
by the Office of Legal Affairs, the Office of Human Resources and outside counsel, and 
was executed by the Senior Vice President for Business and Finance and Chief Financial 
Officer on December 29, 2011. 
 
Purpose of the Resolution. The resolution ratifies and approves the amendment to the 
Deferred Compensation Plans and ratifies the action of the Senior Vice President for 
Business and Finance and Chief Financial Officer in signing the amendment. 
 
Approval of the amendment, restatement and consolidation of the Deferred 
Compensation Plans into one plan document named The Ohio State University 
Amended and Restated 457(b) Deferred Compensation Plan: 
 
To streamline administration, the University is amending, restating and consolidating the 
Deferred Compensation Plans into one plan document named The Ohio State University 
Amended and Restated 457(b) Deferred Compensation Plan (the “457(b) Plan”). In 
addition, the restatement: (a) incorporates changes necessary to maintain compliance with 
Section 457(b) of the Internal Revenue Code and related guidance; (b) adds the ability for 
active participants to make withdrawals due to unforeseeable emergencies; and (c) 
removes the ability for active participants to make certain catch-up contributions to the 
plan. The amendment and restatement has been approved by the Office of Legal Affairs, 
the Office of Human Resources and outside counsel. Purpose of the Resolution. The 
resolution: 
 

 Approves the amendment, restatement and consolidation of the Deferred 
Compensation Plans as set forth in the 457(b) Plan, effective as of January 1, 
2012; 
 

 Authorizes the Senior Vice President for Business and Finance and Chief 
Financial Officer to sign the 457(b) Plan and any other documents needed to 
carry out the resolution; and 
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 Delegates authority to adopt and effectuate certain technical or non-
discretionary amendments that are necessary to comply with federal tax laws or 
the Ohio Revised Code to the Senior Vice President for Business and Finance 
and Chief Financial Officer, in consultation with the Office of Human Resources 
and the Office of Legal Affairs, without further review or resolutions by the Board. 
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(APPENDIX XXIV) 
 

The Ohio State University 
Amended and Restated 457(b) Deferred Compensation Plan 

 
 

The Employer previously established The Ohio State University ING Financial 
Advisors Deferred Compensation Plan, The Ohio State University Deferred Compensation 
Plan funded by TIAA-CREF, The Ohio State University Lincoln National Deferred 
Compensation Plan and The Ohio State University VALIC Deferred Compensation Plan.  
The Employer hereby amends, restates and consolidates those plans as set forth in this 
Plan, effective as of January 1, 2012. 
 

The Plan is established pursuant to Ohio Revised Code Section 148.04(F) and 
is intended to comply with Internal Revenue Code Section 457.  The Plan is effective as to 
each Eligible Employee upon the date he or she becomes an Active Participant by 
executing a Participation Agreement with the Employer. 
 

I.  Definitions 
 
1.01 Account shall mean the Account or Accounts maintained by a Provider 

reflecting the interest of a Participant under the Plan. 
 
1.02 Active Participant shall mean an Eligible Employee who has entered into a 

Participation Agreement with the Employer and has not terminated the deferral 
of compensation under the Participation Agreement. 

 
1.03 Age 50 Catch-up Contribution shall mean the catch-up contribution for workers 

who are or who will attain age 50 during a Plan Year, as allowed under Internal 
Revenue Code Section 414(v). 

 
1.04 Beneficiary shall mean the person or entity designated by a Participant in 

accordance with Article VI of the Plan to receive the Participant’s Plan benefits 
in the event of the Participant’s death. 

 
1.05 Benefit Commencement Date shall mean that date upon which payment of 

benefits begins. 
 
1.06 Benefit Payment Option shall mean the method by which benefits are paid to 

the Participant or, if applicable, to the Beneficiary, as described in Section 5.07 
of this Plan. 

 
1.07 Compensation shall have the same meaning as the applicable one of the 

following: 
 

(a) If the Participant is a member of the Ohio Public Employees Retirement 
System or is a participant in The Ohio State University Alternative 
Retirement Plan, as amended from time to time (the “Alternative 
Retirement Plan”) and would be subject to Ohio Revised Code Chapter 
145 had the Participant not made an election pursuant to Ohio Revised 
Code Section 3305.05 or 3305.051, “Compensation” shall mean 
“earnable salary” as defined in division (R) of Ohio Revised Code 
Section 145.01; or 

 
(b) If the Participant is a member of the State Teachers Retirement System 

of Ohio (“STRS”) or is a participant in the Alternative Retirement Plan and 
would be subject to Ohio Revised Code Chapter 3307 had the Participant 
not made an election pursuant to Ohio Revised Code Section 3305.05 
or 3305.051, “Compensation” shall mean “compensation” as defined 
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in division (L) of Ohio Revised Code Section 3307.01.  For purposes 
of this Section 1.07(b), “Compensation” shall be determined without 
regard to STRS Rule 3307-10-01. 

 
Notwithstanding the foregoing, Compensation shall not be reduced by the 
amount of exclusions that are not currently includable in the Participant’s gross 
income by reason of the application of Internal Revenue Code Sections 125, 
132(f), 402(e)(3), 403(b), 414(h)(2) and 457. 

 
In determining the amount or allocation of any contribution that is based on 
Compensation, only Compensation paid to a Participant for services rendered to 
the Employer while employed as an employee of the Employer shall be taken 
into account.  Compensation shall include amounts received following 
Severance from Employment only if the amounts are “Post-Severance 
Compensation.”  Post-Severance Compensation includes the amounts 
described in (a) and (b) below, paid after a Participant’s Severance from 
Employment, but only to the extent such amounts are paid by the later of 2½ 
months after Severance from Employment or the end of the calendar year that 
includes the date of such Severance from Employment. 
 
(a)  Regular pay after Severance from Employment if:  (i) the payment is 

regular compensation for services during the Participant's regular 
working hours, or compensation for services outside the Participant's 
regular working hours (such as overtime or shift differential), 
commissions, bonuses, or other similar payments; and (ii) the 
payment would have been paid to the Participant prior to a Severance 
from Employment if the Participant had continued in employment with 
the Employer.    

 
(b) Leave cashouts if those amounts would have been included in 

Compensation if they were paid prior to the Participant’s Severance 
from Employment, and the amounts are payable for unused accrued 
bona fide sick leave, vacation, or other leave, but only if the Participant 
would have been able to use the leave if employment had continued.     

 
Effective January 1, 2009, an individual receiving a differential wage payment, 
as defined by Internal Revenue Code Section 3401(h)(2), shall be treated as an 
employee of the Employer making the payment (rather than an employee who 
has incurred a Severance from Employment); and the differential wage payment 
shall be treated as compensation for Plan purposes, including Internal Revenue 
Code Section 415 and any other Internal Revenue Code section that references 
the definition of compensation under Internal Revenue Code Section 415. 

 
If all employees of the Employer performing service in the uniformed services 
described in Internal Revenue Code Section 3401(h)(2)(A) are entitled to receive 
differential wage payments (as defined in Internal Revenue Code Section 
3401(h)(2)) on reasonably equivalent terms and, if eligible to participate in a 
retirement plan maintained by the Employer, to make contributions based on the 
payments on reasonably equivalent terms (taking into account Internal Revenue 
Code Sections 410(b)(3), (4), and (5)), then the Plan shall not be treated as 
failing to meet the requirements of any provision described in Internal Revenue 
Code Section 414(u)(1)(C) by reason of any contribution or benefit which is 
based on the differential wage payment. 
 

1.08 Deferral shall mean the amount of Compensation that a Participant agrees to 
contribute to an Account.  Such amounts are not subject to federal and state 
income taxes until received as benefit payments. 
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1.09 Eligible Employee shall mean all individuals who perform services for the 
Employer and who are eligible to participate under Ohio Revised Code Section 
148.01(A)(1).  Further, individuals who do not perform services for the Employer 
may not defer compensation under the Plan. 

 
1.10 Employer shall mean The Ohio State University. 
 
1.11 Inactive Participant shall mean any former Active Participant who is not 

currently having compensation deferred. 
 
1.12 Includible Compensation shall mean wages as defined in Internal Revenue 

Code Section 3401(a) and all other payments of compensation to a Participant 
by the Employer (in the course of the Employer’s trade or business) for which 
the Employer is required to furnish the Participant a written statement under 
Internal Revenue Code Sections 6041(d), 6051(a)(3), and 6052.  Compensation 
must be determined without regard to any rules under Internal Revenue Code 
Section 3401(a) that limit the remuneration included in wages based on the 
nature or location of the employment or the services performed (such as the 
exception for agricultural labor in Internal Revenue Code Section 3401(a)(2)).  
Includible Compensation shall include any amount excludable from gross 
income under this Plan or any other plan organized in accordance with Internal 
Revenue Code Section 457, or any amount excludable from gross income under 
Internal Revenue Code Sections 105(d), 125, 401(k), 403(b), 408(k), 501(c)(18), 
and 911, or any other amounts excludable from gross income for federal income 
tax purposes.  Includible Compensation for purposes of this Section 1.12 shall 
not include amounts paid as compensation to a non-resident alien, as defined in 
Internal Revenue Code Section 7701(b), who is not a Participant in the Plan to 
the extent the compensation is excludable from gross income and is not 
effectively connected with the conduct of a trade or business within the United 
States.   

 
Effective January 1, 2009, for Participants on active duty in the uniformed 
services for a period of more than 30 days, Includible Compensation shall 
include any differential wage payments, as defined by Internal Revenue Code 
Section 3401(h)(2), to the extent such payments are made by the Employer.  
Such differential wage payments shall be treated as compensation for all Plan 
purposes, including Internal Revenue Code Section 415 and any other Internal 
Revenue Code section that references the definition of compensation under 
Internal Revenue Code Section 415.  A Participant receiving such differential 
wage payment shall be treated as an employee of the Employer making the 
payment.  If all employees of the Employer performing service in the uniformed 
services described in Internal Revenue Code Section 3401(h)(2)(A) are entitled 
to receive differential wage payments on reasonably equivalent terms and, if 
eligible to participate in a retirement plan maintained by the Employer, to make 
contributions based on the payments on reasonably equivalent terms (taking into 
account Internal Revenue Code Sections 410(b)(3), (4), and (5)), then the Plan 
shall not be treated as failing to meet the requirements of any provision 
described in Internal Revenue Code Section 414(u)(1)(C) by reason of any 
contribution or benefit that is based on the differential wage payment. 
 
Notwithstanding anything herein to the contrary, Includible Compensation shall 
include amounts received following Severance from Employment only if the 
amounts are “Post-Severance Compensation.”  Post-Severance Compensation 
includes the amounts described in (a) and (b) below, paid after a Participant’s 
Severance from Employment, but only to the extent such amounts are paid by 
the later of 2½ months after Severance from Employment or the end of the 
calendar year that includes the date of such Severance from Employment. 
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(a)  Regular pay after Severance from Employment if:  (i) the payment is 
regular compensation for services during the Participant's regular 
working hours, or compensation for services outside the Participant's 
regular working hours (such as overtime or shift differential), 
commissions, bonuses, or other similar payments; and (ii) the 
payment would have been paid to the Participant prior to a Severance 
from Employment if the Participant had continued in employment with 
the Employer.    

 
(b) Leave cashouts if those amounts would have been included in 

Includible Compensation if they were paid prior to the Participant’s 
Severance from Employment, and the amounts are payable for 
unused accrued bona fide sick leave, vacation, or other leave, but only 
if the Participant would have been able to use the leave if employment 
had continued.     

 
1.13 Internal Revenue Code shall mean the Internal Revenue Code of 1986, as 

amended, and any regulations or guidance promulgated thereunder. 
 
1.14 Investment Option shall mean the annuity contracts, custodial accounts, or any 

one or more of the various financial products offered as investments under the 
Plan by a Provider. 

 
1.15 Normal Retirement Age shall mean age 65 or that age selected by the 

Participant, which shall be no earlier than age 65 and no later than age 70½.  In 
the case of a Participant who incurs a Severance from Employment prior to 
attainment of his or her Normal Retirement Age, Normal Retirement Age shall 
mean age 65, unless a later age (but not later than age 70½) is specified in an 
election made pursuant to Section 5.02 of this Plan. 

 
1.16 Ohio Revised Code shall mean the Ohio Revised Code, as amended. 
 
1.17 Participant shall include any Active Participant or Inactive Participant. 
 
1.18 Participation Agreement shall mean an agreement entered into between an 

Eligible Employee and the Employer pursuant to which an Eligible Employee 
agrees to the terms and conditions of this Plan and becomes an Active 
Participant. 

 
1.19 Plan shall mean The Ohio State University Amended and Restated 457(b) 

Deferred Compensation Plan, as amended from time to time. 
 
1.20 Plan Administrator shall mean the person, committee or entity selected by the 

Employer to administer the Plan or, if none, the Employer. 
 
1.21 Plan Year shall mean the calendar year in which the Plan becomes effective 

and each succeeding calendar year during the existence of the Plan. 
 
1.22 Provider shall mean any organization providing Investment Options offered by 

the Plan. 
 
1.23 QDRO shall mean a “qualified domestic relations order” as defined in Internal 

Revenue Code Section 414(p). 
 
1.24 Severance from Employment shall mean the termination of the Participant’s 

employment with the Employer for any reason.  A Participant does not have a 
"Severance from Employment" if, in connection with a change of employment, 
the Participant’s new employer maintains the Plan with respect to the Participant. 
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II.  Eligibility and Participation 
 
2.01 Eligibility.  Each Eligible Employee shall be permitted to participate under this 

Plan. 
 
2.02 Commencement of Participation.  An Eligible Employee shall elect to 

participate and become an Active Participant by entering into a Participation 
Agreement with the Employer and opening an account with a Provider.  The 
Participation Agreement shall specify: 

 
(a) The amount of the Active Participant’s Compensation that the 

Employer and the Active Participant agree to defer, subject to the 
limitations of Section 3.02 of this Plan; 

 
(b) The date as of which reduction and deferral of Compensation pursuant 

to the Participation Agreement shall begin, which date shall be as early 
as administratively practicable but not earlier than the first day of the 
first calendar month following the execution of the Participation 
Agreement; provided, however, that a new employee may defer 
Compensation payable in the calendar month during which the 
Participant first becomes an employee if a Participation Agreement 
providing for the deferral is entered into on or before the first day on 
which the Participant performs services for the Employer; and 

 
(c) The Provider selected by the Participant. 
 
The Eligible Employee also shall provide such other information to the Plan 
Administrator or Provider, as appropriate, that is necessary to administer the 
Plan, including, without limitation, whether the Eligible Employee is or has been 
a participant in any other eligible deferred compensation plan under Internal 
Revenue Code Section 457(b) during the applicable plan year. 

 
 

III.  Deferral of Compensation 
 
3.01 Elective Deferrals.  An Eligible Employee may elect to defer Compensation in 

accordance with the applicable Participation Agreement and the terms of this 
Plan. 

 
3.02 Maximum and Minimum Deferrals. 
 

(a) Primary Maximum Limitation.  Except as provided in subsection 
3.02(b), the maximum amount that may be deferred by an Active 
Participant in the Plan in any Plan Year shall not exceed the lesser of 
(i) the dollar amount provided under Internal Revenue Code Section 
457(e)(15) (as may be indexed annually) or (ii) 100% of the Active 
Participant’s Includible Compensation. 

 
(b) Age 50 Catch-Up Contribution.  In addition to the deferral provided 

in subsection (a), an Active Participant who has attained age 50 or 
older during a Plan Year may elect the catch-up provision under 
Internal Revenue Code Section 414(v) and commence making such 
Age 50 Catch-up Contributions to his or her Account via a Participation 
Agreement.  Such contributions are in addition to the basic annual 
deferrals described in Treasury Regulation Section 1.457-4(c)(1) (and 
described in subsection (a) above).   

 
(c) Coordination with Other Plans.  If an Active Participant participates 

in more than one Internal Revenue Code Section 457(b) Plan, the 
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maximum deferral under all such plans shall not exceed the primary 
limit described in subsection (a) above, subject to modification by the 
catch-up limitations in subsection (b) above. 

 
(d) Minimum Deferrals.  The minimum deferral amount per pay period 

shall be: (i) bi-weekly pay $7.00 and (ii) monthly pay $15.00, or such 
other amounts determined by the Plan Administrator. 

 
(e) Maximum Annual Contributions.  In the event that a Participant’s 

deferrals exceed the maximum deferral contributions, the Plan 
Administrator shall direct the Provider as to the proper correction 
method permissible under applicable law, including calculation of any 
earnings or losses and the proper tax reporting with respect to such 
distributions.  Such correction method shall include distribution of any 
excess deferrals to the Active Participant with allocable net income, 
as soon as administratively practicable after the Plan Administrator 
determines that there is an excess deferral and the amount of the 
excess deferral. 

 
3.03 Amendments of Participation Agreements. 
 

(a) The election of a Participant to participate under the Plan is irrevocable 
as to all amounts actually deferred under the Participation Agreement.  
The Participant may, by amendment of the Participation Agreement or 
by any manner as the Plan Administrator may prescribe, do any of the 
following: (i) change the Investment Option allocation of amounts to 
be deferred in the future; (ii) terminate the election to be an Active 
Participant; or (iii) change the amount of Compensation to be deferred. 

 
(b) An amendment or termination shall be effective as early as 

administratively practicable, but not earlier than the first day of the 
following calendar month. 

 
 

IV.  Maintenance of Accounts 
 
4.01 Maintenance of Accounts.  The amounts allocated to the Participants’ 

Accounts shall be invested in an Investment Option provided by the Provider.  
The terms and conditions of any such annuity contract or other Investment 
Option agreement shall be considered part of, and shall be construed as having 
been incorporated into the Plan.  Participants will invest their Accounts based 
upon the Investment Options available and may make their investment 
selections pursuant to the terms and conditions contained in the annuity contract 
or other Investment Option agreement.  If any provision of the annuity contract 
or other Investment Option agreement conflicts with the Plan, the terms of the 
Plan shall control.  All Investment Options offered under this Plan must be 
offered by persons, companies, or entities authorized and duly licensed by the 
State of Ohio and appropriate federal agencies regulating such investments to 
do business in the State of Ohio.  The Employer shall not be responsible for any 
decrease in value of a Participant’s Account resulting from capital or market 
changes or any other changes occurring in the Investment Option or the 
Participant’s Account.  The Plan Administrator may from time to time assess 
reasonable service charges against all or any portion of the deferred amounts or 
Accounts to defray costs associated with the implementation and administration 
of the Plan. 

 
4.02 Crediting of Accounts.  Each Active Participant’s Account shall be credited with 

amounts authorized for deferral and received by the Provider. 
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4.03 Reports.  A report of the total amount credited to a Participant’s Account, in such 
form as the Plan Administrator determines, shall be furnished to the Participant 
by the Provider not more than 60 days after the end of each calendar quarter.  
All reports to a Participant shall be based on the net fair market value of the 
equity investment options and book value of any guaranteed option as of the 
date of the report, to the extent such values are available. 

 
4.04 Assets for Exclusive Benefit of Participants and Beneficiaries.  All amounts 

of Compensation deferred under this Plan, all property and rights that may be 
purchased with such amounts, and all income attributable to such amounts, 
property, or rights shall be held in a custodial account or annuity contract 
described in Code Section 401(f) for the exclusive benefit of Participants and 
their Beneficiaries.  All such amounts shall not be subject to the claims of the 
Employer’s general creditors. 

 
4.05 Exchanges within the Plan.  A Participant (or Beneficiary, if the Participant has 

died) shall be permitted to change the investment of his or her Account among 
Investment Options and Providers that are eligible to receive contributions under 
the Plan in accordance with rules established by the Employer. 

 
4.06 Transfers to and from the Plan. 
 

(a) The Plan will accept plan to plan transfers from other Internal Revenue 
Code Section 457 plans sponsored by an employer that satisfies the 
definition in Internal Revenue Code Section 457(e)(l)(A) upon receipt 
of proper written request and actual transfer of funds. 

 
(b) The Plan will execute plan to plan transfers to other Internal Revenue 

Code Section 457 plans maintained by the Employer, upon proper 
written request by a Participant and will execute plan to plan transfers 
to other Internal Revenue Code Section 457 plans sponsored by an 
employer that satisfies the definition of Internal Revenue Code Section 
457(e)(1)(A) upon proper written request by a Participant who has 
terminated employment with the Employer.  Such transfer of an 
Account may be completed at fair market value providing benefit 
payments have not begun. 

 
(c) Before effectuating plan to plan transfers, the Provider may require 

documentation from the other plan as it deems necessary to effectuate 
the transfer in accordance with the applicable provisions of the Internal 
Revenue Code. 

 
4.07 Rollovers. 
 

(a) Any Participant who has had a severance from employment with any 
employer with which the Participant maintained an account under an 
eligible retirement plan (as defined in Internal Revenue Code Section 
402(c)(8)(B)) may, upon proper written request, rollover the account 
value from that plan to an Account in this Plan.  Any such amounts 
rolled into the Plan will be separately accounted for and may be 
subject to the same tax treatment as applicable in the original plan.  
Amounts rolled into the Plan will be allocated to Investment Options 
and will otherwise be subject to the same rules applicable to other 
inactive Accounts. 

 
(b) A Participant who has had a Severance from Employment or the 

Beneficiary of a deceased Participant (or a Participant’s spouse or 
former spouse who is an alternate payee under a QDRO) who is 
entitled to an eligible rollover distribution (as defined in Internal 
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Revenue Code Section 402(c)(4)) may elect to have any portion of an 
eligible rollover distribution (as defined in Internal Revenue Code 
Section 402(c)(4)) from the Plan paid directly to an eligible retirement 
plan (as defined in Internal Revenue Code Section 402(c)(8)(B)) 
specified by the Participant or Beneficiary in a direct rollover.  
Requests for amounts to be rolled out of the Plan must satisfy the 
requirements of the Provider as to the eligibility of the receiving plan 
and acknowledgment of the plan’s provision to accept such rollover.  
For distributions made after December 31, 2007, a Participant or 
Beneficiary may elect a direct rollover of an eligible rollover distribution 
(as defined in Internal Revenue Code Section 402(c)(4)) to a Roth IRA 
as described in Internal Revenue Code Section 408A(b).   

 
(c) For distributions after December 31, 2009, a non-spouse Beneficiary 

who is a "designated beneficiary" under Internal Revenue Code 
Section 401(a)(9)(E) and the Treasury Regulations thereunder may, 
by a direct trustee-to-trustee transfer ("direct rollover"), roll over all or 
a portion of his or her distribution to an individual retirement account 
("IRA") that is established on behalf of the Beneficiary and that will be 
treated as an inherited IRA (within the meaning of Internal Revenue 
Code Section 408(d)(3)(C)).   

 
In order to be able to roll over the distribution, the distribution must 
otherwise satisfy the definition of an eligible rollover distribution (as 
defined in Internal Revenue Code Section 402(c)(4)).  Although a non-
spouse Beneficiary may roll over directly a distribution as provided 
above, any distribution made prior to January 1, 2010 is not subject to 
the direct rollover requirements of Internal Revenue Code Section 
401(a)(31), the notice requirements of Internal Revenue Code Section 
402(f), or the mandatory withholding requirements of Internal Revenue 
Code Section 3405(c).  If a non-spouse Beneficiary receives a 
distribution from the Plan, the distribution is not eligible for a “60-day” 
rollover. 
 
A non-spouse Beneficiary may not roll over an amount that is a 
required minimum distribution ineligible for rollover, as determined 
under applicable Treasury Regulations and other Internal Revenue 
Service guidance.  If a Participant dies before his or her required 
beginning date, then the non-spouse designated Beneficiary may 
deposit into such IRA all or any portion of the distribution that is 
deemed to be an eligible rollover distribution (as defined in Internal 
Revenue Code Section 402(c)(4)).  In determining the portion of such 
distribution that is considered to be a required minimum distribution 
that must be made from the IRA, the Beneficiary may elect to use 
either the 5-year rule or the life expectancy rule, pursuant to Treasury 
Regulation Section 1.401(a)(9)-3, Q&A-4(c).   
 
If the Participant’s named Beneficiary is a trust, the Plan may make a 
direct rollover to an IRA on behalf of the trust, provided the trust 
satisfies the requirements to be a designated Beneficiary within the 
meaning of Internal Revenue Code Section 401(a)(9)(E). 

 
4.08 Service Credit Purchase.  A Participant may use all or a portion of his or her 

Account balance as a direct trustee-to-trustee transfer to a defined benefit 
governmental plan that permits the purchase of permissive service credit or the 
repayment of service credits.  The Participant must use forms provided by the 
Provider and the defined benefit governmental plan that document the exact 
amount of transfer required. 
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4.09 Current and Former Providers.  All current and former Providers and the Plan 
Administrator shall exchange information as may be necessary to coordinate 
information to satisfy the requirements of Internal Revenue Code Section 457(b) 
and other requirements of applicable law. 

 
 

V.  Distribution of Benefits 
 
5.01 General Requirements.  All distributions are subject to the requirements of 

Internal Revenue Code Sections 457(d) and 401(a)(9) and the Treasury 
Regulations thereunder.  The Plan Administrator will annually determine if the 
Participant’s or Beneficiary’s annual distributions meet the minimum distribution 
requirement of Internal Revenue Code Section 401(a)(9) and adjust the amount 
if necessary to comply with those provisions.  Initial benefit payment elections 
and subsequent changes will be effective only if made on forms provided or in 
the manner prescribed by the Provider and received by the date determined by 
the Provider.  Benefits in the form of an annuity may not be changed once 
payments have begun.  No Benefit Payment Option shall be available that is not 
provided for in Section 5.07 of this Plan.  Benefit payments are taxable income 
to Participants and Beneficiaries in the year of distribution and are subject to the 
required income tax withholdings. 

 
5.02 Participant Election of a Benefit Commencement Date and Option.  Upon 

Severance from Employment, a Participant may elect a date to begin to receive 
benefit payments from the Plan.  Benefit payments may begin after the 
Provider’s receipt of the Employer’s verification of Severance from Employment, 
the final deferral amount, and the election form for the Benefit Payment Option.  
Benefit payments must begin no later than April 1 of the year following the latter 
of (a) the year in which the Participant attains age 70½ or (b) the year in which 
the Participant has a Severance from Employment.  A Participant may elect a 
Benefit Payment Option as permitted in Section 5.07 of this Plan or change a 
Benefit Payment Option previously elected if permitted by the Investment Option. 

 
5.03 Beneficiary Election of a Benefit Commencement Date and Option.  If a 

Participant dies before the Participant’s Account has been exhausted, then any 
benefit payable shall be paid to the designated Beneficiary.  The Beneficiary 
shall have the right to elect the time and method of benefit payments, subject to 
the limitations set forth by this Plan and the Participant’s elected Investment 
Option.  The following will determine the Beneficiary’s election requirements: 

 
(1) If a Participant dies on or after the required minimum distribution date, 

payments shall continue to be paid to the Beneficiary at least as 
rapidly as under the method of distribution in effect at the time of the 
Participant’s death. 

 
(2) If a Participant dies before the required minimum distribution date, 

payments to a Beneficiary may begin after the Provider’s receipt of the 
notice of the Participant’s death, the death certificate, the final deferral 
amount, and the election form for the Benefit Payment Option.  The 
Beneficiary must follow the following applicable requirement: 

 
(a) If the Beneficiary is the Participant’s surviving spouse, 

distribution of the Account may be delayed until the later of 
(1) December 31 of the calendar year in which the 
Participant would have attained age 70½ or (2) December 
31 of the calendar year immediately following the calendar 
year in which the Participant dies.  The entire Account must 
then be paid over a period not extending beyond the life 
expectancy of the spousal Beneficiary; or  
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(b) If the Beneficiary is a person other than the Participant’s 
spouse, distribution of the Account must begin on or before 
December 31 of the calendar year following the 
Participant’s death, and the entire Account must be paid 
over a period not extending beyond the life expectancy of 
the Beneficiary; or 

 
(c) If the Beneficiary is not a person, such as a trust or an 

estate, the entire Account value must be distributed by the 
end of the calendar year that contains the fifth anniversary 
of the Participant’s death. 

 
(3) If the Beneficiary dies after the Participant but before the full Account 

value is distributed, any remaining Account value will be paid to the 
Beneficiary’s estate in a lump sum payment. 

 
(4) Whenever distribution is made to a minor, then the Plan Administrator 

may direct that such distribution be paid to the legal guardian, or if 
none, to a parent of such Beneficiary or a responsible adult with whom 
the Beneficiary maintains his or her residence, or to the custodian for 
such Beneficiary under the Uniform Gift Transfers to Minors Act, if 
such is permitted by the laws of the state in which the Beneficiary 
resides.  Such a payment to the legal guardian, custodian, or parent 
of a minor Beneficiary shall fully discharge the Provider, the Plan 
Administrator, the Employer, and the Plan from further liability on 
account thereof. 

 
5.04 Default Benefit Commencement Date and Option for Participant.  If a 

Participant does not elect a Benefit Commencement Date in the manner 
provided for in Section 5.02 of this Plan, benefit payments to the Participant shall 
begin by December 31 of the calendar year the Participant attains age 70½.  
Benefits shall be paid for the maximum number of years allowed by the required 
minimum distribution tables of the Internal Revenue Code. 

 
5.05 Default Benefit Commencement Date and Option for Beneficiary.  If a 

spousal Beneficiary of a Participant who dies before the required minimum 
distribution date does not elect a Benefit Commencement Date, benefit 
payments to the spousal Beneficiary shall begin by the later of December 31 of 
the calendar year in which the Participant would have attained age 70½ or 
December 31 of the calendar year immediately following the calendar year in 
which the Participant dies.  If a non-spousal Beneficiary does not elect a Benefit 
Commencement Date, benefit payments to the non-spousal Beneficiary shall 
begin not later than December 31 of the calendar year immediately following the 
calendar year in which the Participant dies.  Benefits shall be paid for the 
maximum number of years allowed by the required minimum distribution tables 
of the Internal Revenue Code. 

 
5.06 Acceleration.  If upon a Participant’s Severance from Employment and the 

Provider’s receipt of the last deferral amount, the Participant’s Account value 
(without regard to amounts attributable to rollover contributions) is less than 
$1,000.00 (or such other dollar limit imposed under the Internal Revenue Code), 
the Provider will accelerate the payment of benefits otherwise due in the future 
and pay to such Participant (or Beneficiary, if the Participant has died) the full 
Account value in a lump sum less the required income tax withholding unless the 
Participant (or Beneficiary) timely elects to rollover the Account. 

 
5.07 Benefit Payment Options.  The following Benefit Payment Options are 

available under the Plan.  Definitions of each are provided on the Benefit 
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Payment Option election form.  Benefit payments will be pro-rated among all 
Investment Options held. 

 
Options: 

 
1. Life Income with Payment Certain Purchased Annuity 
2. Joint and Last Survivor Income Purchased Annuity (Participant and 

Spouse) 
3. Designated Period Purchased Annuity 
4. Payments for a Fixed Dollar Amount 
5. Systematic Withdrawals for a Fixed Time Period 
6. Partial Lump Sum and remainder paid as item 1, 2, 3, 4, or 5 above 
7. Lump Sum Payment 
 

5.08 2009 Required Minimum Distributions.  Notwithstanding any other provision 
of Article V, a Participant or Beneficiary who would have been required to receive 
required minimum distributions for 2009 but for the enactment of Internal 
Revenue Code Section 401(a)(9)(H) (“2009 RMDs”), and who would have 
satisfied that requirement by receiving distributions that are (1) equal to the 2009 
RMDs or (2) one or more payments in a series of substantially equal distributions 
(that include the 2009 RMDs) made at least annually and expected to last for the 
life (or life expectancy) of the Participant, the joint lives (or joint life expectancy) 
of the Participant and the Participant’s designated Beneficiary, or for a period of 
at least 10 years (“Extended 2009 RMDs”), will receive those distributions for 
2009 unless the Participant or Beneficiary chooses not to receive such 
distributions.  Participants and Beneficiaries described in the preceding sentence 
will be given the opportunity to elect to stop receiving the distributions described 
in the preceding sentence. 

 
Notwithstanding any other provision of this Plan, and solely for purposes of 
applying the direct rollover provisions of the Plan, a direct rollover will be offered 
only for distributions that would be eligible rollover distributions (as defined in 
Internal Revenue Code Section 402(c)(4)) without regard to Internal Revenue 
Code Section 401(a)(9)(H). 

 
5.09 Unforeseeable Emergency.  If a Participant has an unforeseeable emergency 

before Severance from Employment, the Participant may elect to receive a lump 
sum distribution equal to the amount requested or, if less, the maximum amount 
determined by the Plan Administrator to be permitted to be distributed under this 
Section.  An “unforeseeable emergency” shall mean a severe financial hardship 
of the Participant or the Participant’s Beneficiary resulting from: 
 
(a) an illness or accident of the Participant or Beneficiary, the Participant 

or Beneficiary’s spouse, or the Participant or Beneficiary’s dependent 
(as defined in Internal Revenue Code Section 152, determined without 
regard to Internal Revenue Code Sections 152(b)(1), (b)(2), and 
(d)(1)(B)); 

 
(b) loss of the Participant or Beneficiary’s property due to casualty 

(including the need to rebuild a home following damage to a home not 
otherwise covered by homeowner’s insurance, such as damage that 
is the result of a natural disaster); or 

 
(c) other similar extraordinary and unforeseeable circumstances arising 

as a result of events beyond the control of the Participant or 
Beneficiary. 

 
For example, the imminent foreclosure or eviction from the Participant or 
Beneficiary’s primary residence may constitute an unforeseeable emergency.  In 
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addition, the need to pay for medical expenses, including non-refundable 
deductibles, as well as for the cost of prescription drug medication, may 
constitute an unforeseeable emergency.  Finally, the need to pay for the funeral 
expenses of a spouse or a dependent (as defined in Internal Revenue Code 
Section 152, without regard to Internal Revenue Code Sections 152(b)(1), (b)(2), 
and (d)(1)(B)) of a Participant or Beneficiary may also constitute an 
unforeseeable emergency.  Except as otherwise specifically provided in this 
Section, the purchase of a home and the payment of college tuition are not 
unforeseeable emergencies. 
 
A distribution on account of unforeseeable emergency may not be made to the 
extent such emergency is or may be relieved through reimbursement or 
compensation from insurance or otherwise; by liquidation of the Participant’s 
assets, to the extent the liquidation of such assets would not itself cause severe 
financial hardship; or by cessation of Deferrals under the Plan.   
 
Distributions because of an unforeseeable emergency may not exceed the 
amount reasonably necessary to satisfy the emergency need (which may include 
any amounts necessary to pay any federal, state, or local income taxes or 
penalties reasonably anticipated to result from the distribution). 

 
 

VI.  Beneficiaries 
 
6.01 Designation of Beneficiaries.  Upon commencing participation in the Plan, 

each Participant shall designate a Beneficiary on a form furnished by the 
applicable Provider.  Such forms shall be maintained in files held by the Provider.  
From time to time, the Participant may change the Beneficiary designation by 
written notice on forms furnished by and returned to the Provider.  Upon such 
change, the rights of all previously designated Beneficiaries to receive any 
benefits under the Plan shall cease.  To the extent that there is no Beneficiary 
designation under the Plan at the date of death of the Participant, the Beneficiary 
or Beneficiaries designated have died prior to the death of the Participant or the 
Participant has revoked a prior designation in writing filed with the Provider 
without having filed a new designation, then any benefits which would have been 
payable to the Beneficiary hereunder shall be payable to the Participant’s 
surviving spouse or, if there is not a surviving spouse, to the Participant’s estate. 

 
6.02 Election of Trust as Beneficiary.  If a trust is named as a Beneficiary, 

satisfactory evidence must be furnished to the applicable Provider that the trust 
is the only Beneficiary qualified to receive payment, or payment will be made as 
though no primary Beneficiary had been named, to the contingent Beneficiary if 
named, or to the estate of the Participant.  The Plan will be fully discharged of 
liability for any action taken by the trustee and for all amounts paid to, or at the 
direction of, the trustee and will have no obligation as to the use of the amounts.  
In all dealings with the trust the Plan will be fully protected against the claims of 
every other person.  The Plan will not be charged with notice of a change of trust 
as Beneficiary unless written evidence of the change is made on a signed and 
dated change of Beneficiary form provided by the Provider and shall be effective 
on the date filed with and accepted by the Plan. 

 
 

VII.  Domestic Relations Orders 
 
7.01 Recognition of Approved Domestic Relations Orders.  The Plan recognizes 

and gives effect to QDROs that have been approved by the Plan in accordance 
with Plan procedures and, pursuant to state law, create or recognize the 
existence of the right of an alternate payee to receive all or a portion of any 
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deferred compensation of a Participant in accordance with the criteria set forth 
below. 

 
7.02 Domestic Relations Order Information.  The Plan Administrator shall comply 

with the provisions of a domestic relations order (“DRO”) that the Provider 
determines to constitute a QDRO.  Effective April 6, 2007, a DRO that otherwise 
satisfies the requirements for a QDRO will not fail to be a QDRO (i) solely 
because the order is issued after, or revises, another DRO or QDRO, or (ii) solely 
because of the time at which the order is issued, including issuance after the 
annuity starting date or after the Participant's death.   
 
 

VIII.  Leave of Absence and Military Service 
 
8.01 Leave of Absence.  An Active Participant on an approved leave of absence with 

or without compensation may continue to participate in the Plan subject to all the 
terms and conditions of the Plan; provided further, compensation may be 
deferred for such Participant if such compensation continues while the 
Participant is on an approved leave of absence. 

 
8.02 Military Service.  This Plan will be administered in accordance with Internal 

Revenue Code Section 414(u) for Active Participants who return to work after 
absences from employment due to military service.  This includes make-up 
contributions that were not made during the Active Participant’s period of military 
service.  Contributions made up will be subject to the annual contribution 
limitations for the year in which they relate, rather than the year they are made. 

 
In the case of a death occurring on or after January 1, 2007, if a Participant dies 
while performing qualified military service (as defined in Internal Revenue Code 
Section 414(u)), the Participant's Beneficiary is entitled to any additional benefits 
(other than benefit accruals relating to the period of qualified military service) 
provided under the Plan as if the Participant had resumed employment and then 
terminated employment on account of death.  Moreover, the Plan will credit the 
Participant's qualified military service as service for vesting purposes, as though 
the Participant had resumed employment under the Uniformed Service 
Employment and Reemployment Rights Act of 1994 (USERRA) immediately 
prior to the Participant's death.   

 
 

IX.  Pre-1979 Accounts 
 
9.01 Pre-1979 Accounts.  Any amounts held by the Employer as a result of deferrals 

made by a Participant prior to January 1, 1979 shall be held under this Plan from 
and after the latest of (a) the original effective date of the Plan; (b) the date on 
which the Participant elects to have this Plan apply to such amount; or (c) the 
date on which such Participant exercises any right or power available under this 
Plan but not under the Plan agreement pursuant to which such deferral was 
made.  All such persons who were Participants in any prior plan, who exercise 
any such right or privilege and who have not yet received a distribution of the 
amounts to which they are entitled under such prior plan shall be deemed to be 
Participants under this Plan for all purposes. 

 
 

X.  Administration of the Plan 
 
10.01 Amendment or Termination. 
 

(a) The Employer may at any time alter, amend, or terminate this Plan 
with or without the consent of any Participant.  No Plan amendment 
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shall divest any Participant of any portion of the balance then held in 
an Account subject to the provisions of Section 4.01 of this Plan. 

 
(b) If the Plan is frozen, the Employer shall continue to be responsible for 

the supervision and payment of benefits in accordance with Article V 
hereof. 

 
(c) Upon the full termination of the Plan, the Employer shall direct the 

distribution of the assets to Participants in a manner that is consistent 
with and satisfies the provisions of Article V as soon as 
administratively practicable after termination of the Plan. 

 
10.02 Distribution on Taxability.  In the event the Internal Revenue Service ever 

determines that the Plan has been finally ruled as an ineligible plan, the deferred 
amounts shall be distributed to the Participant upon written request. 

 
10.03 Questions of Fact.  The Plan Administrator is authorized to decide or to resolve 

any questions of fact regarding a Participant or an Account necessary to decide 
the Participant’s rights under this Plan.  Any person may appeal a final 
determination by filing a written statement detailing the cause for grievance with 
the Plan Administrator.  The Plan Administrator shall review each appeal and 
notify the appellant if a hearing will be held.  The decision of the Plan 
Administrator shall be final and shall not be subject to further appeal.  The Plan 
Administrator shall notify the appellant in writing of its decision. 

 
10.04 Construction of Plan.  The Plan Administrator is authorized to construe the 

Plan and to resolve by its decision any ambiguity in the Plan; provided, that all 
such decisions are applied thereafter uniformly to all other Participants until the 
Plan is subsequently amended or unless the facts and circumstances applicable 
to another Participant are different. 

 
10.05 Suspension of Payments in Event of Dispute.  The Plan Administrator or its 

agents, if in doubt concerning the correctness of their action in making a payment 
of a benefit, may suspend the continuation of any such payments until satisfied 
as to the correctness of the amount of payment or the payee, or allow the filing 
in any court of competent jurisdiction of a suit in such form as the Plan 
Administrator deems appropriate, including an interpleader action, for a legal 
determination of the benefits to be paid and/or the payee.  The Plan 
Administrator shall comply with the final orders of the court in any such suit, 
subject to any appellate review, and the Participant and any Beneficiaries 
consent to be similarly bound thereby. 

 
10.06 Delegation by Employer.  The Employer may delegate its powers, duties, and 

responsibilities under this Plan to any agent or administrator, including any public 
or private agency or company.  Such agent or administrator shall thereupon, and 
subject to the terms of any agreement with the Employer, be deemed to be, and 
have all of the powers, duties, and responsibilities of, the Employer under this 
Plan for purposes of administering the Plan. 

 
10.07 Review of Employer Actions.  Any decision, determination, or other action, or 

non-action, of the Employer shall be final and binding on all persons having or 
claiming any interest under the Plan, and may be reviewed only for arbitrary and 
capricious abuse of the wide discretion granted to the Employer by the Plan. 

 
10.08 Account Corrections.  Each Participant is responsible for checking the 

accuracy of his or her quarterly statement.  If an incorrect investment, exchange, 
or transfer is made, the Participant must notify the Provider within 180 days of 
the closing date of the statement that reported the incorrect transaction.  
Incorrect investments, exchanges, and transfers will not be adjusted if the 



February 10, 2012 meeting, Board of Trustees 
 

479 

request is not received by the Provider within 180 days of the closing date of the 
statement. 

 
 

XI.  Miscellaneous 
 
11.01 No Contract of Employment.  This Plan and any Participation Agreement 

between the Employer and the Participant shall not be construed as a contract 
of employment, as an amendment to an existing employment contract of the 
Participant, if in fact one exists, or as affording to the Participant any right to, or 
representation or guarantee regarding, continued employment. 

 
11.02 Tax Effects.  Neither the Employer, the Plan Administrator, the State of Ohio or 

any agency thereof, nor any firm, person, or corporation, represents or 
guarantees that any particular federal, state, or local tax consequences will occur 
as a result of any Participant’s initial or continued participation in this Plan.  Each 
Participant shall consult with his or her own advisors regarding the tax 
consequences of participation in this Plan. 

 
11.03 Governing Law.  The laws of the State of Ohio shall apply in determining the 

construction and validity of the Plan and all rights and obligations under it. 
 
11.04 Non-Alienation.  Except as otherwise required by law, the rights of any 

Participant or Beneficiary (including any Compensation deferred or benefits 
paid) under this Plan shall not be subject to the rights of creditors of the 
Participant or Beneficiary, and shall be exempt from execution, attachment, 
garnishment, prior assignment, transfer by operation of law in the event of the 
bankruptcy or insolvency, or any other judicial relief or order for creditors or other 
third persons.  No Participant or Beneficiary shall have any right to commute, 
sell, assign, encumber, hypothecate, transfer, or otherwise convey the right to 
receive any payments hereunder, which payments and the right thereto are 
expressly declared to be non-assignable and nontransferable, and any such 
attempted assignment or transfer shall not be recognized by the Employer.  
Except as required by law, the right to exercise any power of any Participant or 
Beneficiary shall be personal and shall not be exercisable by any trustee in 
bankruptcy, court of law, or other person or entity seeking to act in the name of 
or by the right of the Participant or Beneficiary except as follows: 

 
A guardian of a Participant who is incapacitated by reason of illness or age, the 
designee of a Participant’s lawfully executed power of attorney where the 
Participant is incapacitated by reason of illness or age, or the guardian of a 
Beneficiary who has not reached their majority.  The Participant agrees that in 
the event of the Participant’s bankruptcy (including petitions filed under 11 
U.S.C. Chapter 13) or insolvency, application will be timely made to secure 
exemption for all funds maintained in the Participant’s Account. 

 
11.05 Entire Agreement; Successors.  This Plan, including the Participation 

Agreement and any subsequently adopted amendments, shall constitute the 
entire agreement or contract between the Employer and the Participant 
regarding the Plan.  No oral statement regarding the Plan may be relied upon by 
the Participant.  This Plan and any amendment shall be binding on the parties 
hereto and their respective heirs, administrators, trustees, successors, and 
assigns, and on all designated Beneficiaries of the Participant.  If any provision 
of this Plan is found by a court of law to be invalid, the remaining provisions shall 
survive and continue to be of full force and effect. 

 
11.06 Intent of Plan.  This Plan is intended to be a Plan as described in Internal 

Revenue Code Section 457.  This Plan shall be construed in accordance with 
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such intent, and no provision hereof that is inconsistent with Internal Revenue 
Code Section 457 shall be valid. 

 
11.07 Participant Acknowledgments.  The Participant specifically understands and 

acknowledges that the Participant’s Account will be charged with any investment 
loss or other loss arising from the use of the Participant’s Investment Options 
and that such loss will reduce the benefits payable to the Participant under this 
Plan.  The Participant also understands and acknowledges that the choice of 
Investment Options may have collateral effect, such as limiting the time and 
manner of payment of benefits. 

 
11.08 Remedies; Standard of Care.  To the extent permitted by law, the Participant 

specifically agrees not to seek recovery against the Employer, the Plan 
Administrator, or any other person for any loss sustained by the Participant as a 
result of negligence or any other misconduct other than fraud or wrongful taking. 

 
{The remainder of this page has been intentionally left blank.} 
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IN WITNESS THEREOF, the Employer has duly executed this Plan this _____ day of 
__________________, 2012. 
 
 
EMPLOYER 
 
The Ohio State University 
 
 
By: ________________________________________________ 
 Geoffrey S. Chatas 
 
Its: Senior Vice President for Business & Finance and Chief Financial Officer 
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(APPENDIX XXV) 
 

RATIFICATION AND APPROVAL OF AMENDMENT RELATING TO THE OHIO 
PUBLIC EDUCATION INSTITUTIONS’ ALTERNATIVE RETIRMENT PLAN 

 
SUMMARY 

 
Background:  
 
The Ohio Public Education Institutions’ Alternative Retirement Plan is classified by the 
Internal Revenue Service (“IRS”) as a “pre-approved” plan, specifically a volume submitter 
plan (the “Volume Submitter Plan”). The University is the sponsor of the Volume Submitter 
Plan for each of the Ohio institutions of higher education. Those institutions each adopt an 
individual alternative retirement plan from the pre-approved Volume Submitter Plan.  
 
As the Volume Submitter Plan sponsor, the University has the authority to amend the 
individual alternative retirement plans on behalf of the adopting employers.  
 
The IRS required that certain amendments be made to all individual alternative retirement 
plans by December 31, 2011 in order to comply with the Pension Protection Act of 2006 
(“PPA”), the Heroes Earnings Assistance and Relief Tax Act of 2008 (“HEART”), and the 
Worker, Retiree, and Employer Recovery Act of 2008 (“WRERA”).  
 

 The University adopted those amendments for its individual Alternative 
Retirement Plan at its November 4, 2011 meeting of the Board of Trustees. 

 

 However, as the Volume Submitter Plan sponsor, the University also exercised 
its authority to adopt those amendments on behalf of other individual alternative 
retirement plans that previously had not adopted them. The amendment on 
behalf of those other individual alternative retirement plans was approved by the 
Office of Legal Affairs, the Office of Human Resources and outside counsel, and 
was executed by the Senior Vice President for Business and Finance and Chief 
Financial Officer on December 15, 2011.  

 
Purpose of the Resolution:  
 
The resolution ratifies and approves the amendment of certain individual alternative 
retirement plans and ratifies the action of the Senior Vice President for Business and 
Finance and Chief Financial Officer in signing the amendment. 
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(APPENDIX XXVI) 
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(APPENDIX XXVII) 
 

SALE OF REAL ESTATE 
 

VACANT LAND, 0.69 ACRES 
APPLE CREEK, OHIO 

 
In 2001, the University and ATI, Wooster Campus, acquired approximately 1725 acres of 
land and buildings from the Ohio Department of Mental Retardation and Developmental 
Disabilities in Wayne County, near Apple Creek, Ohio. The property is being used to 
support various programs being offered by ATI but some of the land containing wooded 
areas is not being used by OSU/ATI and can be considered excess to the mission of ATI. 
One such unused parcel located in the Village of Apple Creek contains 7.226 acres. 
 
In 2010 Jason and Ronda Shultzman, husband and wife, purchased Lot 79 in Apple Creek, 
adjacent to the 7.226 acre parcel. After acquiring their property they later found out that 
part of their garage, porch, deck, and driveway was on contiguous University-owned land. 
They have requested to purchase some of the 7.226 acre parcel, containing approximately 
0.69 acres, from the University to remedy the encroachment problem and to preserve their 
improvements that were purchased. 
 
A review of this request by OSU Physical Planning and Real Estate and ATI officials 
indicates that the land could be sold to the Shultzmans since there are no plans for 
OSU/ATI or the University to use the property. The property to be sold was appraised 
recently indicating a value of $13,800. The Shultzmans have agreed to pay the appraised 
value as purchase price, and the costs of the appraisal, a survey, and preparation of a legal 
description of the property for a total of $15,900. 
 
Appropriate University offices have determined that the site represents a disposable land 
asset and it’s in the University’s best interest to sell the property. 
 
Authorization is requested to finalize negotiations with the Shultzmans, to enter into a 
purchase agreement with terms and conditions acceptable to the University, and to 
complete a sale of the property in the best interest of the University. The proceeds from 
the sale of the property will be deposited in ATI General Funds account for use by the ATI. 
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(APPENDIX XXVIII) 
 

PURCHASE OF REAL ESTATE 
TWO CITY ALLEYS IN THE SOUTH CAMPUS DISTRICT 

COLUMBUS, OHIO 43201 
 
Location and Description 
 
In support of the approved Columbus Campus Framework Plan and the South Campus 
District Plan, the University requested the City of Columbus to consider vacating and selling 
the East/West alley immediately south of West 11th Avenue between Hunter and Highland 
Avenues and the North/South alley between Hunter and Highland Avenues to provide for 
the University’s use of the property. After review, the City approved the request to vacate 
the alleys and the sale of this public right-of-way to the University subject to approval by 
Columbus City Council, an ordinance being approved by the Mayor of Columbus, and 
subject to the retention of a general utility easement for those utilities that are currently 
located within the alley. The granting of this utility easement does not impact the immediate 
use of the properties, and relocation of any utilities at a later date will be considered for 
inclusion in any future University construction project utilizing the land. The property is in 
the South Campus Acquisition Area and is contiguous to other properties owned by the 
University. 
 
The subject East/West alley property contains approximately 4,500 SF and the North/South 
alley contains approximately 1,520 SF. The City has offered to deed the property to the 
University for $24,900. The purchase price compares favorably with the price of other 
alleys that have been purchased by the University. An appraisal of the property is underway 
to verify if the indicated value of the property supports the purchase price that has been 
offered by the City. 
 
Use of the Property 
 
It is the intention of the University to acquire the property and use it for interim circulation 
and parking needs and to hold the land for future use as needed for construction projects 
that will be completed in the South Campus District. Transportation and Parking budgeted 
funds will be used to purchase this property. 
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(APPENDIX XXIX) 
 

SUBLEASE 
 

BETWEEN SCITECH AND THE OHIO STATE UNIVERISITY 
CENTER FOR ELECTRON MICROSCOPY ANALYSIS (CEMAS) 

COLUMBUS, OHIO 
 
 

Background 
 

 
Description of Proposed Project 
 
The Ohio State University--College of Engineering has hired world-renown researcher, 
David McComb, as Professor and Ohio Research Scholar, to perform characterization of 
materials on behalf of the University. To support his research in electron microscopy, 
SciTech, a not for profit corporation, has offered to sublease approximately 22,000 square 
feet of vacant space to be built-out as laboratory space and offices at 1305 Kinnear Road, 
Columbus, Ohio. 
 
 
Terms of Lease  
 
The lease terms have not been completely negotiated between the parties.  Approximately 
22,000 square feet to be leased for a term of 10 years with potential renewal options has been 
proposed. The Tenant Improvements will be  approximately $5.0 M, paid from a Line of Credit 
of $3.4M obtained from Business and Finance with the balance of $1.6M paid from cash on 
hand in the College of Engineering. The Line of Credit will be repaid by the College of 
Engineering within 5 years. The rent and operating expenses to be paid by the College of 
Engineering over the 10 year term would be approximately $5.1 M and would be paid by 
Engineering and Office of Research funds. 
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(APPENDIX XXXI) 
 

Degrees Conferred at 
 

THE OHIO STATE UNIVERSITY 
COMMENCEMENT CONVOCATION 

 
March 18, 2012 
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The Graduate School 
 
Dean: Patrick S. Osmer 
 
 

Doctor of Musical Arts 
 
Ching-Yi Chen, Changhua 

City, Taiwan, ROC 
Certificate (National Taiwan 

Academy of Arts) 
B.Mus., M.Mus. 
Music 
Dr. John Rice 
 
 

Doctor of Philosophy 
 
Rebecca Allen, Columbus, 

GA 
B.S. (Columbus State 

University) 
Integrated Biomedical Science 

Graduate Program 

Dr. John Sheridan 
 
Satyajit Sanjeev Ambike, 

Columbus 
B.Engr. (University of Pune) 
M.S. 
Mechanical Engineering 
Dr. Gary Kinzel 
 
Thavamathi Annamalai, 

Chennai, India 
D.V.M.(Prof.) (Tamil Nadu 

Veterinary and Animal 
Sciences University) 

Master’s (Indian Veterinary 
Research Institute) 

Animal Sciences 
Dr. Ramesh Selvaraj 
 
Bryan Alan Anthony, Solon 
B.S. (University of Dayton) 
Integrated Biomedical Science 

Graduate Program 
Dr. Gregg Hadley 
 
Christian D. Austin, Bay 

Shore, NY 
B.Engr., B.S.Mat.Sc.Eng. 

(State University of New 
York at Stony Brook) 

M.S. 
Electrical and Computer 

Engineering 
Dr. Randolph Moses 
 
Isabel E. Averill, Columbus 
B.S. (University of Akron) 
M.S. 
Mathematics 

Dr. Yuan Lou 

Mark Bahar, Columbus 

Bachelor’s, M.S. (Istanbul 
University) 

Pharmacy 
Dr. Alan Kinghorn 
 
Denitza Svetasloavova 

Bantchevska, Sofia, 
Bulgaria 

Diploma (College of 
Management, Trade and 
Marketing) 

B.Bus.Adm. (Franklin 
University) 

M.S. 
Human Ecology 

Dr. Natasha Slesnick 
 
Thomas Wayne Bebee, 

Columbus 
B.S. (University of South 

Florida) 
Molecular, Cellular, and 

Developmental Biology 
Dr. Dawn Chandler 
 
Marlene Beierle, Dublin 
B.S.Educ., M.A. 
Education 

Dr. David Bloome 
 
Scot David Bohnenstiehl, 

Sacramento, CA 
B.S. (Montana Tech of the 

University of Montana) 
M.S. 
Materials Science and 

Engineering 
Dr. Michael Sumption 
 
Adriane Amelia Boyd, 

Asheville, NC 
B.A.Honors (University of 

North Carolina at Chapel 
Hill) 

M.A., M.S. 
Linguistics 
Dr. Michael White 
 
Austin Roberts Carter, 

Grandview 
B.A. (College of Wooster) 
M.S. 
Physics 

Dr. Arthur Epstein 
 
MinJung Cha, Suwon, Korea 
B.S.H.E., M.B.A. (Seoul 

National University) 
M.Appl.Stats 
Human Ecology 
Dr. Leslie Stoel 
 

Chun Sik Chae, Seoul, Korea 

B.Engr. (Chung-Ang 
University) 

M.S. (Kwangju Institute of 
Science and Technology) 

M.S. 
Electrical and Computer 

Engineering 
Dr. Joel Johnson 
 
Pritam Chakraborty, Kolkata, 

India 
B.Mech.Eng. (Jadavpur 

University) 
M.Tech. (Indian Institute of 

Technology Kanpur) 
Mechanical Engineering 
Dr. June Lee 
 
Shu-Chen Chiang, Yuanlin 

Town, Taiwan, ROC 
B.A. (National Taiwan 

University) 
M.Educ. (National Taiwan 

Normal University) 
Education 
Dr. Joshua Hawley 
 
Soundarya Chidambaram, 

New Delhi, India 
B.A.Journal. (University of 

Delhi) 
M.A., M.Philos. (Jawaharlal 

Nehru University) 
M.A. 
Political Science 
Dr. Irfan Nooruddin 
 
Bum Seok Chun, Seoul, 

Korea 
B.Engr. (Inha University) 
M.S., M.C.R.P. 
City and Regional Planning 
Dr. Jean-Michel Guldmann 
 
Sara Maria Crawford, Hilliard 
B.S.Agric., M.S. 
Animal Sciences 
Dr. Steven Moeller 
 
Joshua Robert Dettman, 

Algoma, WI 
B.S. (Carroll College) 
Chemistry 

Dr. Susan Olesik 
 
John Daniel Draper, Dayton 
B.S.Honors (Florida State 

University) 
M.S. 
Statistics 
Dr. Prem Goel 
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Renee M. Dunnington, 

Blacklick 
B.S.Nurs. (Capital University) 
Master’s (Kent State 

University) 
Education 
Dr. Richard Voithofer 
 
Barbaros Selnur Erdal, 

Columbus 
D.D.S. (Ege University) 
M.S. 
Electrical and Computer 

Engineering 
Dr. Bradley Clymer 
 
Lu Feng, Guiyang, China 
B.Engr. (Beijing University of 

Chemical Technology) 
Master’s (Chinese Academy of 

Sciences) 
Chemical Engineering 
Dr. David Tomasko 
 
Andrew C. Gard, Columbus 
B.A., B.S. 
Mathematics 
Dr. Fangyang Zheng 
 
Robert N. Garner, Starkville, 

MS 
B.S. (Jackson State 

University) 
Chemistry 
Dr. Claudia Turro 
 
Xueqing Geng, Yuci, China 
B.S., Bachelor’s (Shanxi 

Agricultural University) 
M.S. (China Agricultural 

University) 
Plant Cellular and Molecular 

Biology 
Dr. David Mackey 
 
Amanda Janine Gerber, 

Porter Ranch, CA 
B.A. (University of California, 

Irvine) 
M.A. 
English 
Dr. Lisa Kiser 
 
Maria L. Gies, Columbus 

B.A. (University of North 
Florida) 

M.A. (University of Florida) 
M.A. 
Education 
Dr. David Porretta 
 
Shivraman Giri, Pune, India 
B.Engr. (University of Mumbai) 
M.S. 
Biomedical Engineering 
Dr. Orlando Simonetti 

Maria Eugenia Gonzalez-
Posse, Nottingham, UK 

B.A. (George Washington 
University) 

M.A. (Louisiana State 
University) 

English 
Dr. David Riede 
 
Trudi N. Grant, Kingston, 

Jamaica 
B.S.Biol.Sci. (Northern 

Caribbean University) 
M.S. (Walla Walla College) 
Horticulture and Crop Science 
Dr. Imed Dami 

 
Aydin Gunduz, Ankara, 

Turkey 
B.S.Mech.Eng. (Middle East 

Technical University) 
Mechanical Engineering 
Dr. Rajendra Singh 
 
Jennifer Lynn Harrison, Eau 

Claire, WI 
B.S., M.Educ. 
Education 
Dr. Patricia Brosnan 
 
Ryan Matthew Harrison, Eau 

Claire, WI 
B.S., M.Educ. 
Education 
Dr. Michael Battista 
 
Christina I. K. Harsch, 

Dayton 
B.S. (Saint Lawrence 

University) 
B.S. (Saint John Fisher 

College) 
Chemistry 
Dr. Thomas Magliery 
 
Lingna He, Zixing, China 
B.Engr. (University of Science 

and Technology of China) 
Master’s (Shanghai Institute of 

Technology) 
Industrial and Systems 

Engineering 
Dr. Dave Farson 
 
Shaojun He, Yongzhou, 

China 
B.Engr., Master’s (Wuhan 

University) 
Geodetic Science and 

Surveying 
Dr. Rongxing Li 
 
Leon M. Headings, Columbus 
B.A. (Goshen College) 
B.S.Mech.Eng., M.S. 
Mechanical Engineering 
Dr. Gregory Washington 

Kristen Marie Hetrick, 

Pittsburgh, PA 
B.A. (Washington and 

Jefferson College) 
M.A. (University of Cincinnati) 
Germanic Languages and 

Literatures 
Dr. Helen Fehervary 
 
Sai K. Kamarajugadda, 

Hyderabad, India 
B.Tech. (Indian Institute of 

Technology Madras) 
M.S. 
Mechanical Engineering 
Dr. Sandip Mazumder 
 
Naveen Kanthamneni, 

Vijayawada, India 
B.Pharm. (Andhra Pradesh 

Agricultural University) 
M.S.Pharm. (Western 

University of Health 
Sciences) 

Pharmacy 
Dr. Thomas Schmittgen 
 
Yosef M. Khan, Columbus 
B.Med., M.D. (University of 

Karachi) 
M.Pub.Hlth. 
Public Health 
Dr. Kurt Stevenson 
 
Dhohyung Kim, Columbus 

B.S. (Sungkyunkwan 
University) 

Molecular, Cellular, and 
Developmental Biology 

Dr. Stefan Niewiesk 
 
Sungho Kim, Columbus 
B.S., M.S. (Korea Advanced 

Institute of Science and 
Technology) 

Business Administration 
Dr. Jay Barney 
 
Dongkyun Ko, Columbus 
B.S., M.S. (Chung-Ang 

University) 
Physics 
Dr. Ezekiel Johnston-Halperin 
 
Arda Kurt, Aydin, Turkey 
B.S., M.S. (Bilkent University) 
Electrical and Computer 

Engineering 
Dr. Ümit Özgüner 
 
Karolina Anna Kwasek, 

Lebork, Poland 
Certificate (Ghent University) 
Magister (University of Warmia 

and Mazury) 
Animal Sciences 
Dr. Macdonald Wick 
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Mariana Lacunza, 

Cochabamba, Bolivia 
B.A. (Universidad Católica 

Boliviana) 
Spanish and Portuguese 
Dr. Laura Podalsky 
 
Sylvester Amara Lamin, Bo, 

Sierra Leone 
B.A., Diploma (Fourah Bay 

College) 
B.S., Master’s (University of 

Waikato) 
M.S.W. 
Social Work 
Dr. Mo-Yee Lee 
 
Adrian W. Lange, Newton 

Falls 
B.S. 
Chemistry 
Dr. John Herbert 
 
Gil Young Lee, Columbus 
B.Engr. (Korea Air Force 

Academy) 
B.S., M.S. (Seoul National 

University) 
M.S. 
Electrical and Computer 

Engineering 
Dr. John Volakis, 
Dr. Chi-Chih Chen 
 
Seung-Cheol Lee, Korea 

B.S. (Hongik University) 
M.S. 
Electrical and Computer 

Engineering 
Dr. Jin-Fa Lee 
 
Adriana Ley-Chavez, 

Orizaba, Mexico 
B.S. (Universidad de las 

Américas Puebla) 
M.S. 
Industrial and Systems 

Engineering 
Dr. Julia Higle 
 
Huameng Li, Dublin 

B.S., M.S. (East China 
Institute of Technology) 

M.S. (Miami University Oxford) 
Biophysics 
Dr. Chenglong Li 
 
Wei Liu, Beijing, China 
B.S. (Peking University) 
M.S. 
Ohio State Biochemistry 

Program 
Dr. Charles Brooks 

Wen-I Luo, Taiwan, ROC 

B.S., M.S. (National Cheng 
Kung University) 

M.S. (California Institute of 
Technology) 

Ohio State Biochemistry 
Program 

Dr. James Cowan 
 
Jia Ma, Dalian, China 
B.Engr. (Dalian University of 

Technology) 
M.S. 
Materials Science and 

Engineering 
Dr. Yogeshwar Sahai 
 
Yadira Malavez, Columbus 

B.S., Master’s (University of 
Puerto Rico) 

Molecular, Cellular, and 
Developmental Biology 

Dr. Andrea Doseff 
 
Paul Douglas McCormick, 

Toledo 
B.A.Honors (University of 

Toledo) 
M.A. 
English 
Dr. James Phelan 
 
Nancy Ann McDonald-

Kenworthy, Columbus 
B.S.Educ., M.A. 
Education 
Dr. Patricia Lather 
 
Britney Kyle McIlvaine, 

Page, AZ 
B.A. (University of Colorado at 

Boulder) 
M.A. 
Anthropology 
Dr. Clark Larsen 
 
Charity Maria Troyer Moore, 

Columbus 
B.A. (Asbury College) 
M.A. 
Agricultural, Environmental 

and Development 
Economics 

Dr. Joyce Chen 
 
Cathleen R. Muller, Highland, 

NY 
B.A. (Swarthmore College) 
M.A. (Tufts University) 
Philosophy 
Dr. Benjamin Caplan 
 
Kelley Anne Mullick, Canal 

Fulton 
B.S. (Walsh University) 
M.S. (University of Akron) 
Chemical Engineering 

Dr. Barbara Wyslouzil 

Maria Murgia, Oristano, Italy 

Laurea (University of Bologna) 
Veterinary Preventive 

Medicine 
Dr. Yehia Saif 
 
Shrikant Chandrakant 

Nagpure, Columbus 
B.Engr. (University of Pune) 
M.S.Mech.Eng. (Old Dominion 

University) 
Mechanical Engineering 
Dr. Bharat Bhushan 
 
Kenneth Clark Olson, 

Louisburg, KS 
B.S. (Baker University) 
M.A. 
Psychology 
Dr. Patricia Van Zandt 
 
Madhu Micheal Ouseph, 

Lexington, KY 
B.Med.& B.Surgy. (Mahatma 

Gandhi University) 
M.D. (University of Delhi) 
Ohio State Biochemistry 

Program 
Dr. Gustavo Leone 
 
Xiangyong Ouyang, Beijing, 

China 
Bachelor’s, Mech.Engr. 

(Tsinghua University) 
Computer Science and 

Engineering 
Dr. Dhabaleswar Panda 
 
Daniel Paquet, Québec, 

Canada 
B.Eng., Maîtrise (Université de 

Montréal) 
Mechanical Engineering 
Dr. June Lee 
 
Jong-Kook Park, Yongin-si, 

Korea 
D.V.M., M.S. (Konkuk 

University) 
Master’s (Catholic University 

of Korea) 
Pharmacy 
Dr. Thomas Schmittgen 
 
Sung Hee Park, Seoul, Korea 
B.S., M.S.Agr (Konkuk 

University) 
Food Science and Technology 
Dr. V. M. Balasubramaniam 
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Adriana Maria Pedraza 
Toscano, Bogotá, 
Colombia 

D.V.M. (National University of 
Colombia) 

M.S. 
Comparative and Veterinary 

Medicine 
Dr. Robert Hamlin 
 
Patrick Joel Phillips, 

Dousman, WI 
B.S. (Saint Norbert College) 
M.S. 
Materials Science and 

Engineering 

Dr. Michael Mills 
 
Mircea Alexandru Platon, 

Columbus 
B.A. (Alexandru Ioan Cuza 

University) 
M.A. (McMaster University) 
History 
Dr. Dale VanKley, 
Dr. Alice Conklin 
 
Scott Richard Powell, 

Davison, MI 
B.A. (Michigan State 

University) 
M.A. 
Political Science 
Dr. Sarah Brooks 
 
Wenbin Qi, Nanjing, China 
B.S., M.S. (Nanjing University) 
M.S. 
Ohio State Biochemistry 

Program 
Dr. James Cowan 
 
Brinda Ramasubramanian, 

Chennai, India 
B.S. (Mahatma Gandhi 

University) 
M.S. (Regional Engineering 

College - Bharathidasan 
University) 

Chemistry 
Dr. Thomas Magliery 
 
Shilpa J. Register, 

Birmingham, AL 
B.S., M.S. (University of 

Alabama) 
Education 
Dr. Eric Anderman 
 
Laurie J. Reitsema, Boulder, 

CO 
B.A. (Ithaca College) 
M.A. 
Anthropology 
Dr. Douglas Crews 

James Donald Ressler, 

Barnesville 
Bachelor’s (Baldwin-Wallace 

College) 
M.S. (Eastern Illinois 

University) 
Education 
Dr. Susan Sutherland 
 
Paul B. Rimmer, Columbus 
B.S. (University of Colorado 

Denver) 
Physics 
Dr. Richard Freeman 
 
Bradley D. Rowe, Dayton 

B.A. (Wright State University) 
M.S. (University of Dayton) 
M.A. 
Education 
Dr. Bryan Warnick 
 
Darlene Marie Rozewski, 

Hilliard 
B.S.Pharm.Sci. 
Pharmacy 
Dr. John Byrd 
 
Stephen Harold Schlecht, 

Columbus 
Architect (University of 

Wisconsin – La Crosse) 
M.S. (University of Sheffield) 
Anthropology 
Dr. Samuel Stout 
 
Amit Sharma, New Delhi, 

India 
B.Tech. (Guru Gobind Singh 

Indraprastha University) 
Molecular Genetics 

Dr. Kathleen Boris-Lawrie 
 
William N. Sheppard, 

Columbus 
B.A., M.Educ. 
Education 
Dr. Bruce Tuckman, 
Dr. Scottye Cash 
 
Kristen Marie Smith, Dublin 

B.S.Honors (Vanderbilt 
University) 

Integrated Biomedical Science 

Graduate Program 
Dr. Caroline Whitacre 
 
Upender Reddy Somireddy, 

Khammam, India 
B.S.Agr., M.S.Agr. (Acharya 

N. G. Ranga Agricultural 
University) 

Horticulture and Crop Science 
Dr. Steven Harrison 

Petra Sternberg, Columbus 

Ingenieur (Fachhochschule 
Osnabrueck) 

M.S. 
Horticulture and Crop Science 
Dr. Daniel Struve 
 
Amy L. Stottlemyer, 

Delaware 
B.S.Env.&Nat.Res., M.S. 
Evolution, Ecology, and 

Organismal Biology 
Dr. Allison Snow 
 
Kevin Thomas Streib, 

Columbus 
B.S.Elec.&Cptr.Eng., M.S. 
Electrical and Computer 

Engineering 
Dr. James Davis 
 
Sung-Suk Suh, Columbus 
B.S.Bio. (Sungkyunkwan 

University) 
M.S. (Seoul National 

University) 
Ohio State Biochemistry 

Program 
Dr. Carlo Croce 

 
Brandon Joseph Sullivan, 

Gahanna 
B.S. 
Ohio State Biochemistry 

Program 
Dr. Thomas Magliery 
 
Peng Sun, Beijing, China 
B.Engr. (University of Science 

and Technology of China) 
M.S. (Tsinghua University) 
Electrical and Computer 

Engineering 
Dr. Ronald Reano 
 
Andrew Stener Casper 

Svendsen, North Hills, CA 
B.S. (California State 

University, Northridge) 
M.S. 
Electrical and Computer 

Engineering 
Dr. Inder Gupta 
 
David C. Talbot, Coshocton 
B.S.Mech.Eng., M.S. 
Mechanical Engineering 
Dr. Ahmet Kahraman 
 
Pauline Hyan Tan, Centerville 
B.S. 
Chemistry 
Dr. Dehua Pei 
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Eric Steven Taylor, 

Columbus 
B.S. (Brigham Young 

University) 
M.S. 
Geological Sciences 
Dr. Steven Lower 
 
Kelly H. Telu, Kent 
B.S. (University of Akron) 
Chemistry 
Dr. Michael Freitas 
 
Hsiao-Feng Tsai, Taoyuan, 

Taiwan, ROC 
B.A., M.A. (National Taiwan 

Normal University) 
Education 
Dr. Ian Wilkinson 
 
Sowmya Venkatakrishnan, 

Chennai, India 
B.Engr., M.S. (Birla Institute of 

Technology and Science) 
Plant Cellular and Molecular 

Biology 
Dr. Iris Meier 
 
Bo Wang, Shadong Province, 

China 
B.Med. (Shandong University) 
M.Philos (Peking Union 

Medical College) 
Molecular, Cellular, and 

Developmental Biology 
Dr. Samson Jacob 
 
Lei Wang, Columbus 
B.Engr., M.S. (Wuhan 

University) 
Geodetic Science and 

Surveying 
Dr. C. Shum 
 
Qifan Wang, Jianhu, China 
B.S. (Renmin University of 

China) 
M.A. 
Economics 
Dr. Lucia Dunn 
 
Christin Michelle Laroche 

Wilson, Tulsa, OK 
B.A. (Baylor University) 
M.A. 
Linguistics 
Dr. Brian Joseph 
 
Jonathan S. Wilson, 

Richardson, TX 
B.A. (Baylor University) 
M.S. 
Physics 
Dr. Richard Hughes 
 

Isain Zapata, Columbus 

Licenciado (Universidad 
Autónoma de Ciudad 
Juárez) 

M.S. (Universidad Autónoma 
de Chihuahua) 

Animal Sciences 
Dr. Macdonald Wick 
 
Hansong Zeng, Yancheng, 

China 
B.Engr., Master’s (Xi’An 

Jiaotong University) 
Biomedical Engineering 
Dr. Yi Zhao 
 
Ning Zhang, Hefei, China 
B.S.Biol.Sci., Master’s 

(University of Science and 
Technology of China) 

Ohio State Biochemistry 
Program 

Dr. Andre Palmer 
 
 

Master of Applied 
Statistics 
 
Meng Guo, Guanglin, China 
B.Engr., M.S. (Nanjing 

University) 
Statistics 
 
Wei Jing, Wuhen, Hubei, 

China 
B.S.Honors (Wuhan 

University) 
M.S. 
Statistics 
 
Tantan Liu, Huaiyang, China 
B.Engr. (University of Science 

and Technology of China) 
Mech.Engr. (Chinese 

Academy of Sciences) 
Statistics 
 
Yun Tang, Changsha, China 
B.S., M.A.Educ. (Beijing 

Normal University) 
Statistics 

 
 
Master of Arts 
 
Eunyoung An, Seoul, Korea 
B.A. (Pusan National 

University) 
Education 
 
Kristen Noelle Bach, New 

Albany 
B.S.Alld.Hlth.Profs. 
Education 

Paige Ree Bayer, West 

Mansfield 
B.F.A. (Ohio University) 
Art Education 
 
Josie Rachell Belton, 

Wauseon 
B.S. (Eastern Michigan 

University) 
Education 
 
Kelly Nicole Beroske, Toledo 
B.F.A. 
Art Education 
 
Mark David Boonshoft, 

White Plains, NY 
B.A. (State University of New 

York at Buffalo) 
History 
 
Chelsea Mina Bowden, 

Berkeley, CA 
Bachelor’s (San Francisco 

State University) 
Greek and Latin 
 
Chad E. Campbell, North 

Royalton 
B.S. (Heidelberg College) 
M.S. 
Education 
 
Ching-Lan Chang, Taipei, 

Taiwan, ROC 
B.A., M.A. (National Taiwan 

University) 
Music 
 
Tzu-chi Chen, Xinfeng, 

Taiwan, ROC 
B.A. (Tamkang University) 
Education 
 
Ina Choi, Incheon, Korea 
Bachelor’s (Inha University) 
Education 
 
Lyvia Sarah Chriki, Boston, 

MA 
B.A. (Simmons College) 
Psychology 
 
Emilie Jane Christoff, 

Gahanna 
B.S.Educ. (Ohio University) 
Education 
 
Zhaihuan Dai, Chiteng, China 
B.A. (Shandong University) 
Education 
 
Kelly J. Davids, Columbus 
Bachelor’s (Franklin 

University) 
Public Policy and 

Management 
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Timothy Patrick Doyle, 

Dayton 
B.S.Educ. 
Education 
 
Anne Gordon Dunkelberger, 

Chapel Hill, NC 
B.A. (University of Delaware) 
M.A.T. (Manhattanville 

College) 
Education 
 
Jill Ann Dusina, Columbus 
B.S.Bus.Admin. (Franklin 

University) 
Public Policy and 

Management 
 
Christi Lynn Edmonds, 

Orient 
B.S.Alld.Hlth.Profs. 
Education 
 
Jorge Mauricio Espinoza, 

Ashland 
Master’s (Universidad de 

Costa Rica) 
B.A. (Ashland University) 
Latin American Studies 
 
Anne Marie Evans, Westlake 
B.A. 
Public Policy and 

Management 
 
Tiffany Yee Fan, Hacienda 

Heights, CA 
B.A. (University of California, 

Los Angeles) 
Education 
 
Krista Maria Fylak, Huber 

Heights 
B.S. (The University of 

Findlay) 
Education 
 
Lizabeth Alexandra 

Goldstein, Columbus 
B.A. (College of New Jersey) 
Psychology 
 
Rui Gong, He Bei, China 
B.A. (Hebei University) 
Education 
 
Rui Gong, Guangzhou, China 
B.A. (Sun Yat-sen University) 
Education 
 
Seth E. Gordon, Yellow 

Springs 
B.A. (Antioch College) 
M.A. (Antioch University - 

Midwest) 
Education 

Mini Gu, Shanghai, China 

B.A. (Fudan University) 
Arts Policy and Administration 
 
Qianqian Guo, Lanzhou, 

China 
B.A. (Tianjin Normal 

University) 
Education 
 
Richard Allen Hague, 

Columbus 
B.S. (Ohio University) 
Education 
 
Shu-Chin Han, Taipei, 

Taiwan, ROC 
Bachelor’s (National Chi Nan 

University) 
Education 
 
Randy William Hart, Jr., 

Salem Center 
B.A. (Ohio University) 
Public Policy and 

Management 
 
Jacqueline Hyland Heath, 

Prosperity, PA 
B.A. (American University) 
Psychology 
 
Emily Ann Hibbitts, Fairborn 
B.A. (University of Dayton) 
Education 
 
Bryan John Horn, Columbus 
B.S.Educ. 
Education 
 
Kristi Hsu, The Woodlands, 

TX 
B.A. (University of Texas at 

Austin) 
Public Policy and 

Management 
 
Zhenyi Huang, Zhejiang, 

China 
B.S. (London School of 

Economics and Political 
Science) 

Business Administration 
 
Gevorg Hunanyan, Columbus 
B.A. 
Near Eastern Languages and 

Cultures 
 
Erin Elizabeth Kane, 

Manchester, NH 
B.A. (Washington University in 

St. Louis) 
Anthropology 
 
Sara Jean Karl, Freeport 
B.S.Educ. (Ohio University) 
Education 

Niall Andre Munson Klyn, 

Duluth, MN 
B.A. (Concordia College at 

Moorhead) 
Music 
 
Yu-Chun Lee, Taiwan, ROC 
B.A. (National Taiwan Normal 

University) 
Education 
 
Debra Tsu Chi Lei, Columbus 
Bachelor’s, M.B.A. (National 

Taiwan University) 
Business Administration 
 
Caitlyn S. Lemons, Saukville, 

WI 
B.A. 
Slavic and East European 

Studies 
 
Marivic Canlas Lesho, 

Columbus 
B.A.Honors (University of 

Georgia) 
Linguistics 
 
Chenhui Li, Henan, China 

B.A. (Southwest University) 
Education 
 
Rui Li, Xuzhou, China 
B.A. (Southern Yangtze 

University) 
Education 
 
RuiWan Li, Shanghai, China 
B.A. (Kent State University) 
Education 
 
Yue Li, Beijing, China 
B.A. (Shanghai International 

Studies University) 
Education 
 
Chia-yu Lin, Hualien, Taiwan, 

ROC 
B.A. (Tamkang University) 
Education 
 
Amanda Looney, New Albany 
B.S., M.Educ. 
Education 
 
Hong-Chan Lu, Taoyuan, 

Taiwan, ROC 
B.A. (Tunghai University) 
Education 
 
Sebastien J. Mainville, 

Montréal, Canada 
B.A. (Concordia University) 
M.A. (McGill University) 
Political Science 
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Amanda Kay Mallott, 

Columbus 
B.A. (Case Western Reserve 

University) 
Public Policy and 

Management 
 
Kathryn L. McFarland, 

Columbus 
B.S., M.Appl.Stats 
Philosophy 
 
Jonathon Warren Meeker, 

Columbus 
B.Mus. (Youngstown State 

University) 
Music 
 
Angela M. Merrin, Westerville 
B.Educ. (University of Toledo) 
Education 
 
Joseph James Merry, 

Newark 
B.A. (John Carroll University) 
Sociology 
 
Dominik Mischkowski, 

Hutthurm, Germany 
Diploma (University of 

Konstanz) 
Psychology 
 
Seth Tyler Morgan, Hebron 
B.S.Educ. (Miami University 

Oxford) 
Education 
 
Abira Mukhopadhyay, 

Calcutta, India 
B.A.Honors, M.A. (University 

of Calcutta) 
History of Art 
 
Kyoung Hyoun Na, Gwangju, 

Korea 
B.Bus.Adm. (Sejong 

University) 
Education 
 
Ndeye Rama Ndiaye, Orly, 

France 
B.A. 
Education 
 
Colin O’Bannon, Columbus 
B.A. (Allegheny College) 
History 
 
Raymond Russell Orben III, 

Swanton 
B.A. (Hillsdale College) 
Public Policy and 

Management 
 
Kaleigh E. Paul, Zanesville 
B.S.H.E. 
Education 

Nicole Elise Perry, Columbus 

B.A. (Denison University) 
Education 
 
Andrew Robert Plummer, 

Miami, FL 
B.S. (Florida International 

University) 
M.S. (Georgia State 

University) 
Linguistics 
 
Sara Anne Provenzale, 

Columbus 
B.A. (University of Cincinnati) 
Spanish and Portuguese 
 
Robert Talbot Robol, 

Worthington 
B.A. (University of Southern 

California) 
Public Policy and 

Management 
 
Suzanne Renee Schaefer, 

Bexley 
B.A. (University of Minnesota, 

Twin Cities) 
Education 
 
Jayne M. Schwantes, 

Westerville 
B.A. 
Public Policy and 

Management 
 
Ruth Marie Smith, Milan 
B.A. (Anderson University) 
Art Education 
 
Elizabeth Lee Snyder, 

Twinsburg 
B.A. 
Public Policy and 

Management 
 
Misty A. Sopiak, Columbus 
B.S. (California University of 

Pennsylvania) 
Education 
 
Jesse Matthew Stasiewicz, 

Columbus 
B.A. (Boston University) 
Public Policy and 

Management 
 
Terah James Stewart, 

Columbus 
B.A. 
Education 
 
Junting Tan, Guangzhou, 

China 
B.A. (Guangdong University of 

Business Studies) 
Education 

 

Michael Vilensky, Columbus 

B.A. (University of Michigan, 
Ann Arbor) 

M.A. (University of Chicago) 
Psychology 
 
Dawn Marie Wallace-Pascoe, 

Worthington 
B.A. (Miami University Oxford) 
M.A. 
Education 
 
Sisi Wang, Beijing, China 
B.A. (Beijing Wuzi University) 
Education 
 
Betty M. Wershing, 

Columbus 
B.S. (Ashland University) 
Education 
 
Rachel Sue White, New 

Lothrop, MI 
B.A. (University of Michigan, 

Ann Arbor) 
Education 
 
Junyi Wu, Yongzhou, China 
B.A. (University of Science 

and Technology, Beijing) 
Education 
 
Sarah Vue Yang, Akron 
B.S.Educ. (University of 

Akron) 
Education 
 
Jennifer Louise Young, 

Madison, WI 
B.A. (University of Wisconsin-

Madison) 
East Asian Languages and 

Literatures 
 
Amanda M. Zerhusen, South 

Bloomfield 
B.A. 
Public Policy and 

Management 
 
Shufang Zheng, Kunming, 

China 
B.F.A. (Southwest University, 

China) 
Music 
 
Wei Zhou, Changsha, China 
B.A. (Hunan Normal 

University) 
Education 
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Master of Business 
Administration  
 
Weston Verlon Barrett, 

Columbus 
B.S.Bus.Admin. (Western 

Michigan University) 
Business Administration 
 
Robert Edwin Bove, 

Cincinnati 
B.S.Mech.Eng. 
Business Administration 
 
Ha Thi Thu Dang, Ho Chi 

Minh City, Vietnam 
B.Bus.Adm. (University of 

Economics Ho Chi Minh) 
Business Administration 
 
Jonathan Allen Davia, 

Morristown 
B.S.Eng.Phys. 
Business Administration 
 
David Patrick Duvarney, 

Columbus 
B.A. (Ohio University) 
Business Administration 
 
Lucas I. Friedman, Columbus 
B.S.Bus.Admin. 
Business Administration 
 
Anthony Michael Grafsky, 

Columbus 
B.S. 
Business Administration 
 
Joseph Michael Graziano, 

Columbus 
B.S.Bus.Admin. 
Business Administration 
 
Ralph Jacob Gundrum II, 

Canal Winchester 
Business Administration 
 
Sharad Gupta, Columbus 
B.Engr. (University of Delhi) 
M.S. (Drexel University) 
Business Administration 
 
Kalpana Gutha, Chennai, 

India 
B.Engr. (Anna University) 
Business Administration 
 
Wesley Douglas Hahn, 

Findlay 
B.S.Bus.Admin. 
Business Administration 
 

Parag Hardas, Pune, India 

B.Tech. (Babasaheb 
Ambedkar Technological 
University) 

Business Administration 
 
Ryan Daniel Hatfield, Canal 

Winchester 
B.A. (Capital University) 
Business Administration 
 
Holly Marie Haynes, Hilliard 
B.Bus.Adm. (Ohio University) 
Business Administration 
 
Andrew D. Heschel, 

Columbus 
B.S.Comm. (Ohio University) 
Business Administration 
 
Cuyler Matthew Hunter, 

Cleveland 
B.A. (Ohio Wesleyan 

University) 
Business Administration 
 
William C. Jones III, 

Greenville 
B.S.Bus.Admin. (University of 

Wyoming) 
Business Administration 
 
Dennis Joseph, New Delhi, 

India 
B.Bus.Adm. (Southern 

Arkansas University) 
Business Administration 
 
James Kendall Kelley, 

Columbus 
B.A. (University of Virginia) 
M.D. 
Business Administration 
 
David Frederick Klink, New 

Albany 
B.A. (Case Western Reserve 

University) 
Business Administration 
 
William August Kuhar, 

Medina 
B.S.Bus.Admin. (University of 

Akron) 
Business Administration 
 
Walter H. Lewis IV, 

Huntington, WV 
B.S.Bus.Admin. (University of 

Tennessee- Knoxville) 
Business Administration 
 
Matthew James McFadden, 

Marion 
B.A. (Denison University) 
Business Administration 

Antonio Soriano Olmos, 

Dover 
B.A. (Walsh University) 
Business Administration 
 
Amit Roshan Pandit, 

Faridabad, India 
B.Engr. (University of Mumbai) 
M.S. (Eastern Michigan 

University) 
Business Administration 
 
Jason Edward Pfeiffer, 

Columbus 
B.S. (Franklin University) 
Business Administration 
 
Christopher Steven Pflum, 

Columbus 
B.A. 
Business Administration 
 
Song Qin, Dublin 
B.Med. (Beijing Medical 

University) 
Master’s (National Center 

Clinical Laboratory) 
Ph.D. 
Business Administration 
 
Steven J. Shadeed, Bucyrus 
B.S.Bus.Admin. 
Business Administration 
 
Megan M. Sliwa, Chicago, IL 

B.S. (Bradley University) 
Business Administration 
 
Laura Ann Standafer, 

Westerville 
B.S. (Franklin University) 
Business Administration 
 
Vijay Ganesh Sundaram, 

Lewis Center 
B.Engr. (University of Madras) 
Business Administration 
 
Natarajan Swaminathan, 

Pickerington 
M.S. 
Business Administration 
 
Peter John Tender, 

Columbus 
B.S., M.A. 
Business Administration 
 
Lorraine M. Toth, Columbus 
B.Bus.Adm. (University of 

Notre Dame) 
Business Administration 
 
Justin Alexander Trappe, 

Columbus 
B.A. 
J.D. (University of Toledo) 
Business Administration 
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Timothy Joseph Ward, Jr., 

Austintown 
B.S.Mech.Eng. (Youngstown 

State University) 
Business Administration 
 
Duane Todd Warner, 

Columbus 
B.S. (Franklin University) 
Business Administration 
 
Christopher Gerald Widing, 

Upper Arlington 
B.Bus.Adm, B.S.Comm. (Ohio 

University) 
Business Administration 
 
 

Master of Business 
Logistics Engineering 
 
Juan Du, Taiyuan, China 
Bachelor’s (Taiyuan University 

of Technology) 
Business Logistics 

Engineering 
 
Younghoon Lee, Kwangju, 

Korea 
Bachelor’s (Incheon 

University) 
Business Logistics 

Engineering 
 
Lei Xu, Fuyang, China 
Diploma (University of 

Southampton) 
B.S. (Shanghai University of 

Finance and Economics) 
Business Logistics 

Engineering 
 
Feng Zheng, Wenzhou, China 
B.A. (University of 

Indianapolis) 
Business Logistics 

Engineering 
 
 

Master of City and 
Regional Planning 
 
Daniel Lawrence Barbato, 

Liverpool, NY 
B.A. (State University of New 

York at Geneseo) 
City and Regional Planning 
 
Rachel Kathryn Beck, Carey 
B.S.Bus.Admin. (United States 

Military Academy) 
City and Regional Planning 
 
Sarah Nicole Becker, 

Hopkinsville, KY 
B.A. (University of Louisville) 
City and Regional Planning 

Shaquitta Denise Brookins, 

Atlanta, GA 
B.A. (Oglethorpe University) 
City and Regional Planning 
 
Matthew Allen Dickinson, 

Newark 
B.S. (Ohio University) 
City and Regional Planning 
 
Sarah Elizabeth Gribble, 

Newcomerstown 
B.A. 
City and Regional Planning 
 
Lisa A. Minklei, Granville 

B.A. (Swarthmore College) 
J.D. (University of Maryland, 

Baltimore) 
City and Regional Planning 
 
Michael Chandler Norton-

Smith, North Canton 
B.A. (Kent State University) 
City and Regional Planning 
 
Abby Elizabeth Onstott, 

Worthington 
B.S.Alld.Hlth.Profs. 
City and Regional Planning 
 
 

Master of Education 
 
Christine Ann Barr, 

Mansfield 
B.S.Educ. 
Education 
 
Natasha Desiree Beck, 

Bellville 
B.S.Educ. 
Education 
 
Jessie L. Broseus, Heath 
B.S.Educ. 
Education 
 
Sarah Elizabeth Brubaker, 

Sunbury 
B.A. 
Education 
 
Kristen Marie Campbell, 

Chardon 
B.A. 
Education 
 
Ashtin Marie Carpenter, 

Heath 
B.A. 
Education 
 
Jenaya Lenae Clabaugh, 

Upper Sandusky 
B.S.Educ. 
Education 

Joshua D. Cooper, 

Portsmouth 
B.A. 
Education 
 
John David Coy, Marion 
B.S.Educ. 
Education 
 
Abigail Marie Dannemiller, 

Pickerington 
B.A. 
Education 
 
Gabriel Thomas 

Dannemiller, Shelby 

B.S.Educ. 
Education 
 
Rachel C. Davis, Jackson, MI 
B.S.H.E. 
Education 
 
Timothy Lee Fouts, 

Westerville 
B.S.Educ. 
Education 
 
Kaitlyn Nicole Fraley, Lucas 

B.S.Educ. 
Education 
 
Catherine Mary Garrett, 

Elyria 
B.S.Educ. 
Education 
 
Andrea A. Gibson, Willard 
B.S.Educ. 
Education 
 
Laura Mae Gibson, Mansfield 
B.S.Educ. 
Education 
 
Kerinan Rose Greene, 

Westerville 
B.S.Educ. 
Education 
 
Elizabeth Anne Head, 

Westerville 
B.S.Educ. 
Education 
 
Mallory Brooke Hurley, 

Ironton 
B.S.H.E. 
Education 
 
Elizabeth Anne Jones, 

Granville 
B.S. 
Education 
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Brittany Lynee Kaylor, 

Danville 
B.S.Educ. 
Education 
 
Elise Nicole Kehres, 

Pickerington 
B.S.Educ. 
Education 
 
Morgan Bea Kellogg, 

Millersburg 
B.S.Educ. 
Education 
 
Jodi King, Mount Vernon 

B.A. (Ohio Wesleyan 
University) 

Education 
 
Taylor Ernest Logothetides, 

Lyndhurst 
B.S.H.E. 
Education 
 
Catherine Ann Martin, 

Pataskala 
B.S.Educ. 
Education 
 
Jamie Angelina McGinnis, 

Mingo Junction 
B.S.H.E. 
Education 
 
Carrie Ann McMillen, Findlay 
B.S. (The University of 

Findlay) 
Education 
 
Jeremy Seth Miller, 

Cincinnati 
B.S.H.E. 
Education 
 
Amy Joy Mohler, Pataskala 
B.S.Educ. 
Education 
 
Renee F. Mueller, Amelia 
B.A. 
Education 
 
Valerie Rollwagen, Upper 

Arlington 
B.A., Master’s (SUNY at 

Buffalo) 
Education 
 
Toni Marie Schafer, 

Sycamore 
B.S.Educ. 
Education 
 
Suzan Jean Scott, Newark 
B.S.Educ. 
Education 

Katie JoAnn Sinclair, Bryan 

B.S.H.E. 
Education 
 
Casey Lynn VanGundy, 

Delaware 
B.S.Educ. 
Education 
 
Courtney Nicole Worley, 

Logan, WV 
B.F.A. (Marshall University) 
Education 
 
Lisa K. Wright, Newton Falls 
B.S. (Abilene Christian 

University) 
Education 
 
Robert D. Wunsch, 

Westerville 
B.A., B.A.Journal. 
Education 
 
 

Master of Environment 
and Natural Resources 
 
Kimberly Sue Allen, 

Sandusky 
B.A. (Ohio Dominican 

University) 
Environment and Natural 

Resources 
 
Kyle C. Costilow, Lorain 
B.S.Env.& Nat.Res. 
Environment and Natural 

Resources 
 
Ruthanne Arlene Flottman, 

Dayton 
B.S. (University of Arizona) 
Environment and Natural 

Resources 
 
Krissy Pfleider-Smeyak, 

Alva, OK 
B.S. (Oklahoma State 

University) 
Environment and Natural 

Resources 
 
Dezaray Pearl Reed, 

Bellefontaine 
B.A. (Ohio Wesleyan 

University) 
Environment and Natural 

Resources 
 
 

Master of Fine Arts 
 
Samara Ryan Rafert, 

Newark, DE 
B.A. (Macalester College) 
English 

Master of Labor and 
Human Resources 
 
Michelle D. Attias-Goldstein, 

Columbus 
B.A. (Dickinson College) 
Labor and Human Resources 
 
Kathryn Gilliland Beyerchen, 

Columbus 
B.A. (University of California, 

Santa Barbara) 
Labor and Human Resources 
 

 

Master of Music 
 
Jay Hamilshon Hairston, 

Houston, TX 
B.Mus. (University of North 

Texas) 
Music 
 
Katie Marie Morell, Dunmore, 

PA 
B.S. (Pennsylvania State 

University) 
Music 
 
 

Master of Occupational 
Therapy 
 
Emily Sue Dannemiller, 

Pickerington 
B.S.Bus.Admin. 
Allied Medical Professions 
 
Ann Marie Kilpatrick, 

Cincinnati 
B.A. 
Allied Medical Professions 
 
Tricia Ann Storme, 

Independence 
B.S.Alld.Hlth.Profs 
Allied Medical Professions 
 
 

Master of Public 
Administration 
 
Jacqlyn E. Breymaier, 

Toledo 
Bachelor’s (Ohio University) 
Public Policy and 

Management 
 
David Cook, Westerville 
B.A. 
Public Policy and 

Management 
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Ashanthi V. DeSilva, 

Chicago, IL 
B.A. 
Public Policy and 

Management 
 
Jeffrey William Gardiner, 

Macedonia 
B.S.Bus.Admin. 
Public Policy and 

Management 
 
Sarah Mary Harrigan, 

Columbus 
B.A. (McGill University) 
Public Policy and 

Management 
 
Corey James Hawkey, 

Columbus 
B.A. (Bowling Green State 

University) 
Public Policy and 

Management 
 
Antonio Holliday, Jr., 

Lawrenceville, GA 
B.Bus.Adm. (University of 

Georgia) 
Public Policy and 

Management 
 
Amy C. Juravich, Pittsburgh, 

PA 
B.A. (Duquesne University) 
Public Policy and 

Management 
 
Andrew Kao, Columbus 
B.A. (National Sun Yat-sen 

University) 
Public Policy and 

Management 
 
Ursela Simone Knezevic, 

Los Angeles, CA 
B.A. (University of California, 

Berkeley) 
Public Policy and 

Management 
 
Michael Chandler Norton-

Smith, North Canton 
B.A. (Kent State University) 
Public Policy and 

Management 
 
Robert D. Reed, Piqua 
B.A. 
Public Policy and 

Management 
 
Tal D. Sack, Cleveland 

Heights 
B.A. 
Public Policy and 

Management 

Erin Marie Sainato, 

Miamisburg 
B.A. 
Public Policy and 

Management 
 
 

Master of Public Health 
 
Alexandra Marie Berk, Troy 
B.A. (University of Michigan, 

Ann Arbor) 
Public Health 
 
Allyson Chickey, Columbus 
B.S.H.E. 
Public Health 
 
Renee Lynn Stasko Cruz, 

Coral Center, PA 
B.S. (West Virginia University) 
Public Health 
 
Julie Ann Dean, Cincinnati 
B.A. (Denison University) 
Public Health 
 
Emilie Elisabeth Esmont, 

Canton 
B.A. 
Public Health 
 
Kevin Brennan Grill, Dublin 
B.S. 
Public Health 
 
Rachael Whitney Gross, 

Elizabethtown, PA 
B.S. (The University of 

Findlay) 
Public Health 
 
Bianca Michelle Guynn, 

Valparaiso, IN 
B.S. (Miami University) 
Public Health 
 
Paul Arthur Kerr, Newark 
B.S. 
Public Health 
 
Joshua David McKellar, 

Beavercreek 
B.A. (Wheaton College) 
Public Health 
 
Katherine Marie Meeker, 

Toledo 
B.S. (University of Toledo) 
Public Health 
 
Darceilia Tresele Plott, 

Dublin 
B.S.Nurs. (Otterbein College) 
M.D. 
Public Health 

Dale Kline Roberts, 

Columbus 
B.S. 
Public Health 
 
Caroline Anne Sanker, 

Rocky River 
B.S. (Davidson College) 
Public Health 
 
Jonathan Lee Slaughter, 

Whitsett, NC 
B.A. (Catawba College) 
M.D. (Wake Forest University) 
Public Health 
 
Richard Michael Thomas, 

Newark 
B.S. 
Public Health 
 
Jerome U. Wray, Louisville, 

KY 
B.S.Nurs., M.S. (Wright State 

University) 
Public Health 
 
Xuan Zhang, Nanjing, China 
Bachelor’s (Nanjing Medical 

University) 
Public Health 
 
 

Master of Science 
 
Syed Farooq Ali, Lahore, 

Pakistan 
B.S. (National University of 

Computer and Emerging 
Sciences) 

M.S. (Lahore University of 
Management Sciences) 

Computer Science and 
Engineering 

 
Didem Peren Aykas, 

Columbus 
B.S. (Celal Bayar University) 
Food Science and Technology 
 
Bruce Andrew Beitman, 

Columbus 
B.S.Elec.&Cptr.Eng. 
Electrical and Computer 

Engineering 
 
Karen L. Bellman, 

Jacksonville, AL 
B.S. (Mercer University-

Macon) 
Mechanical Engineering 
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Basavaraj Sangappa 
Binjawadagi, Dharwad, 
India 

Bachelor’s (University of 
Agricultural Sciences, 
Dharwad) 

Master’s (Karnataka 
Veterinary, Animal & 
Fisheries Sciences 
University, Bidar) 

Comparative and Veterinary 
Medicine 

 
Joe William Bolinger, 

Columbus 
B.S.Cptr.Sci.&Eng., Ph.D. 
Computer Science and 

Engineering 
 
Matthew Lewis Bowers, 

Aurora 
Bachelor’s (John Carroll 

University) 
Materials Science and 

Engineering 
 
Kimberly Ann Brown, Grove 

City 
B.S.Nurs. 
Nursing 
 
Sameeraja Brundavanam, 

Tamilnadu, India 
B.Engr. (Anna University) 
Electrical and Computer 

Engineering 
 
Eric Allen Carlson, Tomball, 

TX 
B.S. (Ferris State University) 
Welding Engineering 
 
Christopher Joseph 

Casillas, Arcata, CA 
B.S. (Rose-Hulman Institute of 

Technology) 
Mechanical Engineering 
 
Ashwini Chandra, Patna, 

India 
Bachelor’s (Indian Institute of 

Technology Roorkee) 
Materials Science and 

Engineering 

 
Cai Chen, Xiaogan, China 
B.S. (University of Science 

and Technology of China) 
Biophysics 
 
Chenxi Chen, Beijing, China 
B.S. (Tsinghua University) 
Plant Pathology 

Wei Chen, Guilin, China 

B.S. (University of Science 
and Technology of China) 

Electrical and Computer 
Engineering 

 
Jinhwee Choi, Gumi, 

Kyungpook, Korea 
B.S. (Kyungpook National 

University) 
Electrical and Computer 

Engineering 
 
Lucas Abraham Citro, Scio 
B.S.Physics (Kent State 

University) 
Biophysics 
 
Oren Michael Costantini, 

Cincinnati 
B.S.Mech.Eng. 
Mechanical Engineering 
 
Daniel Robert Coughlin, 

Bethel, CT 
B.S. (University of Colorado at 

Boulder) 
M.S. (University of New 

Mexico) 
Materials Science and 

Engineering 
 
Boyi Cui, Anshan, China 
Bachelor’s (Beijing Forestry 

University) 
Computer Science and 

Engineering 
 
Sarah Jane Cusser, 

Shawnee Mission, KS 
B.A. (Pomona College) 
Evolution, Ecology, and 

Organismal Biology 
 
Brian Thomas Dailey, Mount 

Gilead 
B.S. (Kent State University) 
Physics 
 
Brian Scott Dainton, 

Westerville 
B.S. 
Physics 
 
Ketan Dande, Latur, India 
Bachelor’s (University of 

Pune) 
Electrical and Computer 

Engineering 
 
RaviPrakash Srirama 

Venkata Naga Darbha, 
Bangalore, India 

Bachelor’s (National Inst. of 
Tech.) 

Computer Science and 
Engineering 

 

Dongfeng Ding, Suzhou, 

China 
B.S., M.S. (Nankai University) 
Plant Cellular and Molecular 

Biology 
 
Jacob Paul Dumbleton, 

Northville, MI 
B.A. (Albion College) 
Chemistry 
 
Ezdeen Ahmed Elghannai, 

Tripoli, Libya 
B.S. (Garyounis University) 
Electrical and Computer 

Engineering 
 
Craig R. Elgin, Santa Cruz, 

CA 
B.A. (Lewis and Clark College) 
D.D.S. (Oregon Health and 

Science University) 
Dentistry 
 
Everett J. Ewazen, Parma 
B.S.Elec.&Cptr.Eng. 
Electrical and Computer 

Engineering 
 
Kevin Thomas Fletcher, 

Athens 
Bachelor’s (Ohio University) 
Horticulture and Crop Science 
 
Gordon Russell Fox, 

Westerville 
B.S.Mech.Eng. 
Mechanical Engineering 
 
Scott Funk, Norwood 
B.S.Aero.&Astro.Eng. 
Mechanical Engineering 
 
Kathryn Nicole Gabet, 

Canton 
B.S. (Case Western Reserve 

University) 
Mechanical Engineering 
 
Vijay Narasimha Gadepally, 

Columbus 
B.Tech. (Indian Institute of 

Technology Kanpur) 
Electrical and Computer 

Engineering 
 
Alejandra Garcia-Villa, 

Medellín, Colombia 
Ingeniero (Universidad EAFIT) 
Chemical Engineering 
 
Jennifer L. George, 

Cincinnati 
B.S.Honors (Miami University 

Oxford) 
Mathematics 
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Amrita Ghosh, Jhargram, 

India 
B.Engr. (Vidyasagar 

University) 
M.S. 
Computer Science and 

Engineering 
 
Kevin Andrew Giriunas, 

Litchfield 
B.S.Civ.Eng. 
Civil Engineering 
 
Fei Gong, Xiangtan, China 
B.Engr., Master’s (Zhejiang 

University) 
Ph.D. 
Electrical and Computer 

Engineering 
 
Matthew Owen Grant, Stow 
B.S.Civ.Eng. 
Civil Engineering 
 
Alexandra S. Gress, 

Ashtabula 
B.S.Agric. 
Animal Sciences 
 
Matthew John Grossmann, 

Cincinnati 
B.S. (University of Texas at 

Austin) 
Mechanical Engineering 
 
Caroline Marie Burrell Haas, 

North Royalton 
B.S. (Tulane University of 

Louisiana) 
Biomedical Engineering 
 
Amanda Elizabeth 

Haberman, Columbus 
B.S.Nurs. (Purdue University) 
Nursing 
 
Jinnan Hu, Nanjing, China 
B.S. (Nanjing University) 
Plant Pathology 
 
Hechang Huang, Chongqing, 

China 
B.Med., D.D.S. (West China 

University of Medical 
Science) 

Ph.D. (University of 
Connecticut Health Center) 

Dentistry 
 
Remigius K. Jackson, 

Orange, TX 
B.S. (McNeese State 

University) 
D.D.S. (Meharry Medical 

College) 
Dentistry 

Brian Ethan Jan, San Diego, 

CA 
B.A. (University of California, 

Berkeley) 
Molecular, Cellular, and 

Developmental Biology 
 
Christopher Douglas 

Jensen, Perrysburg 
B.S.Aero.&Astro.Eng. 
Aeronautical and Astronautical 

Engineering 
 
Hojun Ji, Columbus 
B.Bus.Adm. (Yonsei 

University) 
M.B.A. (Cleveland State 

University) 
Human Ecology 
 
Bo Jin, Chengdu, China 
B.Engr. (University of 

Electronic Science and 
Technology of China) 

Electrical and Computer 
Engineering 

 
Ahmed Jomaa, Tripoli, Libya 
Bachelor’s (Al-Fateh 

University) 
B.S.Elec.&Cptr.Eng. 
Electrical and Computer 

Engineering 
 
Katrina Nicole Jones, 

Pataskala 
B.S. 
Industrial and Systems 

Engineering 
 
Hui Ju, Missouri City, TX 

B.S. (Wuhan University) 
Diploma (University of 

Stuttgart) 
Geodetic Science and 

Surveying 
 
Preethi Jyothi, Bangalore, 

India 
B.Tech (National Institutes of 

Technology) 
Computer Science and 

Engineering 
 
Nived Kalappuraikal 

Sivadas, Chennai, India 
Bachelor’s (Anna University) 
Computer Science and 

Engineering 
 
Swetha Karusala, Chennai, 

India 
B.Engr. (Anna University) 
Electrical and Computer 

Engineering 

Michael Ryan Kelly, 

Columbus 
B.S. 
Food Science and Technology 
 
Yong Wook Kim, Seoul, 

Korea 
B.S.Bus.Admin. (Hanyang 

University) 
M.S. (Illinois Institute of 

Technology) 
Computer Science and 

Engineering 
 
David Michael Kline, East 

Berlin, PA 
B.A. (Messiah College) 
Statistics 
 
Tianyou Kou, Jining, China 
B.S. (Harbin Institute of 

Technology) 
M.S. (Chinese Academy of 

Sciences) 
Electrical and Computer 

Engineering 
 
Sri Adarsh Kumar, Chennai, 

India 
Bachelor’s (Regional 

Engineering College -
Bharathidasan University) 

Electrical and Computer 
Engineering 

 
Abhisek Kundu, Arambagh, 

India 
B.Engr. (Jadavpur University) 
Computer Science and 

Engineering 
 
Vivek Ayyappa Kuppusamy, 

Cincinnati 
B.S. (University of Maryland, 

College Park) 
Aeronautical and Astronautical 

Engineering 
 
Chang Pil Lee, Seoul, Korea 
Bachelor’s (Hongik University) 
B.S. (Purdue University) 
Computer Science and 

Engineering 
 
Lizhi Li, Hengyang, China 
B.S. (Beijing University) 
B.S. (Peking University) 
Master’s (Osaka University) 
Biophysics 
 
Ting Li, Shanghai, China 
B.S. (Civil Aviation University 

of China) 
M.A. (Beihang University) 
Aeronautical and Astronautical 

Engineering 
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Wei Liu, Xiangfan, China 

B.Engr. (Wuhan University) 
Computer Science and 

Engineering 
 
Zhongning Liu, Chengdu 

Sichuan, China 
B.Engr. (University of 

Electronic Science and 
Technology of China) 

Electrical and Computer 
Engineering 

 
Raymond Montgomery 

Lombardi, Lewis Center 
Master’s (University of 

Bridgeport) 
Human Ecology 
 
Kaitlyn Marie Lozier, Chagrin 

Falls 
B.S.Ind.&Sys.Eng. 
Industrial and Systems 

Engineering 
 
Sharon Christine Lyon-Paul, 

Columbus 
Bachelor’s (Miami University 

Oxford) 
M.S.W. 
Nursing 
 
William Robert Magee, Berea 
B.S. 
Geological Sciences 
 
Joshua Vincent Mahaffey, 

Hilliard 
B.S.Elec.Eng. (University of 

Akron) 
Electrical and Computer 

Engineering 
 
Ankita Maheshwari, 

Cincinnati 
B.S. (University of Texas at 

Austin) 
Mechanical Engineering 
 
Jacob Emil Mainzer, 

Burlingame, CA 
B.S. (University of Rochester) 
Computer Science and 

Engineering 
 
William Arthur Matcham, 

Dublin 
B.S.Nurs. (Capital University) 
Nursing 
 
Natalie Elizabeth Maurer, 

Columbus 
B.S. (Miami University Oxford) 
Food Science and Technology 

James Paul McMillan, 

Buffalo, NY 
B.S. (State University of New 

York at Buffalo) 
Physics 
 
Edward Albert Meier, 

Greenville 
B.S.Elec.Eng. (Ohio Northern 

University) 
Biomedical Engineering 
 
Nicholas S. Miceli, Raytown, 

MO 
B.S.Bus.Admin. (University of 

Central Missouri) 
Ph.D. (University of 

Oklahoma-Norman) 
Public Health 
 
Jacob Ora Miller, Dayton 
B.S.Ind.&Sys.Eng. 
Industrial and Systems 

Engineering 
 
Kristen Kathleen Minca, 

Reynoldsburg 
B.S.Env.&Nat.Res. 
Environment and Natural 

Resources 
 
Michael Christopher 

Morena, Cincinnati 
B.S. (Bucknell University) 
Mechanical Engineering 
 
Austin Fraser Mount-

Campbell, Columbus 
B.S.Ind.&Sys.Eng. 
Industrial and Systems 

Engineering 
 
Renaud Moussounda, 

Gamba, Gabon 
B.S.Elec.Eng. (Georgia 

Institute of Technology) 
Electrical and Computer 

Engineering 
 
Alexandra Neeley, Harrison 
B.S.Mat.Sci.Eng. 
Materials Science and 

Engineering 
 
Hong Anh Nguyen, Ha Noi, 

Vietnam 
B.Pharm. (Hanoi University of 

Pharmacy) 
Rural Sociology 
 
Jill Leigh Niese, London 
B.S.Nurs. (Ohio University) 
Nursing 

Siddhesh Prakash Pai 
Raikar, Mumbai, India 

B.Engr. (University of Mumbai) 
Computer Science and 

Engineering 
 
Mark Adam Patrick, 

Frederick, MD 
B.S. (University of Maryland, 

College Park) 
Physics 
 
Zhizi Peng, Hefei, China 
B.Engr. (Xi’An Jiaotong 

University) 
Mechanical Engineering 
 
Nicholas A. Pike, Comstock 

Park, MI 
B.S. (Grand Valley State 

University) 
Physics 
 
Patrick Lestie Poole, 

Valdosta, GA 
B.S. (Georgia Institute of 

Technology) 
Physics 
 
Rohit Prakash Prabhavalkar, 

Pune, India 
B.Engr. (University of Pune) 
Computer Science and 

Engineering 
 
Adriana E. Quinones, 

Baltimore 
B.S.Agric. 
Horticulture and Crop Science 
 
Nicholas Tellman Reder, 

Cincinnati 
B.S. (Saint Louis University) 
Aeronautical and Astronautical 

Engineering 
 
Adam Joseph Reese, 

Cincinnati 
B.S. (University of Maryland, 

College Park) 
Mechanical Engineering 
 
Fang Ren, Huhhot, Mongolia 
B.S. (Inner Mongolia 

University) 
Master’s (Beihang University) 
Electrical and Computer 

Engineering 
 
Ryan Thomas Riddle, Spring, 

TX 
B.S. (University of Texas at 

Austin) 
Food Science and Technology 
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Lautaro Francisco Rivas 
Reveco, Santiago, Chile 

B.S. (Academia Politecnica 
Militar) 

Geodetic Science and 
Surveying 

 
Samuel Rivera, St. Croix, VI 
B.Elec.Eng. (University of 

Delaware) 
Electrical and Computer 

Engineering 
 
Daniel Robert Roettgen, 

Franklin, WI 
B.S. (University of Kentucky) 
Mechanical Engineering 
 
Jessica Danielle Romine, 

Ashville 
B.S.Ind.&Sys.Eng. 
Industrial and Systems 

Engineering 
 
Huayan Rong, Shanghai, 

China 
B.Engr. (Shanghai University) 
Electrical and Computer 

Engineering 
 
John Francis Rupp, 

Beavercreek 
B.S.Civ.Eng. 
Civil Engineering 
 
Kingsly Jebakumar Samuel 

Durai Raj, Trichy, India 
B.Tech. (Regional Engineering 

College – Bharathidasan 
University) 

Mechanical Engineering 
 
Ariel Antonio Sanmartin 

Mendez, Columbus 
B.S.Chem.Eng. 
Master’s (INCAE Business 

School) 
Agricultural, Environmental 

and Development 
Economics 

 
Jessica Leigh Saul, 

Columbus 
B.S. (Denison University) 
Animal Sciences 
 
Stephen James Scurria, 

Dublin 
B.S. (Miami University Oxford) 
Biomedical Engineering 
 
Kaushik Seshadri, Chennai, 

India 
Bachelor’s (National Institute 

of Technology) 
Electrical and Computer 

Engineering 

Chaya Hema Shivaraju, 

Columbus 
B.Engr. (Visveswaraiah 

Technological University) 
Electrical and Computer 

Engineering 
 
Eric Edward Smith, 

Cincinnati 
B.S. (University of Wisconsin-

Madison) 
Mechanical Engineering 
 
Eugene Sosnov, Fairlawn, NJ 
B.S. (Rutgers University-New 

Brunswick) 
Mechanical Engineering 
 
Brandi Lee Steidley, 

Columbus 
B.S. (Oklahoma State 

University) 
Microbiology 
 
Brian Robert Stephens, 

Detroit, MI 
B.S. (University of Michigan, 

Ann Arbor) 
M.A. (Wayne State University) 
Human Ecology 
 
Robert Keith Stephens, 

Anaheim, CA 
B.S. (University of California, 

Los Angeles) 
Mathematics 
 
Jamey E. Stutz, Mackinaw 

City, MI 
B.S. 
Geological Sciences 

 
James Alexander Suchocki, 

North Royalton 
B.S.Mech.Eng. 
Mechanical Engineering 
 
Ranjit Prakash 

Sundaramurthi, Chennai, 
India 

Mech.Engr. (Anna University) 
Mechanical Engineering 
 
Thomas Timothy Taylor, 

Greensburg, PA 
B.S., D.D.S. (University of 

Pittsburgh) 
Dentistry 
 
Erik Nugroho Tedjaseputra, 

Jakarta, Indonesia 
B.S.Mech.Eng. 
Mechanical Engineering 
 
Daniel Lewis Thomas, 

Dayton 
B.S. (Cedarville University) 
Horticulture and Crop Science 

Joshua Michael Thomas, 

Columbus 
B.S.Aero.&Astro.Eng. 
Mechanical Engineering 
 
Paige Nicole Ties, Eden 

Prairie, MN 
B.S. (Iowa State University) 
Food Science and Technology 
 
Zachary Joseph Trunkely, 

Eastlake 
B.S. (Denison University) 
Geological Sciences 
 
Michael Tuertscher, 

Cincinnati 
B.S. (Case Western Reserve 

University) 
Mechanical Engineering 
 
Danyal Jacob Turkoglu, 

Panama City, FL 
B.S.Chem.Eng. (University of 

Florida) 
Nuclear Engineering 
 
Lana Kay Uhrig, Frankfort 
B.S.Nurs. (Ohio University) 
M.B.A. (Franklin University) 
Public Health 
 
Nick T. Unger, Reynoldsburg 
B.S.Bio. (Capital University) 
Biophysics 
 
Jennifer Lynn Van Saders, 

Columbus 
B.S. (Rutgers University-New 

Brunswick) 
Astronomy 
 
Sandeep Varkey George, 

Cochin, India 
B.Tech. (Mahatma Gandhi 

University) 
Electrical and Computer 

Engineering 
 
Sneha Vasudevan, Chennai, 

India 
B.Tech. (Anna University) 
Electrical and Computer 

Engineering 
 
Richard Warren Vesel, Jr., 

Hudson 
B.S.Aero.&Astro.Eng. 
Aeronautical and Astronautical 

Engineering 
 
Riley Oliver Vollmer, Union 
B.S.Aero.&Astro.Eng. 
Industrial and Systems 

Engineering 
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Adam Joseph Waite, Buffalo 

Grove, IL 
B.S. (Purdue University) 
Mechanical Engineering 
 
Matthew Wayne Wallhead, 

Wooster 
B.S.Agric. 
Plant Pathology 
 
Brendan D. Wampler, 

Bellbrook 
B.S.FoodSci. 
Food Science and Technology 
 
Lei Wang, Huhehaote, China 

B.Engr., M.S. (Wuhan 
University) 

Geodetic Science and 
Surveying 

 
Xin Wang, Jinhua, China 
B.S. (Zhejiang University) 
Statistics 
 
Ying Wang, Xi’an, China 
B.Engr. (Tongji University) 
Civil Engineering 
 
Ashley Marie Weber, North 

Olmsted 
B.S.Nurs. 
Nursing 
 
Maureen Erin Weber, Upper 

Arlington 
B.S. (Kettering University) 
Biomedical Engineering 
 
Daniel Weston, Morral 
B.S. (Mount Vernon Nazarene 

University) 
M.B.A. (Dallas Baptist 

University) 
Statistics 
 
Daniel R. White, Norman, OK 
B.S. (University of Oklahoma-

Norman) 
Physics 
 
Staci Ann White, Chillicothe 
B.S. (Shawnee State 

University) 
Statistics 
 
Lyndsy M. Wolff, 

Youngstown 
B.S. (Youngstown State 

University) 
Anatomy 
 
James Philip Wollaeger, 

Highland Heights 
B.S. (Ohio Northern 

University) 
Electrical and Computer 

Engineering 

Ryan L. Wood, Bliss, ID 

B.A. (Brigham Young 
University) 

D.D.S. (University of North 
Carolina at Chapel Hill) 

Dentistry 
 
Binjie Xu, Columbus 
Bachelor’s (University of 
Science and Technology of 

China) 
Microbiology 
 
Jin Yang, Guoyang, China 
B.S. (University of Science 

and Technology of China) 
Physics 
 
Ran Yang, Zhengzhon, China 
B.A. (Grinnell College) 
Statistics 
 
Mustafa Yesil, Istanbul, 

Turkey 
B.S. (Ege University) 
Food Science and Technology 
 
Hyunjeong Yoo, Seoul, Korea 
B.S. (Sookmyung Women’s 

University) 
Computer Science and 

Engineering 
 
Alan E. Yost, Worthington 
B.S.FoodAg.Bio.Eng. 
Food, Agricultural and 

Biological Engineering 
 
Soung-Bum You, Columbus 
B.S.Elec.&Cptr.Eng. 
Electrical and Computer 

Engineering 
 
Zhe Yuan, Xiangfan, China 
B.Engr. (Huazhong University 

of Science and Technology) 
Computer Science and 

Engineering 
 
Muhammad Fazal Zeeshan, 

Columbus 
B.Med.&B.Surg. (University of 

Peshawar) 
M.Pub.Hlth. (Institute of 

Management Sciences, 
Peshawar) 

Public Health 
 
Wenjie Zeng, Guangzhou, 

China 
B.Engr. (Shanghai Jiao Tong 

University) 
Computer Science and 

Engineering 

Cong Zhang, Tianjin, China 

B.S. (University of Electronic 
Science and Technology of 
China) 

Electrical and Computer 
Engineering 

 
Dong Zhang, Hangzhou, 

China 
B.S. (Nanjing University) 
Astronomy 
 
Wanying Zhao, Shenvana, 

China 
Bachelor’s (China Agricultural 

University) 
Horticulture and Crop Science 
 
Changan Zhu, Weifang, 

China 
Bachelor’s (Nanjing University 

of Posts and 
Telecommunications) 

M.S. (Southeast University) 
Electrical and Computer 

Engineering 
 
 

Master of Social Work 
 
Cassandra Mae Beck, 

Findlay 
B.A. (The University of 

Findlay) 
Social Work 
 
Betty Jean Bollenbacher, 

Westerville 
B.A. 
Social Work 
 
Elisa Marie Frazier, 

Philadelphia, PA 
B.A. 
Social Work 
 
Rebecca Layton Fredin, 

Columbus 
B.A. 
Social Work 
 
Kathryn Estella Wilson 

Geers, Mount Sterling 
B.A. (Otterbein College) 
Social Work 
 
Terry Wayne Hale, McArthur 
B.A. (Ohio University) 
Social Work 
 
Catherine Anne Hechmer, 

Columbus 
B.A. (University of Notre 

Dame) 
Social Work 
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Gregory Allen Recker, 

Columbus Grove 
B.A. (The University of 

Findlay) 
Social Work 
 
Amelia M. Roberts, 

Chillicothe 
B.A. 
Social Work 
 
Keisha Alliya Savage, 

Gahanna 
B.A., M.A. (Cleveland State 

University) 
Social Work 
 
Christian Rose Sells, Kenton 

B.A. (Ohio Northern 
University) 

Social Work 
 
Amy M. Starr, Phoenix, AZ 
B.S. (Northern Arizona 

University) 
Social Work 
 
Kathleen Lynn Stein, 

Pataskala 
B.A. (University of Pittsburgh) 
Social Work 
 
Kimberly Dawn Thomas, 

Cleveland 
B.A. (Malone University) 
Social Work 
 
Kristen Kimberly Webster, 

Westerville 
B.A. (Kent State University) 
Social Work 
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College of Arts and 
Sciences 
 
Executive Dean: Joseph E. 
Steinmetz 
 
Mark W. Shanda, Divisional 
Dean, Arts and Humanities 
 
Peter March, Divisional Dean, 
Natural and Mathematical 
Sciences 
 
Gifford Weary, Divisional 
Dean, Social and Behavioral 
Sciences 
 
 

Bachelor of Arts 
 
Mazen Hisham Abdel Rasoul, 

Al-Birch, Palestine 
Leah Anne Abel, Canton 
Magna Cum Laude 
Austin Patrick Acheson, 

Clemmons, NC 
Cum Laude 
Aaron Matthew Adkins, Hilliard 
Anthony Vito Agosta, 

Lancaster 
Aaron David Agrast, Cleveland 
Meredith Ann Albright, 

Brecksville 
Zayed Abdulla Alkindi, Abu 

Dhabi, UAE 
Morgan Brittany Allen, 

Westerville 
Idrissa Alsouna, Columbus 
Alisa M. Alvich, Dublin 
Madison L. Ammerman, 

Reynoldsburg 
Cum Laude 
Alicia Nichole Armstrong, 

Cleveland 
Brian Austin Armstrong, 

Aurora 
Nicole Cadeau Arntz, 

Kettering 
Reyna Corrin Askew, 

Cleveland 
Cum Laude 
Eric John Atkinson, Jackson 

Township 
Molly Katherine Atves, North 

Royalton 
Lauren Elaine Ault, Springfield 
Diane Babassire, Columbus 
Goran Babic, Powell 
Daniel Thomas Bain, Virginia 

Beach, VA 
Vanessa Christine Baker, 

Columbus 
Daralyn Meagan Baldogo, 

Grove City 
Stephanie J. Barnett, 

Westerville 

Monica Christine 
Bartholomew, Dundee 

Magna Cum Laude 
with Honors in the Arts and 

Sciences 
Walter Robert Bartolucci, 

Olmsted Falls 
Jon Daniel Beal, Del Rio, TX 
Dustin Lee Beckel, Mansfield 
Brittany Ruth Belland, 

Cincinnati 
Magna Cum Laude 
Aaron Thomas Berarducci, 

Hilliard 
Christopher Andrew Berridge, 

Powell 
Tyler Derek Biederman, 

Perrysburg 
Mark A. Bilinski, Dayton 
Curtis Binder, Stow 
Stephen Michael Birk, 

Columbus 
Lori Ann Bishop, Vandalia 
Summa Cum Laude 
Grant Alan Blanton, 

Farmersville 
Magna Cum Laude 
Anna Naomi Bobbitt, Hilliard 
Maxwell Iler Boecker, Shaker 

Heights 
Cum Laude 
Andrew J. Boetto, Akron 
Cody James Bok, Cecil 
with Honors Research Distinction in 

Psychology 
Francesca Rose Boland, 

Cincinnati 
Cum Laude 
Zachary Thomas Boldin, 

Willoughby 
Audrey Elise Bonfig, Xenia 
Cum Laude 
Sarah Elizabeth Booth, 

Marietta 
Cum Laude 
Rachael Renee Borges, 

Wapakoneta 
Steven L. Borne, Kansas City, 

MO 
Alexander James Bowers, 

Brecksville 
Krystal Lynn Boyd, Coshocton 
Lauren Christine Boyd, Canton 
Cum Laude 
Megan Michelle Bracher, 

Mason 
Cum Laude 
with Honors in the Arts and 

Sciences 
Hartman Radd Brawley, 

Hilliard 
Cum Laude 
with Honors in the Arts and 

Sciences 
with Honors Research Distinction in 

Linguistics 
Melanie Marie Brock, Swanton 
Cum Laude 
Thomas Brandon Brubaker, 

Glenview, IL 
Cum Laude 

Bethany Marie Bryner, Elyria 
Shannon Kristin Buckner, 

Columbus 
Kylie Anne Burness, Dublin 
Bryan William Bush, New 

Albany 
Vanessa Lynn Bush, Dallas, 

TX 
Mathias Bustamante, Powell 
Cum Laude 
Kayleigh Elizabeth Ann Byrne, 

Washington Court House 
Jacy Katharine Cagle, 

Cincinnati 
Cum Laude 
Jason Wayne Calder, Galion 
Jessica L. Caldwell, Dayton 
Analee R. Canlas, Columbus 

Victoria M. Cannon, Berea 
Magna Cum Laude 
Loren Daniel Canter, 

Richwood 
Cordell Thomas Capritta, 

Powell 
Randall Park Carey, Bowling 

Green 
Michael Andrew Cargioli, 

Columbus 
Christopher Lee Carr, Dublin 
Nathan Mitchell Casey, 

Marietta 
Alexandra Marie Chamness, 

Ripley 
Michael John Charek, Dayton 
Sherman Daniel Charles, 

Marysville 
Cum Laude 
Charles Christopher Alexander 

Childers, Riverside 
Emma Sadie Chomin, 

Reynoldsburg 
Joshua Keonback Chung, 

Lewis Center 
Steven Kilyoung Chung, 

Columbus 
Carlton Alexander Churchill, 

Columbus 
Barrett William Clark, Milford 
Adam Conaway Clouser, 

Greenfield 
Wendy Lauren Cohen, Dallas, 

TX 
Cum Laude 
Sabrina Catherine Colon, 

Detroit, MI 
Kelsey Lynn Conaway, Mount 

Cory 
Magna Cum Laude 
Katie Morgan Connelly, 

Westlake 
James Anthony Cooper, 

Portland, OR 
Nicola Giuseppe Coppolino, 

Columbus 
Emily Marie Corturillo, Hudson 
Cum Laude 
with Honors in the Arts and 

Sciences 
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Allie M. Costin, Westerville 
Cum Laude 
Dale Eisenhower Cottrell, 

Ashville 
William James Cox, Huber 

Heights 
Magna Cum Laude 
Emma Lizbet Crews, 

Columbus 
Megan Elizabeth Crist, 

Fredonia, NY 
Katherine Leigh Curtis, Milford 
Meagan Rochelle Cyrus, 

Wheelersburg 
with Honors in the Arts and 

Sciences 
Jennifer Renae Dales, Newark 
Cum Laude 
Amanda Cathleen Damrath, 

Novi, MI 
Jeffrey Michael Daneman, 

Gahanna 
Cruz Austin Davis, Grandview 

Heights 
Sophia Marie Deely, 

Pickerington 
Jessica Elizabeth Dekker, 

Mansfield 
Courtney Helen DeVore, 

Cincinnati 
Martin Lee Diaz, Amanda 
Micheal Charles Dickerson, 

Delta 
Dominic James DiMauro, 

Hubbard 
Chelsea Elizabeth Dixon, 

Lakewood 
Amber Rae Dodds, Lima 
Michael James Doherty, 

Geneva 
Jeremy Allan Dolan, Orlando, 

FL 
Kathleen Behm Dolphin, 

Novelty 
Magna Cum Laude 
Yuan Dong, Qingdao, China 
Rachel Lynn Dorsey, New 

Philadelphia 
Gina Marie Dottore, Parma 
Stephen Brian Drabek, Pepper 

Pike 
Bryan James Dritschel, North 

Brunswick 
Krista Briana Drummond, 

Lancaster 
Magna Cum Laude 
Lucas James Du Sablon, 

Cincinnati 
Dianna Marie Durbin, Mount 

Vernon 
Bradley Scott Early, East 

Palestine 
Heather Renee Edgar, 

Springboro 
Brandon Neil Edwards, 

Westerville 
Cum Laude 

Kelsey Anne Ellingsen, Dover 
Plains, NY 

Cum Laude 
with Honors in the Arts and 

Sciences 
Joseph David Ellison, 

Parkersburg, WV 
Caroline Elizabeth Engler, 

Centerville 
Summa Cum Laude 
Rachael Desiree Ervin, 

Gahanna 
Cum Laude 
Todd Edward Evans, Louisville 
Rebecca Anne Eversole, 

Columbus 
Elizabeth Ellen Farrell, 

Cleveland 
Cum Laude 
Anna Elizabeth Fath, 

Cincinnati 
Magna Cum Laude 
Hillary Rae Feather, Bay 

Village 
Summa Cum Laude 
Edward Farrell Feighan III, 

Lakewood 
Brian Michael Ferguson, 

Reynoldsburg 
Andrew Matthew Fermier, 

Coopersburg, PA 
Erin Lynn Field, Pataskala 
Maia Talei Fisher, 

Wapakoneta 
Megan Christine Fitzmartin, 

Westerville 
Cum Laude 
Christina Michelle Flanagan, 

Columbus 
Ka-Hei Fok, Hong Kong, 

China 
Jessica Lynn Foust, Dublin 
Cum Laude 
Chad Mikal Fracker, New 

Concord 
Erika Noel Frank, Wapakoneta 
Ann Kathleen Fritz, Toledo 
Devin Charles Frost, 

Washington Court House 
Mallory Elizabeth Fuller, 

Cincinnati 
Cum Laude 
Andrew Shou Gaddis, Trinway 
with Research Distinction in 

Japanese 
Matthew Wayne Gallant, 

Bucyrus 
Denver Lewis Edward 

Garrard, Marysville 
Jozeff Wayne Gebolys, Akron 
Magna Cum Laude 
Stephanie Loeta Geer, Ontario 
Cum Laude 
Michael David Genco, 

Brecksville 
Cum Laude 
Anna MacKenzie Gentile, 

Croton 

Miriam A.M.H. Ghidan, Mekka, 
Saudi Arabia 

Cum Laude 
Matthew Oscar Glaubman, 

Miami Beach, FL 
Andrea Linn Goard, LaGrange 
Casey Brandin Goddard, 

Newark 
Christopher Wesley Dandridge 

Godfrey, Greensboro, NC 
Kelby Mason Good, Waverly 
Trevor Kevin Goodall, Fairfield 
Leslie Dorothy Goodwin, 

Cincinnati 
Kristofer Gordon, Columbus 
Wesley Ryan Grace, Huber 

Heights 
Neev Keith Granite, Rehovot, 

Israel 
Zachary Vincent Griffin, 

Vandalia 
Joseph A. Griffith, Columbus 
Kristin Rose Grimone, 

Springfield 
Barbara Nicole Grman, 

Kirtland 
Taylor Dane Groscost, 

Mansfield 
Kyle Michael Gross, Westlake 
Seth Allan Grover, Gahanna 
Lada Gubina, Columbus 
Cum Laude 
Emmanuel Asamoah Gyan, 

Ghana 
David Michael Haag, 

Cincinnati 
Rahel Habte, Columbus 
Megan Hadley, Bladensburg 
Ryan Steven Hafner, 

Sandusky 
Magna Cum Laude 
with Honors in the Arts and 

Sciences 
Julie Ann Hallan, Springfield 
Cum Laude 
Susan Marie Hard, Columbus 
Cum Laude 
Jason Scott Harris, Pataskala 
Jimmiea Chryslin Harrison, 

Cincinnati 
Paula Jean Harting, Columbus 
Cum Laude 
Aaron Paul Hatchett, Akron 
Magna Cum Laude 
Kristen Elizabeth Haugh, 

Toledo 
Andrew Hawkins, Columbus 
Stephen Benjamin Lawrence 

Haynes, Vermilion 
Allen C. He, Columbus 
Ryan Shawn Hendrix, Marion 
Jessica Ryan Henry, 

Pickerington 
Cum Laude 
Tyler James Henry, Urbana 
Tyler Clay Hensley, Brookville 
Erik S. Hills, Columbus 
Bradley L. Hock, Clayton 
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Scott Michael Hockenbery, 
West Jefferson 

Natalie Nicole Hodge, 
Twinsburg 

Summa Cum Laude 
with Honors in the Arts and 

Sciences 
Alyssa Rose Hoffman, 

Moreland Hills 
Magna Cum Laude 
Michael S. Holbert, Columbus 
Alexander D. Holford, 

Columbus 
Cum Laude 
HyunPyo Hong, Seoul, Korea 
Cum Laude 
Michael Richard Hornick, 

Shaker Heights 
Cum Laude 
Jessica Michelle Horsley, 

Thornville 
Cum Laude 
Ian J. Howard, Lakewood 
Paula Elise Howell, Coldwater 
Magna Cum Laude 
Alex Henry Hoying, Fort 

Loramie 
Nance Baker Hoza, Hubbard 
Joshua Elliott Hudspeth, 

Mason 
Elyse M. Hueckel, 

Reynoldsburg 
Jacob Philip Irvin, Orient 
Liu Jiang, Guiyang 
Summa Cum Laude 
Jeremy R. Jimenez, Cleveland 
Princess Yiema M. John, 

Selden, NY 
Daniel Alan Johns, Loveland 
Thayne Riley Johnson, 

Youngstown 
Magna Cum Laude 
Aaron Joseph Jones, 

Portsmouth 
David Solomon Jones, Canton 
Kristopher Campbell Jordan, 

Plain City 
Danielle Mae Justice, Milford 
Jeffrey Edward Kallay, 

Westerville 
Lynsey Nicole Kamine, Lima 
Cum Laude 
with Honors in the Arts and 

Sciences 
Ashley Nicole Kanney, 

Coldwater 
Summa Cum Laude 
with Honors in the Arts and 

Sciences 
John Allen Kanzlemar, Dublin 
Katherine Anne Karnitis, 

Perrysburg 
Magna Cum Laude 
with Honors in the Arts and 

Sciences 
Ezekiel Avery Keesbury, 

Defiance 
David Joseph Keffler, Jr., 

Canfield 
Adam C. Keller, Columbus 

Jerri Leigh Kelley, Heath 
Shalynnda Angel Kellogg, 

Johnstown 
Colin Richard Kelly, Dayton 
Kahlin Amber Kelly, Mansfield 
Summa Cum Laude 
Theodore Kelly, Cincinnati 
Jacqueline Elaine Kemble, 

Columbus 
Tyler Lewis Kerr, Lebanon 
Shadden Yasmeen Khan, 

Potomac, MD 
Ryan Joseph Kile, Bexley 
Cum Laude 
Nathan Reid Killen, 

Worthington 
Alexis David Kim, Anchorage, 

AK 

Hye Won Kim, Korea 
Cum Laude 
Andrew George Kimble, 

Columbiana 
Adam Jeffrey King, Hillsboro 
Rebecca Wednesday King, 

Wellington 
Cum Laude 
Sherry Michelle King, Newark 
Emily Michelle Kinter, 

Freeport, PA 
Magna Cum Laude 
with Honors in the Arts and 

Sciences 
Kaitlin Elizabeth Klucas, New 

London 
Spencer Kathryn Knapp, 

Grandview Heights 
Elise Amanda Knueven, 

Cincinnati 
Chad Michael Koester, 

Cincinnati 
Jackson Allen Kohn, Solon 
Cum Laude 
with Honors in the Arts and 

Sciences 
Joel Kopcial, Mansfield 
Amanda L. Kortokrax, Kalida 
Summa Cum Laude 
Niki Katerina Kostakis, Dublin 
Souleymane Kouyate, Guinea 
Brandon Adam Koval, Newark 
Elyse Jean Kowaleski, 

Sandusky 
Magna Cum Laude 
Nicholas Wayne Krafft, 

Columbus 
Elizabeth Marie Kulhanek, 

Centerville 
Summa Cum Laude 
with Honors in the Arts and 

Sciences 
Monica Lynn Kulow, North 

Ridgeville 
Si Hyun Kwon, Seoul, Korea 
Laura Whitney LaBenne, 

Mount Vernon 
James David Lahman, 

Reynoldsburg 
Erin Marie Lammers, Kettering 
Magna Cum Laude 
Ali Walid Latif, Columbus 

Angela Laysourivong, 
Gahanna 

Miguel Alfonso Layton, 
Fremont 

Rachel E. Lea, Columbus 
Magna Cum Laude 
Gina Marie Lee, Gahanna 
Rachel Christina Lee, 

Perrysburg 
Casey Robert Lehman, 

Vermilion 
Thomas Edward Lennertz, 

Columbus 
Kelly Jordan Lichtenwalner, 

Fogelsville, PA 
Cum Laude 
Hannah Virginia Liebreich, 

Reynoldsburg 

Crystal Lin, Mayfield 
Cum Laude 
with Honors in the Arts and 

Sciences 
Yawen Liu, Columbus 
Kevin Christopher Lohrke, 

Albion, MI 
Haley Elizabeth Long, Hilliard 
Joshua Robert Long, Yellow 

Springs 
Jennifer L. Look, Grove City 
James Hugh MacDonald, 

Chicago, IL 
Matthew Lance MacKeown, 

Gahanna 
Christopher John MacKinnon, 

Columbus 
Erin Ashley Maedeker, 

Gahanna 
Bridget Ann Mahler, Columbus 
Magna Cum Laude 
with Honors in the Arts and 

Sciences 
with Honors Research Distinction in 

Speech and Hearing Science 

Kristen Victoria Maiorino, 
Gambier 

Magna Cum Laude 
Matthew Steven Majorana, 

Manhasset, NY 
Christian Lawrence Ward 

Malone, Atlanta, GA 
Amber Marie Mances, 

Columbus 
Nikolaus Stuart Mann, 

Lancaster 
Anthony Patrick Marsano, 

Marion 
John Anthony Marsco, 

Youngstown 
Jennifer Rachel Mason, 

Hilliard 
Samuel Thomas Masters, 

Columbus 
James Anthony Matey, 

Bedford 
Christopher Robert 

Matzenbach, Westerville 
Scott Thomas Maul, 

Pickerington 
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Maxwell Steven Mays, Grove 
City 

Timea Mazhar, Worthington 
Ashley Michael McCarthy, 

Columbus 
Michael Patrick McDermott, 

North Royalton 
Jason Michael McGinnis, 

South Vienna 
Bethany Faith McGowan, 

Bucyrus 
Matthew Alan McGrath, South 

Charleston 
Stuart Desmond McIntyre, 

Columbus 
Magna Cum Laude 
with Honors in the Arts and 

Sciences 
Michael David McKee, 

Whitehall 
Magna Cum Laude 
Stacey Lyn McKenna, Hilliard 
Erin Elisabeth Melaragno, 

Columbus 
Nicholas Matthew Melnick, 

Columbus 
Cum Laude 
Adam Samuel Metz, 

Worthington 
Katherine Miao, Westerville 
Charles Timothy Miller, 

Centerville 
Jennifer Nichole Miller, 

Davidsonville, MD 
Cum Laude 
Joshua Scott Miller, Dayton 
Camille Anease Milner, 

Columbus 
Chad Andrew Minnear, 

Mansfield 
Molly Anne Miracle, Marietta 
Alson Mo, Mayfield 
Steven Michael Moell, 

Centerville 
with Honors in the Arts and 

Sciences 
Daniel Kieth Montague, 

Columbus 
Christina Nicole Montello, 

Chagrin Falls 
Kylee Breanne Moon, 

Bellefontaine 
Portia Diane Moore, Marengo 
Edgar Moreno, Worthington 
Benjamin Philip Morgan, 

Columbus 
Emmily Louise Morris, 

Groveport 
Kerry Jacques Mullins, 

Westerville 
Shannon Alyse Mulroy, Green 
Magna Cum Laude 
Eric Adam Munas, Dayton 
Cum Laude 
David Joshua Muncy, Jackson 
Christopher James Murnen, 

Pickerington 
Daniel William Murphy, 

Tonawanda, NY 

Patrick James Murphy, Upper 
Arlington 

Gregory Andrew Myers, 
Columbus 

James Cody Myers, London 
Thomas Anthony Myers, 

Galloway 
Rachel Sara Nachman, Solon 
Elizabeth Marian Narouz, 

Gahanna 
Megan Christine Nauman, 

Cleveland 
Summa Cum Laude 
Tricia Elyse Naylor, Utica 
Dustin D. Neely, Newark 
Justin Neer, Bainbridge 
Sean Arthur Nemec, Garfield 

Heights 
Bret Michael Newsom, 

Groveport 
Katarina Giao-Marie Nguyen, 

Columbus 
Cum Laude 
Jay Harold Nims, Powell 
Daniel Heath Noe, Iberia 
Galia Nurko, Cleveland 
Summa Cum Laude 
John Edward Nussman, 

Englewood 
with Honors in the Arts and 

Sciences 
Sean Patrick O’Hanlon, 

Thousand Oaks, CA 
Magna Cum Laude 
Ashley Nicole Oiler, Columbus 
Daniel Anthony Okoroski, 

Toledo 
Emily Victoria Oney, Shaker 

Heights 
Magna Cum Laude 
Christopher M. Oruma, 

Ughelli, Delta State, Nigeria 
Michael William Ossman, 

Cincinnati 
Magna Cum Laude 
with Honors in the Arts and 

Sciences 
Michael Nana Yaw Paitoo, 

Padova, Italy 
Joshua W. Pammer, Dayton 
Benjamin Justin Parker, 

Longwood, FL 
Jena Rae Parker, Avon Lake 
Summa Cum Laude 
Mitchell David Parry, Minerva 
Jordan Leigh Pastor, Granville 
Magna Cum Laude 
Mary Colleen Patka, Parma 
Summa Cum Laude 
Kevin Patrick, Trenton 
Donnie Martin Paul III, Lewis 

Center 
Ali Naqee Payne, Huber 

Heights 
Rachel E. Pelphrey, Lima 
Alex David Pence, Lima 
Kristen E. Pendrey, New 

Albany 
Myra Pepino, Columbus 

Alexandra Eileen Peponis, 
Powell 

Cum Laude 
Allison Perry, Columbus 
Bryan Mitchell Peters, 

Granville 
Chelsea Rebecca Pflum, 

Cincinnati 
Summa Cum Laude 
with Honors in the Arts and 

Sciences 
Sarah Nicole Phares, Xenia 
Jason L. Phillips, Columbus 
Derek Todd Philpot, Dayton 
Amanda C. Piasecki, Toledo 
Aleksandra S. Pinkerton, 

Cincinnati 
Avery W. Pinson, Hebron 
Idin Jahan Pirasteh, Columbus 
Lucretia C. Pollard, 

Worthington 
Ian Christopher Poole, Huber 

Heights 
Victor Alexander Popescu, 

Columbus 
Devier Stewart Posey, 

Cincinnati 
Svetlana Posykalyuk, 

Columbus 
Cum Laude 
Thomas A. Powell, Jr., 

Columbus 
Brittany Angela Prade, Akron 
Terry Dana Predmore, Newark 
Brian Christopher Price, 

Westerville 
John Joseph Prunte, 

Columbus 
Stephen Kyle Pytlik, St. 

Clairsville 
Magna Cum Laude 
with Honors in the Arts and 

Sciences 
Rachel Elizabeth Racette, 

Pickerington 
Carla J. Raymo, Newark 
Camille Razeeq, Columbus 
Zachary Thomas Reau, 

Bellevue 
Cum Laude 
Kyle Gregory Reichle, Grove 

City 
Shannon Catherine Reilly, 

Chanhassen, MN 
James MacDougall Reising, 

Sylvania 
Courtney Marie Reither, 

Columbus 
Collette Lynn Reitz, Chicago, 

IL 
J. Aaron Michael Revel, 

Fairfield 
Emanuel Haile Rezene, 

Cincinnati 
Caitlin B. Rice, Hilliard 
Shannon Maureen Richissin, 

Brunswick 
Jacqueline Erin Riedel, Bay 

Village 
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Jessica Ann Riley, Norwalk 
Brian James Rinz, Cleveland 
Magna Cum Laude 
Adam Michael Ripley, Plain 

City 
Holland Marie Rives, 

Columbus 
Jana Robinson, Ostrander 
Michele Anastasia Roczniak, 

Davis, CA 
Cum Laude 
Zane M. Roelen, Port Clinton 
Danielle Marie Rogers, Grove 

City 
Christine Sue Rohweder, 

Cleveland 
Sade Lynette Rolon, Domona, 

CA 

Lauren Virginia Ross, 
Loveland 

Summa Cum Laude 
Ryan Michael Rossos, Parma 
Cum Laude 
with Honors in the Arts and 

Sciences 
Jessica Lynn Roth, 

Beachwood 
Brigette Anne Royer, Akron 
Cum Laude 
with Honors in the Arts and 

Sciences 
Samantha Rose Rubino, 

Aurora 
Cum Laude 
with Research Distinction in History 

Molly Elizabeth Rucki, Findlay 
Cum Laude 
Carlos Eduardo Ruiz-Coll, 

Puerto Cabello, Venezuela 
Ashley Renee Runyon, 

Worthington 
Andrew Brennan Russo, 

Cincinnati 
Daniel Kaoru Sakamoto, Lewis 

Center 
Anthony C. Sams, Huron 
Melissa Ann Sanders, Warren 
Annamaria Santorelli, Euclid 
Andrew Michael Sargent, 

Dublin 
Cum Laude 
Rachael Iris Sauceda, 

Sylvania 
David Sauer, Columbus 
Norbert Howard Savage, 

Columbus 
Summa Cum Laude 
Robert Michael Sawyer, Dillon 
Cum Laude 
Kyle Andrew Schirmer, 

Loveland 
Kendra Bliss Schmoll, 

Alexandria 
Gaige Michael Schoonover, 

Grove City 
Hannah Louise Schroeder, 

Olney, MD 
Summa Cum Laude 
with Honors in the Arts and 

Sciences 

Stefanie Lynn Schulyk, 
Columbus 

Magna Cum Laude 
with Honors in the Arts and 

Sciences 
Sarah Dawn Scott, St. Marys 
Summa Cum Laude 
Alexandra Amelia Sealscott, 

Defiance 
Elizabeth Jane Seitz, Vandalia 
Bethany Perle Semones, 

Westerville 
Summa Cum Laude 
with Honors in the Arts and 

Sciences 
Lauren Katherine Sewell, 

Columbus 
Karma Leigh Shafaieh, Dublin 
Magna Cum Laude 
Cherie Ann Shanko, 

Homerville 
Barbara Anne Shardy, 

Brookfield 
Katherine Graves Shaver, 

Pickerington 
Magna Cum Laude 
David Patrick Sheehe, Rocky 

River 
Meredith Rose Shick, Upper 

Sandusky 
Yeseul Shim, Seoul, Korea 
Katherine Olivia Shultz, Royal 

Palm Beach, FL 
Magna Cum Laude 
Donnie Lee Simpson, 

Louisville, KY 
Sean Michael Simpson, 

Newark 
Benjamin Lee Sims, Brooklyn 
Jason A. Sipes, Columbus 
Tiffany Ann Smith, Pataskala 
Kelly Harrington Smyth, 

Cincinnati 
Danielle Marie Snyder, 

Groveport 
Andrew Yun So, Bath 
Lauren Aleeza Sokol, 

Cincinnati 
Avinash Vishnu Somir, East 

Northport 
Leah JoAnn Sorrell, St. Marys 
Steven J. Henry Thomas 

Spencer, Pleasanton, CA 
James Robert Spires, 

Pataskala 
Christopher David Sprecher, 

Chagrin Falls 
Gabrielle Elizabeth Stanley, 

Avon Lake 
Cum Laude 
with Honors in the Arts and 

Sciences 
Anne Eileen Stewart, 

Columbus 
Halle Marie Stolarsky, Solon 
Cum Laude 
Michael Foster Stone, 

Miamisburg 
Cum Laude 

James H. Stowe, Rockville, 
MD 

Robert S. Strong, Hamilton 
Sarah Elizabeth Stroup, 

Hartville 
Jaime Lynn Stump, Twinsburg 
Randall Tyler Stump, 

Gahanna 
Elizabeth Ann Sullivan, Powell 
Summa Cum Laude 
with Honors in the Arts and 

Sciences 
Jessica Ann Sullivan, Dresden 
Rachel Ann Susi, Dublin 
Cum Laude 
Fahad B. Syed, Cleveland 
Nathan Benjamin Szabados, 

Cleveland 
Summa Cum Laude 
Jeremy J. Tarczy, Chagrin 

Falls 
Adrian Milad Tawadros, 

Maineville 
Owen Michael Temple, 

Fredericktown 
Arianne Wynne Thomas, 

Cleveland 
Magna Cum Laude 
Solomon Matthew Thomas, 

San Diego, CA 
Andrew William Thompson, 

Columbus 
Jeffrey Mark Thompson, 

Blacklick 
Scott Lee Thompson, 

Pittsburgh, PA 
Cum Laude 
Sean Patrick Thompson, 

Pittsburgh, PA 
Cum Laude 
Kayla Ann Thorpe, Grove City 
Steven David Tilley, Dublin 
Michael Bernard Torrence, 

Canton 
Steven Kyle Trattar, 

Independence 
Keisha Margaret Trott, 

Pleasant City 
Brando Stephen Turchan, 

New Albany 
Cum Laude 
Lauren Margaret Upp, 

Delaware 
Laurentiu Mihai Urian, 

Fagaras, Romania 
Gregory Uszak, Avon Lake 
Patricia Erin Callanta Valdez, 

Middleburg Heights 
Gina Marie Valentine, Celina 
Kristen VanNess, Alexandria 
Nikolaos D. Velalis, Athens, 

Greece 
Elizabeth Sarah Volpe, 

Columbus 
Elizabeth Hannah Walker, 

Columbus 
Cum Laude 
David Hamilton Wallace, Jr., 

Columbus 
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Maggie D. Wanis, Cairo, Egypt 
Brittany Latasha Ward, 

Columbus 
Sloane Elizabeth Ward, New 

Albany 
Yaniny Valeska Warden, 

Mount Vernon 
Erica Lynn Warner, Newark 
Daniel J. Warren, Columbus 
Taylor Channing Washington, 

Lima 
Amy Kathryn Waters, 

Grandville, MI 
Cum Laude 
William Andrew Waters, 

Summersville, WV 
Sean Patrick Webber, 

Lexington Park, MD 
Summa Cum Laude 
Tavin Raber Jasper Weeda, 

Hanoverton 
Alan Lorne Weeter, 

Springboro 
Alison Patrice Weisbach, 

Cincinnati 
Christopher Leon 

Weisenberger, Westerville 
Elizabeth Welsh, Columbus 
Logan C. West, Canal 

Winchester 
Andrew Reed Westfall, Dayton 
Sharon Marie Weyand, 

Sunbury 
Jacob Richard Whan, 

Columbus 
Elisha Ann Wheeler, Canal 

Winchester 
Zachary W. Wheeler, Marion 
Stephanie Anne White, Toledo 
Luke Peter Widolff, Latrobe, 

PA 
Magna Cum Laude 
with Honors in the Arts and 

Sciences 
Taylor Carson Wiggins, 

Carlisle 
Lauren Elizabeth Wilk, 

Strongsville 
Olivia Suzanne Wilson, Upper 

Arlington 
Christine Elizabeth Wingate, 

East Sparta 
Summa Cum Laude 
with Honors in the Arts and 

Sciences 
Jason Howard Winrow, 

Bridgeton, NJ 
Bradley Ryan Wise, Hudson 
Ryan David Witchey, Shelby 
Cum Laude 
Emily Nicole Wojtaszek, 

Canton 
Magna Cum Laude 
Christopher Ryan Wolfe, 

Newark 
Adam Joseph Wood, 

Crooksville 
Anna Marie Woodall, Warsaw 
Summa Cum Laude 

Andrew Douglas Woods, 
Wadsworth 

Corey D. Wooten, Rochester, 
NY 

Andrew J. Wright, Hilliard 
Yu Ju Wu, Dayton 
Jacob Andrew Wuensch, 

Litchfield 
Bo John Wullings, Amsterdam 
Han Yang, China 
Steven Yang, Cincinnati 
Albert Andrew Yankulov, West 

Chester 
Kelsey Allison Yarnell, 

Wooster 
Chatavia Nichole Yates, Akron 
Rebecca M. Yoakam, 

Marysville 
Bethany Anne Yoder, Dublin 
Destiney Marie Yoder, 

Millersburg 
Junho Yoon, Daejeon, Korea 
Francis Joseph Yorio, Fort 

Wayne, IN 
Halim Harb Yousef, North 

Olmsted 
Todd Aaron Zeiger, 

Beachwood 
Cum Laude 
Mark Alan Zellefrow, Jr., 

Reynoldsburg 
Shan Zeng, Xiangyang. Hubei, 

China 
Ge Zhang, Kunming, Yunnan, 

China 
Di Zhao, Beijing, China 
Xuyan Zhao, Tianjin, China 
Cum Laude 
David Peter Zunick, 

Strongsville 
 
 

Bachelor of Arts in 
Journalism 
 
Kathryn L. Cubert, Chillicothe 
Magna Cum Laude 
Erika E. deJolsvay-Brooks, 

Marengo 
Lindsey Ann Fox, Marion 
Katie Lane Harriman, Marion 
Travis Michael Kozek, 

Whitehouse 
Samuel Allan Obermyer, 

Petersburg, MI 
Daniel J. Restivo, Wauseon 
Eartha Arcola Terrell, 

Youngstown 
 

Bachelor of Fine Arts 
 
Abigail Marie Christ, 

Pickerington 
Caitlin Grimes, Plain City 
Daniel Kang Hsieh, Dublin 
Victor Samuel Huang, 

Columbus 

Nathan Joseph Klein, Newark 
Cum Laude 
with Distinction in Art 

William Grant Koone, Dublin 
John Handuck Na, Mansfield 
Umar Rashid, Youngstown 
Cum Laude 
Erika Katherine Rowland, 

Akron 
Cum Laude 
Rachael Rebecca Schneider, 

West Chester 
Shawna Diane Schonauer, 

Columbus 
Summa Cum Laude 
John Thomas Sharvin, 

Worthington 
Cum Laude 
Janelle Catherine Simms, 

Rockford, IL 
Jeremiah Hyde Stilson, 

Westerville 
Frederick Lee Wagener, 

Whitehouse 
Cum Laude 
 

 

Bachelor of Music 
 
Nathan Scott Laney, 

Columbus 
Magna Cum Laude 
with Honors in the Arts 

 
 

Bachelor of Music 
Education 
 
Deborah Michelle Showalter, 

Columbus 
Summa Cum Laude 
 
 

Bachelor of Science 
 
David Michael Ablett, 

Cincinnati 
Magna Cum Laude 
with Honors in the Arts and 

Sciences 
Maisa Alafyouni, Cleveland 
Robert Buchanan Alves, La 

Cañada, CA 
Brittany E. Barnwell, Chagrin 

Falls 
Stefanee Alexis Berman, 

Columbus 
Caitlin Patricia Bistrica, 

Boardman 
Cum Laude 
Rebecca Anne Boyle, 

Westerville 
Magna Cum Laude 
Sarah Elizabeth Boyle, 

Westerville 
Cum Laude 
Scherika Scheneen Brinson, 

Akron 
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Reed Michael Brodnik, Seville 
Cum Laude 
with Honors in the Arts and 

Sciences 
with Honors Research Distinction in 

Evolution and Ecology 

Mark William Buenger, 
Deshler 

Cum Laude 
Jordan Nicholas Bulcher, 

Powell 
Magna Cum Laude 
Kenneth Edward Burke, Dublin 
Stephanie Lynn Burton, Dublin 
Cum Laude 
Belinda F. Cai, West Chester 
with Honors in the Arts and 

Sciences 
Sara Carson Castilano, 

Centerville 
with Honors in the Arts and 

Sciences 
Katherine Chang, Cincinnati 
Seung June Cho, Suwon, 

Korea 
Yoonmi Choi, Seoul, Korea 
Magna Cum Laude 
Derek Lee Choops, 

Westerville 
Scott Lee Clark, Sidney 
James Vincent Cooley, 

Columbus 
James Franklin Crum, Jr., 

Sagamore Hills 
Thao-Vi Dao, New Albany 
Cum Laude 
with Honors in the Arts and 

Sciences 
Earon Michael Denovchek, 

Niles 
Summa Cum Laude 
with Honors in the Arts and 

Sciences 
Sean Tyler Devlin, Willard 
Kelly Rae DiTomas, Aurora 
Cum Laude 
with Honors in the Arts and 

Sciences 
Joseph Ryan Doherty, San 

Leandro, CA 
Colin Michael Dolan, 

Lexington 
Tyler Campbell Dolphin, 

Towson, MD 
Magna Cum Laude 
Mengmeng Dong, Dalian, 

China 
Matthew Robert Dreiss, West 

Jefferson 
Greta Duraj, Columbus 
Salma Elsayed Elmasry, 

Columbus 
Eric Matthew Facemyer, 

Painesville 
Chandler Elizabeth Fugate-

Laus, Columbus 
Qian Gao, China 
Chelsea Kathryn Gates, 

Columbus 
Olga Gavrilina, Minsk, Belarus 
Cum Laude 

Jessica Laine Greenberg, 
Cincinnati 

Weixuan Guo, Beijing, China 
with Honors in the Arts and 

Sciences 
Ryan Steven Hafner, 

Sandusky 
Magna Cum Laude 
with Honors in the Arts and 

Sciences 
Jason Hao, Westlake 
Magna Cum Laude 
with Honors in the Arts and 

Sciences 
Eman Taleb Heet, Jordan 
Ashley Elizabeth Henry, Grove 

City 
Janet Doyne Herrin, 

Springfield, IL 
David Augustus Hibler, 

Columbus 
Cassandra Lien Hines, 

Marysville 
Magna Cum Laude 
with Honors in the Arts and 

Sciences 
Michael Richard Hornick, 

Shaker Heights 
Cum Laude 
with Honors in the Arts and 

Sciences 
Morgan Louise Hume, 

Wapakoneta 
Stephen Donald Humphrey, 

Westerville 
Cum Laude 
Lamont Matre Jacobs, 

Hamilton 
Amrita Kaur Jagpal, Liberty 

Township 
Cum Laude 
Robert James Jenrow, 

Redford, MI 
Katherine Anne Karnitis, 

Perrysburg 
Magna Cum Laude 
with Honors in the Arts and 

Sciences 
Jasleen Kaur, North Olmsted 
Jordan Nicole Keels, 

Columbus 
Erica Lucia Keller, 

Worthington 
Bradley Allen Kline, Perrysville 
Kindra Lynn Knight, Zanesville 
Magna Cum Laude 
Marie Michelle Koenig, 

Cincinnati 
with Honors in the Arts and 

Sciences 
Dmitri Ivanovich Kotov, 

Columbus 
with Research Distinction in 

Microbiology 
Kathryn Jane Lang, 

Worthington 
Summa Cum Laude 
with Honors in the Arts and 

Sciences 
with Honors Research Distinction in 

Evolution and Ecology 

Tian Lee, Taiwan, ROC 

Alyssa Marie Loparich, North 
Olmsted 

Cum Laude 
with Honors in the Arts and 

Sciences 
Kate J. Lorenzetti, Niles 
Kayla Lee Lowery, Chillicothe 
Tiffany Jo Lucas, Piqua 
William K. Lum, Toledo 
Sanandan Malhotra, New 

Delhi, India 
Summa Cum Laude 
with Research Distinction in 

Molecular Genetics 

Anthony Paul Marette, 
Cuyahoga Falls 

with Research Distinction in 
Chemistry 

Alexander Christian Masheter, 
Upper Arlington 

Cum Laude 
with Honors in the Arts and 

Sciences 
Meagan Elizabeth Mayes, 

Grove City 
Tyrell L. McDonald, Canton 
Sean Anthony McKinnon, 

Maumee 
Magna Cum Laude 
with Honors in the Arts and 

Sciences 
with Honors Research Distinction in 

Spanish 

Amanda Ann McMurrough, 
Belle Center 

Marijana Micovic, Medina 
Meredith Kathleen Miller, Tiffin 
Ember Montunnas, Columbus 
Philip Dewayne Moor, Wichita 

Falls, TX 
Karla Beth Moore, Oak Hill 
Cum Laude 
Megan Danielle Moore, 

Wooster 
J. Scott Moreland, Bainbridge 
Cum Laude 
with Honors in the Arts and 

Sciences 
William Randal Mutters, 

Columbus 
Jordan Alyssa Myers, 

Gahanna 
Lien Thi-My Nguyen, 

Cincinnati 
Magna Cum Laude 
Nadine Luyinda Nzwanga, 

Columbus 
Daniel Olaka Oder, 

Youngstown 
Shannon Laura O’Donnell, 

Cleveland 
Ji Yon Oh, Korea 
Percy Yeboah Opoku, Accra, 

Ghana 
Hector Luis Ortiz, Bronx, NY 
Lori Ann Osterloh Hagaman, 

Minster 
Kevin R. Patrick, Rochester, 

NY 
Addie Elizabeth Payne, 

Chillicothe 
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Jingyu Pi, Xiangyang, China 
Magna Cum Laude 
James Eric Power, Columbus 
Vladimir Olegovich 

Razuvayev, Delaware 
Cum Laude 
Robert Ricardo Reasoner, 

Columbus 
Dustin Luke Reynolds, 

Portage 
Matthew Scott Rhodebeck, 

Mansfield 
Jamie Marie Riddlebarger, 

Alexandria 
Maximilian Dean Ringwald, 

Milford 
Eric Christopher Runyan, 

Marysville 

Matthew Allen Sarver, 
Columbus 

Andrew John Scherrer, 
Mansfield 

Magna Cum Laude 
Chelsea Le Schmit, Trenton 
Bryant Lyle Schuck, Kettering 
Jacob Paul Schuller, Toledo 
Delanie Ann Schulte, 

Columbus 
Justin Andrew Schulze, 

Willowdell 
Summa Cum Laude 
with Honors in the Arts and 

Sciences 
Menghan Shi, Wuhan, China 
Magna Cum Laude 
Thomas Michael Shroka, 

North Olmsted 
Cum Laude 
Swetha Singh, Dublin 
Alex David Slivinski, Saginaw, 

MI 
Magna Cum Laude 
with Honors in the Arts and 

Sciences 
Paul Joseph Soltesz, Mentor 
Magna Cum Laude 
with Research Distinction in 

Geography 

Elise Marie Strecker, 
Cincinnati 

Jennifer Lynn Sullivan, Dublin 
Magna Cum Laude 
Kylee Donn Swaney, Vincent 
Erin Renee Taylor, Broadview 

Heights 
Cum Laude 
Michele Nicole Taylor, 

Marysville 
Jacqueline Marie Telljohann, 

Solon 
Summa Cum Laude 
Spencer Louis Tepe, 

Cincinnati 
Myranda Michelle Tillis, 

Vernon Hills, IL 
Cum Laude 
Michelle J. Truby, Worthington 
Magna Cum Laude 
Lynn My Truong, Dayton 
Magna Cum Laude 

Christopher Michael Turner, 
Grove City 

Kelly Ugrinov, Columbus 
John Robert Unverzagt III, 

Gahanna 
Takafumi Uzawa, Pickerington 
Magna Cum Laude 
Philip Michael Vail, Gahanna 
Sarah M. Weiskittel, Cincinnati 
Cum Laude 
with Honors in the Arts and 

Sciences 
Kristen Renee Werff, Lima 
Andrew R. Whitacre, Plain City 
Steven Ross White, Lima 
Thomas Steven Willett, Wilder, 

KY 
with Honors in the Arts and 

Sciences 
Andrew John Willsmer, Avon 
Evan James Wilson, Volant, 

PA 
Amanda Marie Wright, 

Gnadenhutten 
Yansi Xu, Jinhua, China 
Summa Cum Laude 
Jiachen Xuan, Shanghai, 

China 
Andrew Scott Yarman, 

Loudonville 
Kaihua Yu, Ningbo, China 
Magna Cum Laude 
Kevin Felix Yu, Mayfield 

Village 
Hua Zhou, Hefei, China 
Cum Laude 
 
 

Associate of Arts 
 
Ashton Alexandra Adams, 

Bucyrus 
Corinne Ann Aebersold, 

Ashland 
Jumana Ali, Galena 
Esther Abena Appiah, 

Westerville 
Diakariyaw Adama Ba, 

Columbus 
Kevin James Bailey, Buckeye 

Lake 
James D. Baisden, Galena 
Alicia Renea Blevins, Marion 
Shelby Alexis Boger, 

Caledonia 
Amanda E. Bowers, Newark 
Jodi Lynne Bowers, Pataskala 
Katelyn Marie Branscum, 

Avon 
Ashley R. Brown, Mansfield 
Zach Alan Brumfield, 

Mansfield 
Nathanial Scott Bryant, St. 

Louisville 
Bradley Neil Casto, Marion 
Maryssa Jeanyl Charley, 

Fredericktown 
Brian Lee Coffey, Sidney 

Ariel Bryce Collins, Shelby 
Magna Cum Laude 
Zachary Alexander Crabtree, 

Pataskala 
Suzanne Renee D’Avanzo, 

Shelby 
Cecylia Daab-Krzykowski, 

Columbus 
Amber Marie Daniels, 

Columbus 
Rachel Lynn Desanto, Marion 
Jessica Marie Diller, Bucyrus 
Amber Alisha Dingess, 

Johnstown 
Cum Laude 
Chase Owen Dye, Columbus 
Janay L. Dyer, Marion 
Michael Robert Dyson, 

Mansfield 
Nora Catherine Farmer, 

Mansfield 
Wasey Farooqui, Pickerington 
Dante Lamar Farris, Columbus 
Mariah Rae Ferguson, Shelby 
Jamie Jasmine Michelle 

Ferrin, Newark 
Tonya Nicole Foss, Galion 
Stephani Ann Fuson, Harrod 
Kyleigh Suzanne Gahr, Willard 
Summa Cum Laude 
Benjamin Cody Garrett, Shiloh 
Magna Cum Laude 
Sandra Dee Gavin, Newark 
Kelli Rachelle Goodwin, 

Marion 
Sarah Kae Hamons, Mansfield 
Michael Caleb Hart, Pataskala 
Patricia Hazelrigg, Sunbury 
Kelly Suzanne Highland, 

Marion 
Cum Laude 
Rebecca Kay Hile, Lexington 
Kaci Ann Hill, Wapakoneta 
Cum Laude 
Ryan Marc Hoffman, Crestline 
Jason Charles Hunter, 

Greenwich 
Summa Cum Laude 
Mitchell Robert Jacobson, 

Ashland 
Neil Steven Johnson, Ashland 
Gene Thomas Kaser, Lima 
Corree Denise Kaylor, 

Ashland 
Christopher Allen Kilgore, 

Newark 
Austin Wayne Stuart King, La 

Rue 
Kaitlyn Mae King, Plymouth 
Benjamin David Kracker, 

Canton 
Ryan Daniel Krivacek, Sidney 
Carly Devon Kunkle-Swagler, 

Ashley 
Michael John Lee, Newark 
Cum Laude 
Michael Paul Lester, Marion 
Danielle Dawn Lofay, New 

Riegel 
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Courtney Renee Loney, 
Mansfield 

Kassandra Leeann Long, 
Layfayette 

Katie Erin Mackey, Galena 
Kourtnye R. Maez, Lafayette 
Stephanie Elizabeth Maneese, 

Ashland 
Danielle Caitlin McGee, New 

Albany 
Macie McKensey, Marion 
Traci Lynn McKinney, 

Mansfield 
Benjamin M. McPherson, 

Morral 
Summa Cum Laude 
Monika Miji´c, Columbus 
Pamela Angela Miller-Sheets, 

Cardington 
Summa Cum Laude 
Muhubo Ahmed Mohamed, 

Columbus 
Rasheed Ali Mohamoud, 

Columbus 
Erin Elizabeth Monnett, 

Columbus 
Ashley Beth Montgomery, 

Ashland 
Shawn A. Moore, Columbus 
Maria A. Nagel, Akron 
Deborah Lynn Noll, 

Cardington 
Magna Cum Laude 
Katherine Victoria O’Neil, 

Carroll 
Faith Ann Oswalt, Mansfield 
William Thomas Pack, 

Reynoldsburg 
Cum Laude 
Stephen A. Parker, Lexington 
Jordan Micah Parsons, 

Ashland 
Matthew David Patterson, 

Massillon 
Amber Gene Perkins, Willard 
Michael A. Piemonte, Newark 
Kylie Renee Radovich, 

Pickerington 
Bradley Allen Rand, Marion 
Melissa Lynn Redick, Mount 

Gilead 
Amanda G. Richards, Mount 

Perry 
Kayla B. Robertson, Marion 
Lashonna Marie Royster, 

Heath 
Stephen Robert Sardini, Jr., 

Newark 
Adam Richard Sauer, 

Columbus 
Stacy Renee Scarberry, 

Pataskala 
Jason Cline Schuttera, 

Ashland 
Joshua Maitland Self, 

Columbus 
Jason Alan Selzer, Mansfield 

Lauren Brooke Shifley, 
Mansfield 

Hannah Shim, Powell 
Brandy Nichole Sims, Marion 
Caitlin Noel Singleton, 

Nashport 
Michelle Leigh Ann Sliger, 

Mount Gilead 
Nicole Renee Smith, Ashland 
Thomas Lee Smith, Heath 
Zane Daniel Stepp, Ashland 
Mark A. Stevens, Bellefontaine 
Brian Dean Stewart, Lima 
Ramona Jeanne Suarez, Lima 
Anne Marie Taggart, 

Worthington 
Alexander David Thompson, 

Pataskala 
Elizabeth Ann Tiefenthaler, 

Hilliard 
Darrell Scott Timmons, Marion 
Nickolas S.D. Truax, Mansfield 
Shauna N. Vahalik, Newark 
Kaylee Danielle Voigt, 

Gahanna 
Erin Jessica Walters, Newark 
Abigail Rose Warfel, Upper 

Sandusky 
Bernard Justin Weithman, 

Bucyrus 
Tamara Maya Wilkerson, 

Marion 
Summa Cum Laude 
Wyatt Drew Wiseman, New 

Lexington 
Ryan Mathew Yeater, Ashland 
Jennifer Lyn Young, Plain City 
Nicholas Ryan Young, Newark 
Gregory Victor Zarichny, 

Columbus 
 
 
 

The Max M. Fisher 
College of Business 
 
Dean: Christine A. Poon 
 
 

Bachelor of Science in 
Business Administration 
 
Diya A, Huhot, China 
Magna Cum Laude 
Lukas Hung-soo Abrahams, 

Bartlett, TN 
Majed Reyadh Abujarad, Abu 

Dhabi, UAE 
Magna Cum Laude 
Kasper Klitten W. Andreasen, 

Bellbrook 
Leah Helen Argyle, Granville 
Tyler Scott Armstrong, 

Columbus 
Sarah Ellen Avery, Lewis 

Center 

Steven Michael Backus, 
Lisbon 

Timothy Samuel Bartolett, 
Sylvania 

Jim Andrew Beam, Jr., 
Chagrin Falls 

Eric David Bergantino, New 
Salem, MA 

Cassandra Lynn Bernard, 
Hinckley 

Joshua McClain Bonifas, 
Powell 

Jennifer Anne Bores, Bellevue 
Bradley Keith Bowron, Galion 
Daniel J. Bricker, Buffalo 

Grove, IL 
Renee C. Briggs, Fremont 
Tony John Brost, Delaware 
Joshua Dennis Brown, Perry 
Steven Bruno, Dublin 
Kazzien Wilusz Bryan, 

Delphos 
Lei Bu, Sharjah, UAE 
Alec Robert Budinsky, Poland 
Connor Gregory Cantrell, 

Dallas, TX 
Minhua Cao, Shanghai, China 
Cum Laude 
Jorge Manuel Carrero, 

Mayaguez, PR 
Ryan Joseph Chappell, 

Cincinnati 
Sijie Che, Ningbo, China 
Summa Cum Laude 
Cheng Chen, Ru Gao, China 
Cum Laude 
Jinhee Cho, Seoul, Korea 
Ka Yu Shirin Choy, Hong 

Kong, China 
Robert Paul Chriss, Westlake 
Cum Laude 
Roderick Montgomery 

Claerbout, Columbus 
Matthew Trevor Cleverly, 

Columbus 
Alexandra Paige Collett, 

Westerville 
Karen Rebecca Cook, 

Perrysburg 
Kylee Michelle Cramer, 

Waterville 
Jia Cui, Xinxiang, Henan, 

China 
Min Cui, Inner Mongolia, 

China 
Emily Elizabeth Dahler, 

Madison, WI 
Summa Cum Laude 
with Honors in Accounting 

Sarah Elizabeth Dailey, 
Hilliard 

Adam Christopher Daniels, 
Kettering 

Timothy Jacob Daniels, Avon 
Lake 

Erica Renee Davis, Mansfield 
Joseph Anthony DiNapoli, 

Naples, Italy 
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Hang Dong, Beijing, China 
Magna Cum Laude 
Sean Kaichen Duddy, Ann 

Arbor, MI 
Summa Cum Laude 
Nalbi Ethem Erdogan, 

Hawthorne, NJ 
Michael Jared Falcon, 

Marietta, GA 
Cum Laude 
with Honors in Business 

Administration 

Chenyang Feng, Hangzhou, 
China 

Magna Cum Laude 
Frank Carlo Ferritto, Cleveland 
Tyler James Feth, Mentor-on-

the-Lake 
Robert Michael Fohl, 

Cincinnati 
Magna Cum Laude 
with Honors in Accounting 

Bryant William Fox, Piqua 
Christina Jane Fox, Cincinnati 
Michael William Freeman, 

Cincinnati 
Andrew Simon Friedhoff, 

Sagamore Hills 
Geno Braden Frissora, 

Columbus 
Cum Laude 
Rachel Ann Goettemoeller, St. 

Henry 
Cody Kenneth Goodwin, 

Broadview Heights 
Jessica Ashley Gottron, 

Gahanna 
Mehartaaj Singh Grewal, San 

Diego, CA 
Shi Ting Gu, Ningbo, China 
Audra Kay Gunter, Delphos 
Cum Laude 
Jia Ying Guo, Wuhan, China 
Summa Cum Laude 
Jonathan Rudolph Gurgol, 

North Royalton 
Kyle Geoffrey Hancharick, 

Lebanon 
Cum Laude 
Jessica Janet Hand, Sandusky 
Ryan Randel Harvey, 

Gahanna 
Kerry Ann Hawkins, University 

Heights 
Brooke Eileen Hays, St. 

Clairsville 
Cum Laude 
Yi He, Fuzhou, China 
Megan Alyce Heller, Lancaster 
Madison Michela Hogan, 

Ellicott City, MD 
Tyler Scott Houser, Hamilton 
Song Hu, Shenzhen, China 
Yang Hu, Nanjing, China 
Yuhui Hua, Shanghai, China 
Lu Huang, Dongguan, China 
Serena Nicole Huddleson, 

Washington Court House 

Jordan Matthew David Hurley, 
Columbus 

Rachel Mary Illig, Lima 
Kevin William Jennison, Dublin 
Angelita Elizabeth Johnson, 

Lewis Center 
Casey N. Justus, Heath 
Natalie Alene Kahl, 

Reynoldsburg 
Aaron Matthew Kalnasy, 

Hilliard 
Cum Laude 
Douglas Dongwoan Kang, 

Seoul, Korea 
Kohl Kaufman, Cleveland 
Cum Laude 
with Honors in Business 

Administration 

Tara Nicole Kelly, Waverly 
Jennifer Megan Kilpatrick, 

New Prague, MN 
Jae-Hee Kim, Cheonan, Korea 
Magna Cum Laude 
Ye Seul Kim, Seoul, Korea 
Ross Klosterman, Celina 
Lauren Nicole Klute, 

Columbus 
Kevin Joseph Kray, Bay 

Village 
Magna Cum Laude 
Ricky John Lattro, Hilliard 
Charles A. Lawson, Dublin 
Ko Wun Lee, Seoul, Korea 
Kara Marie Lenkey, Powell 
Ruixuan Li, Shenzhen, 

Guangdong, China 
Magna Cum Laude 
Yuan’Ao Li, Beijing, China 
Cum Laude 
Zhen Li, Nanjing, Jiang Su, 

China 
Chen Liu, DaLian, China 
Congcong Liu, Jinan, China 
Magna Cum Laude 
Shenyang Liu, Beijing, China 
Yawen Liu, Columbus 
Yin Liu, Beijing, China 
Cum Laude 
Evan Loh, Great Falls, VA 
Cynthia Lu, Brecksville 
Cum Laude 
Chuanyne Luo, Xiangtan, 

China 
Wilson Henry Ly, Parma 
Jacob Christopher Macaluso, 

Mansfield 
Ryan James Mack, New 

Riegel 
Chengding Mao, Ningde, 

China 
Magna Cum Laude 
Dustin E. McCann, Columbus 
R. Anthony McClish, Lima 
Cum Laude 
Jeffrey Raymond McCloskey, 

Columbus 
Stephani Julene McIntyre, 

Columbus 

Agam Shalom Melmed, 
Columbus 

Leah Marie Meyers, Buffalo, 
NY 

Holly Marie Smith Miller, Solon 
Brian Keith Moore, Jr., Dayton 
William Clyde Moore, Granville 
Phillip Andrew Moorman, 

Minster 
Xantara Song Mossman, 

Reynoldsburg 
Xinyu Mu, Dalian, China 
Patrick Ryan Mullally, 

Strongsville 
Ashley Ann Munson, Hilliard 
Toni Danielle Nelson, Edison 
Jeffrey Warren Nilsen, West 

Chester 
Tyler Glen Nugent, Cleveland 
Brooke Marie Nye, Sylvania 
Kevin Timothy O’Brien, Dublin 
Anthony Oey, Bandung, 

Indonesia 
Da Young Oh, Seoul, Korea 
Erika Nicole Overturf, Lewis 

Center 
Cum Laude 
Wuyao Pan, Hefei, China 
Magna Cum Laude 
Adam Bradley Pandrangi, 

Westlake 
Brent David Parys, Ottawa 
Howard Singleton Patton, 

Cincinnati 
Kayla Nicole Pickana, St. 

Clairsville 
Kelsey Lane Pockl, Martins 

Ferry 
Alexander Scott Preisse, 

Akron 
Colin David Prescott, Newark 
Stephen Anthony Pruchnicki, 

Amherst 
Shabei Qian, Ningbo, China 
Cum Laude 
Matthew Scott Rayl, Carmel, 

IN 
Saadia Razzaq Chaudhry, 

Pickerington 
Maggie Renee Retterer, 

Hilliard 
Jeremy Michael Saham, Solon 
Jaideep Saran, Delhi, India 
Mark Francis Scarcello, 

Columbus 
Preston Thomas Scherer, 

Powell 
Cum Laude 
Cory J. Schneider, Rochester, 

NY 
Michael Alexander Scholz, 

Mentor 
Michelle Scinkovec, Parma 
Dominic Patrick Shaw, 

Cincinnati 
Cum Laude 
Xin Shen, Hangzhou, China 
Summa Cum Laude 
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Menghan Shi, Wu Han, China 
Magna Cum Laude 
Shaowei Shi, Qinhuangdao, 

China 
Emil Slobodnik, St. 

Petersburg, Russia 
Kyle Justin Smigel, Westlake 
Matthew Michael Smith, 

Olmsted Falls 
Kevin George Smouse, 

California, MD 
Abdiel Enrique Solis, 

Columbus 
Keri Elizabeth South, 

Bellbrook 
Alexis Ann Spillman, Bexley 
Colton Roy Sponseller, 

Glenmont 
Tyler David Stafford, 

Willoughby 
Shaun Alan Steiger, Bucyrus 
Dennis Eugene Stonebraker, 

Miami, FL 
Magna Cum Laude 
Hsin-Ti Tang, Taipei, Taiwan, 

ROC 
Weiwei Tang, Xiangtan, China 
Magna Cum Laude 
Jacob Thomas Teetor, 

Columbus 
Gregory P. Thompson, Dayton 
Anthony Vincent Trovato, 

Gahanna 
Phuc Nguyen Truong, 

Columbus 
Drake Addison Unger, Findlay 
Shuhei Uzawa, Ichikawa, 

Japan 
Daniella Christine Vespoli, 

Akron 
Magna Cum Laude 
Andrew M. Vieth, Dublin 
Elizabeth Marie Waldo, 

Columbus 
Patrick John Wallace, Findlay 
Yiyi Wang, Yuyao, Zhejiang, 

China 
Zinuo Wang, Shenzhen, China 
Magna Cum Laude 
Peng Wei, Beijing, China 
Menachem Yonah Weiss, 

Pepper Pike 
Magna Cum Laude 
Alan Jay Winegardner, 

Newark 
Bradley Ryan Wise, Hudson 
Zexiu Wu, Columbus 
Xiaoyu Xu, Changsha, Hunan, 

China 
Summa Cum Laude 
with Honors in Accounting 

Yingjin Xu, Guangzhou, 
Guangdong, China 

Cum Laude 
Zengsan Xu, Jinhua, China 
Summa Cum Laude 
Wanwan Yang, Beijing, China 
Cum Laude 

Robyn Margaret Yates, Lewis 
Center 

Yin Yin, Beijing, China 
Dawei Yu, Beijing,China 
Summa Cum Laude 
Kaihua Yu, Ningbo, China 
Magna Cum Laude 
Xiaolu Yu, Nanjing, China 
Cum Laude 
Adam Joseph Yurkovic, 

Columbus 
Jiayuan Zhang, Yangzhou, 

China 
Magna Cum Laude 
Tong Zhou, Beijing, China 
Magna Cum Laude 
Kai Zhu, Beijing, China 
 
 
 

College of Dentistry 
 
Dean: Patrick M. Lloyd 
 
 

Doctor of Dental Surgery 
 
Patrick J. McKinley, Canal 

Winchester 
B.S.Nutrition 
 
 

Bachelor of Science in 
Dental Hygiene 
 
Julie Ann Lantis, West Chester 
Christina Niehoff Smith, 

Columbus 
Emily J. Stuart, Ada 
 
 
 

College of Education 
and Human Ecology 
 
Dean: Cheryl L. Achterberg 
 
 

Bachelor of Science in 
Human Ecology 
 
Stephanie Nicole Abraham, 

Columbus 
Heidi Rosa Adkins-Koehler, 

Columbus 
Magna Cum Laude 
Julianne Aiello, Riverbank, CA 
Ashley Caitlyn Alvarez, 

Columbus 
Kyle Vincent Arnold, Bexley 
Samantha Marie Artino, 

Chagrin Falls 
Meredith Anne Baker, Powell 
Kristi Jo Baldwin, Dayton 
Nekesha Louise Baldwin, 

Cambridge 

Candace Allysha Barber, 
Reynoldsburg 

Brittni Lynn Barker, McComb 
Jennifer Ryan Barnett, 

Columbus 
Julie Asha Barr, Worthington 
Lacy Rachel Bateson, New 

Lexington 
Tiffany Patrice Belton, 

Columbus 
Brittany Annette Bennett, 

Akron 
Brad Thomas Bernhart, 

Washington, PA 
Margaret Kathleen Berry, 

Uniontown 
Lacey Renae Birchfield, 

Prospect 
Daniella Nicole Bonfante, 

Dublin 
Zachary Boyt, Pittsburgh, PA 
Jillian Lee Bradley, Dublin 
Magna Cum Laude 
Briana Braver, Westerville 
Amanda Katherine Bright, 

Norwalk 
Kelsey Rae Buckley, Nashport 
Alexandra Catherine 

Burzynski, Chicago, IL 
Bethany Nicole Busick, 

Columbus 
Jake David Calvert, Mason 
Devin Sara Campion, 

Flemington, NJ 
Elizabeth Clare Carlin, Solon 
Hannah Nicole Chandler, 

Johnstown 
Amber Christian Chillious, 

Mayfield 
Kristina Lee Collins, Columbus 
Kara Rachelle Conard, 

Blacklick 
Cum Laude 
Christen Danielle Conroy, 

Ashley 
Susan E. Cook, Frazeysburg 
Amanda M. Cramer, Mansfield 
Cum Laude 
Megan Lee Daniel, Springboro 
Megan M. Drozda, Parma 
Magna Cum Laude 
Kenley Aaron Dull, Powell 
Megan Eberl, Parma 
Katie Mae Etheridge, 

Westerville 
Craig Matthew Ferguson, 

Dublin 
Ana-Ilia Fitzhugh, Hilliard 
Danielle Elizabeth Fiumara, 

Pittsburgh, PA 
Bridget Alice Fredricksen, 

Columbus 
Justin W. Fry, Wapakoneta 
Kelley Elizabeth Geisen, 

Cincinnati 
Andrija Marie Gingell, 

Jamestown 
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Brent Daniel Gingerich, 
Columbus 

Margaret Mary Hardin, Powell 
Brooke Elizabeth Harrison, 

Columbus 
Elizabeth Anne Hastings, 

Columbus 
Keith Jesse Haws, Dublin 
Megan Marie Hecht, Canton 
Robert Lee Hedmond III, 

Torrance, CA 
Katherine Elizabeth Hemmer, 

Powell 
Jessica Nicole Hofstetter, 

Dalton 
Chelsea Lynne Holberg, 

Medford, NJ 
Renee Marie Holton, Huber 

Heights 
Brittany Marie Homola, Parma 
Ashley Elizabeth Hook, Grove 

City 
Alison Margaret Huff, 

Worthington 
Cum Laude 
Tiara R. Husband, Columbus 
Philip Zachary Irmen, Holland 
Paul D. Ivinskas, Westerville 
Amy Marie James, Newark 
Lisa Saesam Jang, 

Fayetteville, NC 
Nicole Rae John, Newark 
Kelsie Leigh Kollins, Dublin 
Emil Koniecko, Columbus 
Mary Angela Lafogiannis, 

Dublin 
Deanna Marie Liccardi, 

Brecksville 
Lauren Alicia Lindsey, 

Cincinnati 
Brooke A. Lyons, Powell 
Melissa A. Lytle, Rawson 
Jeffrey John Mains, Brook 

Park 
Harshil P. Maniar, Powell 
Emily Ann Marsh, Galena 
Olivia Anita Marshall, Staten 

Island, NY 
Lindsey Elyse McIntosh, 

Cypress, TX 
Andrew G. McLaughlin, Liberty 

Township 
William Ross Meadema, Bay 

Village 
Mary Cinda Miehls, Dublin 
James Ryan Miller, Pataskala 
Samantha Marie Miller, 

Pataskala 
Safiya Sharif-Ali Mohamed, 

Columbus 
Megan Marie Moriarty, 

Westerville 
Cum Laude 
Lizeth Morton, Hilliard 
Alex Daniel Motter, 

Waynesfield 
Maliha Mujeeb, Miamisburg 

Michael Anthony Muran, 
Brecksville 

Monica Jane Neil, Columbus 
Austin Paul Nye, Millersport 
Kathleen Jordan Obenour, 

New Albany 
Shelby Lynn Oster, Columbus 
Emma Catherine Parker, 

Columbus 
Cum Laude 
Sohil H. Patel, Hilliard 
Mike L. Pepple, Spencerville 
Brian Michael Petite, Aurora 
Lauren Kathryn Noelle Priest, 

Trinway 
Lesley Elizabeth Pryor, Canal 

Winchester 
Meghan Renee Rasey, Dublin 
Allison Frances Rawlings, 

Bexley 
Samantha Lee Rawlings, 

Columbus 
Shelby Jean Reising, 

Cincinnati 
Cum Laude 
Kathryn Lauren Richardson, 

Powell 
Melanie Kay Ringle, Dublin 
Summa Cum Laude 
Vanessa Lee Roll, Dublin 
Amanda M. Sabaturski, 

Westerville 
Derek James Scheetz, Dublin 
Jonathan Clancy Schrand, 

Cincinnati 
Robert Richard Scott, 

Chesterland 
Christy Lynne Shanyfelt, 

Columbus 
Kathleen Evelyn Shepard, 

Delaware 
Benjamin Ian Skinner, New 

Albany 
Magna Cum Laude 
Alexandra E. Skubovius, 

Columbus 
Magna Cum Laude 
Mara Helene Smith, Grove 

City 
Melody Joy Stauffer, Irwin 
Rebecca Lea Stomps, 

Columbus 
Magna Cum Laude 
Amanda May Swanson, 

Cambridge 
Titinan Tanglertpaibul, 

Columbus 
Ashley Nicole Till, Delaware 
Chelsea Louise Toler, Canal 

Winchester 
Summa Cum Laude 
Sammy Paul Tonyemba, 

Columbus 
Carmella Marie Tortora, 

Canton 
Christopher John Toth, 

Springfield 
Jordan Leanne Turner, 

Mechanicsburg 

Abigail Jean Upton, Hudson 
Cum Laude 
Aleck Maxfield Wagman, 

Parker, CO 
Caroline B. Waidelich, 

Columbus 
Summa Cum Laude 
Ashlee L. Walters, Columbus 
Kayla Ward, Galena 
Larry Keith Ward II, 

Westerville 
Amanda L. Watters, Heath 
Jessica Louise Watters, 

Columbus 
Andrea Marie Exotica 

Whitehill-Taynor, Columbus 
Alejandra Kirsten Whitehurst, 

Cincinnati 

Martin R. Whitener, Lewis 
Center 

Jonathon Ramsey Winland, 
Columbus 

Emily Brooke Wise, Delaware 
Cum Laude 
Andrew Joseph Wrzosek, 

West Seneca, NY 
Sarah Ann Yerkey, Salem 
Cum Laude 
Lydia Abigail Yoder, Columbus 
Yong Seok Yoo, Columbus 
Jessica Amanda-Sue Young, 

Grove City 
Magna Cum Laude 
Alexis N. Zoldan, North 

Canton 
 
 

Bachelor of Science in 
Hospitality Management 
 
Kamneel Amin, Middletown 
Alexander Whitman Bates, 

Hilliard 
Lauren Ann Bezilla, Warren 
Jason Patrick Bucher, 

Columbus 
Jason Edward Casterline, 

Warren 
Carla Jean Clifton, Grove City 
Delores Cooper, Cincinnati 
Mia Nicole Davis, Columbus 
Shukla Debnath, West 

Chester 
Benjamin Ross Frasher, 

Powell 
Layne Elizabeth Fulks, 

Covington 
Cum Laude 
Joshua Michael Greer, 

Fostoria 
Summa Cum Laude 
Sara Frances Keck, Piqua 
Ryan James Kline, Columbus 
Meagan Michaela Lajoie, 

Mansfield 
Travis Michael Latham, 

Columbus 
Parker Alan Lawrence, Urbana 



Commencement Convocation, March 18, 2012 
 

534 

Moises Lozano, Bowling 
Green, FL 

Alexandra Catherine Mailloux-
Beauchemin, Morgan Hill, 
CA 

Janee’ Elise Mays, Lisbon 
Heather Elizabeth McGurrin, 

South Euclid 
Amina Hassan Mohamed, 

Columbus 
Elizabeth Linel Mullins, 

Germantown 
Philip Andrew Seleskie, 

Hastings, MN 
Anne Katherine Spak, Hudson 
Devin James Vent, Sunbury 
Sam Wackler, Trenton 
Kathryn Sue Wigginton, 

Springfield 
 
 

Bachelor of Science in 
Nutrition 
 
John Burris Hicks, Cleveland 
Cum Laude 
Elaina Katherine Jones, 

Homer, NY 
Cum Laude 
with Honors Research Distinction in 

Nutrition 

 
 

Bachelor of Science in 
Education 
 
Jonda Danielle Axthelm, 

Cardington 
Amanda Marie Barrell, 

Pataskala 
Christine Castillo, Weslaco, 

TX 
Cum Laude 
Ellen J. Cavanaugh, 

Columbus 
Katherine Marie Clime, Hilliard 
Joseph Paul Crouch, 

Delaware 
Sara F. Dzierwa, Fort 

Lauderdale, FL 
Sarah Marie Grosel, Marietta 
Cum Laude 
Kasey Mackenzie Hageman, 

Stryker 
Kyle Arthur Herbruck, Hartville 
Kathryn Ashley Knotts, 

Perrysburg 
Kayla Marie Laman, Lima 
Slbora Lee, Columbus 
Elan Joshua Lieber, Columbus 
Cum Laude 
with Research Distinction in 

Exercise Science Education 

Joshua Tyler Longood, 
Mansfield 

Jordan Michael Lusk, West 
Lafayette 

Nicole Marie McAlpine, Heath 

Michael Jerry McGilbra, 
Aurora 

Chase Brendan McWhorter, 
South Point 

Elizabeth M. Miller, Marion 
Julie Ann Nejedlik, Strongsville 
Allison Margaret Nichols, 

Mansfield 
Summa Cum Laude 
Nathaniel Cole Oliver, 

Columbus 
John Thomas Porter, Lewis 

Center 
Chelsey Lyann Ramsey, 

Rushsylvania 
Daniel Wade Rice, Newark 
Collin Daniel Richards, 

Westerville 
Steven James Rider, 

Columbus 
Anthony C. Sallee, Columbus 
Erica Jo Schimmoeller, Lima 
Dominick Carmine Sica, 

Fairfax Station, VA 
Anthony Michael Thrush, 

Columbus 
Cathleen Michele Ward, 

Columbus 
Magna Cum Laude 
Michael Antwoin Webb, 

Cleveland 
Brandi Paige Zwelling, New 

Albany 
 
 
 

College of 
Engineering 
 

Dean: David B. Williams 
 
 

Bachelor of Science in 
Aeronautical and 
Astronautical 
Engineering 
 
Kevin John Holcomb, Jr., 

Akron 
 
 

Bachelor of Science in 
Aviation 
 
Lyndsey E. Humpal, Medina 
Scott Patrick Lechner, Chagrin 

Falls 
 
 

Bachelor of Science in 
Biomedical Engineering 
 
Scott D. Cukras, Broadview 

Heights 
Brad Richard Doepker, Findlay 

Gunter Erick Eickert, 
Gibsonburg 

Kim B. Elliott, Cincinnati 
Cum Laude 
Douglas Walter Follmer, 

Westerville 
Magna Cum Laude 
Shubhra Kochar, New Delhi, 

India 
Cum Laude 
Daniel Aaron Krakauer, Akron 
Cum Laude 
Lauren Ilyse Levey, Cincinnati 
Cum Laude 
Joshua Login Mena, Gales 

Ferry, CT 
Jennifer Ashley Smith, 

Westlake 
John Adam Zurmehly, 

Clarksburg 
 
 

Bachelor of Science in 
Chemical Engineering 
 
Matthew Daniel Cerone, West 

Chester 
Ryan Lincoln Clark, Cincinnati 
Magna Cum Laude 
with Honors in Engineering 
with Honors Research Distinction in 

Chemical Engineering 

Christopher K. Harvey, Hilliard 
Johnathan Brooks Johnson, 

Columbus 
Katrina Marie Kolkmeier, 

Cincinnati 
Brooke Elizabeth Laing, 

Schoolcraft, MI 
Magna Cum Laude 
with Honors in Engineering 
with Honors Research Distinction in 

Chemical Engineering 

Mengchuan Li, Dalian, China 
Magna Cum Laude 
Steven Kwo Wey Lim, Mason 
Magna Cum Laude 
with Honors in Engineering 

Julia H. Mueller, Columbus 
with Research Distinction in 

Chemical Engineering 

Arthur Call Neeley, Fremont 
Justin Leonard Que, Port 

Clinton 
Cum Laude 
Hermondeep Singh Sahota, 

Mason 
Michael Sean Smith, Akron 
Alexander Donald Vermejan, 

Mason 
Cum Laude 
Thomas Dewey Warden, 

Delaware 
Michael Lee Witwer, Tipp City 
Magna Cum Laude 
Michael Thomas Yingling, 

Bellevue 
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Bachelor of Science in 
Civil Engineering 
 
Mitchell James Appleman, 

Canton 
Ryan David Black, Willoughby 
Drew Michael Browning, Lewis 

Center 
Joseph Matthew Case, 

Chardon 
Andrew D. Clarridge, 

Marysville 
Corey Lee Cottrell, Chillicothe 
Wesley Michael Davis, Rocky 

River 
Timothy Michael Dea, Mentor 
Cum Laude 
Nate C. Engel, Loveland 
Derek Jeffrey Erwin, Tiro 
Jordan Thomas Fleischman, 

North Canton 
Robel Giackero, Takoma Park, 

MD 
Joshua A. Ginnetti, Struthers 
Andrew D. Grice, Bellevue 
Kyle Joseph Harmon, Lima 
Jacob Robert Kelly, Olmsted 

Falls 
Laura Rachael Kirkland, 

Steubenville 
Michael G. Lindawan, 

Columbus 
Patrick Charles Mead, San 

Jose, CA 
Jessica A. Nowak, 

Pickerington 
Chad Edward Smith, East 

Liverpool 
Amanda Jane Verhoff, Fort 

Jennings 
Cum Laude 
Adam Lee Winebrenner, 

Reynoldsburg 
John Joseph Woolley, 

Gahanna 
Bruce William Young, Lima 
 
 

Bachelor of Science in 
Computer Science and 
Engineering 
 
Brian M. Alberta, Chillicothe 
Kyle Joseph Armstrong, Brook 

Park 
Praseeda Badami, Upper 

Arlington 
Cum Laude 
with Honors in Engineering 

David D. Chuha, Columbus 
Rajni Gora, Sikar, India 
Samuel Joseph Habenschuss, 

Willowick 
Matthew R. Henderson, 

Marlboro 
Randall P. Henderson, 

Twinsburg 

Alexander Stewart Holmes, 
Dayton 

Jonathan D. Hsu, Somerset, 
NJ 

Anthony Leonti, Strongsville 
Cum Laude 
Steven Charles Lewis, Hilliard 
Naiqiao Liang, Shen Yang, 

China 
Sean Patrick Mahaffey, 

Hudson 
Eric Van Peters, Miamisburg 
Alexander Philip Stevens, 

Harrison 
Matthew Jordan Stvartak, 

Toledo 
Justin Allen Vayda, Elyria 
Jordan Todd Welzbacher, 

Sylvania 
 
 

Bachelor of Science in 
Electrical and Computer 
Engineering 
 
Forest Mateo Agostinelli, 

Washington, DC 
Magna Cum Laude 
Timurbek B. Babadjanov, 

Tashkent, Uzbekistan 
Andrew Taylor Baster, 

Timberlake 
Gregory Richard Bauman, 

Medina 
Ross M. Bertsch, Cincinnati 
Nicholas Blayne Blanton, 

Morrow 
Dan Joseph Brandesky, Lima 
Alex Kyle Bryan, Oregonia 
Phuoc Minh Chung, Ho Chi 

Minh City, Vietnam 
Magna Cum Laude 
Kenneth Elliott Clive, Mumbai, 

India 
Christopher Walter Davis, 

Buffalo, NY 
Michael Martin Dearth, 

Columbus 
Ehab H. Elsherif, Columbus 
Robert Lowell George, Powell 
Chen Greene, Beijing, China 
Cum Laude 
Jennifer Leigh Horton, 

Gaithersburg, MD 
Summa Cum Laude 
with Honors in Engineering 

Huizheng Huang, Guangzhou, 
China 

Juntae Kim, Seoul, Korea 
Peter Christian Koelsch, 

Marietta 
Magna Cum Laude 
Jonathan A. Lane, Columbus 
Hanna Larusdottir, Columbus 
Alexander James Lowman, 

Columbus 

Kevin Thomas McDermott, 
Whitehouse 

Cum Laude 
Amritesh Rai, Patna, India 
Summa Cum Laude 
Vahid Michael Rajabian 

Schwart, Groveport 
Magna Cum Laude 
with Honors Research Distinction in 

Electrical and Computer 
Engineering 

Bryan Matthew Rosine, 
Hubbard 

Nathaniel Joseph Secord, 
Toledo 

Cum Laude 
Robel Tsegate Setegne, Addis 

Abeba, Ethiopia 
Kyle Allen Sharkey, Gahanna 
Hye Jin Song, Seoul, Korea 
Cum Laude 
John Robert Stevens, 

Worthington 
Joseph Robert Vermeersch, 
Liberty Township 
Christopher David Becker 

Yuska, Jacksonville, IL 
Cum Laude 
 
 

Bachelor of Science in 
Engineering Physics 
 
Louis Frank Isabella, 

Strongsville 
Magna Cum Laude 
Ronni Gilmore Nimps, Lima 
Summa Cum Laude 
with Honors in Engineering 

Aakash Patel, Columbus 
with Research Distinction in 

Engineering Physics 

Christopher Patrick Youssefi, 
Nashville, TN 

 
 

Bachelor of Science in 
Environmental 
Engineering 
 
Timothy Stephen Duning, 

Dayton 
 
 

Bachelor of Science in 
Food, Agricultural, and 
Biological Engineering 
 
 
Sara Diane Little, New 

Philadelphia 
Joshua R. Lutz, Thornville 
Ali Waris Rizvi, Lima 
Cum Laude 
with Honors Research Distinction in 

Biomedical Engineering 
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Bachelor of Science in 
Industrial and Systems 
Engineering 
 
 
Scott Patrick Berns, Monroe 
Magna Cum Laude 
John Ryan Clifford, Getzville, 

NY 
Jonathan Kevin Clune, St. 

Henry 
Magna Cum Laude 
Frank Anthony Dachtyl, 

Garfield Heights 
Magna Cum Laude 
Kyle Gregory Doppler, 

Loveland 
Thomas Kenneth Herman, 

Cincinnati 
Melvin L. Hill, Canton 
Alexa Beth Hutras, Hilliard 
Matthew Daniel Johnson, 

Fayetteville 
Magna Cum Laude 
Gina Marie Kammer, 

Strongsville 
Magna Cum Laude 
with Honors in Engineering 

Robert Joseph Keeling, 
Mayfield 

Justin Louis Koester, 
Englewood 

Cameron M. Laudick, Van 
Wert 

Chien-Yu Lin, Taipei, Taiwan, 
ROC 

Xiaoli Liu, Beijing, China 
with Research Distinction in 

Industrial and System 
Engineering 

Brent Michael Miller, Gahanna 
Martin Paul Moser, Bucyrus 
Tyler Pensiero, Bellevue 
Gloria Marie Phillips, 

Rochester Hills, MI 
Joshua Loren Sexton, 

Sunbury 
Robert Neal Smyth, Cincinnati 
Alexander Nathaniel Watson, 

Marion 
Tyler John Yosua, Centerville 
 
 

Bachelor of Science in 
Mechanical Engineering 
 
Brett Robert Baker, 

Westerville 
David Michael Barger, Canton 
Bradley Scott Bashore, 

Hamburg, PA 
Rebecca Michelle Brandt, 

Akron 
James Anthony Coughlin, 

Mentor 
Eric Michael Daulton, Sidney 
Cum Laude 

Nathan Michael Davies, 
Wadsworth 

Daniel Evert Ebinger, Parma 
Cum Laude 
John David Frederick, 

Worthington 
Summa Cum Laude 
Richard W. Geary, Lyndhurst 
John H. Greenwood, 

Oklahoma City, OK 
Kody Dale Kadesch, Paulding 
Ryan Neal Kay, Trenton 
Cum Laude 
with Honors in Engineering 

Kurt Marek Kroplin, West 
Milton 

Andrew Philip Laux, 
Strongsville 

Matthew Thomas Lenk, 
Springfield 

Cum Laude 
Brian Matthew Maupin, 

Centerville 
Andrew Heinke Montecalvo, 

Cedarville 
Paul Gregory Murphy, Akron 
Cum Laude 
James William Neagle, 

Westerville 
Alexander Michael Nestoff, 

North Olmsted 
Joshua J. Pax, Coldwater 
Benjamin Ray Pulley, West 

Lafayette 
Christopher Michael Reichert, 

St. Henry 
Cory John Riffe, Hilliard 
Magna Cum Laude 
Derek Larimore Schmid, 

Springfield 
Gregory Alan Seckel, Lewis 

Center 
Cum Laude 
Jonathon Andrew Strah, North 

Royalton 
Cory Michael Strait, Poland 
Stephen Richard Sweetnich, 

Brecksville 
Greggory Kevin Swint, 

Sylvania 
Cum Laude 
David Michael Toth, 

Twinsburg 
Thomas Wilson Turner, West 

Chester 
Nick E. Veneri, Mentor 
Kevin Andrew Veverka, North 

Royalton 
Cum Laude 
Brian Joseph Vick, Bay Village 
Aaron Charles Vranekovic, 

Amherst 
Evan Ryan Wells, Van Wert 
David Francis Woodrow, 

Urbana 
Yuki Yamazaki, Tsu, Japan 

Bachelor of Science in 
Welding Engineering 
 
Christopher David Barnhill, 

Cincinnati 
Justin Winslow Miller, 

Bellbrook 
Michael Presley, Harrison 
 
 
 

Austin E. Knowlton 
School of 
Architecture 
 
 

Bachelor of Science in 
Architecture 
 
Hong Bing Beh, Penang, 

Malaysia 
Ryan Joseph Biasella, North 

Canton 
Briana Louise Borkowski, 

Rockland, ME 
Sally Romas Cejauskas, 

McLean, VA 
Marceline Febriani Dalimarta, 

Jakarta, Indonesia 
Morgan Rachel Embt, 

Herndon, VA 
Cum Laude 
Michael T. Grafton, New 

Albany 
Lauren Elizabeth Grech, 

Bellbrook 
Qing Huang, Hangzhou, China 
Chelsea Marie Meyer, Fort 

Loramie 
Cum Laude 
Zachary Paul Ring, 

Woodsfield 
Cum Laude 
Yong Seok Shin, Seoul, Korea 
Lauren Page Spetnagel, 

Frankfort 
 
 

Bachelor of Science in 
City and Regional 
Planning 
 
Beth Ann Doliboa, Springboro 
Ayden Rafael Ergun, Pepper 

Pike 
Cum Laude 
David Allen Gentile, Sunbury 
Christopher Patrick Jenkins, 

Cleveland 
Sean McNash, Pittsburgh, PA 
Cum Laude 
Ernest Ray Rhodes, 

Beavercreek 
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College of Food, 
Agricultural, and 
Environmental 
Sciences 
 
Dean: Bobby D. Moser 
 
 

Bachelor of Science in 
Agriculture 
 
Benjamin William Albaitis, 

Elyria 
Douglas Ryan Andresen, 

Groveport 
Holly Ann Bacon, Columbus 
Casey Erin Beacom, Sunbury 
Robert Allen Bellard, Dublin 
Keri A. Bickel, New Vienna 
Nick A. Billesbach, Medina 
Nicole Lee Boerger, Columbus 
Jonathan Michael Borges, 

Minster 
Colleen Grace Brown, 

Columbus 
Cum Laude 
Joshua Allen Bussing, 

Defiance 
Jared Joseph Butts, Circleville 
Sally Romas Cejauskas, 

McLean, VA 
Chris James Chester, 

Napoleon 
Hannah Marie Crossen, 

Jeromesville 
Cum Laude 
Kyla Jordan Curnutte, West 

Portsmouth 
Cum Laude 
Jonathan David Dombroski, 

Hudson 
Cum Laude 
Daniel William Duncan, 

Brecksville 
Scott Robert Eickholt, Van 

Wert 
Matthew William Elsass, Anna 
Cum Laude 
Alison Coleen Finnarn, 

Greenville 
Andrew James Fovargue, 

Utica 
Mary Colleen Fox, Cincinnati 
Bryant David Gerber, Paulding 
Jon Erik Goodman, Galena 
Joshua Michael Greer, 

Fostoria 
Summa Cum Laude 
Charles Phillip Guy, Toledo 
Philip Douglas Hatfield, 

Wapakoneta 
Summa Cum Laude 
Kelsey Michelle Holter, 

Pomeroy 
Nicole A. Jolliff, Richwood 
Magna Cum Laude 
Rachel Marie Kiser, Hillsboro 

Alyssa Marie Kitchen, Forest 
Donald Robert Kitchen, Hilliard 
Blake Charles Knoefel, 

Newark 
David Samuel Koepf, 

Columbus 
Alexander Ross Koltun, 

Columbus 
Kevin Lewis Kreutz, Columbus 
Fred Jackson Kungl, 

Uniontown 
Joshua Dean Kuszmaul, 

Salem 
Domenic Ralph Lauria, 

Chesterland 
Cory Thomas Lawson, Ripley 
Bradley Jacob Line, Findlay 
Hannah Michelle Long, Troy 
Amanda Marie Lord, Concord 
Shasta Renae Madden, 

Chillicothe 
Zachery Wade Marlow, 

Columbus 
Dana Marie Mass, Bellaire 
Andrew David Mazur, Dublin 
Magna Cum Laude 
Troy Kenneth McCarron, 

Mansfield 
Peter Michael McDonough, 

Millersburg 
Summa Cum Laude 
Krizia Melendez, Columbus 
John Robert Moser, 

Perrysburg 
Thomas James Nagel, 

Columbus 
Lyndsay Joelle Nezbeth, 

Salem 
Amelia Brooke Nyhart, Mount 

Vernon 
Cum Laude 
with Research Distinction in Animal 

Sciences 

Lindsay Jordan Pate, 
Middletown 

Kyle James Pitt, St. Louisville 
Wade Edward Planson, 

Stryker 
Magna Cum Laude 
Kelli Michelle Prowant, 

Cloverdale 
Joshua Matthew Rachel, 

Massillon 
Lindsey M. Randolph, 

Columbus 
Joshua Craig Ray, Langsville 
Elizabeth Reeder, Parma 
Jason Walter Rethman, Maria 

Stein 
Brock Andrew Rieser, 

Harpster 
Maxwell G. Salinger, Mentor 
Justin Leonard Schulte, Celina 
Christine R. Shannon, Grafton 
Timothy Allen Short, Wauseon 
Cum Laude 
Justin Richard Shreyer, 

Baltimore 

Aaron James Siefker, 
Columbus Grove 

Cum Laude 
Casey Murdoch Skowron, 

Salem 
William Patrick Sorter, 

Loveland 
Cum Laude 
David Charles Spisak, Perry 
Kathryn Elizabeth Tignor, 

Wooster 
Kimberly Jane Tippin, Holland 
John Carl Visgak, Austintown 
Samantha Marie Walker, 

Galion 
Andrew H. Wei, Columbus 
Christopher Lee Winand, 

Powell 

Laina Wireman, Waynesfield 
Johel Bradford Woodliff, 

Columbus 
Brandon Bernard Wright, 

Galena 
Helen Yang, Columbus 
Alicia M. Yonyon, Shadyside 
 
 

Bachelor of Science in 
Construction Systems 
Management 
 
Justin Michael Alt, West 

Jefferson 
Brittany Phoenix Beaver, 

Groveport 
Joseph Michael Boehm, 

Columbus 
Joseph Paul Bruggeman, 

Middletown 
Derek Richard Budde, Mason 
Stephen Edwin Dawson, Jr., 

Frazeysburg 
Dennis Michael Dibling, 

Marion 
Jenna Marie Eaves, 

Reynoldsburg 
Ryan William Edwards, Canal 

Winchester 
Joshua David Epstein, Solon 
Brendan Scott Gordon, 

Westerville 
Brian Andrew Hicks, Lancaster 
Magna Cum Laude 
Andrew Joseph Hoehn, 

Delphos 
Cum Laude 
Jason C. Lawhead, 

Worthington 
Matthew Allen Mullins, 

Springfield 
Spenser Lee Oxer, Galion 
David Joseph Perek, Seven 

Hills 
Alexander Harold Phlipot, 

Paulding 
Donald Joseph Porvasnik III, 

North Royalton 
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Peyton Joseph Randolph, 
Baltimore 

Brandon Michael Reder, West 
Chester 

Bryan Zachary Ridge, 
Delaware 

Benjamin Daniel Stickney, 
Clyde 

Hansen Tanoto, Surabaya, 
Indonesia 

Chad Michael Vonderembse, 
Lima 

Michael Thomas Walsh, Niles 
 
 

Bachelor of Science in 
Food Science 
 
Bryan G. Finfrock, Springfield 
Elaina Katherine Jones, 

Homer, NY 
Cum Laude 
Huan-Qi Pang, Melaka, 

Malaysia 
Abigail Rose Ruth Romans, 

South Lyon, MI 
 
 
 

School of 
Environment and 
Natural Resources 
 
 

Bachelor of Science in 
Environment and Natural 
Resources 
 
Shane Phillip Anderson, 

Lexington 
Cody Grant Berkebile, 

Pickerington 
Magna Cum Laude 
Justin Alexander Bochnak, 

Lexington 
Samuel Blake Carlisle, Hilliard 
Thomas Mark Cottrell, Grove 

City 
Daniel Alan Craig, Huron 
Ashley Nicole Doria, Orland 

Park, IL 
Andrew Lewis Dowling, Norton 
Clay Abraham East, Medina 
Jessica Lauren Ellison, 

Steubenville 
Jamie S. Elmlinger, Willard 
Joseph Jon Ferrara, Mentor 
Alan Thomas Goss, Clayton 
Natasha Lynn Groitzsch, 

Jamestown 
Nicholas Hardesty, 

Bladensburg 
Brent M. Harter, Lima 
Gus Jerome, Westerville 
Taewook Kim, Cheongju, 

Korea 

Rikki Jane Knerr, Crooksville 
Thomas Paul Knight, Milan 
Kenrick Scott Knighton, 

Newark 
Magna Cum Laude 
Davids Lauge, Lyndhurst 
Lee D. Napierkowski, Highland 

Heights 
Jawnie Lanette Payne, 

Reynoldsburg 
Cole Joseph Rumschlag, 

Findlay 
Scott Christopher Sansone, 

Dublin 
Kirk Sehlmeyer, Napoleon 
Zachary Thomas Talstein, 

Warren 
Alexa Nicole Weiss, Cincinnati 
Summa Cum Laude 
with Research Distinction 

Nathaniel Thomas Welch, 
Vermilion 

Kyle Ross Yeager, Newark 
 
 
 

Agricultural Technical 
Institute - Wooster 
 
 

Associate in Applied 
Science 
 
Patrick Richard Anderson, 

Hebron, KY 
Keith G. Berns, Middletown 
Toni Renee Boehn, 

Normangee, TX 
Michael Andrew Dahs, 

Wakeman 
Sarah Marie Etling, Bedford 

Heights 
Kristine Sue Hunt, Alliance 
Patrick Kevin Kane, Wooster 
Ryan James Mack, Thornville 
Amy Michelle Robinson, Nova 
Cum Laude 
Sheena Marie Sarno, Dalton 
Joseph Franklin Schopp, 

Newark 
Bryce Allen Stilwill, Archbold 
Keith M. Viola, Salem 
Amanda M. Williams, Wooster 
Cum Laude 
 
 

Associate of Science 
 
Roland George Freeman III, 

Rochester, NH 
Brittany Marie Hoisington, 

Medina 
Katie A. Johnson, Thornville 
Abagail Elizabeth Lavy, 

Wooster 
David Andrew Ludwig, 

Louisville 

Brianna Elizabeth Maher, 
Columbus 

Danae Ellen Mulligan, West 
Salem 

Tyler Jacob Smith, West 
Mansfield 

Lisa Marie Zavesky, West 
Salem 

 
 

Certificate in 
Commercial Turf 
Equipment 
 
Ryan James Mack, Thornville 
 
 
 

College of Medicine 
 
Dean: Charles J. Lockwood 
 
 

School of Health and 
Rehabilitation 
Sciences 
 
 

Bachelor of Science in 
Allied Health 
Professions 
 
Reem Ibrahim Aboomar, 

Columbus 
Courtney Brianne Eichholtz, 

Bellefontaine 
Abigail Theresia Lang, Dayton 
Summa Cum Laude 
Ethan Wallace Leyda, 

Waynesburg 
Cum Laude 
 

Certificate of Post 
Baccalaureate Medical 
Technologist 
 
Eunseong Jang, Incheon, 

Korea 
B.S. (Kosin University) 
M.S. (Pusan National 

University) 
 
 
 

College of Nursing 
 

Dean: Bernadette M. Melnyk 
 
 

Bachelor of Science in 
Nursing 
 
Christopher Douglas Bell, 

Crestline 
Lori Ann Dalton, Mansfield 
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Lyne Ellen Ellis, Hilliard 
Tracy Lynn Haring, Powell 
Emily Marie Jackson, 

Columbus 
Sheila Marie Johnson, Lewis 

Center 
Kimberly Ann Messner, 

Lancaster 
David Christopher Stemen, 

Delphos 
Hawabu Shiraj Suhaiba, 

Yendi, Ghana 
 
 
 

College of Pharmacy 
 
Dean: Robert W. 
Brueggemeier 
 
 

Doctor of Pharmacy 
 
Kehinde Ayoola Ojedele, 

University Heights 
B.Pharm. (Obafemi Awolowo 

University) 
 
 
 

Bachelor of Science in 
Pharmaceutical 
Sciences 
 
Khadra Yusuf Ahmed, 

Mogadishu, Somalia 
Nada Ali, Cairo, Egypt 
Matthew Christopher 

Firestone, Canfield 
David Heng, Columbus 
Marcus Timothy Joy, 

Pickerington 
Summa Cum Laude 
with Honors in Pharmaceutical 

Sciences 

Jinkyung Keum, Seoul, Korea 
Peng I. Lam, Macao, China 
Derek Justin Nixon, Newark 
Rebecca Nadine Snyder, 

Akron 
Cum Laude 
Lut Lam Tsoi, Hong Kong, 

China 

John Glenn School of 
Public Affairs 

 
Director: Charles R. Wise 
 
 

Bachelor of Arts 
 
Gianna Marie Domine, Powell 
Magna Cum Laude 
Taozhen Huang, Chongqing, 

China 
Steven David Redd, North 

Canton 
Summa Cum Laude 
with Honors in Public Affairs 

Abigail Katherine Warner, 
Factoryville, PA 

 
 
 

College of Social 
Work 
 
Dean: Thomas K. Gregoire 

 
 
Bachelor of Science in 
Social Work 
 
Suadi Mohamed Adan, Hilliard 
Jonathan Edward Evener, 

Gahanna 
Janna Lynn Johnson, Fairborn 
Michael Thomas Keller, 

Marion 
John Joseph Provenzano, 

Edgewood, MD 
Lindsy Marie Rivera, Olmsted 

Falls 
Carly S. Skillington, Dublin 
Cum Laude 
Brooke Arvella Staggs, 

Sciotoville 
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